

TO: Dr. Mike Riggle
 FROM: Rosanne Williamson
 RE: FOIA Requests
 DATE: September 19, 2012

Attached you will find FOIA requests received by the district and our response.

Received From	Request	Received Request	Date Replied	Responded within required deadline	How response was sent
Rado, Diane	<ul style="list-style-type: none"> For each of the graduating classes of 2008, 2009, 2010, 2011, and 2012 at Glenbrook North and Glenbrook South, please provide the number of students at each high school who applied; the number of students admitted, and the number of students who enrolled in each of the highly-selective colleges/universities listed on the spreadsheet. For the Class of 2012 ONLY at North and South, please list, for each of the highly-selective colleges/universities on the spreadsheet: The ACT composite score and GPA for each student who applied. (Please use the highest ACT score, from Prairie State testing or testing on a national ACT testing date.) YES or NO, to show if the student was admitted. YES or NO, to show if the student enrolled. 	08.29.12	09.06.12	Yes	email
Please find our response attached. The documents above have been made available online. These items were not copied for the Board packet.					
Shields, Todd	<ul style="list-style-type: none"> All school district 225 legal costs pertaining to the complaint against the district filed by citizens organized to save the tax-cap. 	08.29.12	09.06.12	Yes	email
Please find our response attached. The documents above have been made available online. These items were not copied for the Board packet.					
Asante, Kwame	<ul style="list-style-type: none"> information of all employees of schools offering Supplemental Educational Services (SES) be provided to our organization: Full Employee Name, School district assigned email address, School Site presently employed, Grade/subject taught or title of position employed, Physical Address of School Site employed 	09.11.12	09.13.12	Yes	email
Please find our response attached. The documents above have been made available online.					



Elaine Geallis <egeallis@glenbrook225.org>

Re: Chicago Tribune Freedom of Information request

1 message

Rosanne Marie Williamson <rwilliamson@glenbrook225.org>

Thu, Sep 6, 2012 at 2:49 PM

To: "Rado, Diane" <drado@tribune.com>

Bcc: egeallis@glenbrook225.org

Dear Ms. Rado,

Thank you for writing to Glenbrook High School District 225 with your request for information pursuant to the Illinois Freedom of Information Act, 5 ILCS 140/1 et seq.

On 8/29/12 you requested the following documents:

- For each of the graduating classes of 2008, 2009, 2010, 2011, and 2012 at Glenbrook North and Glenbrook South, please provide the number of students at each high school who applied; the number of students admitted, and the number of students who enrolled in each of the highly-selective colleges/universities listed on the spreadsheet.
- For the Class of 2012 ONLY at North and South, please list, for each of the highly-selective colleges/universities on the spreadsheet: The ACT composite score and GPA for each student who applied. (Please use the highest ACT score, from Prairie State testing or testing on a national ACT testing date.) YES or NO, to show if the student was admitted. YES or NO, to show if the student enrolled.

After a review of the available configurations of District data, the record providing the requested information contains both student ACT scores and grade point averages ("GPA"). While student names can be redacted from the record, in the case where a single District student has a status of accepted, attend, waitlisted, denied, withdrawn, unknown, deferred or no decision with a particular institution, it is highly likely that such student can be identified. Given that the ACT score and GPA is student record information and would be identifiable to a specific student in such instances, the student record information (ACT score and GPA) in such instances has been redacted under Section 7.5 (r) of the Freedom of Information Act.

You have the right to seek review of the denial of redacted information by the Public Access Counselor (PAC) in the Attorney General's office or to judicial review under Section 11 of the Freedom of Information Act. The Public Access Counselor is a part of the Public Access Bureau in the Attorney General's Office. Here is her contact information:

Cara Smith

Public Access Counselor

Public Access Bureau

500 S. 2nd Street

Springfield, Illinois 62706

E-mail: CSmith@atg.state.il.us

FOIA Hotline: 1-877-299-FOIA (1-877-299-3642)

Direct Line: [312-814-5526](tel:312-814-5526)

Rosanne Williamson Ed.D.
Secretary, Board of Education
Assistant Superintendent for Educational Services
Glenbrook H.S. District 225
3801 West Lake Ave.
Glenview, IL 60026
[847-486-4701](tel:847-486-4701)

On Wed, Aug 29, 2012 at 1:49 PM, Rado, Diane <drado@tribune.com> wrote:

To: FOIA Officer:

This is a request under Illinois' Freedom of Information Act.

I am working on a story related to how many Illinois public high school students get into the Ivy League and other highly-selective colleges and universities.

I have attached a spreadsheet of 30 highly-selective colleges/universities, based on rankings for 2012.

Please provide the information below, using any records responsive to my request: (If your school/district uses "Naviance" or any other college tracking software, you should be able to find and pull the data I need very easily.)

For each of the graduating classes of 2008, 2009, 2010, 2011, and 2012 at **Glenbrook North and Glenbrook South**, please provide the number of students at each high school who applied; the number of students admitted, and the number of students who enrolled in **each** of the highly-selective colleges/universities listed on the spreadsheet.

For the Class of 2012 ONLY at North and South, please list, for **each** of the highly-selective colleges/universities on the spreadsheet:

The ACT composite score and GPA for **each** student who applied. (Please use the highest ACT score, from Prairie State testing or testing on a national ACT testing date.)

YES or NO, to show if the student was admitted.

YES or NO, to show if the student enrolled.

I am not requesting any student names.

I prefer this information in a separate spreadsheet for each school, if possible.

If you have any questions, please contact me as soon as possible. If you don't have Naviance or other college tracking software, please provide any other records that would be responsive to my request, including but not

limited to information generated and kept by high school guidance counselors.

I request a waiver of any fees because I believe this request will serve the best interests of the public and will primarily benefit the public at large.

Diane Rado

Education reporter

Chicago Tribune

[708-498-4248](tel:708-498-4248) (Office)

[312-823-3764](tel:312-823-3764) (BlackBerry)

drado@tribune.com

--

4 attachments



GBN Collegedata.pdf

2171K



GBSCollegedata.pdf

1436K



GBN 2012listRedacted.xls

98K



GBS 2012listRedacted.xlsx

32K

College	Class	GPA	High ACT	Result	Attending
Amherst College	2012	4.7143	34	Denied	
Amherst College	2012	4.3333	33	Denied	
Brown University	2012	redacted			attend
Brown University	2012	4.2703	34	Denied	
Brown University	2012	4.9143	34	Denied	
Brown University	2012	3.6286	29	Withdrawn	
Brown University	2012	4.6857	33	Denied	
Brown University	2012	4.5	34	Denied	
Brown University	2012	4.3714	33	Denied	
Brown University	2012	4.3784	34	Withdrawn	
Brown University	2012	4.3333	32	Denied	
Brown University	2012	4.65	35	Denied	
Brown University	2012	4.1714	34	Denied	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	4.7647	31	Denied	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	4.9412	35	Denied	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	Redacted			Attend
University of California at Berkeley	2012	4.6176	35	Denied	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	Redacted			
University of California at Berkeley	2012	4.619	32	Denied	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	3.9706	33	Denied	
California Inst. of Technology	2012	no apps			
Case Western Reserve University	2012	Redacted			Attend
Case Western Reserve University	2012	Redacted			
Case Western Reserve University	2012	3.7429	31	Accepted	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	Redacted			
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.5152	36	Accepted	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.2778	32	Accepted	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.3784	34	Accepted	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.7273	32	Accepted	

Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.3077	33 Accepted
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.4737	32 Accepted
Case Western Reserve University	2012	Redacted	
University of Chicago	2012	4.9744	35 Accepted
University of Chicago	2012	Redacted	
University of Chicago	2012	3.0556	28 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.6667	32 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4	34 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.9444	35 Accepted
University of Chicago	2012	3.8056	34 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.0714	25 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	3.8056	32 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.725	31 Withdrawn
University of Chicago	2012	4.1389	32 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.5135	32 Withdrawn
University of Chicago	2012	4.5	34 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	2.8286	22 Accepted
University of Chicago	2012	4.5946	34 Withdrawn
University of Chicago	2012	4.65	35 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.4737	32 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	Redacted	Attend
University of Chicago	2012	3.2424	33 Withdrawn
Columbia University	2012	4.9744	35 Denied
Columbia University	2012	4.2432	29 Denied
Columbia University	2012	4.3939	32 Denied
Columbia University	2012	3.8056	32 Denied
Columbia University	2012	4.6176	35 Denied
Columbia University	2012	Redacted	
Cornell University	2012	Redacted	
Cornell University	2012	Redacted	

Dartmouth College	2012	4.7143	34 Denied	
Dartmouth College	2012	4.9744	35 Accepted	
Dartmouth College	2012	4.6857	33 Denied	
Dartmouth College	2012	Redacted		Attend
Dartmouth College	2012	4.6176	35 Accepted	
Dartmouth College	2012	4.4545	32 Denied	
Duke University	2012	4.2188	29 Denied	
Duke University	2012	4.6944	33 Denied	
Duke University	2012	4.8286	35 Denied	
Duke University	2012	4.4571	33 Denied	
Duke University	2012	4.7647	31 Denied	
Duke University	2012	4.9412	35 Denied	
Duke University	2012	4.0278	30 Denied	
Duke University	2012	4.7429	36 Denied	
Duke University	2012	4.0882	33 Denied	
Duke University	2012	4.3636	32 Denied	
Duke University	2012	4.65	35 Denied	
Duke University	2012	4.4545	32 Denied	
Emory University	2012	Redacted		Attend
Emory University	2012	3.9706	27 Denied	
Emory University	2012	4.6765	32 Accepted	
Emory University	2012	3.7429	31 Denied	
Emory University	2012	Redacted		
Emory University	2012	4.3939	32 Denied	
Emory University	2012	4.3714	33 Denied	
Emory University	2012	4.0882	33 Denied	
Emory University	2012	4.3333	32 Denied	
Emory University	2012	4.727	32 Accepted	
Emory University	2012	4.8	34 Accepted	
Emory University	2012	4.1765	29 Unknown	
Emory University	2012	4.3333	33 Unknown	
Emory University	2012	4.1714	34 Denied	

Harvard University	2012	4.514	34 Denied	
Harvard University	2012	4.8235	32 Denied	
Harvard University	2012	4.9744	35 Denied	
Harvard University	2012	4.8286	35 Denied	
Harvard University	2012	4.5405	35 Denied	
Harvard University	2012	4.9444	35 Waitlisted	
Harvard University	2012	4.9412	35 Denied	
Harvard University	2012	5	36 Waitlisted	
Harvard University	2012	4.7429	36 Denied	
Harvard University	2012	4.5	34 Denied	
Harvard University	2012	Redacted		
Harvard University	2012	4.65	35 Denied	
Harvard University	2012	Redacted		Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.465	31 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.9706	28 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4	28 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.8125	23 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.6071	33 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.9444	29 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.6765	32 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.3824	28 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.9333	33 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.6389	28 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.5357	26 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.9412	28 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.3947	32 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.0606	27 No decision	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	1.8788	26 Unknown	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	2	20 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	3.5882	28 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	3.52	24 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	3.7333	21 Accepted	

University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	3.6765	27 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	3.2162	26 Unknown	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	2.4167	20 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	3.6571	29 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	3.4286	27 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	3.3529	32 Deferred	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	3.1053	28 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	3.1081	30 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	3.4286	26 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	3.6176	27 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Agricultural, Consumer, & Env)	2012	3.7568	27 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Applied Health Sciences)	2012	3.9722	29 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Applied Health Sciences)	2012	4.1429	31 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.2188	29 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.4118	33 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	3.2	30 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	3.9688	30 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	3.0294	27 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.5882	32 No decision	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.1765	31 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	3.2432	24 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.3529	33 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.2222	33 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.1944	31 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.4375	33 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.1667	33 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.5946	34 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.3333	32 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	3.2973	27 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.0303	32 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.8	34 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.4545	32 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	2.8197	22 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	3.7714	27 Denied	

University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Business)	2012	4.3824	31 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	4.6667	32 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	4.4286	32 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	3.4545	30 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	2.6944	23 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	3.5	34 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	4.9412	35 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	4.0882	32 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	4.5588	33 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	3.5	26 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	3.9706	33 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	4.6757	32 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	4.3077	33 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	4.65	35 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	4.4737	32 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	4.3333	28 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (College of Engineering)	2012	3.4571	32 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.5294	28 Deferred
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	4.1143	28 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.3529	29 No decision
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.6765	27 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.2105	28 Deferred
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	4.2	28 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	4.1176	27 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.7714	31 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.6757	31 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	4.0278	30 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.3714	29 Deferred
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.7059	31 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.0588	25 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.4054	25 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.7027	23 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	2.8611	27 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.8529	27 Accepted Attend

University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.9032	28 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.3889	28 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.5882	25 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3	29 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	4.6176	35 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.3333	27 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.7576	28 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.7778	30 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.75	23 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.9118	31 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.4706	30 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	4.1389	29 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	2.8235	23 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.9091	33 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	4.0526	27 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.8947	31 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.5588	27 Deferred	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.9459	27 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.8529	31 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Division of General Studies)	2012	3.4412	29 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Education)	2012	4.2353	28 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Education)	2012	4.2286	32 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Education)	2012	3.3143	23 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Education)	2012	3.8	26 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Education)	2012	2.7576	26 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Education)	2012	3.7353	26 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Education)	2012	4	25 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Education)	2012	3.5455	26 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Education)	2012	3.7429	25 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Education)	2012	3.4242	25 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Education)	2012	3.2121	27 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Education)	2012	3.7353	26 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Fine & Applied Arts)	2012	3.8056	34 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Fine & Applied Arts)	2012	3.1818	24 Denied	

University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Fine & Applied Arts)	2012	Redacted		
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Fine & Applied Arts)	2012	3.1471	32 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Fine & Applied Arts)	2012	3.5758	27 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.4651	31 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.0556	28 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.2821	30 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4	34 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.7429	31 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.9444	35 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.4722	29 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	2.9189	34 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.3939	33 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.0857	27 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.4545	24 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.9143	27 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.4872	32 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	2.9697	24 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4	34 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.3143	30 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.3235	30 Deferred	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.7742	28 Waitlisted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.7778	33 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.1389	32 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.7188	29 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.175	31 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.4375	29 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.2778	32 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.3714	33 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.5556	30 Deferred	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.5135	32 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.9024	29 Waitlisted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.5	34 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.9118	27 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.619	32 Accepted	

University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.025	21	No decision
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.0833	29	Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	2.7027	28	Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.1471	32	Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.0278	32	Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.9444	32	Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.5833	32	Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.7353	33	Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.0513	31	Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.1429	28	Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.8824	30	Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.8286	28	No decision
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.027	28	Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.5333	28	Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	3.9063	21	Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.1714	34	Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Liberal Arts & Sciences)	2012	4.5172	32	Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Media)	2012	3.9706	27	Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Media)	2012	3.4848	28	Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Media)	2012	4	30	Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Media)	2012	3.5	30	Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Media)	2012	4.0286	30	Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (Media)	2012	3.7059	27	Accepted Attend
Johns Hopkins University	2012	4.9412	35	Denied
Johns Hopkins University	2012	4.4872	32	Denied
Johns Hopkins University	2012	Redacted		Attend
Johns Hopkins University	2012	4.3333	32	Denied
Johns Hopkins University	2012	Redacted		
Massachusetts Institute of Technology	2012	4.5405	35	Denied
Massachusetts Institute of Technology	2012	Redacted		
Massachusetts Institute of Technology	2012	4.9412	35	Denied
Massachusetts Institute of Technology	2012	Redacted		

Massachusetts Institute of Technology	2012	4.6757	32 Denied
Massachusetts Institute of Technology	2012	4.65	35 Denied
Massachusetts Institute of Technology	2012	4.3333	28 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4.5526	32 Withdrawn
University of Michigan	2012	4.4651	31 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	3.9706	28 Unknown
University of Michigan	2012	4.5429	32 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	3.9706	27 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	4.8235	32 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	3.9444	29 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.6765	32 Withdrawn
University of Michigan	2012	4.9744	35 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.6944	33 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	3.0556	28 Deferred
University of Michigan	2012	4.2353	28 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	3.3529	29 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	3.6765	27 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4.2703	34 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	3.7429	31 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4.4286	32 Unknown
University of Michigan	2012	3.9333	33 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	3.4848	28 Unknown
University of Michigan	2012	4.9444	35 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	3.5882	28 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	3.8056	34 Deferred
University of Michigan	2012	4.2286	32 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	4.7647	31 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	4.1714	30 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.1176	27 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4.5882	32 No decision
University of Michigan	2012	3.5	30 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4.9412	35 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	3.9143	27 Deferred

University of Michigan	2012	4.3939	32 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4	34 Deferred
University of Michigan	2012	4.4412	30 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.3529	33 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.2222	33 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4.3143	30 Unknown
University of Michigan	2012	4.1944	31 No decision
University of Michigan	2012	4.1389	32 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	4.4375	33 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	4.1667	33 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	4.4	31 Withdrawn
University of Michigan	2012	4.175	31 Deferred
University of Michigan	2012	4.7429	36 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	4.5	34 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.5135	32 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.5294	31 Incomplete
University of Michigan	2012	4.5	34 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	3.9706	31 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	3.7576	28 Waitlisted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	4.0882	33 Incomplete
University of Michigan	2012	4.3636	32 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	3.9706	33 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	3.9444	28 Deferred
University of Michigan	2012	4.3333	32 Waitlisted
University of Michigan	2012	4.1389	29 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.1389	29 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.0286	30 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.6757	32 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.3077	33 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	3.875	29 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.8571	35 Withdrawn
University of Michigan	2012	4	28 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4.0526	27 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	4.8	34 Accepted

University of Michigan	2012	4.7353	33 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.0513	31 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	3.6176	27 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4.3333	28 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	4.3333	33 Unknown
University of Michigan	2012	3.8824	30 Deferred
University of Michigan	2012	4.4545	32 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	4.5333	28 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.3824	31 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	3.4571	32 Deferred
University of Michigan	2012	4.1429	31 Accepted
Middlebury College	2012	Redacted	
Middlebury College	2012	Redacted	
Northwestern University	2012	4.5143	34 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	3.9706	27 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.8235	32 Waitlisted
Northwestern University	2012	3.9444	29 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.6765	32 Unknown
Northwestern University	2012	4.9744	35 Accepted Attend
Northwestern University	2012	4.2821	30 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.6667	32 Waitlisted
Northwestern University	2012	4	34 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.5405	35 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.2703	34 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	3.9333	33 Deferred
Northwestern University	2012	4.9444	35 Accepted
Northwestern University	2012	3.8056	34 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.2	28 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	3.7333	21 Unknown
Northwestern University	2012	4.7647	31 Waitlisted
Northwestern University	2012	3.6286	29 Accepted Attend
Northwestern University	2012	4.2121	32 Denied

Northwestern University	2012	4.9412	35 Accepted Attend
Northwestern University	2012	4.0278	30 Unknown
Northwestern University	2012	4.2432	29 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.3939	32 Accepted
Northwestern University	2012	3.8056	32 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.725	31 Withdrawn
Northwestern University	2012	4.7778	33 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.1389	32 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.4375	33 Accepted
Northwestern University	2012	4.175	31 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.7429	36 Accepted
Northwestern University	2012	4.5	34 Accepted
Northwestern University	2012	4.5588	33 Withdrawn
Northwestern University	2012	4.5135	32 Accepted Attend
Northwestern University	2012	4.5	34 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.6176	35 Accepted Attend
Northwestern University	2012	4.3784	34 Withdrawn
Northwestern University	2012	4.619	32 Waitlisted
Northwestern University	2012	3.3529	32 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.3333	32 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.6757	32 Waitlisted
Northwestern University	2012	4.3077	33 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.0286	36 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	3.9091	33 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.7353	33 Unknown
Northwestern University	2012	4.65	35 Waitlisted
Northwestern University	2012	4.0513	31 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	3.1212	26 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.3333	28 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.3333	33 Unknown
Northwestern University	2012	3.8286	28 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.4545	32 Accepted
Northwestern University	2012	4.1143	31 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.3824	31 Denied

Northwestern University	2012	3.7429	26 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.1714	34 Denied
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.8286	35 Accepted
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.4571	33 Accepted Attend
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.2	28 Denied
University of Notre Dame	2012	Redacted	
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.4	31 Denied
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.0833	29 Denied
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.1765	27 Denied
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.4737	32 Accepted Attend
University of Notre Dame	2012	3.5714	34 Denied
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.1143	31 Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.5526	32 Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.9744	35 Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	Redacted	
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.5405	35 Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.8286	32 Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.4872	32 Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.7429	36 Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.619	32 Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.6757	32 Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	Redacted	attend
Pomona College	2012	Redacted	
Pomona College	2012	Redacted	
Princeton University	2012	4.9744	35 Denied
Princeton University	2012	Redacted	
Princeton University	2012	4.5405	35 Denied
Princeton University	2012	Redacted	
Princeton University	2012	4.9412	35 Denied
Princeton University	2012	4.65	35 Denied

Princeton University	2012	Redacted	
Rice University	2012	Redacted	
Rice University	2012	4.4412	30 Denied
Rice University	2012	4.7778	33 Denied
Rice University	2012	Redacted	
Stanford University	2012	3.0556	28 Denied
Stanford University	2012	4.9444	35 Accepted
Stanford University	2012	4.3939	33 Denied
Stanford University	2012	4.7647	31 Denied
Stanford University	2012	4.9143	34 Denied
Stanford University	2012	4.9412	35 Denied
Stanford University	2012	4.3939	32 Denied
Stanford University	2012	Redacted	attend
Stanford University	2012	4.7429	36 Denied
Stanford University	2012	4.5	34 Denied
Stanford University	2012	4.6176	35 Denied
Stanford University	2012	4.619	32 Denied
Stanford University	2012	3.9706	33 Denied
Stanford University	2012	Redacted	
Stanford University	2012	4.65	35 Denied
Stanford University	2012	5	35 Denied
Stanford University	2012	4.3824	31 Denied
Swarthmore College	2012	Redacted	
Swarthmore College	2012	Redacted	
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.5429	32 Accepted Attend
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.5143	34 Waitlisted
Vanderbilt University	2012	3.9706	27 Denied
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.8235	32 Accepted Attend
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.6071	33 Withdrawn
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.4571	33 Denied

Vanderbilt University	2012	3.8056	34 Denied
Vanderbilt University	2012	4	30 Denied
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.3939	33 Waitlisted
Vanderbilt University	2012	Redacted	
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.4054	32 Accepted Attend
Vanderbilt University	2012	Redacted	
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.6857	33 Accepted
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.4857	33 Waitlisted
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.7429	36 Accepted
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.3714	33 Waitlisted
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.3784	34 Accepted
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.619	32 Waitlisted
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.1389	29 Denied
Vanderbilt University	2012	3.9091	33 Denied
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.7353	33 Accepted Attend
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.4737	32 Waitlisted
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.4545	32 Deferred
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.3824	31 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.5526	32 Withdrawn
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	Redacted	
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	3.9706	27 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.6071	33 Withdrawn
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.6765	32 Withdrawn
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.8286	35 Accepted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.5405	35 Accepted Attend
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.2703	34 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.9444	35 Withdrawn
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.8286	32 Accepted Attend
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.5882	32 Accepted Attend
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.9412	35 Accepted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.2432	29 Waitlisted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.3939	32 Accepted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.3529	33 Accepted

Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.725	31 Withdrawn
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.7778	33 Waitlisted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.2778	32 Waitlisted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.5	34 Waitlisted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.5263	35 Accepted Attend
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.5588	33 Accepted Attend
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.3714	33 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.6176	35 Waitlisted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.3784	34 Withdrawn
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	3.4706	30 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	3.9706	33 Accepted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.3333	32 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.6757	32 Accepted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.0286	36 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.8	34 Accepted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.65	35 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.4737	32 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.3333	33 Unknown
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	3.5714	34 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.4545	32 Deferred
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.1143	31 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.3824	31 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.1714	34 Denied

Williams College

2012 Redacted

University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.4651	31 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9706	28 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7188	25 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.5294	28 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0278	31 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6667	29 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9706	27 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.8235	32 Accepted

University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.6071	33 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9444	29 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.2188	29 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.1143	28 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.3824	28 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.6944	33 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.0556	28 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.2821	30 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.4118	33 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4	34 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.3529	29 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.2105	28 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.2703	34 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.4286	32 Unknown
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.5405	27 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4848	28 Unknown
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4722	29 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	2.9189	34 Unknown
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.5882	28 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.8056	34 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	2.9737	21 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.52	24 Incomplete
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.2286	32 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6389	28 Unknown
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.3939	33 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6286	28 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.1714	30 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.8286	32 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0857	27 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4545	24 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.5882	32 No decision
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.3947	32 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4848	28 Waitlisted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0278	30 Accepted

University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9143	27 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	2.9697	24 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.3714	29 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.2571	26 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7059	31 Unknown
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4	34 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.4412	30 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6765	27 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.0909	31 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.1944	31 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.2571	27 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.2703	25 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.3421	24 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0882	32 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.7778	33 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.4375	33 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4118	25 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.1667	33 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.4	31 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.175	31 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4375	29 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.7429	36 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	2.5455	26 Unknown
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.3714	33 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.5556	30 Unknown
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.5135	32 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.5294	31 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	2.9688	25 Unknown
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9024	29 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3	29 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7941	24 Waitlisted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7941	24 Waitlisted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.5	34 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.6176	35 Accepted

University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6364	29 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9722	29 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7576	28 Waitlisted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.25	28 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.5	26 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7778	30 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0278	32 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.75	23 Waitlisted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9118	31 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.3636	32 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.5946	34 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4706	30 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.3529	32 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	2.7353	19 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9444	28 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.5455	26 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.1389	29 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.1389	29 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.2973	27 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0286	30 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0303	32 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.875	29 No decision
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.5833	32 Unknown
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4	28 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0526	27 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.8	34 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7429	25 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.1081	30 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9714	28 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0513	31 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.8947	31 Waitlisted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.1765	29 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.1429	28 Unknown
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4286	26 Denied

University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6176	27 Unknown
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9459	27 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.8824	30 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.8286	28 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.027	28 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7714	27 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.5333	28 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.3824	31 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.1429	31 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7353	26 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7568	27 Deferred
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4412	29 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.5172	32 Accepted
Yale University	2012	4.9744	35 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.6667	32 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.8286	35 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.5405	35 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.9444	35 Accepted
Yale University	2012	4.3939	33 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.9143	34 Denied
Yale University	2012	5	36 Accepted
Yale University	2012	4.725	31 Withdrawn
Yale University	2012	4.4857	33 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.5	34 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.6176	35 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.3784	34 Withdrawn
Yale University	2012	4.65	35 Denied
Yale University	2012	3.5714	34 Denied



College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Harvard University :: Cambridge, MA :: U.S.

www.harvard.edu

General	Applications	Analysis	Admissions	Academics	Cost & aid	Extracurriculars
---------	--------------	----------	------------	-----------	------------	------------------

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	13	1	1
2011	9	0	0
2010	5	0	0
2009	9	0	0
2008	8	0	0
2007	7	0	0
2006	2	0	0
2005	19	2	2
2004	7	0	0
2003	10	2	1

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(617) 495-1551
Fax: +1-(617) 495-8821
Financial Aid: +1-(617)495-1581
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

James Pautz

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Groups edit

- Colleges that have Visited
- Colleges Accepted our Students
- Our Students Have Attended

Application Deadlines

- Regular Decision - Jan 1
- Restrictive Early Action - Nov 1

Admissions Office Address

86 Brattle Street
 Cambridge MA 02138

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 10,265
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 3434
ACT Code: 1840

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup

help | sign out

quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: **Advanced Search**

Princeton University :: Princeton, NJ :: U.S.

www.princeton.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	7	1	0
2011	9	0	0
2010	6	1	1
2009	5	1	0
2008	8	0	0
2007	7	0	0
2006	4	1	0
2005	10	0	0
2004	5	2	2
2003	3	0	0

Scheduled Visits

October 12, 2012 7:45 AM

Contacts

Jameel Freeman (primary)

Groups

Colleges that have Visited
Colleges Accepted our Students
Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes

Quick Name: N/A ()

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(609) 258-3060
Fax: +1-(609) 258-6743
Financial Aid: +1-(609)258-3330

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-609-258-3060
Fax: +1-609-258-6743
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: SEND E-MAIL

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Regular Decision - Jan 1
Restrictive Early Action - Nov 1

Admissions Office Address

Undergraduate Admission Office
110 West College
PO Box 430
Princeton NJ 08542-0430

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 5,142
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small Town
CEEB Code: 2672
ACT Code: 2588

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out
 quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

- College Options**
- :: request update
 - :: batch update
 - :: schedule visit
 - :: remove from quicklist
 - :: set quickname
 - :: update groups
 - :: print mailing labels
 - :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: Advanced Search

Yale University :: New Haven, CT :: U.S.
 www.yale.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	15	2	0
2011	12	1	1
2010	9	2	1
2009	9	1	1
2008	7	0	0
2007	7	2	2
2006	11	2	0
2005	18	0	0
2004	9	1	1
2003	6	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(203) 432-9300
Fax: +1-(203)-777-6120
Financial Aid: +1-(203) 432-2700

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(203) 432-9316
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: SEND E-MAIL

Scheduled Visits

No visits scheduled.

Contacts

No contacts.

Groups edit

Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Regular Decision - Dec 31
 Restrictive Early Action - Nov 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 38 Hillhouse Avenue
 PO Box 208234
 New Haven CT 06520-8234

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 5,310
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 3987
ACT Code: 0618

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



- home
 - students
 - scholarships
 - colleges
 - careers
 - connections
 - reports
 - setup
 - help
 - sign out
- quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Columbia University :: New York, NY :: U.S.

www.columbia.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	6	0	0
2011	3	0	0
2010	2	0	0
2009	8	0	0
2008	4	0	0
2007	6	1	0
2006	7	1	0
2005	13	1	1
2004	4	1	0

Scheduled Visits

No visits scheduled.

Contacts

No contacts.

Groups

Colleges Accepted our Students
Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-212-854-2522
 Fax: +1-212-854-3393
 Financial Aid: +1-(212)854-3711
 Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
 Fax: N/A
 Financial Aid: N/A
 Email: N/A

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 212 Hamilton Hall, MC 2807
 1130 Amsterdam Avenue
 New York NY 10027

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
 Enrollment: 7,950
 Religious Affiliation: -
 Campus Surroundings: Large City
 CEEB Code: 2116
 ACT Code: 2716

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup

help | sign out

quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

University of Pennsylvania :: Philadelphia, PA :: U.S.

www.upenn.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	10	1	1
2011	7	2	2
2010	8	0	0
2009	9	0	0
2008	9	1	0
2007	22	2	1
2006	10	2	0
2005	19	2	1
2004	10	2	0
2003	7	1	1

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(215) 898-7507
Fax: +1-(215) 898-9670
Financial Aid: +1-(215) 898-7526
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

Teran Tadal (primary)

Groups edit

Colleges that have Visited
 Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

The Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 1 College Hall
 Room 1
 Philadelphia PA 19104-6376

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 11,940
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 2926
ACT Code: 3732

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out
 quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: **Advanced Search**

California Institute of Technology :: Pasadena, CA :: U.S.
 www.caltech.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2011	2	0	0
2010	1	0	0
2009	3	0	0
2008	2	0	0
2006	4	2	0
2004	1	1	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(626) 395-6341
 Fax: +1-(626) 683-3026
 Financial Aid: +1-(626)395-6280
 Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
 Fax: N/A
 Financial Aid: N/A
 Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

No visits scheduled.

Contacts

Ray Prado

Groups edit

Colleges that have Visited
 Colleges Accepted our Students

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Private Notes edit

Application Deadlines

Early Action - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 3

Admissions Office Address

Caltech Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 1200 E. California Blvd
 Mail code 10-90
 Pasadena CA 91125

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
 Enrollment: 967
 Religious Affiliation: -
 Campus Surroundings: Small City
 CEEB Code: 4034
 ACT Code: 0182

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out
 quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Massachusetts Institute of Technology :: Cambridge, MA :: U.S.
 www.mit.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	7	1	1
2011	8	0	0
2010	3	0	0
2009	9	0	0
2008	3	0	0
2007	3	0	0
2006	7	1	1
2005	2	0	0
2004	4	1	1
2003	2	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(617)-253-3400
Fax: +1-(617) 258-8304
Financial Aid: +1-(617) 253-4971
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-617-253-3400
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

No contacts.

You may submit transcripts and recommendations electronically via eDocs.

Groups edit

Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Application Deadlines

Regular Decision - Jan 1
 Early Action - Nov 1

Private Notes edit

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admissions
 Room 10-100
 77 Massachusetts Avenue
 Cambridge MA 02139-4307

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 4,299
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 3514
ACT Code: 1858

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:
 (select state)

Browse by country:
 (select country)

:: **Advanced Search**

Stanford University :: Stanford, CA :: U.S.
 www.stanford.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	17	2	1
2011	11	0	0
2010	14	1	0
2009	13	1	1
2008	6	0	0
2007	10	3	3
2006	10	1	0
2005	16	2	2
2004	15	3	1
2003	9	1	1

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(650) 723-2091
Fax: +1-(650) 723-6050
Financial Aid: +1-(650) 723-3058
Email: SEND E-MAIL
Online Inquiry: inq.applyyourself.com/?id=su-ugrad&pid=753

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

No visits scheduled.

Contacts

Taryn Upchurch (primary)

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Groups edit

Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Application Deadlines

Regular Decision - Jan 1
 Restrictive Early Action - Nov 1

Private Notes edit

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admission
 Montag Hall - 355 Galvez Street
 Stanford CA 94305-6106

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 6,940
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large Town
CEEB Code: 4704
ACT Code: 0434

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out
 quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

University of Chicago :: Chicago, IL :: U.S.

www.uchicago.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	19	4	1
2011	12	0	0
2010	13	1	1
2009	14	3	1
2008	15	2	0
2007	11	2	1
2006	8	2	1
2005	9	2	0
2004	7	0	0
2003	10	4	2

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(773) 702-8650
 Fax: +1-(773) 702-4199
 Financial Aid: +1-(773) 702-8666

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
 Fax: N/A
 Financial Aid: N/A
 Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits new

September 18, 2012 11:00 AM

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Contacts new

Shalini Uppu

Application Deadlines

Early Action - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 2

Groups edit

Colleges that have Visited
 Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Admissions Office Address

Office of College Admissions
 1101 East 58th Street
 Chicago IL 60637

Private Notes edit

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
 Enrollment: 5,270
 Religious Affiliation: -
 Campus Surroundings: Large City
 CEEB Code: 1832
 ACT Code: 1152

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out
 quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

- College Options**
- :: request update
 - :: batch update
 - :: schedule visit
 - :: remove from quicklist
 - :: set quickname
 - :: update groups
 - :: print mailing labels
 - :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: Advanced Search

Duke University :: Durham, NC :: U.S.
 www.duke.edu

General	Applications	Analysis	Admissions	Academics	Cost & aid	Extracurriculars
---------	--------------	----------	------------	-----------	------------	------------------

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	12	0	0
2011	12	1	1
2010	7	1	0
2009	9	0	0
2008	8	0	0
2007	9	3	2
2006	12	0	1
2005	16	1	0
2004	18	3	1
2003	11	4	1

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(919) 684-3214
Fax: +1-(919) 681-8941
Financial Aid: +1-(919) 684-6225
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(919) 684-3214
Fax: +1-(919) 684-8128
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Scheduled Visits new
 October 26, 2012 7:45 AM

Contacts new

Will Dixon (primary)
 Will Dixon

Groups edit

Colleges that have Visited
 Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 2

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 2138 Campus Drive
 Box 90586
 Durham NC 27708-0586

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 6,697
Religious Affiliation: United Methodist
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 5156
ACT Code: 3088

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out

quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: **Advanced Search**

Dartmouth College :: Hanover, NH :: U.S.
www.dartmouth.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	6	3	1
2011	4	1	1
2010	5	0	0
2009	9	2	1
2008	4	1	0
2007	6	2	0
2006	5	1	1
2005	8	0	0
2004	8	0	0
2003	5	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(603) 646-2875
Fax: +1-(603) 646-1216
Financial Aid: +1-(603) 646-2451
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: SEND E-MAIL

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Scheduled Visits

No visits scheduled.

Contacts

Ben Schwartz

Groups edit

Colleges that have Visited
 Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Undergraduate Admissions
 6016 McNutt Hall
 Hanover NH 03755

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 4,194
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small Town
CEEB Code: 3351
ACT Code: 2508

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: **Advanced Search**

Northwestern University :: Evanston, IL :: U.S.

www.northwestern.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	55	11	5
2011	68	25	13
2010	47	13	5
2009	52	19	11
2008	52	13	9
2007	48	14	9
2006	44	20	9
2005	40	16	10
2004	48	17	12
2003	36	14	7

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(847) 491-7271
Fax: +1-(847) 467-1317
Financial Aid: +1-(847) 491-7400
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-847-491-7271
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)

Scheduled Visits **new**

No visits scheduled.

Contacts **new**

Onis Cheatham (primary)

Groups **edit**

Big 10
 Colleges that have Visited
 Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes **edit**

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admission
 1801 Hinman Avenue
 PO Box 3060
 Evanston IL 60204-3060

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 9,535
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large Town
CEEB Code: 1565
ACT Code: 1106

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup

help | sign out

quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Johns Hopkins University :: Baltimore, MD :: U.S.

www.jhu.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	5	1	1
2011	10	1	1
2010	5	2	0
2009	7	2	0
2008	7	2	1
2007	8	2	1
2006	4	0	0
2005	6	4	2
2004	5	1	0
2003	4	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(410) 516-8171
Fax: +1-(410) 516-6025
Financial Aid: +1-(410) 516-8028
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(410) 516-5155
Fax: +1-410-516-6025
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: SEND E-MAIL

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Scheduled Visits

No visits scheduled.

Contacts

No contacts.

Groups edit

Colleges Accepted our Students
Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
Mason Hall
3400 North Charles Street
Baltimore MD 21218

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 5,820
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 5332
ACT Code: 1704

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out
 quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

- A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z
- Browse by state:**

Browse by country:

:: **Advanced Search**

Washington University in St. Louis :: St. Louis, MO :: U.S.

www.wustl.edu

General	Applications	Analysis	Admissions	Academics	Cost & aid	Extracurriculars
---------	--------------	----------	------------	-----------	------------	------------------

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	38	12	5
2011	44	13	4
2010	26	7	2
2009	36	16	8
2008	35	12	7
2007	38	5	2
2006	34	9	6
2005	34	5	3
2004	40	3	0
2003	18	3	1

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

Danforth Scholarship Info:

To be considered, a student must be nominated by an individual who has substantive knowledge of the student's accomplishments and goals. In addition to outstanding ...
 [view more]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(314) 935-6000
Fax: +1-(314) 935-4290
Financial Aid: +1-(314) 935-5900
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits new

September 13, 2012 7:45 AM

Contacts new

Danielle Anderson

Groups edit

- Colleges that have Visited
- Colleges Accepted our Students
- Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 15
 Regular Decision - Jan 15

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 Campus Box 3403
 One Brookings Drive
 St. Louis MO 63143-0403

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 7,138
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 6929
ACT Code: 2386

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup

help | sign out

quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: Advanced Search

Brown University :: Providence, RI :: U.S.

www.brown.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	11	1	1
2011	15	2	2
2010	17	1	0
2009	14	4	3
2008	3	0	0
2007	11	1	1
2006	7	1	1
2005	6	1	0
2004	4	0	0
2003	7	0	0

Scheduled Visits

No visits scheduled.

Contacts

No contacts.

Groups edit

Colleges Accepted our Students
Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(401) 863-2378
Fax: +1-(401) 863-9300
Financial Aid: +1-(401) 863-2378
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(401)863-2378
Fax: +1-(401)863-9300
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: SEND E-MAIL

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
Regular Decision - Jan 2

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admission
45 Prospect Street
Box 1876
Providence RI 02912

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 6,318
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 3094
ACT Code: 3800

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out
quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Cornell University :: Ithaca, NY :: U.S.

www.cornell.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	2	0	0
2011	10	1	0
2010	11	2	2
2009	4	0	0
2008	11	1	1
2007	9	2	1
2006	10	5	0
2005	12	2	1
2004	11	5	3
2003	4	2	2

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

From the Admissions Office - For Counselors Undergraduate Colleges & Majors

[view more]

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(607) 255-5241
 Fax: +1-(607) 255-5452
 Financial Aid: +1-(607)255-5145
 Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
 Fax: +1-(607) 255-5452
 Financial Aid: N/A
 Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

No contacts.

Groups edit

Colleges Accepted our Students
Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
Regular Decision - Jan 2

Admissions Office Address

Undergraduate Admissions Office
410 Thurston Ave.
Ithaca NY 14850-2488

Application Mailing Address

Cornell Undergraduate Admissions
Application Processing Center
349 Pine Tree Road
Ithaca NY 14850-2899

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Application Mailing Address

International Students Address

same as Application Mailing Address

General Information

School Type: Private
 Enrollment: 13,935
 Religious Affiliation: -
 Campus Surroundings: Large Town
 CEEB Code: 2098
 ACT Code: 2726

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out
 quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

- College Options**
- :: request update
 - :: batch update
 - :: schedule visit
 - :: add to quicklist
 - :: set quickname
 - :: update groups
 - :: print mailing labels
 - :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: Advanced Search

Rice University :: Houston, TX :: U.S.
 www.rice.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	4	0	0
2011	5	0	0
2010	1	1	0
2009	4	1	0
2008	3	0	0
2006	1	1	0
2004	2	1	0
2003	4	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(713) 348-7423
Fax: +1-(713) 348-5323
Financial Aid: +1-(713) 348-4958
Email: SEND E-MAIL

Scheduled Visits new

No visits scheduled.

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Contacts new

No contacts.

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Groups edit

- Colleges that have Visited
- Colleges Accepted our Students
- Our Students Have Attended

Application Deadlines

- Early Decision - Nov 1
- Regular Decision - Jan 1

Private Notes edit

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admission - MS 17
 PO Box 1892
 Houston TX 77251-1892

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 3,529
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 6609
ACT Code: 4152

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup

help | sign out

quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Go

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Vanderbilt University :: Nashville, TN :: U.S.

www.vanderbilt.edu

General	Applications	Analysis	Admissions	Academics	Cost & aid	Extracurriculars
---------	--------------	----------	------------	-----------	------------	------------------

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	24	8	4
2011	24	5	1
2010	14	4	1
2009	15	3	1
2008	14	4	2
2007	4	2	0
2006	8	4	1
2005	6	2	0
2004	10	3	1
2003	6	3	1

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(615) 322-2561
 Fax: +1-(615) 343-7765
 Financial Aid: +1-(615) 322-3591
 Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(615) 322-2561
 Fax: +1-(615) 343-7765
 Financial Aid: N/A
 Email: SEND E-MAIL

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Scheduled Visits

September 12, 2012 7:45 AM

Contacts

Thom Golden

Groups

Colleges that have Visited
 Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Early Decision II - Jan 3
 Regular Decision - Jan 3

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 2305 West End Avenue
 Nashville TN 37203-1727

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
 Enrollment: 6,817
 Religious Affiliation: -
 Campus Surroundings: Large City
 CEEB Code: 1871
 ACT Code: 4036

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.





College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

University of Notre Dame :: Notre Dame, IN :: U.S.

www.nd.edu

General	Applications	Analysis	Admissions	Academics	Cost & aid	Extracurriculars
---------	--------------	----------	------------	-----------	------------	------------------

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	10	3	2
2011	20	5	3
2010	12	4	3
2009	12	4	2
2008	15	4	3
2007	16	2	1
2006	6	1	1
2005	11	6	4
2004	4	2	1
2003	6	2	2

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(574) 631-7505
Fax: +1-(574) 631-8865
Financial Aid: +1-(574)631-6436
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits new

September 6, 2012 7:45 AM

Contacts new

Alisa Fisher

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Groups edit

- Colleges that have Visited
- Colleges Accepted our Students
- Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

Application Deadlines

Early Action - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Dec 31

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 220 Main Building
 Notre Dame IN 46556

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 8,442
Religious Affiliation: Roman Catholic
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 1841
ACT Code: 1252

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out
 quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Emory University :: Atlanta, GA :: U.S.

www.emory.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	14	4	1
2011	17	1	0
2010	5	2	0
2009	11	3	0
2008	19	2	0
2007	18	6	2
2006	17	9	3
2005	22	6	4
2004	16	9	5
2003	22	7	3

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(404) 727-6036
Fax: +1-(404) 727-4303
Financial Aid: +1-(404) 727-6039
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Scheduled Visits new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

Timothy Fields (primary)

Groups edit

Colleges that have Visited
 Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Early Decision II - Jan 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 15

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admission
 3263-001-1AA
 1390 Oxford Road NE
 Atlanta GA 30322-1016

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 7,231
Religious Affiliation: United Methodist
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 5187
ACT Code: 0810

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out

quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: **Advanced Search**

University of California at Berkeley :: Berkeley, CA :: U.S.
 www.berkeley.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	1	0	0
2012	7	1	1
2011	3	2	0
2010	4	2	1
2009	2	1	0
2008	3	0	0
2006	2	1	1
2005	2	1	1
2004	3	0	0
2003	3	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(510) 642-3175
Fax: +1-(510) 642-7333
Financial Aid: +1-(510) 642-0485
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(510) 642-3246
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

Michelle Larkith (primary)

Groups edit

Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

This college is not an eDocs destination. You must print and mail school forms if you use eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Regular Decision - Nov 30

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 110 Sproul Hall #5800
 Berkeley CA 94720-5800

Application Mailing Address

University of California
 Undergraduate Application Processing Service
 P.O. Box 4010
 Concord CA 94524-4010

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Public
Enrollment: 25,540
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 4833
ACT Code: 0444

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup

help | sign out

quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

 Go

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

 (select state)

Browse by country:

 (select country)

:: Advanced Search

Williams College :: Williamstown, MA :: U.S.

www.williams.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	1	0	0
2011	2	0	0
2010	1	0	0
2009	3	1	0
2008	1	0	0
2007	3	0	0
2006	5	1	1
2005	5	0	0
2004	2	1	1

Scheduled Visits

No visits scheduled.

Contacts

No contacts.

Groups edit

Colleges Accepted our Students
Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(413) 597-2211
Fax: +1-(413) 597-4052
Financial Aid: +1-(413) 597-4181
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 10
Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admission
33 Stetson Court
Williamstown MA 01267

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 2,048
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small Town
CEEB Code: 3965
ACT Code: 1936

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.

Copyright © 2012, Hobsons Inc. | Terms of Service | Privacy
Signed in as David Boyle from Glenbrook North High School

HOBSONS



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out
 quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

- College Options**
- :: request update
 - :: batch update
 - :: schedule visit
 - :: remove from quicklist
 - :: set quickname
 - :: update groups
 - :: print mailing labels
 - :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: **Advanced Search**

Amherst College :: Amherst, MA :: U.S.
 www.amherst.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	2	0	0
2011	1	0	0
2010	3	1	0
2009	1	0	0
2008	1	0	0
2007	2	2	1
2006	4	0	0
2005	2	0	0
2004	2	0	0
2003	2	1	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(413) 542-2328
Fax: +1-(413) 542-2040
Financial Aid: +1-(413) 542-2296
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

Cate Zolkos

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Groups edit

Colleges that have Visited
 Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 15
 Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

PO Box 5000
 Amherst MA 01002-5000

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 1,794
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large Town
CEEB Code: 3003
ACT Code: 1774

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: **Advanced Search**

Swarthmore College :: Swarthmore, PA :: U.S.

www.swarthmore.edu

General	Applications	Analysis	Admissions	Academics	Cost & aid	Extracurriculars
---------	--------------	----------	------------	-----------	------------	------------------

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	2	0	0
2011	2	0	0
2010	6	2	1
2009	2	0	0
2008	1	0	0
2007	1	1	1
2006	4	1	0
2004	1	0	0
2003	2	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(610) 328-8300
Fax: +1-(610) 328-8580
Financial Aid: +1-(610) 328-8358
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(610) 328-8300
Fax: +1-(610) 328-8580
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

No visits scheduled.

Contacts

Andrea Pien

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Groups edit

- Colleges that have Visited
- Colleges Accepted our Students
- Our Students Have Attended

Application Deadlines

- Early Decision - Nov 15
- Early Decision II - Jan 1
- Regular Decision - Jan 1

Private Notes edit

Admissions Office Address

Admissions Office
 500 College Avenue
 Swarthmore PA 19081-1397

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 1,524
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small Town
CEEB Code: 2821
ACT Code: 3722

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out
 quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Pomona College :: Claremont, CA :: U.S.

www.pomona.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	2	0	0
2011	1	0	0
2010	3	1	1
2009	2	0	0
2008	2	1	0
2007	1	0	0
2006	1	0	0
2005	2	1	0
2004	4	0	0
2003	5	1	1

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(909) 621-8134
Fax: +1-(909) 621-8952
Financial Aid: +1-(909) 621-8205
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

No contacts.

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Groups edit

Colleges that have Visited
 Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Early Decision II - Dec 28
 Regular Decision - Jan 2

Private Notes edit

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admissions
 Sumner Hall
 333 N. College Way
 Claremont CA 91711

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 1,560
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large Town
CEEB Code: 4607
ACT Code: 0372

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out
 quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

- College Options**
- :: request update
 - :: batch update
 - :: schedule visit
 - :: add to quicklist
 - :: set quickname
 - :: update groups
 - :: print mailing labels
 - :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: Advanced Search

Middlebury College :: Middlebury, VT :: U.S.
 www.middlebury.edu

General	Applications	Analysis	Admissions	Academics	Cost & aid	Extracurriculars
---------	--------------	----------	------------	-----------	------------	------------------

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	2	0	0
2011	4	0	0
2010	2	0	0
2009	4	3	0
2008	2	0	0
2007	4	3	1
2006	5	0	0
2005	5	0	0
2004	2	0	0
2003	1	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(802) 443-3000
Fax: +1-(802) 443-2056
Financial Aid: +1-(802) 443-5158
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Scheduled Visits **new**

No visits scheduled.

Contacts **new**

No contacts.

Groups **edit**

Colleges that have Visited
 Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes **edit**

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 10
 Early Decision II - Jan 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Admissions Office
 Emma Willard House
 131 South Main Street
 Middlebury VT 05753-6002

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 2,532
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small Town
CEEB Code: 3526
ACT Code: 4306

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Case Western Reserve University :: Cleveland, OH :: U.S.
 www.case.edu

General	Applications	Analysis	Admissions	Academics	Cost & aid	Extracurriculars
---------	--------------	----------	------------	-----------	------------	------------------

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	11	8	1
2011	17	13	5
2010	5	4	0
2009	6	3	0
2008	3	2	0
2007	6	2	0
2006	2	2	2
2005	6	3	1
2004	3	3	1
2003	3	3	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

From the Admissions Office - For Students

[view more]

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(216)368-4450
Fax: +1-(216) 368-5111
Financial Aid: +1-216 368 4530
Email: SEND E-MAIL
Online Inquiry: http://admission.case.edu/admissions/secure/adm_pe

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits new

September 14, 2012 1:25 PM

Contacts new

Richard Bischoff (primary)

Groups edit

Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Action - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 15

Admissions Office Address

Application Processing
 Wolstein Hall
 11318 Bellflower Road
 Cleveland OH 44106-7055

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 4,227
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 1105
ACT Code: 3244

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup help | sign out
 quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: **Advanced Search**

University of Michigan :: Ann Arbor, MI :: U.S.
 www.umich.edu

General	Applications	Analysis	Admissions	Academics	Cost & aid	Extracurriculars
---------	--------------	----------	------------	-----------	------------	------------------

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	1	0	0
2012	75	42	16
2011	73	37	11
2010	46	27	6
2009	56	26	5
2008	58	12	8
2007	69	25	6
2006	53	17	6
2005	53	25	10
2004	48	36	19
2003	45	28	12

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(734) 764-7433
Fax: +1-(734) 936-0740
Financial Aid: +1-(734) 763-6600
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Scheduled Visits new

September 25, 2012 11:00 AM

Contacts new

Sally Lindsley

Groups edit

Big 10
 Colleges that have Visited
 Colleges Accepted our Students
 Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

Application Deadlines

Early Action - Nov 1
 Rolling Admissions

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 1220 Student Activities Building
 515 East Jefferson Street
 Ann Arbor MI 48109-1316

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Public
Enrollment: 27,027
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 1839
ACT Code: 2062

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: **Advanced Search**

University of Wisconsin, Madison :: Madison, WI :: U.S.

www.wisc.edu

General	Applications	Analysis	Admissions	Academics	Cost & aid	Extracurriculars
---------	--------------	----------	------------	-----------	------------	------------------

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	123	55	13
2011	125	50	17
2010	88	56	20
2009	104	59	14
2008	106	38	9
2007	82	51	11
2006	116	66	24
2005	87	55	16
2004	74	50	16
2003	59	40	13

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

U of Wisconsin does not require letters of recommendation. If you are having a letter sent, you should notify them as they will read your file when it's complete unless they know one is on the way...
[view more]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(608) 262-3961
Fax: +1-(608) 262-7706
Financial Aid: +1-(608) 262-3060
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: SEND E-MAIL

Scheduled Visits

September 20, 2012 9:25 AM

Contacts

Jenny Bottoni

Groups

- Big 10
- Colleges that have Visited
- Colleges Accepted our Students
- Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes

You may submit transcripts and recommendations electronically via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

- Regular Decision - Feb 1
- Priority - Nov 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admissions and Recruitment
 702 West Johnson Street
 Suite 1101
 Madison WI 53715-1007

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Public
Enrollment: 30,170
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 1846
ACT Code: 4656

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.



home students scholarships colleges careers connections reports setup

help | sign out

quicklist quicknames groups college search maps visits enrichment programs contacts

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign :: Urbana, IL :: U.S.

www.uiuc.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	1	0	0
2012	177	126	51
2011	171	120	55
2010	170	109	50
2009	199	116	46
2008	185	101	48
2007	172	117	60
2006	209	128	66
2005	148	110	50
2004	168	113	46
2003	159	96	49

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

Application priority date: Complete application file by November 1st.

...
[view more]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(217) 333-0302
Fax: +1-(217)-244-4614
Financial Aid: +1-(217) 333-0100
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(217) 333-0413
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits new

September 7, 2012 11:00 AM

Contacts new

Stacey Kostell (primary)

Groups edit

Big 10
Colleges that have Visited
Colleges Accepted our Students
Our Students Have Attended

Private Notes edit

You may submit transcripts and recommendations electronically via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Regular Decision - Jan 2
Priority - Nov 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admissions and Records
901 West Illinois Street
Urbana IL 61801-3028

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Public
Enrollment: 31,540
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 1836
ACT Code: 1154

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.

College	Class	GPA	High ACT	Result	Attending
Amherst College	2012	redacted			
Brown University	2012	3.825		30 Denied	
Brown University	2012	3.4359		29 Denied	
Brown University	2012	4.725		31 Withdrawn	
Brown University	2012	4.6389		34 Denied	
Brown University	2012	3.0909		29 Withdrawn	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	4.2105		30 Denied	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	4.7059		32 Denied	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	4.0556		31 Denied	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	5		35 Accepted	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	4.4634		33 Denied	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	3.4848		29 Denied	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	4.9512		36 Accepted	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	3.9756		30 Denied	
University of California at Berkeley	2012	4.6111		35 Denied	
California Institute of Technology	2012	redacted			
California Institute of Technology	2012	redacted			
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.8286		30 Accepted	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4		34 Accepted	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.4167		33 Accepted	Attend
Case Western Reserve University	2012	3.9737		32 Waitlisted	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.725		31 Accepted	Attend
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.9722		35 Accepted	Attend
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.4211		27 Accepted	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.5		34 Accepted	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.4865		31 Accepted	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	3.8889		24 Waitlisted	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.3714		31 Withdrawn	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.45		31 Withdrawn	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.0606		33 Accepted	Attend
Case Western Reserve University	2012	3.5588		30 Waitlisted	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.1	no ACT	Waitlisted	
Case Western Reserve University	2012	3.6486		27 Denied	

Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.925	33 Accepted
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.2059	32 Accepted
Case Western Reserve University	2012	3.4054	29 Denied
Case Western Reserve University	2012	3.0909	29 Accepted
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.2571	30 Accepted
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.8611	33 Accepted
Case Western Reserve University	2012	3.2813	32 Waitlisted
Case Western Reserve University	2012	4.3235	31 Accepted
University of Chicago	2012	4	34 Withdrawn
University of Chicago	2012	3.8857	22 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.7857	35 Accepted
University of Chicago	2012	4.0556	31 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.4634	33 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	redacted	Attend
University of Chicago	2012	3.9737	32 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.725	31 Waitlisted
University of Chicago	2012	3.4722	30 Withdrawn
University of Chicago	2012	3.7333	29 Waitlisted
University of Chicago	2012	3.7	32 Withdrawn
University of Chicago	2012	3.1667	22 Withdrawn
University of Chicago	2012	4.3714	31 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.2083	27 Withdrawn
University of Chicago	2012	3.8235	30 Withdrawn
University of Chicago	2012	3.6486	27 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	2.9677	20 Withdrawn
University of Chicago	2012	4.3947	35 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.925	33 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	2.9375	18 Waitlisted
University of Chicago	2012	3.3429	29 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.6111	28 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.2571	30 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.8611	33 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	4.3243	33 Denied
University of Chicago	2012	3.8571	29 Denied

Columbia University	2012	4.0541	31 Denied
Columbia University	2012	3.825	30 Denied
Columbia University	2012	4.275	30 Denied
Columbia University	2012	redacted	
Cornell University	2012	4.8286	30 Withdrawn
Cornell University	2012	4.8125	36 Accepted
Cornell University	2012	4.125	28 Denied
Cornell University	2012	4.275	30 Denied
Cornell University	2012	4.9512	36 Waitlisted
Cornell University	2012	3.9737	32 Denied
Cornell University	2012	4.45	31 Waitlisted
Cornell University	2012	redacted	Attend
Cornell University	2012	4.6389	34 Waitlisted
Cornell University	2012	3.9535	31 Withdrawn
Dartmouth College	2012	4.7059	32 Denied
Dartmouth College	2012	4.0556	31 Denied
Dartmouth College	2012	3.7632	27 Denied
Dartmouth College	2012	3.9737	32 Denied
Dartmouth College	2012	4.725	31 Denied
Dartmouth College	2012	4.3947	35 Denied
Duke University	2012	4.7059	32 Denied
Duke University	2012	redacted	Attend
Duke University	2012	5	35 Denied
Duke University	2012	4.4571	33 Denied
Duke University	2012	4.85	33 Denied
Duke University	2012	3.4359	29 Denied
Duke University	2012	3.9737	32 Denied
Duke University	2012	4.725	31 Denied
Duke University	2012	4.2778	32 Denied
Duke University	2012	4.9706	35 Denied
Duke University	2012	4.6111	35 Denied
Duke University	2012	4.2571	30 Denied
Duke University	2012	4.5714	35 Denied
Emory University	2012	3.4359	29 Waitlisted

Emory University	2012	4.9722	35 Waitlisted
Emory University	2012	4.4324	30 Denied
Emory University	2012	4.0294	32 Denied
Emory University	2012	redacted	
Emory University	2012	4.3947	35 Accepted
Emory University	2012	4.6111	35 Waitlisted
Emory University	2012	redacted	
Harvard University	2012	4.7857	35 Denied
Harvard University	2012	4.8125	36 Denied
Harvard University	2012	5	35 Denied
Harvard University	2012	4.85	33 Denied
Harvard University	2012	4.9512	36 Denied
Harvard University	2012	4.9706	35 Denied
Harvard University	2012	4.2059	32 Denied
Harvard University	2012	4.5714	35 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.8286	30 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.8857	22 Withdrawn
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.4595	31 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.0278	32 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.2286	28 Withdrawn
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.4286	28 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.6176	25 Withdrawn
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.7	32 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.4211	27 Withdrawn
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.8788	24 Withdrawn
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.5405	27 Withdrawn
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.3243	29 Waitlisted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.2083	27 Withdrawn
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.375	20 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.6957	16 Withdrawn
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.9655	23 Withdrawn
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.0769	19 Withdrawn
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.1176	25 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.9615	28 Denied

University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.125	28 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.4286	27 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.7353	25 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.8684	19 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.1515	21 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.3438	24 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.1143	29 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.4571	25 Withdrawn
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.6923	30 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.7222	30 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.2857	25 Waitlisted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.0286	30 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.8	31 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.0938	24 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.5882	29 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.0541	31 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.3429	30 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.8438	30 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.9032	24 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.2188	23 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.0556	32 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.0588	28 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.5	33 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.4571	28 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.8333	26 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.5833	33 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.3333	33 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.2059	32 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.6111	35 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.4839	24 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.2973	29 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.8889	32 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.5714	35 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.25	30 Accepted

University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.2432	32 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.3421	25 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4	34 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.2	31 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.5294	24 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.4634	33 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.7838	30 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.4444	31 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.9512	36 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.4286	31 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.8	24 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.425	30 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4	34 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.9706	35 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.3333	32 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.45	31 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.4667	24 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.5429	27 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.4848	29 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.1 -	Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4	34 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.5429	32 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.3947	35 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.2973	29 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4	35 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.5	33 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.3235	31 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.4688	23 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.8421	29 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.1622	29 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.7143	31 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.625	26 Waitlisted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.6389	32 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.4571	33 Accepted

University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.3939	31 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.8529	31 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.4167	33 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.9697	20 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.3529	27 Deferred
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.4571	29 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.9412	26 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.0303	23 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	-	Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.2973	28 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.1667	Withdrawn
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.4211	23 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.4	26 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.3429	31 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.2353	27 Deferred
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.9744	27 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.4	31 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.8889	24 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.9714	30 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.5588	30 Waitlisted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.6	26 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.878	30 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.9487	32 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.9429	25 Denied
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.6486	27 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.0909	25 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.9	27 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.3226	28 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.5	32 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.6316	27 Accepted Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.6111	28 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.1875	28 Waitlisted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.5143	32 Accepted
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.4412	30 Accepted

University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.5556	26 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.3824	27 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.3714	22 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.9091	24 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.5	27 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.6471	28 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.2286	30 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.9063	25 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.6667	23 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.8529	32 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.8571	25 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.3243	29 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.75	26 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.7059	32 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.2353	29 Waitlisted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.0556	31 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.8125	36 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.5143	25 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.825	30 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.7073	29 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.85	33 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.275	30 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.4722	30 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.85	29 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.8529	25 Deferred	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.9722	35 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.9118	22 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.2432	25 Waitlisted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.5	34 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.1818	27 Deferred	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.6667	24 Deferred	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.3714	31 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.5833	29 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.7838	27 Deferred	

University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.2	26 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.8235	30 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.5946	30 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4	29 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.3784	31 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.9706	27 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.6486	33 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.2353	29 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.1143	30 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.925	33 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.2619	31 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.6389	34 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.4054	29 Deferred	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.2571	30 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.8372	29 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.3243	33 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.2286	27 Deferred	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.4	27 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.0278	29 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.0857	32 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.125	25 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.973	29 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.7895	27 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	2.9697	24 Denied	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.7576	28 Accepted	Attend
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	3.5833	30 Accepted	
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign	2012	4.8056	33 Accepted	
Johns Hopkins University	2012	4.8286	30 Denied	
Johns Hopkins University	2012	3.4359	29 Denied	
Johns Hopkins University	2012	3.9737	32 Denied	
Johns Hopkins University	2012	redacted		
Johns Hopkins University	2012	redacted		
Johns Hopkins University	2012	redacted		
Johns Hopkins University	2012	4.925	33 Denied	

Massachusetts Institute of Technology	2012	4.9512	36 Denied
Massachusetts Institute of Technology	2012	4.1 no ACT	Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4.3243	29 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.8286	30 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4	34 Withdrawn
University of Michigan	2012	3.8421	29 Withdrawn
University of Michigan	2012	3.5882	29 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4.1622	29 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.0556	31 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	3.825	30 Waitlisted
University of Michigan	2012	4.4634	33 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.275	30 Waitlisted
University of Michigan	2012	4.4167	33 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.4444	31 Waitlisted
University of Michigan	2012	3.9737	32 Waitlisted
University of Michigan	2012	3.7333	29 Withdrawn
University of Michigan	2012	3.85	29 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4.2857	30 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	3.9756	30 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	3.9	32 Withdrawn
University of Michigan	2012	4.5349	32 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	4.0556	32 Waitlisted
University of Michigan	2012	4.4	31 Waitlisted
University of Michigan	2012	3.6923	30 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	3.7222	30 Withdrawn
University of Michigan	2012	3.878	30 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	3.8529	32 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	3.6486	27 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4.3947	35 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4	35 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.6389	34 Accepted
University of Michigan	2012	4.3333	33 Accepted Attend
University of Michigan	2012	3.4286	30 Denied
University of Michigan	2012	4.1163	32 Accepted

University of Michigan	2012	4.2571	30 Accepted	Attend
University of Michigan	2012	4.5143	32 Accepted	
University of Michigan	2012	4	27 Accepted	Attend
University of Michigan	2012	3.9535	31 Waitlisted	
University of Michigan	2012	4.25	30 Accepted	
University of Michigan	2012	4.2432	32 Accepted	
Middlebury College	2012	redacted		
Middlebury College	2012	redacted		
Middlebury College	2012	redacted		
Northwestern University	2012	4	34 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	4.7857	35 Accepted	
Northwestern University	2012	3.6429	30 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	4.0556	31 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	3.5143	25 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	3.825	30 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	4.4634	33 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	4.4595	31 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	4.4571	33 Accepted	Attend
Northwestern University	2012	4.3939	31 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	4.85	33 Waitlisted	
Northwestern University	2012	3.7632	27 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	4.275	30 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	3.4359	29 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	4.4167	33 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	3.7647	26 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	4.9512	36 Withdrawn	
Northwestern University	2012	3.9737	32 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	4.725	31 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	3.7333	29 Withdrawn	
Northwestern University	2012	3.7	32 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	3.85	29 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	4.2857	30 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	3.8529	25 Denied	
Northwestern University	2012	3.973	28 Denied	

Northwestern University	2012	4.425	30 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.5	34 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.5349	32 Accepted
Northwestern University	2012	3.1765	28 Accepted Attend
Northwestern University	2012	4.4865	31 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.3704	31 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.9706	35 Accepted Attend
Northwestern University	2012	3.7895	27 Withdrawn
Northwestern University	2012	4.3714	31 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.45	31 Waitlisted
Northwestern University	2012	4.5833	29 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.3333	32 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.2083	27 Withdrawn
Northwestern University	2012	4.5	33 Accepted Attend
Northwestern University	2012	3.7222	30 Withdrawn
Northwestern University	2012	3.8235	30 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	3.878	30 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.3784	31 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.6486	33 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.3947	35 Accepted Attend
Northwestern University	2012	4.925	33 Waitlisted
Northwestern University	2012	3.1176	25 Withdrawn
Northwestern University	2012	4.6944	33 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.6389	34 Accepted Attend
Northwestern University	2012	3.0909	29 Withdrawn
Northwestern University	2012	4.2571	30 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.1143	31 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.9211	33 Accepted
Northwestern University	2012	3.5143	32 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.8611	33 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.3243	33 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	redacted	
Northwestern University	2012	4.4	27 Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.0278	29 Denied

Northwestern University	2012	4.25	30	Withdrawn
Northwestern University	2012	3.8571	29	Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.3235	31	Denied
Northwestern University	2012	4.8056	33	Accepted
Northwestern University	2012	4.0857	32	Withdrawn
Northwestern University (Honors progr	2012	redacted		
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.4571	33	Accepted
University of Notre Dame	2012	3.4359	29	Denied
University of Notre Dame	2012	3.4571	29	Denied
University of Notre Dame	2012	redacted		
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.5429	32	Accepted
University of Notre Dame	2012	2.8529	26	Denied
University of Notre Dame	2012	3.9412	33	Denied
University of Notre Dame	2012	4	35	Waitlisted
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.3333	33	Waitlisted
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.8611	33	Accepted Attend
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.3243	33	Denied
University of Notre Dame	2012	4.5714	35	Accepted Attend
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.2105	30	Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.7857	35	Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.0556	31	Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	redacted		
University of Pennsylvania	2012	redacted		
University of Pennsylvania	2012	3.9737	32	Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.2778	32	Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.9706	35	Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.925	33	Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.2571	30	Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.8611	33	Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.5143	32	Denied
University of Pennsylvania	2012	4.8889	32	Denied
Pomona College	2012	redacted		
Pomona College	2012	4.85	33	Denied
Pomona College	2012	3.9737	32	Denied

Princeton University	2012	4.7857	35 Denied	
Princeton University	2012	4.7059	32 Denied	
Princeton University	2012	4.9512	36 Denied	
Princeton University	2012	redacted		
Princeton University	2012	4.3704	31 Denied	
Princeton University	2012	4.9706	35 Denied	
Princeton University	2012	redacted		Attend
Rice University	2012	4.7059	32 Denied	
Rice University	2012	3.4359	29 Denied	
Rice University	2012	redacted		Attend
Stanford University	2012	4.7857	35 Denied	
Stanford University	2012	redacted		Attend
Stanford University	2012	4.4571	33 Denied	
Stanford University	2012	4.85	33 Denied	
Stanford University	2012	4.9512	36 Denied	
Stanford University	2012	3.9737	32 Denied	
Stanford University	2012	4.425	30 Denied	
Stanford University	2012	4.9706	35 Denied	
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.7059	32 Waitlisted	
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.0556	31 Denied	
Vanderbilt University	2012	5	35 Accepted	
Vanderbilt University	2012	redacted		
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.275	30 Denied	
Vanderbilt University	2012	3.5143	29 Denied	
Vanderbilt University	2012	3.4359	29 Denied	
Vanderbilt University	2012	3.9737	32 Denied	
Vanderbilt University	2012	3.4571	29 Denied	
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.9722	35 Accepted	
Vanderbilt University	2012	3.973	28 Denied	
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.973	31 Accepted	Attend
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.4	31 Denied	
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.45	31 Waitlisted	
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.5	33 Waitlisted	
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.5429	32 Accepted	Attend

Vanderbilt University	2012	4.925	33 Accepted
Vanderbilt University	2012	4	35 Waitlisted
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.3333	33 Waitlisted
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.2059	32 Denied
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.5	32 Waitlisted
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.4688	33 Accepted Attend
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.1163	32 Denied
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.5143	32 Waitlisted
Vanderbilt University	2012	4.0278	29 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.7059	32 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.0541	31 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	3.825	30 Withdrawn
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	redacted	
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.4167	33 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	2.0294	19 Withdrawn
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.4444	31 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	3.9737	32 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.5	34 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.45	31 Waitlisted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	3.9714	30 Waitlisted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	3.878	30 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	3.8529	32 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.5429	32 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	3.6486	27 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4	29 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.3784	31 Waitlisted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	3.9412	33 Waitlisted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.6486	33 Waitlisted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.925	33 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.6944	33 Waitlisted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.5	32 Waitlisted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	3.25	28 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.2571	30 Denied
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.2973	29 Denied

Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.5714	35 Waitlisted
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.25	30 Withdrawn
Washington University in St. Louis	2012	4.3235	31 Denied
Williams College	2012	redacted	
Williams College	2012	redacted	
Williams College	2012	redacted	
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.3421	25 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.8286	30 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	2.9615	28 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4	34 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.8	31 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6571	31 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.8421	29 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.75	26 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.5882	29 Waitlisted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.1622	29 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0556	31 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0541	31 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.2	31 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.5143	25 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.5294	24 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.4634	33 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7073	29 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	2.8438	30 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.2286	28 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.125	28 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.275	30 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9737	32 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.8611	29 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0294	28 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7	32 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.85	29 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.2857	30 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.8438	29 Accepted Attend

University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9756	30 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.3611	27 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.973	28 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	-	Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.4324	30 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	2.4571	25 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.2973	28 Waitlisted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4	34 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.2353	27 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0556	32 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9744	27 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7895	27 Waitlisted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6667	24 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6667	23 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.4	31 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6923	30 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.3333	32 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.2	26 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	2.8684	19 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.7222	30 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4571	28 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6667	28 Waitlisted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6	26 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.5429	27 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.878	30 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4848	29 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0294	32 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4	34 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6486	27 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.1563	27 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9706	27 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.3947	35 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.2353	29 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	2.8438	23 Withdrawn

University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0909	25 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4	35 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.2619	31 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9	27 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.3226	28 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.5	32 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4054	29 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.6316	27 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.1429	25 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	2.9394	22 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.1875	28 Denied
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4839	24 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.2973	29 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.5143	32 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.8889	32 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.9535	31 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.0278	29 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.25	30 Accepted Attend
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	4.2432	32 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.5	27 Withdrawn
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	2.8571	25 Accepted
University of Wisconsin, Madison	2012	3.4412	30 Waitlisted
Yale University	2012	redacted	Attend
Yale University	2012	4.7059	32 Denied
Yale University	2012	5	35 Denied
Yale University	2012	redacted	
Yale University	2012	4.85	33 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.9512	36 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.725	31 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.5	33 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.925	33 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.6389	34 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.8611	33 Denied
Yale University	2012	4.2439	32 Denied

Yale University

2012

4.5714

35 Denied

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R

S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Harvard University :: Cambridge, MA :: U.S.

www.harvard.edu

- General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	8	0	0
2011	11	1	1
2010	9	2	2
2009	7	1	0
2008	9	1	1
2007	4	0	0
2006	6	0	0
2005	9	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students
No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(617) 495-1551
Fax: +1-(617) 495-8821
Financial Aid: +1-(617)495-1581
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

new
No visits scheduled.

Contacts new
Jim Pautz (primary)

Groups edit
None assigned.

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Private Notes edit

Application Deadlines
 Regular Decision - Jan 1
 Restrictive Early Action - Nov 1

Admissions Office Address
 86 Brattle Street
 Cambridge MA 02138

Application Mailing Address
 same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address
 same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address
 same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 10,265
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 3434
ACT Code: 1840

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

 :: [Advanced Search](#)
Princeton University :: Princeton, NJ :: U.S.
www.princeton.edu

General	Applications	Analysis	Admissions	Academics	Cost & aid	Extracurriculars
---------	--------------	----------	------------	-----------	------------	------------------

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	7	1	1
2011	7	2	2
2010	10	0	0
2009	7	0	0
2008	8	2	1
2007	5	0	0
2006	7	0	0
2005	4	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)
Counselor Comments for Students  
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information
Phone: +1-(609) 258-3060
Fax: +1-(609) 258-6743
Financial Aid: +1-(609)258-3330

International Admissions Contact Information
Phone: +1-609-258-3060
Fax: +1-609-258-6743
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)
Scheduled Visits
 [new](#)

No visits scheduled.

Contacts  [new](#)

Robyn Kent (primary)

Groups [edit](#)

None assigned.

Private Notes [edit](#)


This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

 Regular Decision - Jan 1
 Restrictive Early Action - Nov 1

Admissions Office Address

 Undergraduate Admission Office
 110 West College
 PO Box 430
 Princeton NJ 08542-0430

Application Mailing Address
same as Admissions Office Address
Supplemental Materials Address
same as Admissions Office Address
International Students Address
same as Admissions Office Address
General Information
School Type: Private
Enrollment: 5,142
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small Town
CEEB Code: 2672
ACT Code: 2588

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: [Advanced Search](#)

Yale University :: New Haven, CT :: U.S.

www.yale.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	13	1	1
2011	8	0	0
2010	11	1	0
2009	6	1	1
2008	14	1	1
2007	4	1	1
2006	3	0	0
2005	5	1	1

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students  
No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(203) 432-9300
Fax: +1-(203)-777-6120
Financial Aid: +1-(203) 432-2700

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(203) 432-9316
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)

Scheduled Visits

 new
No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

No contacts.

Groups [edit](#)

None assigned.

Private Notes [edit](#)



This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via [eDocs](#).

Application Deadlines

Regular Decision - Dec 31
Restrictive Early Action - Nov 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
38 Hillhouse Avenue
PO Box 208234
New Haven CT 06520-8234

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 5,310
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 3987
ACT Code: 0618

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Columbia University :: New York, NY :: U.S.
www.columbia.edu

- General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	4	0	0
2011	9	0	0
2010	6	1	1
2009	4	0	0
2008	6	0	0
2007	7	1	0
2006	5	1	1
2005	1	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students  
No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-212-854-2522
Fax: +1-212-854-3393
Financial Aid: +1-(212)854-3711
Email: **SEND E-MAIL**

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Scheduled Visits

 new
No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

Mary Ann McDonough
(primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
212 Hamilton Hall, MC 2807
1130 Amsterdam Avenue
New York NY 10027

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 7,950
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 2116

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

University of Pennsylvania :: Philadelphia, PA :: U.S.
www.upenn.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	13	0	0
2011	13	1	0
2010	7	0	0
2009	5	1	1
2008	11	0	0
2007	6	1	1
2006	11	0	0
2005	2	1	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students  
No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(215) 898-7507
Fax: +1-(215) 898-9670
Financial Aid: +1-(215) 898-7526
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Scheduled Visits

 new
September 25, 2012
10:45 AM

Contacts new

Teran Tadal (primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

The Office of Undergraduate Admissions
1 College Hall
Room 1
Philadelphia PA 19104-6376

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 11,940
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 2926

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:
 ▼

Browse by country:
 ▼

:: Advanced Search

California Institute of Technology :: Pasadena, CA :: U.S.

www.caltech.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	2	0	0
2011	2	0	0
2010	3	0	0
2009	4	1	0
2008	3	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students  
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(626) 395-6341
Fax: +1-(626) 683-3026
Financial Aid: +1-(626)395-6280
Email: **SEND E-MAIL**

Scheduled Visits

 new
 No visits scheduled.

Contacts

 new
 No contacts.

Groups

edit
 None assigned.

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Private Notes



This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Action - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 3

Admissions Office Address

Caltech Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 1200 E. California Blvd
 Mail code 10-90
 Pasadena CA 91125

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 967
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 4034

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Massachusetts Institute of Technology :: Cambridge, MA :: U.S.

www.mit.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	2	0	0
2011	4	0	0
2010	6	0	0
2009	7	1	1
2008	4	1	0
2007	1	0	0
2006	4	0	0
2005	4	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students  
No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(617)-253-3400
Fax: +1-(617) 258-8304
Financial Aid: +1-(617) 253-4971
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-617-253-3400
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

 new
No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

No contacts.

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit

Application Deadlines

Regular Decision - Jan 1
Early Action - Nov 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admissions
Room 10-100
77 Massachusetts Avenue
Cambridge MA 02139-4307

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 4,299
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 3514
ACT Code: 1858

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:
 ▼

Browse by country:
 ▼

:: Advanced Search

Stanford University :: Stanford, CA :: U.S.
 www.stanford.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	8	1	1
2011	7	1	1
2010	10	1	1
2009	12	1	0
2008	12	1	0
2007	9	1	1
2006	7	1	0
2005	9	1	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students  
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(650) 723-2091
Fax: +1-(650) 723-6050
Financial Aid: +1-(650) 723-3058
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)
Online Inquiry: inq.applyyourself.com/?id=su-ugrad&pid=753

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

 new
 No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

Taryn Upchurch (primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Regular Decision - Jan 1
 Restrictive Early Action - Nov 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admission
 Montag Hall - 355 Galvez Street
 Stanford CA 94305-6106

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 6,940
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large Town
CEEB Code: 4704

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

University of Chicago :: Chicago, IL :: U.S.

www.uchicago.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	26	2	1
2011	19	5	2
2010	16	3	0
2009	20	5	2
2008	14	4	1
2007	14	3	0
2006	6	2	0
2005	14	6	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(773) 702-8650
Fax: +1-(773) 702-4199
Financial Aid: +1-(773) 702-8666

Scheduled Visits

 new
September 18, 2012
12:35 PM

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Contacts

 new
 Shalini Uppu (primary)

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Groups edit

None assigned.

Application Deadlines

Early Action - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 2

Private Notes edit



Admissions Office Address

Office of College Admissions
 1101 East 58th Street
 Chicago IL 60637

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 5,270
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 1832
ACT Code: 1152

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
 Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: [Advanced Search](#)

Duke University :: Durham, NC :: U.S.
 www.duke.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	13	1	1
2011	13	1	0
2010	8	3	1
2009	5	0	0
2008	15	1	0
2007	10	1	0
2006	15	4	3
2005	10	4	3

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students  
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(919) 684-3214
Fax: +1-(919) 681-8941
Financial Aid: +1-(919) 684-6225
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(919) 684-3214
Fax: +1-(919) 684-8128
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Scheduled Visits

 new
 No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

Will Dixon (primary)
 Will Dixon (primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 2

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 2138 Campus Drive
 Box 90586
 Durham NC 27708-0586

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 6,697
Religious Affiliation: United Methodist
Campus Surroundings: Small City

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: Advanced Search

Dartmouth College :: Hanover, NH :: U.S.

www.dartmouth.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	6	0	0
2011	10	2	0
2010	10	3	2
2009	6	0	0
2008	4	2	1
2007	8	0	0
2006	5	0	0
2005	7	2	1

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(603) 646-2875
Fax: +1-(603) 646-1216
Financial Aid: +1-(603) 646-2451
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: SEND E-MAIL

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Scheduled Visits

new
 No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

Benjamim Schwartz
 (primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Undergraduate Admissions
 6016 McNutt Hall
 Hanover NH 03755

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 4,194
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small Town
CEEB Code: 3351
ACT Code: 2508

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:
 ▼

Browse by country:
 ▼

:: Advanced Search

Northwestern University :: Evanston, IL :: U.S.
 www.northwestern.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	65	10	6
2011	53	11	5
2010	63	18	8
2009	62	14	5
2008	65	16	10
2007	48	10	5
2006	41	16	8
2005	45	23	14

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students  
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(847) 491-7271
 Fax: +1-(847) 467-1317
 Financial Aid: +1-(847) 491-7400
 Email: **SEND E-MAIL**

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-847-491-7271
 Fax: N/A
 Financial Aid: N/A
 Email: **SEND E-MAIL**

Scheduled Visits

 new
 No visits scheduled.

Contacts  new

Onis Cheatham
 (primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admission
 1801 Hinman Avenue
 PO Box 3060
 Evanston IL 60204-3060

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
 Enrollment: 9,535
 Religious Affiliation: -
 Campus Surroundings: Large Town
 CEEB Code: 1565

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Johns Hopkins University :: Baltimore, MD :: U.S.

www.jhu.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	7	1	0
2011	7	0	0
2010	9	0	0
2009	4	1	0
2008	9	1	1
2007	6	0	0
2006	5	0	0
2005	2	1	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students  
No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(410) 516-8171
Fax: +1-(410) 516-6025
Financial Aid: +1-(410) 516-8028
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(410) 516-5155
Fax: +1-410-516-6025
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)

Scheduled Visits

 new
No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

John Latting (primary)

Groups [edit](#)

None assigned.

Private Notes [edit](#)



Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
Mason Hall
3400 North Charles Street
Baltimore MD 21218

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 5,820
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 5332

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Washington University in St. Louis :: St. Louis, MO :: U.S.

www.wustl.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	28	1	0
2011	19	5	0
2010	15	3	0
2009	20	7	1
2008	34	7	0
2007	20	5	2
2006	25	9	4
2005	22	5	1

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(314) 935-6000
 Fax: +1-(314) 935-4290
 Financial Aid: +1-(314) 935-5900
 Email: **SEND E-MAIL**

Scheduled Visits

 new

September 12, 2012
2:25 PM

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
 Fax: N/A
 Financial Aid: N/A
 Email: N/A

Contacts new

Danielle Anderson
(primary)

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 15
 Regular Decision - Jan 15

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 Campus Box 3403
 One Brookings Drive
 St. Louis MO 63143-0403

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
 Enrollment: 7,138
 Religious Affiliation: -
 Campus: Large City
 Surroundings: 6929
 CEEB Code: 6929

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Brown University :: Providence, RI :: U.S.
www.brown.edu

General	Applications	Analysis	Admissions	Academics	Cost & aid	Extracurriculars
---------	--------------	----------	------------	-----------	------------	------------------

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	5	0	0
2011	10	0	0
2010	16	3	2
2009	6	1	0
2008	14	0	0
2007	3	0	0
2006	5	0	0
2005	5	1	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(401) 863-2378
Fax: +1-(401) 863-9300
Financial Aid: +1-(401) 863-2378
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(401)863-2378
Fax: +1-(401)863-9300
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: SEND E-MAIL

Scheduled Visits

 new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts

 new
No contacts.

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
Regular Decision - Jan 2

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admission
45 Prospect Street
Box 1876
Providence RI 02912

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 6,318
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 3094

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Cornell University :: Ithaca, NY :: U.S.

www.cornell.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	10	2	1
2011	7	3	1
2010	12	1	0
2009	12	1	1
2008	12	2	2
2007	11	2	0
2006	10	3	1
2005	8	3	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

From the Admissions Office - For Counselors Undergraduate Colleges & Majors
[view more]

Counselor Comments for Students  
No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(607) 255-5241
Fax: +1-(607) 255-5452
Financial Aid: +1-(607)255-5145
Email: SEND E-MAIL

Scheduled Visits

 new
No visits scheduled.

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: +1-(607) 255-5452
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Contacts

Reba McCutcheon
(primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
Regular Decision - Jan 2

Admissions Office Address

Undergraduate Admissions Office
410 Thurston Ave.
Ithaca NY 14850-2488

Application Mailing Address

Cornell Undergraduate Admissions
Application Processing Center
349 Pine Tree Road
Ithaca NY 14850-2899

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Application Mailing Address

International Students Address

same as Application Mailing Address

General Information

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Rice University :: Houston, TX :: U.S.
www.rice.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	3	1	1
2011	4	1	0
2010	6	0	0
2009	3	0	0
2008	1	0	0
2007	4	2	0
2006	4	1	0
2005	1	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(713) 348-7423
Fax: +1-(713) 348-5323
Financial Aid: +1-(713) 348-4958
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

 new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

Sheila Baisden (primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admission - MS 17
 PO Box 1892
 Houston TX 77251-1892

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 3,529
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 6609
ACT Code: 4152

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

 College name

Browse by alphabet

 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

[:: Advanced Search](#)
Vanderbilt University :: Nashville, TN :: U.S.
www.vanderbilt.edu
[General](#) | [Applications](#) | [Analysis](#) | [Admissions](#) | [Academics](#) | [Cost & aid](#) | [Extracurriculars](#)
Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	25	6	3
2011	18	2	1
2010	11	2	0
2009	17	2	1
2008	33	8	1
2007	9	1	1
2006	15	6	4
2005	17	11	7

Quick Name: N/A (edit)
Counselor Comments for Students  

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information
Phone: +1-(615) 322-2561
Fax: +1-(615) 343-7765
Financial Aid: +1-(615) 322-3591
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)
International Admissions Contact Information
Phone: +1-(615) 322-2561
Fax: +1-(615) 343-7765
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)
Scheduled Visits
 new

October 10, 2012 2:25 PM
Contacts  new

Thomas Golden (primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit


This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.
Application Deadlines

 Early Decision - Nov 1
 Early Decision II - Jan 3
 Regular Decision - Jan 3

Admissions Office Address

 Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 2305 West End Avenue
 Nashville TN 37203-1727

Application Mailing Address
same as Admissions Office Address
Supplemental Materials Address
same as Admissions Office Address
International Students Address
same as Admissions Office Address
General Information
School Type: Private
Enrollment: 6,817
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large City
CEEB Code: 1871

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: [Advanced Search](#)

University of Notre Dame :: Notre Dame, IN :: U.S.
www.nd.edu

- General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	12	4	2
2011	15	2	0
2010	16	6	2
2009	13	4	2
2008	15	9	7
2007	15	4	3
2006	7	1	1
2005	6	2	2

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students  

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(574) 631-7505
 Fax: +1-(574) 631-8865
 Financial Aid: +1-(574)631-6436
 Email: **SEND E-MAIL**

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
 Fax: N/A
 Financial Aid: N/A
 Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

 new
September 6, 2012
9:50 AM

Contacts  new

Alisa Fisher (primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Action - Nov 1
 Regular Decision - Dec 31

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 220 Main Building
 Notre Dame IN 46556

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
 Enrollment: 8,442
 Religious Affiliation: Roman Catholic
 Campus Surroundings: Small City
 CEEB Code: 1841
 ACT Code: 1252

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet
 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

:: Advanced Search

Emory University :: Atlanta, GA :: U.S.
 www.emory.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	8	1	0
2011	9	2	0
2010	12	3	0
2009	10	1	0
2008	15	5	0
2007	10	3	0
2006	10	4	0
2005	12	3	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students  
 No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(404) 727-6036
Fax: +1-(404) 727-4303
Financial Aid: +1-(404) 727-6039
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

 new
 No visits scheduled.

Contacts

Timothy Fields (primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Early Decision II - Jan 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 15

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admission
 3263-001-1AA
 1390 Oxford Road NE
 Atlanta GA 30322-1016

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 7,231
Religious Affiliation: United Methodist
Campus Surroundings: Large City

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change Colleg

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

University of California at Berkeley :: Berkeley, CA :: U.S.

www.berkeley.edu

- General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	1	0	0
2012	9	2	0
2011	4	2	0
2010	6	2	0
2009	4	2	0
2008	8	2	0
2007	2	2	1
2006	5	1	0
2005	4	1	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(510) 642-3175
 Fax: +1-(510) 642-7333
 Financial Aid: +1-(510) 642-0485
 Email: **SEND E-MAIL**

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(510) 642-3246
 Fax: N/A
 Financial Aid: N/A
 Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

 new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

Michelle Larkith (primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



This college is not an eDocs destination. You must print and mail school forms if you use eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Regular Decision - Nov 30

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
 110 Sproul Hall #5800
 Berkeley CA 94720-5800

Application Mailing Address

University of California
 Undergraduate Application Processing Service
 P.O. Box 4010
 Concord CA 94524-4010

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Public
 Enrollment: 25,540
 Religious Affiliation: -
 Campus: Small City
 Surroundings: 4833
 CEEB Code: 4833

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

 :: [Advanced Search](#)
Williams College :: Williamstown, MA :: U.S.
www.williams.edu
[General](#) | [Applications](#) | [Analysis](#) | [Admissions](#) | [Academics](#) | [Cost & aid](#) | [Extracurriculars](#)
Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	3	1	0
2011	2	1	0
2010	8	2	1
2008	2	0	0
2007	2	1	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)
Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(413) 597-2211
Fax: +1-(413) 597-4052
Financial Aid: +1-(413) 597-4181
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

No visits scheduled.

Contacts
 Richard Nesbitt (primary)

Groups

None assigned.

Private Notes

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 10
 Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admission
 33 Stetson Court
 Williamstown MA 01267

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 2,048
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small Town
CEEB Code: 3965
ACT Code: 1936

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Amherst College :: Amherst, MA :: U.S.
www.amherst.edu

- General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	1	0	0
2011	3	0	0
2010	6	2	2
2009	1	0	0
2008	3	0	0
2007	3	0	0
2006	2	0	0
2005	3	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students  
No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(413) 542-2328
Fax: +1-(413) 542-2040
Financial Aid: +1-(413) 542-2296
Email: SEND E-MAIL

Scheduled Visits

 new
No visits scheduled.

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Contacts  new

Katherine Black (primary)

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 15
Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

PO Box 5000
Amherst MA 01002-5000

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 1,794
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Large Town
CEEB Code: 3003
ACT Code: 1774

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
Copyright © 2012 Used by permission. All rights reserved.

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Swarthmore College :: Swarthmore, PA :: U.S.

www.swarthmore.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2010	4	0	0
2009	1	1	0
2008	2	0	0
2007	2	0	0
2006	1	0	0
2005	1	0	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(610) 328-8300
Fax: +1-(610) 328-8580
Financial Aid: +1-(610) 328-8358
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(610) 328-8300
Fax: +1-(610) 328-8580
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

 new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

James Bock (primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 15
 Early Decision II - Jan 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Admissions Office
 500 College Avenue
 Swarthmore PA 19081-1397

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 1,524
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small Town
CEEB Code: 2821

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Pomona College :: Claremont, CA :: U.S.
www.pomona.edu

- General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2012	3	1	0
2011	3	0	0
2010	5	2	0
2009	2	2	1
2008	2	1	1
2007	4	1	2

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(909) 621-8134
 Fax: +1-(909) 621-8952
 Financial Aid: +1-(909) 621-8205
 Email: **SEND E-MAIL**

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
 Fax: N/A
 Financial Aid: N/A
 Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

 new

October 22, 2012
12:35 PM

Contacts new

Samantha Jones
(primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 1
 Early Decision II - Dec 28
 Regular Decision - Jan 2

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admissions
 Sumner Hall
 333 N. College Way
 Claremont CA 91711

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
 Enrollment: 1,560
 Religious Affiliation: -
 Campus: Large Town
 Surroundings: 4607
 CEEB Code: 4607

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: add to quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

Middlebury College :: Middlebury, VT :: U.S.

www.middlebury.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	3	1	0
2011	4	0	0
2010	4	1	0
2009	2	0	0
2008	6	0	0
2007	2	1	0
2005	3	1	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(802) 443-3000
Fax: +1-(802) 443-2056
Financial Aid: +1-(802) 443-5158
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits



new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts new

Rachel Rosenfeld
(primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit

Application Deadlines

Early Decision - Nov 10
 Early Decision II - Jan 1
 Regular Decision - Jan 1

Admissions Office Address

Admissions Office
 Emma Willard House
 131 South Main Street
 Middlebury VT 05753-6002

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Private
Enrollment: 2,532
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small Town
CEEB Code: 3526

This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: [Advanced Search](#)

University of Michigan :: Ann Arbor, MI :: U.S.
www.umich.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	38	18	6
2011	41	18	4
2010	48	16	5
2009	47	13	3
2008	38	10	5
2007	30	10	4
2006	39	16	4
2005	39	16	4

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(734) 764-7433
Fax: +1-(734) 936-0740
Financial Aid: +1-(734) 763-6600
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)

Scheduled Visits

 new

September 25, 2012
9:50 AM

Contacts new

Sally Lindsley (primary)

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Action - Nov 1
Rolling Admissions

Admissions Office Address

Office of Undergraduate Admissions
1220 Student Activities Building
515 East Jefferson Street
Ann Arbor MI 48109-1316

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Public
Enrollment: 27,027
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 1839

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

 A B C D E F G H I
 J K L M N O P Q R
 S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

Browse by country:

 :: [Advanced Search](#)
Case Western Reserve University :: Cleveland, OH :: U.S.
www.case.edu
[General](#) | [Applications](#) | [Analysis](#) | [Admissions](#) | [Academics](#) | [Cost & aid](#) | [Extracurriculars](#)
Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	24	15	4
2011	20	10	1
2010	9	6	1
2009	5	3	0
2008	12	10	1
2007	12	10	3
2006	5	3	0
2005	3	1	0

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

From the Admissions Office - For Students
[\[view more\]](#)
Counselor Comments for Students  

 No comments. [\[add comments\]](#)
Admissions Contact Information
Phone: +1-(216)368-4450

Fax: +1-(216) 368-5111

Financial Aid: +1-216 368 4530

Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)
Online Inquiry: http://admission.case.edu/admissions/secure/adm_pe
Scheduled Visits
 new

No visits scheduled.

Contacts  new

John Gest, Jr. (primary)

International Admissions Contact Information
Phone: N/A

Fax: N/A

Financial Aid: N/A

Email: N/A

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit


This college accepts the Common Application. You may submit transcripts and recommendations via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Early Action - Nov 1

Regular Decision - Jan 15

Admissions Office Address

 Application Processing
 Wolstein Hall
 11318 Bellflower Road
 Cleveland OH 44106-7055

Application Mailing Address
same as Admissions Office Address
Supplemental Materials Address
same as Admissions Office Address
International Students Address
same as Admissions Office Address
General Information
School Type: Private

Enrollment: 4 227

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: [Advanced Search](#)

University of Wisconsin, Madison :: Madison, WI :: U.S.

www.wisc.edu

General Applications Analysis Admissions Academics Cost & aid Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	84	45	8
2011	111	51	20
2010	93	43	22
2009	76	47	9
2008	96	45	6
2007	81	44	17
2006	76	44	12
2005	50	32	12

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(608) 262-3961
Fax: +1-(608) 262-7706
Financial Aid: +1-(608) 262-3060
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: N/A
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: [SEND E-MAIL](#)

Scheduled Visits

 new

September 24, 2012
2:25 PM

Contacts new

Bobbie Jean St. Arnauld
(primary)

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



You may submit transcripts and recommendations electronically via eDocs.

Application Deadlines

Regular Decision - Feb 1
Priority - Nov 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admissions and Recruitment
702 West Johnson Street
Suite 1101
Madison WI 53715-1007

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Public
Enrollment: 30,170
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 1846
ACT Code: 4656

College Options

- :: request update
- :: batch update
- :: schedule visit
- :: remove from quicklist
- :: set quickname
- :: update groups
- :: print mailing labels
- :: print envelopes

Change College

College name

Browse by alphabet

A B C D E F G H I
J K L M N O P Q R
S T U V W X Y Z

Browse by state:

(select state)

Browse by country:

(select country)

:: Advanced Search

University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign :: Urbana, IL :: U.S.

www.uiuc.edu

- General
- Applications
- Analysis
- Admissions
- Academics
- Cost & aid
- Extracurriculars

Application History

Class	Apply	Admit	Enroll
2013	0	0	0
2012	182	117	53
2011	156	108	63
2010	194	111	54
2009	198	109	65
2008	196	109	53
2007	205	111	57
2006	188	105	63
2005	176	124	75

Quick Name: N/A (edit)

Counselor Comments for Students

No comments. [add comments]

Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(217) 333-0302
Fax: +1-(217)-244-4614
Financial Aid: +1-(217) 333-0100
Email: SEND E-MAIL

International Admissions Contact Information

Phone: +1-(217) 333-0413
Fax: N/A
Financial Aid: N/A
Email: N/A

Scheduled Visits

 new

September 7, 2012
8:55 AM

Contacts new

Stacey Kostell (primary)

You may submit transcripts and recommendations electronically via eDocs.

Groups edit

None assigned.

Private Notes edit



Application Deadlines

Regular Decision - Jan 2
Priority - Nov 1

Admissions Office Address

Office of Admissions and Records
901 West Illinois Street
Urbana IL 61801-3028

Application Mailing Address

same as Admissions Office Address

Supplemental Materials Address

same as Admissions Office Address

International Students Address

same as Admissions Office Address

General Information

School Type: Public
Enrollment: 31,540
Religious Affiliation: -
Campus Surroundings: Small City
CEEB Code: 1836
ACT Code: 1154

Selected college data are provided by CollegeView.com
Copyright © 2012. Used by permission. All rights reserved.

PROCEDURES FOR IMPLEMENTING BOARD POLICY: ILLINOIS FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT (FOIA) Page 13 of 16 pages

Section D - Written Request for District Public Records

All requests to inspect and/or to obtain a copy of a District record must be made in writing. This form is provided for convenience - its use is not required. Please submit all requests to the District's Freedom of Information Officer. Copying fees, if any, must be paid before copies will be provided. The Freedom of Information Officer can give you an estimate of the copying fees, if any.

Todd Shields tshields@pioneerlocal.com
 Name of individual(s) requesting District records Email address
3701 W. Lake Ave 847-486-6829
 Address Telephone number
Glenview Ill. 60026 8/29/12
 City State Zip Date of request

Please check if this request of records is being made for a commercial purpose. Section 2 of the Freedom of Information Act states: "Commercial purpose means the use of any part of a public record or records, or information derived from public records, in any form for sale, resale, or solicitation or advertisement for sales or services. For purposes of this definition, requests made by news media and non-profit, scientific, or academic organizations shall not be considered to be made for a "commercial purpose" when the principal purpose of the request is (i) to access and disseminate information concerning news and current or passing events, (ii) for articles of opinion or features of interest to the public, or (iii) for the purpose of academic, scientific, or public research or education. Section 3.1 states: "It is a violation of this Act for a person to knowingly obtain a public record for a commercial purpose without disclosing that it is for a commercial purpose, if requested to do so by the public body."

Please check if a fee waiver or reduction is being requested. Section 6 of the Freedom of Information Act states: "Documents shall be furnished without charge or at a reduced charge, as determined by the public body, if the person requesting the documents states the specific purpose for the request and indicates that a waiver or reduction of the fee is in the public interest. Waiver or reduction of the fee is in the public interest if the principal purpose of the request is to access and disseminate information regarding the health, safety and welfare or the legal rights of the general public and is not for the principal purpose of personal or commercial benefit."

Please indicate your reason for requesting a fee waiver: information used for non-commercial reasons

Record description (Please be specific)	Check if you are requesting:		
	Electronic Copy	Inspection	Copy
	X		

All school district 225 legal costs pertaining to the complaint against the District filed by Citizens Organized to Save the Tax-cap. The complaint involved money spent by the district to inform the public on the 2006 Bond referendum.

Todd Shields



Elaine Geallis <egeallis@glenbrook225.org>

FOIA Response

1 message

Rosanne Marie Williamson <rwilliamson@glenbrook225.org>

Thu, Sep 6, 2012 at 3:26 PM

To: tshields@pioneerlocal.com

Bcc: egeallis@glenbrook225.org

Dear Mr. Shields,

Thank you for writing to Glenbrook High School District 225 with your request for information pursuant to the Illinois Freedom of Information Act, 5 ILCS 140/1 et seq.

On 8/29/12 you requested the following documents:

- All school district 225 legal costs pertaining to the complaint against the district filed by citizens organized to save the tax-cap.

I have attached the documents that you requested; however, redactions were made to the documents as this information is exempt under 7(1)(m) of the Freedom of Information Act.

You have the right to seek review of the denial of redacted information by the Public Access Counselor (PAC) in the Attorney General's office or to judicial review under Section 11 of the Freedom of Information Act. The Public Access Counselor is a part of the Public Access Bureau in the Attorney General's Office. Here is her contact information:

Cara Smith

Public Access Counselor

Public Access Bureau

500 S. 2nd Street

Springfield, Illinois 62706

E-mail: CSmith@atg.state.il.us

FOIA Hotline: 1-877-299-FOIA ([1-877-299-3642](tel:1-877-299-3642))

Direct Line: [312-814-5526](tel:312-814-5526)

Sincerely,

Rosanne Williamson, Ed.D.
Secretary, Board of Education
Assistant Superintendent for Educational Services
Glenbrook High School District 225
3801 West Lake Avenue
Glenview, IL 60026



COST Legal Expenses.pdf

2130K

DATE	HOURS	FEE	NARRATIVE
5/14/2007	1	210	REVIEW AND ANALYZE COMPLAINT FILED WITH THE ILLINOIS STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS ALLEGING THAT THE BOARD OF EDUCATION VIOLATED THE ELECTION CODE BY NOT REGISTERING AS A "LOCAL POLITICAL COMMITTEE"
5/16/2007	0.4	84	DRAFT APPEARANCE RE: COMPLAINT FILED BEFORE ILLINOIS STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS ALLEGING THAT THE SCHOOL BOARD SHOULD BE CONSIDERED A LOCAL POLITICAL COMMITTEE
5/16/2007	0.5	105	RESEARCH ISSUES RE: COMPLAINT FILED BEFORE ILLINOIS STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS ALLEGING THAT THE SCHOOL BOARD SHOULD BE CONSIDERED A LOCAL POLITICAL COMMITTEE
5/18/2007	0.3	63	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: COMPLAINT FILED WITH ILLINOIS BOARD OF ELECTIONS AGAINST BOARD OF EDUCATION
5/21/2007	1	210	RESEARCH AND ANALYZE COMPLAINT FILED WITH THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS AGAINST THE BOARD OF EDUCATION RELATING TO THE REFERENDUM EFFORT
5/21/2007	0.4	84	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES (2) ██████████ RE: COMPLAINT FILED WITH THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS AGAINST THE BOARD OF EDUCATION RELATING TO THE REFERENDUM EFFORT
5/21/2007	0.6	126	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES OPPOSING COUNSEL AND THE HEARING OFFICER RE: SCHEDULING A HEARING ON THE COMPLAINT FILED WITH THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS AGAINST THE BOARD OF EDUCATION RELATING TO THE REFERENDUM EFFORT
5/22/2007	0.3	63	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: COMPLAINT FILED WITH THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS AGAINST BOARD OF EDUCATION ALLEGING IMPROPER SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
5/22/2007	0.4	84	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: COMPLAINT FILED WITH THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS AGAINST BOARD OF EDUCATION ALLEGING IMPROPER SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
5/23/2007	0.3	63	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: HEARING ON THE COMPLAINT AGAINST BOARD OF EDUCATION ALLEGING IMPROPER SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM

5/23/2007	0.3	63	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: HEARING ON THE COMPLAINT AGAINST BOARD OF EDUCATION ALLEGING IMPROPER SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
5/24/2007	0.5	105	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: COMPLAINT AGAINST BOARD OF EDUCATION RE: ALLEGEDLY IMPROPER ASSISTANCE TO THE REFERENDUM DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: COMPLAINT FILED WITH STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS CHALLENGING SCHOOL BOARD'S SUPPORT OF THE REFERENDUM
5/31/2007	0.5	105	PLAN STRATEGY FOR RESPONDING TO ELECTION BOARD COMPLAINT CHALLENGING SCHOOL BOARD SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
5/31/2007	1	210	RESEARCH BOARD OF ELECTION POLICIES AND PROCEDURES RELATING TO CLOSED HEARING RE: COMPLAINT FILED AGAINST BOARD OF EDUCATION FOR ALLEGED IMPROPER SUPPORT FOR REFERENDUM
6/1/2007	2	420	RESEARCH LEGAL ISSUES FOR RESPONSE TO CHALLENGE IN THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS CHALLENGING SCHOOL DISTRICT'S SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
6/4/2007	2.5	525	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: CHALLENGE TO BOARD OF EDUCATION'S SUPPORT FOR REFERENDUM
6/4/2007	0.3	63	REVIEW AND ANALYZE COMPLAINT AND SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS RE: STATE BOARD OF ELECTION CHALLENGE TO BOARD OF EDUCATION SUPPORT FOR REFERENDUM
6/4/2007	2	420	RESEARCH LEGAL ISSUES RE: COMPLAINT FILED WITH THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS CHALLENGING THE BOARD OF EDUCATION'S SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
6/6/2007	1	210	DRAFT MOTION TO DISMISS COMPLAINT FILED WITH THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS CHALLENGING THE BOARD OF EDUCATION'S SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
6/11/2007	6	1,260.00	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: COMPLAINT FILED WITH THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS CHALLENGING THE BOARD OF EDUCATION'S SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
6/12/2007	0.3	63	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: CHALLENGE TO BOARD OF EDUCATION SUPPORT FOR REFERENDUM
6/12/2007	0.3	63	REVISE AND EDIT MOTION TO DISMISS COMPLAINT FILED WITH THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS CHALLENGING THE BOARD OF EDUCATION'S SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
6/12/2007	1.5	315	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING BEFORE HEARING OFFICER APPOINTED BY STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS TO HEAR THE CHALLENGE TO THE SCHOOL DISTRICT'S ALLEGED IMPROPER SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
6/13/2007	6	1,260.00	

6/15/2007	1.5	315	REVIEW AND ANALYZE THE FOURTEEN EXHIBITS INTRODUCED AT THE PRELIMINARY HEARING RE: THE CHALLENGE TO THE THE BOARD OF EDUCATION'S SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
6/15/2007	2	420	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████ RE: STATUS OF CHALLENGE TO BOARD OF EDUCATION'S SUPPORT FOR REFERENDUM
6/18/2007	2	420	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS REGARDING CITIZENS ORGANIZED TO SAVE THE TAX-CAP; TRIP TO TO STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS TO COPY D-2'S AND ITEMIZED CONTRIBUTIONS/EXPENSES
6/18/2007	1	210	REVIEW AND ANALYZE RESEARCH RELATING TO ISSUES RAISED BY CHALLENGE TO SCHOOL BOARD SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
6/18/2007	0.8	168	REVISE AND EDIT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████ RE: STATUS OF CHALLENGE TO BOARD OF EDUCATION'S SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
6/20/2007	0.3	63	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ██████████ RELATING CHALLENGE TO SCHOOL DISTRICT'S SUPPORT FOR REFERENDUM AND RESPOND TO SAME
6/20/2007	2	420	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DECISION BY HEARING OFFICER IN CHALLENGE TO SCHOOL DISTRICT'S SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM PENDING BEFORE THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS
6/22/2007	0.5	105	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DECISION BY HEARING OFFICER IN CHALLENGE TO SCHOOL DISTRICT'S SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM PENDING BEFORE THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS
6/27/2007	0.5	105	RESEARCH FOR REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF SCHOOL DISTRICT MOTION TO DISMISS IN THE COST LITIGATION CHALLENGING BOARD OF EDUCATION SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
7/3/2007	0.2	42	TELEPHONE MESSAGES TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: CHALLENGE TO SCHOOL BOARD'S SUPPORT OF THE REFERENDUM AT THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS
7/3/2007	0.5	105	DRAFT REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF SCHOOL DISTRICT'S MOTION TO DISMISS CHALLENGE TO SCHOOL BOARD' SUPPORT OF THE REFERENDUM
7/9/2007	7	1,470.00	RESEARCH AND DRAFT REPLY BRIEF BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF SCHOOL DISTRICT'S MOTION TO DISMISS COMPLAINT FILED BEFORE THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS CHALLENGING SCHOOL DISTRICT'S SUPPORT OF REFERENDUM
7/10/2007	8	1,680.00	DRAFT REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF SCHOOL DISTRICT MOTION TO DISMISS RE: LITIGATION BEFORE THE BOARD OF ELECTIONS CHALLENGING BOARD OF EDUCATION SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM

7/11/2007	5	1,050.00	REVISE AND EDIT REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF SCHOOL DISTRICT MOTION TO DISMISS RE: LITIGATION BEFORE THE BOARD OF ELECTIONS CHALLENGING BOARD OF EDUCATION SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
7/17/2007	0.4	84	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████ RE: LITIGATION AT THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS CHALLENGING THE SCHOOL DISTRICT'S SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
7/31/2007	1	210	REVIEW AND ANALYZE SUR-REPLY BRIEF FILED BY PLAINTIFF IN SUPPORT OF CLAIM THAT SCHOOL DISTRICT IMPROPERLY SUPPORTED REFERENDUM; REVIEW AND ANALYZE OBJECTIONS TO HEARING OFFICER'S DECISION IN SAME MATTER
8/17/2007	0.3	63	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO TELEPHONE MESSAGE FROM ██████████ RE: STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS MEETING CONSIDERING CHALLENGE TO SCHOOL DISTRICT'S SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
8/20/2007	3	630	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS MEETING RE: CHALLENGE TO SCHOOL DISTRICT'S SUPPORT FOR REFERENDUM
8/21/2007	1	210	██████████ REVIEW STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS ORDER
8/29/2007	1	210	REVIEW AND ANALYZE PETITION FOR REVIEW IN THE APPELLATE COURT OF THE DECISION OF THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS TO DISMISS THE COMPLAINT AGAINST THE BOARD OF EDUCATION AND ITS MEMBERS THAT CHALLENGED THEIR SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
8/30/2007	1.5	315	RESEARCH LEGAL ISSUES RE: ADMINISTRATIVE REVIEW OF STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION IN CHALLENGE TO SCHOOL BOARD SUPPORT OF REFERENDUM; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO SUPERINTENDENT HALES RE: SAME
9/19/2007	1.2	252	REVIEW AND ANALYZE APPELLATE COURT DOCKETING STATEMENT FILED BY "COST" RE: APPEAL OF STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS FINDING THAT SCHOOL BOARD DID NOT VIOLATE ELECTION LAWS BY ITS SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
9/28/2007	0.2	42	REVIEW APPEARANCE FILED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL'S OFFICER ON BEHALF OF STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS IN APPEAL BY "COST" OF DECISION FINDING THAT SCHOOL BOARD DID NOT VIOLATE ELECTION LAWS DURING THE REFERENDUM
9/28/2007	0.5	105	DRAFT APPEARANCE ON BEHALF OF SCHOOL BOARD IN APPEAL BY "COST" OF DECISION FINDING THAT SCHOOL BOARD DID NOT VIOLATE ELECTION LAWS DURING THE REFERENDUM
10/4/2007	0.3	63	FILE APPEARANCE IN APPEAL OF DECISION OF STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION DENYING COMPLAINT THAT SCHOOL BOARD IMPROPERLY SUPPORTED THE REFERENDUM
10/23/2007	0.7	147	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES (2) WITH ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL RE: APPEAL OF STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION IN "COST" LITIGATION

10/23/2007	1	210	REVISE AND EDIT AGREED MOTION TO SUPPLEMENT THE APPELLATE COURT RECORD IN APPEAL BY "COST" OF THE DECISION OF THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS
10/30/2007	0.5	105	REVIEW AND ANALYZE MOTION TO SUPPLEMENT APPELLATE RECORD FILED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL'S OFFICE RE: "COST" APPEAL OF STATE BOARD OF ELECTION'S DECISION RE: SCHOOL BOARD'S SUPPORT OF THE REFERENDUM
11/20/2007	0.4	84	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: APPEAL BY "COST" OF BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION IN FAVOR OF SCHOOL DISTRICT ON REFERENDUM SPENDING
11/26/2007	0.7	147	REVIEW AND ANALYZE PROPOSED MOTION TO SUPPLEMENT THE RECORD BY "COST" ATTORNEYS IN APPEAL OF BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION IN FAVOR OF SCHOOL DISTRICT RE: REFERENDUM SUPPORT
11/27/2007	0.5	105	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM "COST" ATTORNEYS RE: SUPPLEMENTING THE APPELLATE COURT RECORD IN APPEAL OF BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION IN FAVOR OF SCHOOL DISTRICT RE: REFERENDUM SUPPORT
12/3/2007	1.5	315	DRAFT EXTENSION MOTION AND SUPPORTING AFFIDAVITS IN APPELLATE COURT LITIGATION FILED BY "COST" APPEALING BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION IN FAVOR OF SCHOOL DISTRICT RE: SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
12/3/2007	0.3	63	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL RE: APPELLATE COURT LITIGATION FILED BY "COST" APPEALING BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION IN FAVOR OF SCHOOL DISTRICT RE: SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
12/3/2007	0.4	84	REVIEW EXTENSION MOTION FILED BY ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL IN APPELLATE COURT LITIGATION FILED BY "COST" APPEALING BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION IN FAVOR OF SCHOOL DISTRICT RE: SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
12/4/2007	4	840	LEGAL RESEARCH FOR DRAFTING APPELLATE COURT BRIEF IN "COST" APPEAL OF DECISION OF STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS IN FAVOR TO SCHOOL DISTRICT RE: REFERENDUM SUPPORT
12/5/2007	2.5	525	LEGAL RESEARCH FOR DRAFTING APPELLATE COURT BRIEF IN "COST" APPEAL OF DECISION OF STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS IN FAVOR TO SCHOOL DISTRICT RE: REFERENDUM SUPPORT
12/6/2007	1	210	LEGAL RESEARCH FOR DRAFTING APPELLATE COURT BRIEF IN "COST" APPEAL OF DECISION OF STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS IN FAVOR TO SCHOOL DISTRICT RE: REFERENDUM SUPPORT
12/13/2007	0.3	63	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: "COST" REQUEST FOR A PROTECTIVE ORDER FOR PRESERVATION OF SCHOOL RECORDS PENDING APPEAL OF STATE OF ELECTIONS DECISION

			RESEARCH REQUEST BY "COST" ATTORNEY FOR A PROTECTIVE ORDER FOR PRESERVATION OF
12/13/2007	0.5	105	SCHOOL RECORDS PENDING APPEAL OF STATE OF ELECTIONS DECISION
1/10/2008	0.6	126	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████ RE: "COST" LITIGATION UPDATE
1/15/2008	0.5	105	REVIEW AND ANALYZE MOTION FOR PROTECTIVE ORDER BEFORE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: CITIZENS ORGANIZED TO SAVE THE TAX-CAP
1/15/2008	1.5	315	RESEARCH RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PROTECTIVE ORDER FILED BY "COST" BEFORE THE ILLINOIS STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS
1/16/2008	3	630	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW CONCERNING ██████████ TO PRESERVE EVIDENCE IN PREPARATION FOR RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PROTECTIVE ORDER RE: CITIZENS ORGANIZED TO SAVE THE TAX-CAP
1/16/2008	1.5	315	PREPARE RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PROTECTIVE ORDER FILED BY "COST" BEFORE THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS
1/17/2008	1	210	REVISE AND EDIT BRIEF IN RESPONSE TO MOTION TO PRESERVE DOCUMENTS FILED BY "COST" BEFORE THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS "
1/21/2008	0.7	147	PREPARE FOR HEARING ON "COST" MOTION FOR PROTECTIVE ORDER BEFORE THE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS
1/22/2008	0.8	168	ATTEND STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS MEETING RE: MOTION FOR PROTECTIVE ORDER FROM CITIZENS AGAINST TAX-CAP
1/22/2008	2	420	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS HEARING RE: "COST" MOTION FOR PROTECTIVE ORDER
1/30/2008	0.3	63	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL RE: "COST" APPEAL
1/31/2008	0.3	63	REVIEW ORDER FROM STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS FINDING THAT IT HAS NO JURISDICTION OVER MOTION BY "COST" ASKING FOR ORDER OF PROTECTION
2/4/2008	0.5	105	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR DRAFTING APPELLATE BRIEF IN "COST" LITIGATION
2/7/2008	0.7	147	DRAFT RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PROTECTIVE ORDER IN APPELLATE COURT RE: CITIZENS ORGANIZED TO SAVE THE TAX CAP
2/11/2008	1.5	315	REVISE AND EDIT RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR PROTECTIVE FILED BY "COST" BEFORE THE APPELLATE COURT
2/11/2008	1.5	315	RESEARCH ISSUES FOR PREPARING APPELLATE COURT BRIEF IN "COST" APPEAL OF STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION
2/12/2008	1.7	357	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW RE: BRIEF FOR PETITIONER IN CITIZENS ORGANIZED TO SAVE TAX CAP
2/12/2008	5	1,050.00	RESEARCH ISSUES FOR PREPARING APPELLATE COURT BRIEF IN "COST" APPEAL OF STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION

2/13/2008	5	1,050.00	DRAFT APPELLATE COURT BRIEF IN COST LITIGATION
2/14/2008	6	1,260.00	DRAFT APPELLATE BRIEF IN "COST" APPEAL OF BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION FAVORING THE SCHOOL DISTRICT
2/15/2008	7	1,470.00	DRAFT APPELLATE BRIEF IN "COST" APPEAL OF BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION FAVORING THE SCHOOL DISTRICT
2/18/2008	2	420	DRAFT MEMORANDUM OUTLINING APPELLATE COURT'S STANDARD OF REVIEW FOR STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISIONS RE: CITIZENS AGAINST TAX CAP LITIGATION
2/18/2008	7	1,470.00	RESEARCH AND DRAFT APPELLATE COURT BRIEF IN "COST" APPEAL OF BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION IN SCHOOL DISTRICT'S FAVOR
2/19/2008	6	1,260.00	RESEARCH AND DRAFT APPELLATE COURT BRIEF IN "COST" APPEAL
2/20/2008	0.5	105	REVIEW AND ANALYZE ORDER FROM APPELLATE COURT RE: COST'S MOTION FOR PROTECTIVE ORDER
2/20/2008	5	1,050.00	DRAFT APPELLATE BRIEF IN "COST" APPEAL
2/21/2008	3	630	DRAFT APPELLATE COURT BRIEF IN COST APPEAL
2/27/2008	1	210	REVISE AND EDIT APPELLATE COURT BRIEF IN COST LITIGATION
2/29/2008	0.4	84	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: COST APPELLATE LITIGATION
3/4/2008	2	420	DRAFT APPELLATE COURT BRIEF IN "COST" APPEAL
3/4/2008	0.4	84	REVIEW MOTION BY "COST" FOR EXTENSION OF TIME TO FILE APPELLATE COURT BRIEF
3/11/2008	0.3	63	REVIEW ORDER FROM APPELLATE COURT RE: COST REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL TIME TO FILE BRIEF
3/15/2008	1	210	WORK ON COST BRIEF
3/17/2008	0.5	105	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL IN "COST" APPEAL
3/18/2008	1	210	REVISE AND EDIT APPELLATE COURT BRIEF IN COST LITIGATION
3/18/2008	0.3	63	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL RE: COST APPEAL (ATTORNEY GENERAL'S OFFICE REPRESENTS STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS ON THIS APPEAL)
3/19/2008	0.5	105	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL RE: COST APPEAL (ATTORNEY GENERAL'S OFFICE REPRESENTS STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS ON THIS APPEAL)
3/20/2008	2	420	MAKE FINAL REVISIONS AND EDITS TO COST APPELLATE BRIEF; PREPARE BRIEF FOR FILING IN THE APPELLATE COURT
3/21/2008	1.5	315	PREPARE FILES FOR ORAL ARGUMENT IN COST LITIGATION
3/21/2008	0.5	105	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO [REDACTED] RE: STATUS OF COST APPEAL
3/24/2008	3	630	REVIEW AND ANALYZE APPELLATE BRIEF FILED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL'S OFFICE ON BEHALF OF STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS IN "COST" APPEAL
3/25/2008	1.5	315	REVIEW ATTORNEY GENERAL BRIEF IN COST CASE

4/10/2008	0.3	63	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ILLINOIS APPELLATE COURT RE: COST APPEAL
4/28/2008	0.7	147	REVIEW AND ANALYZE APPELLATE COURT REPLY BRIEF FILED BY COST IN THEIR APPEAL OF BOARD OF ELECTION'S DECISION RE: BOARD OF EDUCATION'S SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
5/1/2008	0.5	105	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████ RE: COST APPEAL
3/12/2009	0.7	154	REVIEW RECENT APPELLATE COURT DECISION RELATING TO APPEALS FROM STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS FOR THE PENDING "COST" APPELLATE MATTER
5/21/2009	0.3	66	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM APPELLATE COURT RE: "COST" APPELLATE DECISION
5/22/2009	4	880	REVIEW AND ANALYZE APPELLATE COURT DECISION IN "COST" APPEAL OF BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION IN FAVOR OF SCHOOL DISTRICT CONCERNING THE 2006 BOND REFERENDUM TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: APPELLATE COURT DECISION IN "COST" APPEAL OF BOARD OF ELECTIONS DECISION IN FAVOR OF SCHOOL DISTRICT CONCERNING THE 2006 BOND REFERENDUM
5/22/2009	0.3	66	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: APPELLATE COURT DECISION RE: SPENDING BY SCHOOL DISTRICT ON INFORMATIONAL BROCHURES RELATED TO 2006 BOND REFERENDUM
5/26/2009	0.3	66	DRAFT MEDIA RELEASE IN RESPONSE TO APPELLATE COURT DECISION RE: SPENDING BY SCHOOL DISTRICT ON INFORMATIONAL BROCHURES RELATED TO 2006 BOND REFERENDUM
5/26/2009	1	220	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL REPRESENTING THE ILLINOIS STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: APPELLATE COURT DECISION RE: SPENDING BY SCHOOL DISTRICT ON INFORMATIONAL BROCHURES RELATED TO 2006 BOND REFERENDUM
5/26/2009	0.4	88	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL REPRESENTING THE ILLINOIS STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: APPELLATE COURT DECISION RE: SPENDING BY SCHOOL DISTRICT ON INFORMATIONAL BROCHURES RELATED TO 2006 BOND REFERENDUM
5/27/2009	0.3	66	INFORMATIONAL BROCHURES RELATED TO 2006 BOND REFERENDUM
5/28/2009	7	1,540.00	ANALYZE APPELLATE COURT DECISION AND RESEARCH LEGAL OPTIONS AFTER APPELLATE COURT DECISION IN "COST" LITIGATION
5/29/2009	6	1,320.00	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████ AND ██████████ RE: BOARD OPTIONS AFTER APPELLATE COURT DECISION IN "COST" LITIGATION
6/2/2009	0.3	66	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: APPELLATE COURT DECISION CONCERNING SCHOOL DISTRICT SUPPORT FOR THE 2006 REFERENDUM
6/2/2009	0.5	110	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ILLINOIS ASSOCIATION OF SCHOOL BOARDS RE: APPELLATE COURT DECISION CONCERNING SCHOOL DISTRICT SUPPORT FOR THE 2006 REFERENDUM

6/3/2009	1.7	374	PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH ██████████ RE: APPELLATE COURT DECISION CONCERNING SCHOOL DISTRICT SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
6/8/2009	5.5	1,210.00	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND ██████████ MEETING RE: OPTIONS FOLLOWING APPELLATE COURT DECISION ON LITIGATION CONCERNING SCHOOL DISTRICT SUPPORT FOR 2006 REFERENDUM
6/9/2009	5	1,100.00	RESEARCH ISSUES FOR PETITION FOR REHEARING BEFORE APPELLATE COURT RE: DECISION CONCERNING SCHOOL DISTRICT SUPPORT FOR 2006 REFERENDUM
6/10/2009	0.5	110	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████ RE: APPELLATE COURT DECISION CONCERNING SCHOOL DISTRICT SUPPORT FOR 2006 REFERENDUM
6/10/2009	7.5	1,650.00	DRAFT PETITION FOR REHEARING BEFORE THE APPELLATE COURT RE: DECISION CONCERNING THE BOARD OF EDUCATION SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
6/11/2009	11.5	2,530.00	DRAFT PETITION FOR REHEARING BEFORE THE APPELLATE COURT RE: DECISION CONCERNING THE BOARD OF EDUCATION SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
6/12/2009	1.5	330	REVISE AND EDIT PETITION FOR REHEARING BEFORE THE APPELLATE COURT RE: DECISION CONCERNING THE BOARD OF EDUCATION SUPPORT FOR THE REFERENDUM
6/15/2009	3	660	WORK ON FOLLOW UP MATTERS RELATING TO THE FILING OF THE PETITION FOR REHEARING RE: THE APPELLATE COURT DECISION CONCERNING SCHOOL DISTRICT SUPPORT FOR THE 2006 REFERENDUM
6/15/2009	0.7	154	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████ RE: PETITION OF REHEARING IN APPELLATE COURT OF DECISION CONCERNING SCHOOL DISTRICT S SUPPORT FOR REFERENDUM
6/23/2009	0.3	66	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: THE APPELLATE COURT MATTER INVOLVING THE 2006 REFERENDUM
6/25/2009	0.5	110	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: THE APPELLATE COURT MATTER INVOLVING THE 2006 REFERENDUM; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RECEIVED FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL
6/30/2009	0.8	176	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES (2) WITH REPORTER FOR PIONEER PRESS RE: APPELLATE COURT DECISION IN "COST" APPEAL
7/1/2009	1.2	264	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY WHO WILL FILE AN AMICUS BRIEF ON BEHALF OF ILLINOIS ASSOCIATION OF SCHOOL BOARDS IN "COST" APPEAL
7/2/2009	0.3	66	REVIEW NEWS MEDIA STORY RE: "COST" APPEAL
7/24/2009	0.25	55	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING "COST" APPEAL.
7/24/2009	0.5	110	REVIEW APPELLATE COURT DECISION DENYING SCHOOL DISTRICT'S PETITION FOR REHEARING IN "COST" APPEAL

7/28/2009	0.2	44	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: "COST" APPEAL
			TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY WRITING AMICUS BRIEF ON BEHALF OF ISBA IN "COST"
7/28/2009	0.4	88	APPEAL
7/29/2009	1	220	RESEARCH STANDARDS FOR APPEAL TO ILLINOIS SUPREME COURT IN "COST" APPEAL
			DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO VARIOUS REPRESENTATIVES OF GOVERNMENTAL BODIES
			REQUESTING THAT THEY JOIN IN AMICUS BRIEF IN THE "COST" APPEAL BEFORE THE ILLINOIS
7/29/2009	1.5	330	SUPREME COURT
			DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO VARIOUS REPRESENTATIVES OF GOVERNMENTAL BODIES
			REQUESTING THAT THEY JOIN IN AMICUS BRIEF IN THE "COST" APPEAL BEFORE THE ILLINOIS
7/30/2009	3.5	770	SUPREME COURT
			REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND FILE TO PREPARE FOR DRAFTING PETITION FOR LEAVE TO APPEAL TO
8/19/2009	1.5	330	ILLINOIS SUPREME COURT IN "COST" LITIGATION
8/20/2009	1.5	330	RESEARCH FOR DRAFTING PETITION FOR LEAVE TO APPEAL TO ILLINOIS SUPREME COURT IN "COST"
			LITIGATION
8/20/2009	0.6	132	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW CONCERNING PLA AND PUBLIC IMPORTANCE RE: "COST" APPEAL
8/20/2009	0.8	66	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY DRAFTING AMICUS BRIEF IN COST APPEAL ON BEHALF
			OF ILLINOIS SCHOOL BOARD ASSOCIATION
8/20/2009	0.3	66	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL RE: APPEAL TO THE ILLINOIS
			SUPREME COURT OF THE "COST" MATTER
8/21/2009	5	1,100.00	RESEARCH ISSUES FOR DRAFTING PETITION FOR LEAVE TO APPEAL TO ILLINOIS SUPREME COURT IN
			"COST" LITIGATION
			REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW CONCERNING PLA AND GENERAL IMPORTANCE RE: "COST"
8/21/2009	2.3	506	APPEAL
8/24/2009	7.5	1,650.00	RESEARCH AND DRAFT PETITION FOR LEAVE TO APPEAL TO ILLINOIS SUPREME COURT IN "COST"
			LITIGATION
8/25/2009	13	2,860.00	DRAFT PETITION FOR LEAVE TO APPEAL TO ILLINOIS SUPREME COURT IN "COST" LITIGATION
			CONTINUE TO DRAFT PETITION FOR LEAVE TO APPEAL TO ILLINOIS SUPREME COURT IN "COST"
8/26/2009	10	2,200.00	LITIGATION
8/26/2009	1.3	286	EDIT PETITION FOR LEAVE TO APPEAL RE: "COST" LITIGATION.
8/27/2009	1	220	WORK ON "COST" SUPREME COURT APPEAL FILING

			TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE: PETITION FOR LEAVE TO APPEAL FILED IN "COST" APPEAL TO THE ILLINOIS SUPREME COURT; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO
8/31/2009	0.6	132	[REDACTED] RE: SAME
			DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO [REDACTED] RE: SCHOOL DISTRICT APPEAL TO THE
9/2/2009	0.5	110	ILLINOIS SUPREME COURT OF THE "COST" LITIGATION
9/4/2009	0.5	110	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO [REDACTED] RE: "COST" APPEAL
9/11/2009	0.75	165	REVIEW COST BRIEF.
9/14/2009	0.5	110	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO [REDACTED] RE: "COST" APPELLATE MATTER
			REVIEW SUPREME COURT DENIAL OF SCHOOL DISTRICT'S PETITION FOR LEAVE TO APPEAL; LEAVE
			PHONE MESSAGE FOR [REDACTED] RE: SAME; PLAN STRATEGY FOR LITIGATION
			BEFORE STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE:
11/25/2009	0.8	176	STATUS OF LITIGATION
12/1/2009	0.75	165	REVIEW COST ORDER
			TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH REPORTER FROM PIONEER PRESS RE: NEWS STORY ABOUT "COST"
12/1/2009	0.4	88	APPELLATE DECISION
			REVIEW PROTECTIVE ORDER APPROVED BY APPELLATE COURT IN "COST" LITIGATION; DRAFT
12/3/2009	0.8	176	CORRESPONDENCE TO [REDACTED] RE: SAME
12/6/2009	1	220	PREPARATION FOR [REDACTED] MEETING REGARDING COST
			TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: EXPECTATIONS FOR COST
			LITIGATION RETURNING TO TO BOARD OF ELECTIONS; RESEARCH CHANGES IN LAW RELATING TO
12/7/2009	1.5	330	PRESENT LITIGATION
			PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH [REDACTED] RE: UPDATE ON "COST" APPEAL
12/7/2009	3.5	770	AND DISCUSSION OF LITIGATION OPTIONS
			RESEARCH ISSUES RE: LITIGATION STRATEGY FOR COST LITIGATION BEFORE STATE BOARD OF
12/8/2009	1.5	330	ELECTIONS
			REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW RE: "COST" APPEAL LITIGATION RE: RETROACTIVELY APPLYING
12/8/2009	2.9	319	RECENTLY ENACTED LEGISLATION ON APPEAL TO FACTS OCCURRING UNDER FORMER LAW
			TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] (2) RE: STATUS OF LEGISLATION
12/9/2009	0.8	176	ADDRESSING ISSUES IN COST LITIGATION; REVIEW FINAL LEGISLATION SIGNED BY GOVERNOR
			DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO [REDACTED] AND BOARD OF EDUCATION UPDATING
12/11/2009	1.7	374	LITIGATION STRATEGY FOR COST LITIGATION

Date	Hours	Minutes	Task Description
			DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] ON UPDATING
12/14/2009	2	440	LITIGATION STRATEGY FOR COST LITIGATION
12/14/2009	0.3	66	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY FOR STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: COST LITIGATION
12/14/2009	1.5	330	DRAFT LEGAL OPINION TO [REDACTED] REFERENDUM LAWSUIT
12/16/2009	1	220	WORK ON COST HEARING
12/17/2009	1	220	WORK ON COST ORDER
12/17/2009	0.3	66	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE: COST LITIGATION
12/22/2009	0.5	110	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CORRESPONDENCE FROM [REDACTED] RE: COST LITIGATION
12/24/2009	0.7	154	RESEARCH LEGAL ISSUES RAISED BY RAISED BY [REDACTED] N AND [REDACTED] RE: COST LITIGATION
12/26/2009	1.75	385	REVIEW BOARD CORRESPONDENCE RE-COST
12/28/2009	0.5	110	PLAN RESPONSE TO LEGAL ISSUES RAISED BY RAISED BY [REDACTED] N AND [REDACTED] RE: COST LITIGATION
12/29/2009	0.4	88	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM ATTORNEY [REDACTED] RE: COST LITIGATION
12/29/2009	1.3	286	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW CONCERNING RETROACTIVE APPLICATION OF LAW RE: COST LITIGATION
12/30/2009	4	880	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW IN RESPONSE TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE RE: COST LITIGATION
1/4/2010	0.4	88	REVIEW AND ANALYZE E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE RE: COST LITIGATION
1/5/2010	0.2	44	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE: COST LITIGATION
1/5/2010	1.4	308	DRAFT RESPONSE TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE RE: COST LITIGATION
1/6/2010	4.3	946	RESEARCH LEGAL ISSUES RAISED BY [REDACTED] RE: COST LITIGATION
1/7/2010	3.2	704	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW AND STATUTES IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING RESPONSE TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE RE: COST LITIGATION
1/7/2010	4	880	RESEARCH LEGAL ISSUES RELATING TO COST LITIGATION
1/8/2010	6	1,320:00	RESEARCH LEGAL ISSUES FOR COST LITIGATION; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] RE: SAME
1/8/2010	1.5	330	REVISE AND EDIT CORRESPONDENCE IN RESPONSE TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE RECEIVED RE: COST LITIGATION
1/11/2010	4.8	946	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH [REDACTED] RE: COST LITIGATION
1/12/2010	1	220	WORK OF COST APPEAL

1/15/2010	0.7	154	REVIEW RECENT ILLINOIS APPELLATE COURT DECISION ON RETRACTIVE APPLICATION OF NEW LEGISLATION FOR COST LITIGATION; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM APPELLATE COURT RE: ISSUANCE OF MANDATE
1/22/2010	0.6	132	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ILLINOIS STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: PUBLIC HEARING ON COST MATTER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: SAME
1/22/2010	2.3	506	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW CONCERNING MOTION TO DISMISS INDIVIDUAL DEFENDANTS RE: COST LITIGATION
1/23/2010	0.4	88	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ██████████ RE: COST LITIGATION; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ██████████ RE: SAME
1/25/2010	0.25	55	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING COST APPEAL
1/25/2010	4.8	1,056.00	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW CONCERNING MOTION TO DISMISS INDIVIDUAL DEFENDANTS RE: COST LITIGATION
1/26/2010	4.3	946	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RAISED IN E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE IN PREPARATION FOR TELEPHONE CONFERENCE RE: COST LITIGATION
1/26/2010	1.3	286	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE RE: COST LITIGATION
1/26/2010	1.5	330	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ AND ██████████ ██████████ RE: COST LITIGATION
1/28/2010	0.8	176	RESEARCH ISSUES FOR MOTION TO DISMISS COST COMPLAINT BEFORE THE BOARD OF ELECTIONS
1/28/2010	0.6	132	REVIEW NOTES FROM TELEPHONE CONFERENCE IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
2/1/2010	1.8	396	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: PUBLIC HEARING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY FOR COMPLAINANT RE: SAME; DRAFT MOTION TO EXTEND TIME FOR PUBLIC HEARING
2/2/2010	0.6	132	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION RE: DISCOVERY; DRAFT RESPONSE TO SAME
2/2/2010	1.2	264	REVIEW DISCOVERY REQUESTS FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION; REVIEW BOARD OF ELECTIONS RULES RE: DISCOVERY
2/3/2010	1.25	275	REVIEW DISCOVERY REQUESTS FOR COST, REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE
2/11/2010	0.75	165	REVIEW COST DISCOVERY REQUEST ██████████
2/11/2010	1.3	286	PLAN STRATEGY IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION

2/12/2010	2.4	528	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
2/15/2010	0.5	110	REVIEW ORDER FROM HEARING OFFICER IN COST LITIGATION ALLOWING BRIEFING SCHEDULE FOR SCHOOL DISTRICT'S MOTION TO DISMISS; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO SUPERINTENDENT RIGGLE RE: SAME
2/15/2010	2	440	RESEARCH ISSUES FOR COST MOTION TO DISMISS
2/16/2010	0.7	154	PLAN STRATEGY FOR DRAFTING MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION
2/17/2010	2	440	PLAN STRATEGY CONCERNING MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
2/17/2010	2.3	506	RESEARCH FOR MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION
2/18/2010	1.8	396	DRAFT OUTLINE OF MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
2/18/2010	0.3	66	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: DISCOVERY ISSUES IN COST LITIGATION
2/18/2010	5	1,100.00	DRAFT MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION
2/19/2010	2	440	WORK ON COST DISCOVERY
2/19/2010	3.2	704	REVIEW AND ANALYZE STATUTES CONCERNING BOARD OF ELECTIONS JURISDICTION RE: COST LITIGATION
2/19/2010	3	660	DRAFT MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS CONCERNING JURISDICTIONAL ISSUES RE: COST LITIGATION
2/23/2010	1.8	396	REVIEW NOTES IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
2/23/2010	5.5	1,210.00	DRAFT MOTION TO DISMISS COMPLAINT IN COST LITIGATION
2/24/2010	2	440	RESEARCH AND DRAFT MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION
2/24/2010	3	660	DRAFT MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
2/25/2010	1.8	396	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW CONCERNING MOOTNESS RE: COST LITIGATION
2/25/2010	3.4	748	DRAFT MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
2/28/2010	4	880	RESEARCH AND DRAFT MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION
3/1/2010	0.5	110	REVIEW ORDERS OF COST LITIGATION
3/1/2010	4	880	DRAFT MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS CONCERNING LIABILITY OF INDIVIDUAL BOARD MEMBERS RE: COST LITIGATION
3/1/2010	5.2	1,144.00	DRAFT MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION
3/2/2010	7.2	1,584.00	DRAFT MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION

3/2/2010	1.6	352	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW CONCERNING MOOTNESS IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
3/2/2010	4.8	1,056.00	DRAFT MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS CONCERNING MOOTNESS RE: COST LITIGATION
3/3/2010	2.3	506	REVISE AND EDIT MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
3/3/2010	8	1,760.00	DRAFT, REVISE, AND EDIT MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION
3/3/2010	1.5	330	WORK ON COST BRIEF
3/4/2010	0.3	66	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: COST MOTION TO DISMISS
3/5/2010	5.3	1,166.00	REVISE AND EDIT MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION BASED ON SUGGESTED CHANGES BY ██████████; DRAFT NOTICE OF FILINGS; PREPARE BRIEF FOR FILING
3/5/2010	1.3	286	FILE MOTION TO DISMISS WITH STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: COST LITIGATION
3/5/2010	1	220	REVIEW ██████████ SUGGESTED CHANGES TO MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
3/5/2010	0.3	66	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH ██████████ CONCERNING SUGGESTED REVISIONS TO MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
3/5/2010	2	440	REVISE AND EDIT MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
3/18/2010	0.3	66	REVIEW RECENT APPELLATE COURT DECISION FOR COST LITIGATION
3/26/2010	0.3	66	REVIEW RESPONSE TO MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
3/26/2010	1	220	REVIEW RESPONSE TO SCHOOL DISTRICT'S MOTION TO DISMISS FILED BY COST
3/29/2010	2	440	REVIEW COST RESPONSE TO MOTION TO DISMISS
3/31/2010	1.2	264	REVIEW AND ANALYZE RESPONSE TO MOTION TO DISMISS IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING REPLY RE: COST LITIGATION
4/1/2010	1	220	WORK ON COST MOTION TO DISMISS REPLY
4/1/2010	2	440	REVIEW AND ANALYZE PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE TO SCHOOL DISTRICT'S MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION
4/1/2010	0.5	110	ANALYZE LAW OF CASE DOCTRINE AND IMPACT ON COST LITIGATION
4/1/2010	0	0	REVIEW AND ANALYZE RESPONSE TO MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
4/1/2010	0	0	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW CONCERNING JURISDICTIONAL ISSUES RAISED IN RESPONSE TO MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
4/2/2010	0	0	DRAFT REPLY TO MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION

4/5/2010	3.2	704	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW CONCERNING RETRO-ACTIVITY OF AMENDMENTS TO ELECTION CODE IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING REPLY TO MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
4/5/2010	0	0	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW CONCERNING LAW OF THE CASE DOCTRINE IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING REPLY TO MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
4/5/2010	0	0	DRAFT REPLY TO MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
4/6/2010	4.1	902	DRAFT REPLY TO MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
4/7/2010	0	0	DRAFT REPLY TO MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
4/8/2010	2.2	484	DRAFT REPLY TO MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
4/8/2010	4	880	DRAFT REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF SCHOOL DISTRICT'S MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION
4/12/2010	0	0	DRAFT REPLY TO MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
4/13/2010	6.8	1,496.00	DRAFT REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF SCHOOL DISTRICT'S MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION
4/14/2010	0	0	REVISE AND EDIT REPLY IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION
4/14/2010	7	1,540.00	DRAFT REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF SCHOOL DISTRICT'S MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION
4/15/2010	6.5	1,430.00	REVISE AND EDIT REPLY BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF SCHOOL DISTRICT'S MOTION TO DISMISS IN COST LITIGATION
4/15/2010	2.6	572	REVISE AND AMEND REPLY IN SUPPORT OF SCHOOL DISTRICT'S SECOND MOTION TO DISMISS RE: COST LITIGATION; REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW RE: VALIDITY OF ILLINOIS STATUTORY ENACTMENTS
4/16/2010	2	440	MAKE FINAL AMENDMENTS TO REPLY BRIEF IN COST LITIGATION
4/16/2010	2.25	495	REVIEW COST RESPONSIVE MOTION; SUPPLEMENT AND FINALIZE
6/17/2010	0.2	44	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL TO HEARING OFFICER IN COST LITIGATION
6/17/2010	0.2	44	INQUIRING ABOUT STATUS OF SCHOOL DISTRICT'S MOTION TO DISMISS
6/28/2010	0.3	66	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM SAME
6/28/2010	0.3	66	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: NEWS ARTICLE CONCERNING COST LITIGATION; REVIEW NEWS ARTICLE; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████ RE:
12/3/2010	0.9	198	SAME
12/6/2010	1	220	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM HEARING OFFICER IN COST LITIGATION RE: STATUS OF LITIGATION; RESPOND TO SAME; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: SAME

			REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM HEARING OFFICER IN COST LITIGATION RE: STATUS HEARING ; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: SAME; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO
12/9/2010	0.8	176	[REDACTED] RE: SAME
12/10/2010	0	0	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM HEARING OFFICE RE: COST LITIGATION
12/13/2010	0	0	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM HEARING OFFICER IN COST LITIGATION
12/14/2010	0.8	176	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND FILES TO PREPARE FOR SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE IN COST LITIGATION REVIEW DOCUMENTS, FILES AND LEGAL RESEARCH TO PREPARE FOR SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE AT STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS FOR COST LITIGATION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
12/16/2010	4	880	[REDACTED] RE: SAME
12/17/2010	0.35	77	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING DISCLOSURE OF INFORMATION REGARDING COST SUIT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE RE: COST LITIGATION; TELEPHONE
12/17/2010	4	880	CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE: SAME
12/21/2010	0.6	132	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] RE: SETTLEMENT OPTIONS IN COST LITIGATION
1/6/2011	0.3	66	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO [REDACTED] RE: COST LITIGATION
1/10/2011	2.5	550	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND [REDACTED] MEETING RE: POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT OF COST LITIGATION
1/11/2011	0.5	110	WORK ON SCOPE OF COST DISCOVERY
1/12/2011	0.8	176	REVIEW DISCOVERY REQUESTS FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: PROPOSED SETTLEMENT IN COST LITIGATION
1/25/2011	0.5	110	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION RE: SETTLEMENT
1/26/2011	0.3	66	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE: COST LITIGATION SETTLEMENT ISSUES
2/14/2011	2	440	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE: ANSWERS TO DISCOVERY; REVIEW AND ANALYZE SAME; PREPARE FOR STATUS HEARING BEFORE BOARD OF ELECTIONS
2/15/2011	8	660	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND STATUS HEARING AT ILLINOIS STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: COST LITIGATION; REVIEW PROPOSED DISCOVERY ANSWERS RECEIVED FROM [REDACTED]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE: SAME

			REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM HEARING OFFICER IN COST LITIGATION; DRAFT RESPONSE TO
2/16/2011	0.5	110	SAME
2/16/2011	0	0	CONFERENCE REGARDING COST DISCOVERY
2/23/2011	0	0	CONFERENCE REGARDING COST DISCOVERY
3/2/2011	8	660	PREPARE SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL IN COST LITIGATION; PLAN STRATEGY FOR SAME
3/3/2011	0.5	110	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING COST DISCOVERY AND DUE DILIGENCE
3/3/2011	2	440	PREPARE SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS IN COST LITIGATION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
3/3/2011	2	440	OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: SETTLEMENT ISSUES
3/4/2011	1.5	330	WORK ON SETTLEMENT ISSUES RE: COST LITIGATION
3/10/2011	0.25	55	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING COST PROPOSAL ON DISCOVERY
3/14/2011	0.3	66	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: STATUS OF COST LITIGATION
3/21/2011	3	660	PREPARE FOR STATUS HEARING RE: COST LITIGATION; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM HEARING
			OFFICER AND OPPOSING COUNSEL ; DRAFT RESPONSES TO SAME
			PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND STATUS CONFERENCE AT THE ILLINOIS STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE:
3/24/2011	2	440	POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT OF COST LITIGATION
3/29/2011	0.25	55	REVIEW COST SETTLEMENT DATA
			WORK ON SETTLEMENT ISSUES IN COST LITIGATION; PREPARE FOR DRAFTING OF SETTLEMENT
4/13/2011	3.4	748	AGREEMENT
4/14/2011	3.6	792	DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT IN COST LITIGATION
4/15/2011	5.2	1,144.00	DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT IN COST LITIGATION
4/18/2011	4.8	1,056.00	DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT IN COST LITIGATION
4/19/2011	3.5	770	DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT IN COST LITIGATION
4/20/2011	0.65	143	REVIEW COST ORDER
			TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: PROPOSED COST SETTLEMENT
4/20/2011	0.7	154	AGREEMENT; MAKE CHANGES TO AGREEMENT
4/21/2011	0.8	176	REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM ██████████ RE: PROPOSED COST
			SETTLEMENT; REVIEW PROPOSED CHANGES TO SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT FROM ██████████
4/25/2011	1.2	264	WORK ON COST SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL AND RELATED ISSUES
4/29/2011	1.5	330	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ██████████ RE: PROPOSED COST
			SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; MAKE FINAL CHANGES TO SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; DRAFT
4/29/2011	1.5	330	CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: SAME
4/29/2011	0.75	165	REVIEW ██████████ COMMENTS REGARDING COST AND JUDGMENT
5/2/2011	0.5	110	PREPARE FOR MEETING AND WORK ON COST LITIGATION

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT IN COST LITIGATION; REVIEW RESPONSE TO SAME; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING

5/9/2011	0.7	154	COUNSEL REQUESTING POSTPONEMENT OF SCHEDULED STATUS HEARING
5/10/2011	0.7	154	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE TO AND FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL AND HEARING OFFICER RESCHEDULING STATUS HEARING FOR COST LITIGATION
PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND STATUS HEARING BEFORE THE ILLINOIS STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE:			
5/18/2011	3	660	COST LITIGATION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: SAME
5/19/2011	0.75	165	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND WORK ON COST SETTLEMENT
5/26/2011	1	220	REVIEW COUNTER SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL IN COST LITIGATION
5/26/2011	0.75	165	REVIEW COST SETTLEMENT ORDER REQUIREMENTS
5/27/2011	0.5	110	WORK ON COST SETTLEMENT
5/30/2011	1	220	PREPARATION OF COST SETTLEMENT
5/31/2011	0.75	165	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY AND ██████████ ON ELEMENTS OF COST SETTLEMENT
5/31/2011	0.5	110	PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH ██████████ ON COST SUIT SETTLEMENT
5/31/2011	3	660	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH ██████████ RE: COST LITIGATION
6/1/2011	1.3	286	REVIEW AND ANALYZE COST SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL
6/7/2011	1.5	330	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: SETTLEMENT ISSUES IN COST LITIGATION; REVIEW SETTLEMENT PROPOSALS; DRAFT MODIFIED SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL
6/9/2011	4	880	PREPARE AND DRAFT RESPONSE TO COST'S COUNTER PROPOSALS TO OUR PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT IN THE COST LITIGATION
6/15/2011	0.5	110	REVIEW COST DOCUMENTS
6/16/2011	6	1,320.00	DRAFT FURTHER RESPONSE TO COUNTER SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL RECEIVED FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION
6/17/2011	1.3	286	MAKE CHANGES TO UPDATE TO SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL IN COST LITIGATION
6/21/2011	0.25	55	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING COST LITIGATION
7/19/2011	0.5	115	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM HEARING OFFICER RE: COST LITIGATION; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████: SAME
7/27/2011	2	460	PREPARE FOR SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE BEFORE HEARING OFFICER RE: COST LITIGATION

				PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WITH HEARING OFFICER FROM STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: COST LITIGATION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED]
7/28/2011	5	1,150.00		[REDACTED] RE: SAME
8/10/2011	0.3	69		TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE: COST LITIGATION
8/12/2011	0.3	69		TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE: COST LITIGATION
8/17/2011	2.5	575		DRAFT REVISED SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL FOR COST LITIGATION
8/24/2011	4	920		REVIEW AND ANALYZE OPTIONS RE: COST LITIGATION AS TO SETTLEMENT, HEARING, OR FILING OF DOCUMENTS WITH STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS
8/24/2011	1.5	345		PREPARE FOR [REDACTED] MEETING RE: COST LITIGATION
8/25/2011	1.1	253		REVIEW DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RE: COST LITIGATION; WORK ON OPTIONS FOR [REDACTED]
8/25/2011	4	920		CONSIDERATION RE: SAME
				REVIEW REFERENDUM EXPENDITURE CALCULATIONS; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND [REDACTED] MEETING
8/25/2011	6.5	0		RE: COST LITIGATION
				PREPARE SUMMARY OF COST LITIGATION FOR [REDACTED]; REVIEW SETTLEMENT ISSUES; ATTEND [REDACTED] MEETING [NO CHARGE PER ATTORNEY PETRARCA]
8/26/2011	5	1,150.00		RESEARCH ISSUES OF STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS AND LACHES FOR COST LITIGATION; MAKE CHANGES TO PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT
8/29/2011	4	920		AMEND PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; REVIEW VIDEOS PRODUCED BY SCHOOL DISTRICT RELATED TO REFERENDUM; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: PROPOSED SETTLEMENT
9/1/2011	0.4	92		REVIEW COST LITIGATION SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL
9/7/2011	1.5	345		PREPARE FOR STATUS HEARING AT STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS RE: COST LITIGATION; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL AND HEARING OFFICER RE: NEW STATUS DATE
9/8/2011	0.2	46		REVIEW COST PRELIMINARY RESPONSE TO PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT
10/17/2011	0.8	184		REVIEW COST SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL AND CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY
10/24/2011	2	460		TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE: COST LITIGATION; REVIEW SETTLEMENT OPTIONS TO PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH [REDACTED]
10/25/2011	2.7	621		PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH [REDACTED] TO REVIEW COST SETTLEMENT PROPOSALS; REVIEW PROPOSED CHANGES TO SETTLEMENT DOCUMENT BY [REDACTED]
10/26/2011	0.8	184		REVIEW PHONE MESSAGE FROM [REDACTED] RE: COST SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL; REVIEW PREVIOUS SETTLEMENT PROPOSALS

10/28/2011	3.3	759	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: COST LITIGATION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: SAME
10/31/2011	4	920	REVIEW AND ANALYZE LATEST VERSION OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RECEIVED FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION; COMPARE TO RECENT VERSIONS; SUPPLEMENT PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT
11/1/2011	1.5	345	MAKE REVISIONS TO DRAFT OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RECEIVED FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL IN THE COST LITIGATION
11/2/2011	2	460	REVIEW COST PROPOSAL TO SETTLEMENT; SUPPLEMENT SAME
11/4/2011	3	690	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH ██████████ TO REVIEW COST SETTLEMENT OPTIONS
11/7/2011	3.7	851	DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT FOR COST LITIGATION; MAKE CHANGES INCORPORATING CONVERSATIONS WITH ██████████
11/8/2011	2	460	REVIEW AMENDED COST AGREEMENT
11/8/2011	4	920	MAKE CHANGES TO PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT IN COST LITIGATION; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████
11/9/2011	1	230	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: REVIEW OF PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT IN COST LITIGATION; ADOPT CHANGES TO PROPOSED SETTLEMENT DOCUMENT; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ██████████
11/11/2011	1	230	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL; DRAFT RESPONSE TO SAID CORRESPONDENCE; MAKE CHANGES TO PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT IN COST LITIGATION
11/16/2011	3	690	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE RE: COST LITIGATION
11/17/2011	4.8	989	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS HEARING OFFICER RE: REVIEW OF PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: SAME; DRAFT NEW VERSION OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT BASED UPON MEETING WITH COST ATTORNEYS AND HEARING OFFICER
11/30/2011	1	230	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████ RE: PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT IN COST LITIGATION; MAKE CHANGES TO PROPOSED SETTLEMENT
12/6/2011	0.8	184	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ██████████ RE: COST LITIGATION; WORK ON SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT
12/15/2011	1.8	414	WORK ON EXHIBITS TO COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT

12/20/2011	2.5	575	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: EXHIBITS FOR COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ██████████ RE: SAME; DRAFT EXHIBITS
12/21/2011	2	460	DRAFT EXHIBITS FOR COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; REVIEW PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT FOR ANY ADDITIONAL CHANGES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: SAME; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: SAME
1/5/2012	0.3	69	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: STATUS OF COST LITIGATION
1/12/2012	0.3	69	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: COST LITIGATION
2/1/2012	1	230	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CHANGES PROPOSED BY OPPOSING COUNSEL TO COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT
2/2/2012	0.5	115	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: REVIEW OF PROPOSED CHANGES BY OPPOSING COUNSEL TO COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT
2/3/2012	0.3	69	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: COST LITIGATION
2/13/2012	1	230	PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION RE: PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT
2/14/2012	2	460	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: DRAFTING REVISIONS TO PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT FOR COST LITIGATION
2/15/2012	0.2	46	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION
2/21/2012	0.3	69	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: COST SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL
2/29/2012	0.4	92	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: COST LITIGATION; RESPOND TO SAME
3/7/2012	2.5	575	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION; REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND DRAFT OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; DRAFT RESPONSE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL CORRESPONDENCE
3/8/2012	3.5	805	REVIEW AND ANALYZE LATEST VERSION OF PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RECEIVED FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION; DRAFT PROPOSED CHANGES AND REVISIONS TO DOCUMENT
3/9/2012	1.2	276	REVIEW AND ANALYZE PROPOSED CHANGES TO EXHIBITS TO PROPOSED COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RECEIVED FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL
3/13/2012	2.3	529	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: PROPOSED COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; REVIEW DRAFT OF AGREEMENT, MAKE CHANGES TO DRAFT AGREEMENT; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL COUNSEL RE: SAME

3/16/2012	1.5	345	REVIEW FINAL CHANGES TO COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: SAME
3/19/2012	0.3	69	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION
3/20/2012	0.6	138	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL IN COST LITIGATION; REPLY TO SAME
3/22/2012	0.5	115	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM HEARING OFFICER IN COST LITIGATION; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████ RE: STATUS OF COST LITIGATION
4/12/2012	1.5	345	REVIEW AND ANALYZE PROPOSED CHANGES TO COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT MADE BY OPPOSING COUNSEL; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████ RE: SAME
4/20/2012	0.5	115	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ██████████ RE: PROPOSED COST SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL; REVIEW PROPOSED AGREEMENT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████
4/20/2012	0.5	115	██████████ RE: SAME
4/24/2012	0.3	69	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: COST SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL DRAFT ██████████ FOR COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; REVIEW FINAL DRAFT OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: SETTLEMENT
4/26/2012	1.3	299	AGREEMENT
4/27/2012	0.8	184	WORK ON COST SETTLEMENT
4/30/2012	0.3	69	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: COST SETTLEMENT
5/7/2012	0.6	138	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION; REVIEW RESPONSE; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████
5/9/2012	0.3	69	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION
5/15/2012	0.5	115	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: COST LITIGATION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: SAME; DRAFT RESPONSE CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL
5/17/2012	0.4	92	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ██████████ RE: COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; RESPOND TO SAME
6/1/2012	0.5	115	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: COST LITIGATION; LEAVE VOICE MESSAGE FOR ██████████
6/4/2012	0.3	69	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ RE: COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT
6/15/2012	0.8	69	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL IN COST LITIGATION RE: PROPOSED SETTLEMENT

			TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE: COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT;
6/25/2012	0.7	161	WORK ON SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT
6/29/2012	1	230	WORK ON SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT FOR COST LITIGATION
7/2/2012	1.3	299	WORK ON COST SETTLEMENT ISSUES
7/3/2012	0.8	184	REVIEW SETTLEMENT ISSUES AND DOCUMENTS IN COST LITIGATION
			REVIEW MOST RECENT VERSION OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT OF COST LITIGATION RECEIVED FROM
7/5/2012	1.5	345	OPPOSING COUNSEL
			TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] RE: PROPOSED SETTLEMENT OF COST
			LITIGATION; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: PROPOSED SETTLEMENT
7/6/2012	1	230	AGREEMENT; RESPOND TO SAME
			PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH STATE BOARD OF ELECTIONS HEARING OFFICER RE:
7/10/2012	3	690	COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT
7/11/2012	0.7	161	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO [REDACTED] RE: COST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT
7/27/2012	0.3	69	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: COST SETTLEMENT
Total	719.45	\$ 156,007.00	



Elaine Geallis <egeallis@glenbrook225.org>

Re: Freedom of Information Act Request

1 message

Rosanne Marie Williamson <rwilliamson@glenbrook225.org>

Thu, Sep 13, 2012 at 12:45 PM

To: Vinsheka Simpson <vinsheka.simpson@gmail.com>

Bcc: egeallis@glenbrook225.org

Dear Mr. Asante,

Thank you for writing to Glenbrook High School District 225 with your request for information pursuant to the Illinois Freedom of Information Act, 5 ILCS 140/1 et seq.

On 9/11/12 you requested the following documents:

- information of all employees of schools offering Supplemental Educational Services (SES) be provided to our organization:

- Full Employee Name
- School district assigned email address
- School Site presently employed
- Grade/subject taught or title of position employed
- Physical Address of School Site employed

Please find the information requested on our website at:

[http://www.glenbrook225.org/gbs/Staff-Directory-\(GBS\)](http://www.glenbrook225.org/gbs/Staff-Directory-(GBS))

Sincerely,

Rosanne Williamson, Ed.D.
Secretary, Board of Education
Assistant Superintendent for Educational Services
Glenbrook High School District 225
3801 West Lake Avenue
Glenview, IL 60026

On Tue, Sep 11, 2012 at 2:24 PM, Vinsheka Simpson <vinsheka.simpson@gmail.com> wrote:

Good Afternoon,

On behalf of Mr. Kwame I. Asante, please see attached the FOIA request.

Thanks!

--

Vin C. Simpson

The Achievement Academy

Dr. Rosanne Williamson
3801 West Lake Ave., Suite 203
Glenview, IL 60026
P: (847) 998-6100
F: (847) 486-4733
E: foia@glenbrook225.org

Re: Freedom of Information Act Request

Dear Dr. Williamson:

This is a request under the Freedom of Information Act.
I request that a copy of the following documents or information of all employees of schools offering Supplemental Educational Services (SES) be provided to our organization:

Full Employee Name
School district assigned email address
School Site presently employed
Grade/subject taught or title of position employed
Physical Address of School Site employed

In order to help to determine my status for purposes of determining the applicability of any fees, you should know that I am a representative affiliated with the NAACP, a non-profit organization and I am seeking information for use in our education resource guide.

I request a waiver of all fees for this request. Disclosure of the requested information to me is in the public interest because it is likely to contribute significantly to public understanding of the staffing operations or employees of schools and is not primarily in my commercial interest.

I request that the information I seek be provided in electronic format, and I would like to receive it on a personal computer disk [or a CD-ROM] or emailed to **kasante1@cox.net**.

I ask that my request receive expedited processing because of the inclusion of the following information in public information disseminated to parents in the furtherance of education opportunities. The urgency to inform the public concerning the need to easily access information relative to their child's schools should correspond with the start of school which has currently commenced.

I also include a telephone number at which I can be contacted during the hours of 8am -4pm if necessary, to discuss any aspect of my request. As a courtesy, a copy of the Freedom of Information Act State Law has been included.

Thank you for your consideration of this request.

Sincerely,

/s/ Kwame Asante'

Kwame Asante, Esq.
1150 Florida Blvd.
Baton Rouge, LA 70802
225-214-7804 Office
225-214-7801 Fax

Under the Illinois Freedom of Information Act (5 ILCS 140), records in possession of public agencies may be accessed by the public upon written request. Pursuant to 5 ILCS 140, Section 2(c), a public record is any records, reports, forms, writings, letters, memoranda, books, papers, maps, photographs, cards, tapes, recordings, electronic data processing records, recorded information and all other documentary materials, regardless of physical form or characteristics, having been prepared, or having been or being used, received, possessed or under the control of any public body. Records that are not subject to release via the FOIA process include confidential and trade secret information.