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Elaine Geallis <egeallis@glenbrook225.org>

Re: FOIA Request 
1 message

Rosanne Marie Williamson <rwilliamson@glenbrook225.org> Thu, Jun 23, 2016 at 5:50 PM
To: "Roy F. McCampbell" <royfmc@aol.com>

Dear Mr. McCampbell, 

Thank you for writing to Glenbrook High School  District 225 with your request for information pursuant to the Illinois
Freedom of Information Act, 5 ILCS 140/1 et seq.  

On 6/8//2016 we received your request for the following information: 

       A copy of all invoices for legal services for the period of January 1, 2014 through May 31, 2016. I am requesting
these documents in electronic format. 

The School District extended the time to respond to June 23, 2016 pursuant to Section 3(e) of the FOIA because:

·       The request requires the collection of a substantial number of specified records

·        The  requested  records  require  examination  and  evaluation  by  personnel  having  the  necessary  competence  and
discretion to determine if they are exempt from disclosure or should be redacted

District response:      Please see attached.

Rosanne Williamson Ed.D.

Assistant Superintendent for Educational Services

Glenbrook H.S. District 225

3801 West Lake Ave.

Glenview, IL 60026

847­486­4701

On Wed, Jun 8, 2016 at 4:24 PM, 'Roy F. McCampbell' via FOIA <Foia@glenbrook225.org> wrote: 
A copy of all invoices for legal services for the period of January 1, 2014 through May 31, 2016. I am requesting these
documents in electronic format. 

This request is for non commercial purposes. 

Roy F. McCampbell  

708/878­7957 

Roy F. McCampbell
Sent from my iPad

­­ 
Rosanne Williamson Ed.D.
Assistant Superintendent for Educational Services

tel:847-486-4701
mailto:Foia@glenbrook225.org
tel:708/878-7957
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Glenbrook H.S. District 225
3801 West Lake Ave.
Glenview, IL 60026
847­486­4701

11 attachments

3.pdf
454K

4.pdf
692K

5.pdf
561K

6.pdf
925K

1.pdf
501K

2.pdf
536K

Redacted FOIA Legal Bill­ SRAGA.pdf
1840K

RedactedMisc.pdf
388K

Engler, Callaway,  Baasten & Sraga.pdf 
573K

McGladrey & McDonald Hopkins.pdf
618K

Redacted FOIA Legal Bill­ HODGES.pdf
466K
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1'.0 llOX 81355 
( 'l 'IC' >.Gl l ILLI ~(JI~ 6:V,~' -"l."S 

l' •.X" \YER 11) a Ji-2~ I \.l?~ 

Jnnuary 2, 2014 RECEJVEO rfJ,J [I 3 2014 
Elillcdllirough 12131/2013 
Invoice No. 34266 
Client number 26670 JDP 
Maller number 00000 

3801 \\'. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
CLENVIEW, JL 60026 

~( HOUI, LA II' 

l"OTAL FEl::S 

COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER 

PLEASF. REMIT P/1 YMDJT TO: 
Scariano, H,mc, & l'ctrn1ca 

P.O. llOX 8135:\ 
CHICAGO, IL 601,S 1·0355 

Fo1 131lling or Paynient Inquiries, contott AccoL0"1i11g al (J 11) 565-31 00 "-" 161 

$7,337 00 
5366.85 

S7,i03.85 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

l'.0 BOX ~13;5 
Cl I IC A\iO, ILLINOI~ 606~ 1-11155 

l'i\Xl'A YER It) 1 ]6-:!~1342~ 

roll IJll.1.1'1(; INQUIR1£S CONTACT .\CCOUJ•,'"111''(1 .\ I 1.lll) 5r,5.1100 "" l(,1 

Jamtaiy 2, 2014 

Bil ling thro.,gh I 213 1120 I 3 
Invoice No. 34266 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE. SUITE 200 
GU::NVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR l'ROFESSJONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
12102/20 13 

12/03/2013 

12/04/2013 

12104/2013 

12/04/2013 

12/04/2013 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WIT!! 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDEN._. 
REc PERSONNEL MATTERS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCES \VITH 
ASSOCTA TE SUPERINTENDENT~ 
DRAFT RESIGNATION AGREEMENT; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSOCIATE 
SUPERINTENDENT.- RE. 
GROUNDS EMPLOYEE DISMJSSALS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
,\SSOCIA TE SUPERINTENDENT~ 
DRAFTCORRESl'ONDENCE TO ATTORNEY, 
REVIEW RESPONSE; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSOCIATE 
SUPERINTENDENT RFVIFW 
HANDBOOK RE..-IJISMISSAL 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM DISTRICT; 
ANALYZE EMPLOYEE ATTENDA1''CE ISSUE 
RE, ....... 

DRAFT AND REVIEW OPINION LETTER TO 
ASSOCIATE SUPERJNTENDENT~ 
RE; FMLA LEAVE PROCESSING 

REVIEW IMPACT AND 8ARGAINJNG 
AGREEMENT !SSUES RE: PENSION REFORM 
,\ND CALCUl,A TION QUESTIONS 

Client Number 26670 
Matier Number 00000 

0.20 1i,s_(c $46.oo 

2 IO hrs.-¢:.- S483.00 

0 90 br~ $207.00 

0.30 h,s.~ S69.00 

1.30 hr~=(__- S299.00 

O.JO 1,,-~ S69.00 



Z0(,7" 

12105/2013 

12/05/2013 

121051201] 

1211(112013 

12'1012013 

12'11/2013 

1211112013 

12-'12/2013 

12/1212013 

DJ\ 1 RIC'l 22.< - COOK COUNTY lmo,c, f;,,,nl,c, ;,)(,6 

REVIEW OPTIONS: TELEPHONE 
CO\:FERE:\:CE WITH ASSOCIATE 
SUPERlNTLNDENT AND 
ASSOCIATE PRINCIPAL RE· CUSTODIAN 
SICK LEAVE ISSUE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT~ 
ASSIST ANT PRINCIPAL AND 
JNSTRUCTIONAL SUPERVISOR RE· 
TEACHER REMEDIATION 

REVIEW HANDBOOK; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ATTORNEY: DRAfT ADDJTIQ:,.IAL 
AGREEMENT LANGUAGE, DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSOCIATE 
SUPERINTENDENT RE~ 

TE:.EPl·!ONE CONFERENCE\\ ITH 
ASSOCJA TE SUPERINTENDENT-­
RE:~ 

REVISE AGREEMENT, DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ATrORNEY RE· _, 
REVIEW EVALUATION DOCUMENTS FROM 
DISTRICT RE: TEACHER R!,MEDIA TION 

REVIEW TRS PENSION LEGISLATION IN 
PREPARATION l'OR TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH ADMINISTRATION 

CONTINUED REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS 
FROM DISTRICT RE: TEA CI IER 
REMEDIATION -. 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
SUPERINTENDENT RIGGLE RE: BOARD 
ACTION TO APPROVE EMPLOYEE 
RES!GNAT!ON AGREEMENTS 

REVIEW DISTRICT DOCUMENTS RE; 
CERTil'IED EMPLOYEE RETIREMENT 
ELECTION; TELEPHONE CONFER ENC<: 
WITH ADMINISTRATION REc SAME 

•• 

0.50 1,,,-;4(__ S 115.00 

0.40 hrs,-,{(.__ $92.00 

$253.00 

0.20h,~ q:,_(10 

0.30 lu·~ $69.00 

O.SOhr~C $184.00 

0.40 hl"S. l! G $92.00 

U.40 hrs. c;{G $92.00 

0.30 brs. 
.,.,. J'. 

$6D.OO 

I 20 hrs. ~$276 00 



;'.(,(,7[1 

11/12/2013 

12/1212013 

1211212013 

12/13/2013 

12113/2013 

12/1512013 

12/1612013 

12/1612013 

1211612013 

DrYI RJC i ll< - COOK COlJ'sTY 

WORK ON SUMMA TIVE EVALUATION 
DRAFT; REVIEW BARGAINING 
AGREEMENT; IDENTIFY 11'FOR~1ATTO:S 
NEEDS RE, ~REMEDIATION 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ATTORNEY; REVIEW AGREEMENT: DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO An·oRNEY AND 
ASSOCIATE SUPERTNTENDENT CALIENDO 
RE·4111m1J 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: GROUNDS 
EMPLOYEE RESIGNATIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. 
~REVISE EVALUATION DOCUMENTS; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MS.--.. 
RE:.--.REMEDIATION 

WORK 0)'; ARGIJMF,7':TS FOR C::.\1PLOYLL 
DISMISSALS RE: GROUNDS EMPLOYEES 

PREPARE FOR DUE PROCESS HEARING 
CONCERNING TERMlNA TION OF GROUNDS 
EMPLOYEES 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCt: FROM 
PRINCJPAL....,AND INVESTIGATORY 
MATERIALS AND PREPARE FOR DISMISS,\L 
HEARING CONCERNING EMPLOYEES 
,....,AND~DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO PRINCIPAL 
._,RE:SAME 

REVIEW ARGUMENTS; DEVELOP POINTS 
SUPPORTING DISMISSAL RE. GROUNDS 
EMPLOYEES DISMISSALS 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MS. 
~DRAFT RESPONSE, REVIEW REPLY 
RE,.....,REMEDIATION 

CONT ACT A TTORNl:'.Y REPRESENTING 
EMPLOYEE~CONCERNING 
DISMISSAL HEARTNG; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH PR!NCIPAL411i1119 
AND ASSOCJATE PRINCIPAL .-.RE: 
PREPARATION FOR EMPLOYEES 

~ANO-HEARINGS; 
REVIEW SUPPORT STAFF EMPLOYEE 
HANDBOOK AND BOARD POLICIES TO 
IDENTIFY POLICIES VIOLATED BY 

10 Im. tG $253.00 

0.30 hrsc-{C......., $69.00 

'"!" f!_ 
0.30 h,s. $69.00 

0.90 hrs. Le, S207.00 

0.]0 111,=(L.. S6'J.CC 

O.SO his.->[(_ $184.00 

$345.00 

0.30 lirs-~c_::...... $69.00 

0.40 hrs. ~ sn.oo 

8.80 l11s-:g,"JIV $2.014.00 



12117/2013 

l~/171:201) 

12/17/2013 

12/18/2013 

IHIH/2013 

12/1812013 

12/18/2013 

12/19/2013 

12/19/2013 

DI.\TRICI 225 - COOK COUNTY l,wo,c, Nu,nhc, .14261, 

EMPLOYEES RE: SAME; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO PRINCIPAL 
~RE. SAM!.:; TEL!cl'HONE 
CONFERENCE WlTH .-.-r 
.... RE:SAME;P~ 
A TT END BOARD MEETING RE. 
TERM INA TlON HEARINGS 

FINAL REVIEW OF SUMMA Tl VE 
EVALUATION; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
T~RE:-­
EVALUATION 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VITH 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT ...... 
RE: GROUNDS EMPLOYEE DlSClPLINE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTIJ 
SUPERINTENDENT~AND 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT....., 
CO~CCR.."J!NG !MPLEME"!T A'! ION Of 
BOARD'S DISCIPLINE Of EMPLOYEES 
.-,AND.-.AND 
CONCERNING RESCISSION OF EMPLOYEE 

~RESIGNATION AGREEMENT: 
~SAME 

REVIEW ST A TUS OF CUSTODIAN 
DISMISSALS 

WORK ON EMPLOYEE RETJREMENT 
CONTRACTS 

TEUOPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSOC IA TE SUPERINTENDENT~ 
RE:~ 

ANALYZE NEW PENSION LAW AND 
CHANGES ·;·o EM PLO i'EE CO"'TRACTS 
NEEDED TO PRESERVE DISTRICT'S EARLY 
RETIREMENT JNCENTJVE 

WORK ON EMPLOYEE RETIREMENT 
AGREEMENTS, TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
WIT! I IEA GENERAL COUNSEi, RE: SA"'1E 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH 
ANO 

ASSOCIATE SUPERrNTENDEN~; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO A TT0Rl\1EY; 
REVJEW RESPONSE: DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ....... 
RE:._. 

0.40 hrs. tG $92 00 

0.30 hrs...{C. $69.00 

1.00 hrs. '7'1£ $230.00 

0.30 hrs~ S69.00 

0.40 hrs. t <;, $92.00 

0.20 l,rs . ./,.- $46.00 

0.30 hrs. /l{; $69.00 

0.80 hrs t_~ $18~00 

0.80 hrs. P, f2.. $ I 84.00 



12/3(112013 

1213012013 

U"'l l<IC I' '"-' - coo~ COUNTY 

DRAFT EMl'LOYEE DUE PROCESS HEARING 
PACKET T[MPLA 1 E A'-iD 
CORRESPONDENCE TO..----
ANALYZE TEACHF.R PENSION LAW 
CHANGES AND DRAFT AGREEMEC,'TS TO 
ENSURE RETIREMENT !NCENTJVE IS 
GRANDFATHERED UNDER NEW LAW 

·1orAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER 

BILLING SUMMARY 

rO'l,\I. l'EES 
COS r ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CIIARGES FOR THIS BILL 

''·'8" ' 

-yo£ ' 0.90 h,s. $_07.00 

1.10 hr<; t; $253 00 

S7,337.00 

$7,337.00 

5366.85 

S7,7UJ.S5 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

February 3, 2014 

Billed through 01131/2014 

Invoice No. 34349 

Client number 

Matter number 

Z6670 

00000 

3801 W. LAKE A VENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MA TIER 

RECEIVED FEB 2 7 2014 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO: 
Scar,ano, Hinies & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 6068l·03SS 

JDP 

, P.O BOX &1355 
S,t:JICA(]O, ILLINOIS 1,063 1-0355 
~ TAXPAYERID#36-1&13423 

SS,037.00 

$251.85 

$S,288.8S 

for Il1lling or Paynient Inquiries; contact Accounting al (312) 565-3100 ext. 261 



SCARIANO, IIlMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNE;YS AT LAW· Cl-!ARTERED 

PO.BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, lLLINOIS 6068 1-0355 

TAX PA YER ID~ 36-2Sl3428 

FOR BILLING INQUIRIES CONTACT ACCOUNTING AT (312) 565-3100 e>:t. 261 

February 3, 2014 
Billing through O 1/3112014 

Invoice No. 34349 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUlTE200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
01/02/2014 REVJEW AND REVISE DRAFT HEARING 

PACKET FOR EMPLOYEE DISCIPLINARY 
HEARINGS 

01/07/2014 

0\/08/2014 

OiiG9i20l<i 

0110912014 

01109/2014 

0110912014 

REVIEW FORMS Al\'D OPTIONS; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT.._.. 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSOCIATE 
SUPERTNTENDENT~RE: NURSE 
EVALUATION AND PROFESSIONAL 
DEVELOPMENT PLAN 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WlT!! 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT .... 
RE: BOARD ACTION~ 

TELEl'llONE CONFERENCE WITH 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: GEA NEGOTIATIONS 
RE: NEW SALARY SCHEDULE 

TELEPHOJ\'E CONFERENCE WITH DR. 
~E. GEA SALARY SCI IEDULE 
DEVELOPMENT 

PREPARE COMMUNICATIONS STYLES 
TRAINING MATERIALS FOR OESSA 
PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT 
COMMITIEE [NO CHARGE PER ATrORNEY 
PETRARCA] 

REVIEW PENSION CODE MODIFJCA'flONS 

Client Number 
Mauer Number 

Z6670 
00000 

. "' 1.00 hrs. 1'Vi ~ $230.00 

0.80 ~ $184.00 

0.20 hrs~ 546.00 

0.40 hrs .. f""\ .(.?. $92.00 

0.50 h~(___ $115.00 

0.50 lrrs. NIC 

1.80 hrs_-)'Yl-tZ-- $414.00 



26610 

01/1012014 

01/1312014 

01/13/2014 

01113/2014 

Ol/1412014 

01114/2014 

0111512014 

Ol/l512014 

0\11612014 

DISTRICT 221 - COOK COU~'TY lnvo,ceNumbcr )4)49 Page 2 

AND DRAFT ADDENDUM TO 
ADM1NJSTRA.TOR CONTRACT TO COMPLY 
WITH REVISED PENSION LAW AND EARLY 
RETIREMENT OPTION INCENTIVES 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSISTANTPRTNCIPAL-..DRAFT 
RESPONSE; REVIEW REPLY; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITI-I ASSOCIATE 
SUPERJNTI;NDENT ..... RE: 
~EDIATJON 

. , " ~"'" J:.'> •. 

BEGIN DRAFTING REMEDIATJON PLAN RE: 
REMEDIATION 

~NDENCEFROM 
~TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCES WITH 
REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND OPTIONS RE: 
GROUNDS EMPLOYEE REMEDIATION 
PLANS 

DRAFT ADMINISTRATOR AND TEACHERS 
CONTRACT ADDENDA RE: NEW PENSION 
LAW AND IMPACT ON BOARD POLICIES 
6100 AND 61 JO AND ANALYZE NEED FOR 
ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTATION FROM 
DISTRICT RE: SAME 

COMPLETE PREPARATION OF DRAFT 
REMEDIATION PLAN DOCUMENTS RE: 

REMEDIATION 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSIST ANT SUPERINTENDENT~ 
RE: MATERJALS NEEDED FOR CONTRACT 
AMENDMENTS CONCERNING EMPLOYEES 
RETIRING UNDER DISIBJCT'S EARLY 
RloTIKEM£Nf INCl:NTIVE 

FINAL REVIEW OF REMEDIATION PLAN; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
EVALUATION TEAM; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH ASSOCIATE 
SUPERINTENDENT ~E: ..... 
REVISE AND REVIEW REMEDIA TJON PLANS 
RE: GROUNDS EMPLOYEE REMEDIATION 
PLANS 

FINAL REVIEW OF GROUNDS EMPLOYEE 
PLANS; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 

c 
0.60 hr~ $138.00 

1.20 hrs~276.00 

1.20 hrs. ('If $276.00 

1.50 hrs. ·,r,? $345.00 

2 50 ~ $575.00 

0.20 hr~ $46.00 

0.40 h~ $92.00 

1.20 hrs. '(J'/ $276.00 

0.20 hrs. t1'f $46.00 



Z007D 

01/1612014 

0112012014 

0112212014 

Ol/2412014 

0112412014 

01130/2014 

0113112014 

01/311:20 14 

DISTR!CT 225 - COOK COUNTY I"'~"' Number )4)49 

PRINCIPAL WEGLEY 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT~ 
RE: RIF QUESTIONS 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT~RE: 
MATERIALS NEEDED FOR CONTRACT 
AMENDMENTS TO PRESERVE DISTRICT'S 
RETIREMENT INCENTIVES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WlTH 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT ....... 
RE:~MEET!NG 

CONFERENCE AND MS. 
~: GEA SALARY SCHEDULE; 
ATTEND MEETING WITH GEA LEADERSHIP 
RE: SAME 

REVIEW CONTRACT MATERIALS FROM 
ASS!STANTSUPERINTENDENT­
AND ANALYZE AMENDMENTS THERETO 
RE: EARLY RETJREMENT OPTION, 
~E CONfERENCEWTTH'9 
._RE: SAME;D~_ 

CORRESl'ONDENCETO.--RE: 
SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: DISTRIBUTION OF 

LITERATURE AT BOARD MEETING 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM PARENT 
FOR DISTRIBUTION AT BOARD MEETING 

RFVJEW CORRESPONDENCE f'RO~ 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT__., 
REVIEW PLAN OPTIONS, DRAFT RESPONSE 
RE.._. 

TOT AL l'EES FOR TI!IS MA1vfER 

O.JOhr~c_ S69.00 

0.20 mri(:::_ $46.00 

0.20h~ $46.00 

6.00 hr~C-SJ,380.00 

0.50 h,w(c.- $115.00 

,., f.'. 
0.30 hrs. $69.00 

'"" -{<: 0.30 hrs. $69.00 

0.40 h~C...-sn.oo 

$5,037 00 



l6610 DISTRICT221 ·COOK COUNTY 

BILL!NG SlJl',,fMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

l"'oicc Numb" J4J49 Page 4 

$5,037.00 
$251.85 

$5,288.85 
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SCARIANO, HllvIES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED l'.0 llOX ~1)55 

( I I IL·\! ,ll 11.1.ll\OI~ Mil,~ I UJ55 
I . \\ I'.\ YI.R 11) " J(d~ i;sw 

!'Oil Bii.LiNG 11'.l)Ull<IES COX I ACT At"(;OU.~TINt. A 1· 1.i 12) 5.,s 3 IOll "" 161 

:.larch 3. 20 14 
Bil I ing through 0212812014 

lmoiee No. _14'.i6} JDP 

130-\IU) OF l'.DUC1\ J"ION 

SCH O. 

J8UI W. \.AKI' AVENUl:. 200 
(iLENVIE\V, IL 601126 

, .. 

SCI IOOL LA\\' 

f(JI{ PROFESSiC';',\I. 
0211J312014 

02/ll5i20 14 

02106 1201-1 

021121101~ 

02ii1/2014 

COMPLAINT 

Tl:t.EPHONL' CONFER[NC'E WITH 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT~ 
REVIIC\V CORRESl'ONl)I- NCE I RO:vl 

ASSOCIATE SllPCIUNl EN DENT -­
ORAi' i RESPO)',..Slc RF. TRANSGENllL-.R AN\l 
PERA JSSIJl'S 

TELEP! 10;-..;E CONFERENCE \VITI l 
ASSOCIATE SL'l'FRINTICNDENT ._ 
RE:.-.l'ERFOR:-..1ANCE 
l·.Xl'l,(TA LIONS 

'II ''Ii ·.'.'C<)JlR.''~!'(~·.nr~:.·,. H"1'! 
c\SSulli\TE SUP-ER-1'.\'TE;_,,DEl'<T~ 
URAFT Rl:Sl'ONSE; R1-v11-:w lffPI.Y IH'.: 
PART-TIME EMPLOYEE RlF QUESTIONS 

TELEPl!ONE CON!'ERJ..'NC..E \VJTI-l !EA 
Rl;.PRESLCNTt\'I IVL RF· ! 1-.,\C!I 1:1< 
RESIGNATION ANlJ DOCUMENTS RL SAME 

wrnu.,: ON AMENDMENT ro t\SSJSTANT 
SUPrR1t,n ENDENl CON"f RA(T 

\\'ORK 0"-J ,\MENDMEJ\.T ·1 Cl 
ADM!NlSTRA TOR CONTR,\Cl 

Client Numbe, 

;Vinlter Number 

/.6670 
00000 

o.30 hrs --;vr,-1!- sm.oo 

0.60 Ins...-/(__ $1'.l&OIJ 

O .. lO h~C-- $6Q.OO 

O SO lu~ $18·1 00 

OJO lors.r"-L %9.00 

0. \II hrs. 'Y"" -(( S6<J.ll0 



26" ]fl 

02/1212014 

02/1312014 

02/13/201-1 

02113no1-1 

02119/2014 

02/2(112014 

02/20!20 I 4 

0)1211201·1 

02/21/2014 

02/2112014 

02 121/201·1 

02124/20 I .J 

D'> rn,c r l.ll . corn; crn1N1 ,. '"'""'~'""''" .11.<G.l 

!Tl.EPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSOClATE SUPERJNTENDENT~ 
URA FT S/\ivl Pl. F. [X l'l'l"'f"rl '!10},,S '.'<0 I t(' IC: 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WlTll !EA 
REPRESENTATIVI\ RE:~ 

WORK ON OPINION R£: RII' 01· l'ART--1 IME 
TENURED TEACHERS 

l{I·.: COMi\·1UNITY 
BOUNDARY TASK FORCE 

REVIEW OPTIONS: DRAFT 
CORRESl'ONDl·.NCE TO ,\SSOCIA 11~ 
SUPERfl'.JTENDENT ._. RE: 
PA.In - rlMI' n:ACHER RII GROUPING 

REVl[.W CURRr,NT ISSC'FS ro PREPARF 
FOR ADMINISTRATOR CUN FERENCE CALL 
1, 1;_ ;;Tu n,:,.r: fR,\ N sc; r_ ~1 ;)I ::, ISSl' ;'$ 

RICVIEW CORRF.SPONlJENCfc FROM JU\ 
REPRESENT A TJVE; DRAFT RESPONSE RE: 

~ 
n;1.LPHONE CONFERL,-icr WI rH 
ASSOCIATE SllPERlNTENDENT~ 
A:-<D ,\[)MINIS rRA TORS RE: STL.'IJEN r 
TRANSGENDER ISSUES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \YITll 
~f.c BOARD WORIZSflOI' 

'l"EI.EPHONf'. COC\FlORENCl: Wll H 
ASSOClA TE SUPERINTENDENT...., 
R.li: PEil A AND Rlr QUES rio:-.s 

RFV I~\\ CA Sb AND 01' l'IONS I-OR 
ADlJRESSlNG lNVOL\1-:-ST ARY REDUCTIOl's 
TO PART-Tlr-ff ~ l"ATLJS RI·:· Tl-./,CH[R 
l>l.'MPING QUESI'l01' 

TEl.EPI IONE co:,,:FERF'\JCE \\'ITI I 
ASSOCI-\TI·. SUl'l:RIN'l'Li\DU'tl ~ 
RE: NURSE REMEDIATION AND BUMPING 
QIJES I ION 

REVIEW 01' l"IONS FOR IIDDRf:SSING 
PART-TIME TEACHER JOB REALIGN.\.tEl\l 
1'0SSll311.I I-Y RE: BUMPING ISSUE 

o.so il"a(G ~ 1 s4_00 

IJ.40 hr~ 'i,92.0H 

0.30 hrs. ("l .f(.. $69.00 

0.20111~ 

IJ.4() hr};,(C.... $92.()0 

$46.()0 

$21l7.110 

0.30 h,-,_71'.,.e. $69 00 

0.50 hr~ ~ 11 ~.llll 

0.811 111~ SIR~.Oll 

0 ~() 1,r~ $16.IJO 

0.40 111·,-E-" $92 (10 



ZMJO 

0212512014 

02125/201·1 

02/2512()1--1 

02/25/20 1,1 

02/2612014 

112127/2014 

o~,2s1201,1 

Ill> r ••c L" ,,, - cou~ COUNTY 

REVIEW CORRLSl'ONDENCE f'ROM 
ASSOCIATE SlJPERJNTENDENT..._ 
ltCV!l-:W DOCUMl'KTS fRCM DJS l"RICT; 
TELEPI-IONE CONFERENCE WIT! I 
ADMINISTRATORS RE,... 
REMEDIATION 

REVIEW AND REVISE SUMMATJVE 
lV ALU,\ I ION: DRAFT CORKLSPONDI01'<CI. 
TO EVALUATORS RE.~ 
REMlODIArlON 

RL-.Vlf-_ W Ol'TIONS l'OR /\ODRFSSIN(j 
TRANSGENDER ST! TD ENT ISSUES 

ANALYZE TRANSGENDER S flJDENT 
M,\TlTRS 

IUOVI t.W CORRESl'ONDl:NCl FROM 
DISTRICT; REVJSE AND RJ..VJSE 
[\',\LU,\ 1"10:-S: URA:· I :'.°')l{Ri.Si'O!'D: "Cl. 
TO EVALUATORS RE:~ 
RICMl,DIA TION 

·:.!,i,lrilii,li,l;;!~.!~.££!.!:!.!:YR 1-.NC le WITI I 
~RE· (jfA :-.JEGOTJA no:-.:s 

rELEPl IONE CONFERENCE WITH 
~RF: Giel\ NEGOrit\'rlONS 

TOTAL FEES FOR Tl IIS :-..-1A TTEI{ 

1.10 lors.46 

0.50 hr,.~ 

0.50 bry~ 

ruo 111'.s. T"f. 

0.30 hrs. I"' I!-. 

l)ISilURSJ;MFN'I S 
l'EBRl)ARY 201·1 l.l'GII I. RESL':ARCH CH,\RC;l,S Rl:: SD 225 (C) RI I· 

QUESTION 

$253.00 

$69.0(1 

$115.00 

$115.110 

$69.00 

569.00 

$2,898.00 

$"/8.80 

-- -----------
}UI AL Ul'>Hl}RSf::\-1EN rs roR Tl-U$. ~L\FI E.R $78 80 



Z661'l lllSl RIC I ,2; - (00~ COUN'I Y 

811,J_JNG SLJM)l.1ARY 

TOTAL FEES 
TOT AL DISBURSEMENTS 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL Cl-lAR(JES FOR TIJIS J)]J.L 

''""'" ~,,mh" _U;h.l 

S2,8'J8.0II 

$78.80 
,;144_90 

$3,111.70 



SCARIANO, Hli\1ES and PETl{ARCA ----------- .----

BOARD OF FOIJCA 110~ 

April J.2014 

Bille,! thro~gh 
Invoice N,,. 
Client numl~,r 

;l.1ancr mm1h~r 

0313112014 

34687 

Z6670 

000{)0 

/ 

JOI' 

1'0 no., t;.1,., 
CHICA<:O 111 l'slllS 60(,Si-ll1.S'i 

1 \~ l'•\ \ rn 111 , 16<'81 _;.,n 

RECEIVED I\PR 2 3 Z014 

SCI lOOL LAW 

·101-ALH.l·:S 
\()I ,\I. l)ISIJURSl:MEN rs 
COST Al U)\\'ANCE 

TOTAL Cl IARGES FOR nus MA TTEt{ 

-------l'i Ci\Sl·. l(f-'MI I l'AYMENf 10: 
Sca,,a,w. I [jmcs & )'~1rarcn 

I' 0. 80X 81355 
C'l llC ,\CO. !I. '1!1681-03).' 

$5,~97 00 
S 18 ·15 

~~74.85 



SCARIANO, Hll\'IES and PF.TR/\RC/\ 
AllORl'.[.ISAI LAY,' CHARTER,-[) ,,,, n,;,x 1::' ,­

c;;1c.,r,\1_ 11.1.1:-srn~<,0(,~1.0J; 
I IIXI',\ YL'H 10 a 36-lSIJ> ~ 

FOR lllLI.ING 11\QUIRTES (.'ONl ACT lllTOlJI-J"I ING ,\T (] 111 ;r,5- J I (IU c,1. "61 

April l.2014 

Billin~ through UJ/11/2014 

!11voicc No. 34687 JDP 

110-\RD 01' EDL:(' A I ION 

3 01 V,' 1./\KF AVl·.NUI-.. <;UilT.200 

(iLENYIEW, IL 60026 

SCHC'OL J.A \V 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
RLVll,W CASE Li\ W ,\ND Al'l'I .ICAUUC 01104/2014 

0310512014 

(131051201-1 

~3106/20 14 

111!06i21J 14 

031(16/:014 

(13.'06,'~014 

ST A TUTES/REG!JLA T!ONS A)';D ANALYZE 
l'R /\NSCFNDFR STUDENT ISSUES 

Rl,VI t.\V 01' I IONS FOR Al)()Rl'SSING 
STUOE}·tr ISSUES RE: T J{ANSGENDF.R 

ANALYZF TRANSGENDER STUDENT 
ISSU l,S A:,.,'[) REVIEW APl'i .lCA!.ll E CASlO 
AND STATUTORY LAW: DRAFT 
c.1EMORANl)LJM RE: SAMI-: 

ITI F.l'HON[ CONf'l'.R['.',i(T WI rH ~ts 
.... RE: JOlNT PROJECT RE: 
BOUl'\[)1\RY CH/\NGE STUDY 

Rr:v1 I· W CORRESl'ONDFNCI-. FRO~l 
ASSUCIATE SIJPERINTLNDENT ~ 
RICVll·W DOCUMENTS: DRAFT RESPONSES 
RE: PROH.\ J"IONARY DJSMISS,\LS 

REVl~W OPTIONS FOR ADDRESSING 
TR ·\NSGI .NDFR S l"l.f)FYI IC,SUES 

ff.I CPHOl\'10 CONFERENCE wn 11 
,\SSOCIATE SlJPERr.--TENDENT ..... 
IH .. RII· (.,)UF.STIONS 

lll{AI I ,\ND Rl:VI l'W Rlr RESOl .l n IONS. 
DRAFT CORl{!::Sl'ONDFNCE TO ASSOC IA TE 
SUPl;Rl'>Jl ENDLNl~RE: RIF 

Client Nu,nber Z6670 

MatlCt' '.'>Jum\:,er 00000 

1.20 hr.;.,,/L--- $176.00 

o.~11 hrs<t(C..... $92.llO 

3.Jo 11r'4c__. 5759_00 

0.40 1,,.,)'11-tZ $9~.oo 

ow 1i,-,1c· s 1.rn.111, 

0.30 i,r<n{C sM.oo 

OAO hr~ S<J~ 1111 



l.M10 

03/0612014 

03/12/2014 

0311212014 

()311212014 

OJ/12/2014 

OJ/14/2014 

OJ/l412014 

03117/201<1 

0311712014 

03117no14 

0311800H 

Im, 11{1('T l.'S • COOK CC lUN I Y 

l<LSOLlJ flUNS 

REVIEW ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS FR0:'-.1 
[)I STRICT RE:~l<Uv1EDIATION 

WORK ON~ CON rR.A I 
AMENDMENT 

REVIEW CONTRACT A?'>JD OPTJOKS FOR 
AlJDRlcSSING l'LNSIO~. l<l]-"ORM ISSLI-S RI-.: 
-RETIREMENr 

R.E\'JEW OPTIONS FOR Rl'.VISIO;,..:S TO 
ADMINIS l"R,\ I OR CON rRAC rs Rt.:. 
PENSION REFORM CONTRACT I SSC ES 

CONTR/\CTS ANO IMl'AC' r 01· N~W 
PEN'-ION LAW ON THOSE 
,\D\11~11s rn.td'ORS \VHO HA Vl: r:LECI ED 
Tl IE DIS"] ]{]CT'S RETmE.\-lENT l1'"CE:--n1VE 

\\OllK ON RESPO:-SSE TO A TIORNF.Y 
CORRl'SPONDENCE Rt. DISMISS,\L OF 
NURSE EMPLOYEES 

WORK ON AMENDMHITTO 
,\0\11NIS 1 R,Yl'OR co~ fRACl S 

l{l·.VII'\\' RLSl'ONSIC IO~ ·\'I' I ORN LY 
u=n 1-.1, 

REVIEW LETTER AND0PTIONS FOR 
RESPONSE: DR,\IT RESl'ONSI·: AN IJ 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSOC!,\ TE 
S\Jl'ICRl:,JTENDEN·r~RI::._. 
ATTOR'.'JEY LETTER 

TELEP I IONE CONFERE:--.:CES \\"!Tl T 

.'1SSOCI./\TE SUP.-kRIN'rl'.NDf-N'I ....... 
RE. PERSOl\'NEL "'1A TIERS AND 
Rl:Dl:CTION IN f-ORCE QUES'J IONS 

Rl:Vl l'.W I.A YOFF !. IS I FROM lJIS fRICT: 
rELEf'IIO'lE CONrERf1'CE \VIT(l 
ASSOC I A TL SUl'ERI N 11,:-.JlJE'lT...-. 

0.30 hr~ $69.00 

0.30 hr.s{C.... 569.00 

$46.00 

$69.00 

3 80 I~ $874.00 

0.111 hrsr::fV $69.00 

(1.40 hrs. 'yvl.-;( $9J.00 

0.30 1,r~ $69.00 

(J_j[) lu·,...,{C- !511:iOO 

OAO lma(C $92.0il 

5~07.00 



0311812014 

03/19/201·1 

03120/201-1 

0312012014 

03121/201,1 

03/2M,Ol·I 

0312:i/2014 

03127/20 14 

rm, TRI( I 21; - ( ()()~ (Ull~ 1 y 

;'R[i'AKi:o S".Ml'i. F DOC<. :,fE}t-~ R£. 
REDUCTION IN FOl{CF ANL) GROUPING 

LISTS 

REVIEW CONSULT!NG TEACHER OPTIONS 
KE:~KEMH)I,\ rlON 

TELEPHONE CONFERE'iCI. \\•l fH 
ASSOCIATE S\JPERINTENDEN~ 
l{f.· REDUCTION IN r:c11UTQL'F.STIONS 

CONFERfCNCE \Iii fl-{ 
BOARD WORKSHOP ON tv[EETIN(J 
EFFl-.CTIVl:NFSS. Gfc/1 N ICGOTIA'i IONS A Nil 

E:--JROLLMENT STUDY 

TELEPI IONE CONFERENCE \VITI! 
ASSOCIATE SUl'f,KINTLNDFN I~ 
WORK ON ..... RE\lEDIATlON PLAN RE· 

~CMEDl/11 ION 

REVl~;W CORRESP01'DENCC FROM 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT~ 
DRAFT REMICDJATIO'-< Pl.AN, llRAl-'T 
CORRESPO:,JDEl\"CE TO 1\SSOCIA TE 
~UPLoRINTFNDEN'l..-,RE; 
CONSUL TING TEACllER RE...., 
REi\-lEDIATION 

Rl:VIEW CORRU,l'ONl)ENCl l'R0_\,1 
ASSIST ANT PRINCIPAL-REVISE 
REMEDIATION PLAN: DR,\FT 
CORRESPQ}<DENCE TO,\ <;SOCIA TE 
SUPl'.RIN fENDJ..:'-.J l - 11-.1.FPHONI; 
CONFERENCE WITIJ ASS()CIATE 
~Ul'I .RINTENDION'I 
REMFDJATJON 

REV] lo W CORRE'>l'ON[J!:.NCE FROt\-1 
ASSISTA>JT l'RIN_CIPAL~llRI\I· 
RESPONSE RE..--.REMEDIATIO}l 

TELET'llONE CONFERENCE \\'ITI I 
ASSOCIA'l'lO SUPl'.RIN I EN DEN-~ 
RE:~XlNDUt:1 ISSUES -

,.,,,,, J 

0.20 ],r~ $46.00 

0.20 hr~ $,16.00 

J.50 hrs. 7'I\ f!- 5805.00 

1.1 IJ llrrfl:..-- $253.00 

2.50 1,P7(:__ $575.110 

0.90 h~_ S'n7.00 

0.201~ $46.0IJ 

S4r,.OO 

$5.497 .Oil 
TOTAL FEC".S FOR TJ-IIS MATTER 

OISBURSl::'.M!:1':TS @ 
MARCI I 2d ,4 LEC,AL l<ESl'ARCI I CI IAl<C.E\ RE: SD 225(C I {) ,.'J 
1RA'sS<Jl:NDER /\NAI.YSIS -1--r 



u,, 11un "·' -com: coL'NTY 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS FOR TlilS MA TIER 

Bii.LiNG SUMMAKY 

TOTAL l'EES 
TOTAi. DISfl\JRSEMENTS 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL (l-JARGES FOR nus BILL 

'''"' .j 

'578 . .15 

$5_497.00 

.'1,78.~5 

5274.85 

$5,S50.30 



SCARlANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CKARTERED 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

I 
GLENVIEW, lL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

Mayl,2014 
Billed through 04/30/20 14 

lnvoice No. 
Client number 

Matter munber 

34826 
7...6670 
00000 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER 

' 

I 
/ 

m, 

RECE/'1 

P.O. IJOX Sl35S 
CHICAGO, lLLINOIS 60681-0355 

TAXPAYER ID# 36·2813428 

·~v202014 

$6,877.00 
$343.85 

S7,220.85 

JC ... 
11.f};f , / 

PLEASE REM!T PAYMENT TO: 
Scariano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

For Il1lling or Payment Inquiries; contact Accounting at (312) 565-3100 e;<t. 261 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

PO. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60681·0355 

TAXPAYER lD # 36-2813428 

FOR BILLING INQUIRJES CONT A Cf ACCOUNTJNG AT(312) 565·3100e.t. 261 

May 1, 2014 

Billing through 04/30/20 l 4 
Invoice No. 34826 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

UE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERE~~D;:~::~·· 
04/01/2014 ATIEND MEETING WITH 

AND BOARD II lb ii RE: BOARD 

04/03/2014 

04/04/2014 

04/09/2014 

04/09/2014 

04/09/2014 

04/10/2014 

04/10/2014 

WORKSHOP; ATTEND GEA NEGOTIATIONS 
SESSION 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
tE: ADMINISTRATOR 

TELEPHOl\'E CONFERENCE WITH 
·: ADMJNISTRATOR 

RETIREMENT CO NTH.ACTS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: BOARD MEETING 

WORKSHOP PREPARATION 

REVIEW SCHOOL CODE REQUIREMENTS 
RE: TEACHER REMEDIATION; 
CORRESPONDENC~RE: 
SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTEND£~ 
RE-REMEDIATION . 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH IASB 
REPRESENTATIVE RE: BOARD WORKSHOP 

TRAINING 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WIT!l 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

26670 

00000 

6.40 hrs. ltf\ f2.s1,472.00 

0.30 hrs. pf!-. $69.00 

0.30 hrs. ,..,_ f!.. $69.00 

0.30 hrs. yfl,f!- 569.00 

0.60 hrs. fY!.{Z. $138.00 

0.20 hrs~ $46.00 

0.40 hrs. ~ .{!._ $92.00 

0.30 hrs,./[... $69.00 



04/14/2014 

04/)4/2014 

04/14/2014 

04/1512014 

04/15/20!4 

04/15/2014 

04116/2014 

04/22/2014 

04/23/2014 

04/24/2014 

04/28/2014 

DISTRICT l.21 • COOK COUNTY [n,·ojc, Number )4826 

ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT .... 
RE: STUDENT TEACHER JS SUE 

PREPARE MATERIALS FOR BOARD 
WORKSHOP OF APRJL 16, 2014 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ADMINISTRATJON AND GEA RE: 
NEGOTIATIONS 

REVrEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSOCIATE SUPERJNTENDEN 
REVIEW REGULA T!ONS AND GUIDANCE; 
DRAFT RESPONSE RE: FMLA AND 
DOMESTIC PARTNER QUESTIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH !SBA 
REPRESENTATIVE RE: BOARD WORKSHOP 

PREPARE PRESE!'.'TA T!ON FOR BOARD 
WORKSHOP 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSOCIATE SUPER!NTENDENT-­
REVJEW CONSULTING TEACHER 
RECOMMENDATIONS; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSOCIATE 
SUPERJNTENDENT ...... RE:.-it 
REMEDIATION 

PREPARE l'OR AND ATfEND WORKSHOP 

PREPARE FORAND ATTEND GEA 
COJ\.'TRACT EXTENSION NEGOTIATIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE Willi 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT ........ 
RE:~REMEDJATION . .. 

T~ERENCEWITH 
---RE: STUDENT 
DJSCIPLINE MA TIER 

PREPARE FOR AND ATfEND BOARD 
MEETING RE: GEA EXTENSION 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

P,~, 2 

2.50 hrs. '7"1 £.. $575.00 

1.20 hrs. ('"'1 .f2.. $276.00 

o.5o hrsdC $115.oo 

0.40 hrs. ,-'11-f!. $92.00 

1.00 hrs. ,r1,£ $230.00 

0.30 hrs~ $69.00 

5.50 hrs. t"'-:tls1,265.00 

soo hrs. '-")Vlil.s1,1so.oo 

0.40 hrs.~ $92.00 

0.30 hrs. ~-,.2.. $69.00 

4.00 hrs. /~-,Z. $920.00 

$6,877.00 



DISTRICT 225. COOK COUNTY 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

ln,o,ce Numb<,- 34826 P•go J 

$6,877.00 
$343.85 

$7,220.85 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTEREO 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

COST ALLOWANCE 

June2,2014 
Billed through 05/31/2014 

Invoice No. 
Client number 
Matter number 

34944 
Z6670 
00000 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR TI-JJS MA'ITER 

>DP 

/ 

p 0. BOX 81.l55 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60661-0355 

TAXPAYER ID ~ 36--2~ I 342S 

llECEIVEJ) JUN 17 2014 

$7,153.00 
S3S7.6S 

$7,510.65 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO: 
Scananc, Hirnes & Penarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60G81 ·0355 

For B1llmg or Payment Inquiries: contact Accoun(rng at (312) 565-3100 ext 261 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYSATLAW CHARTERED 

P.O. BOX 81l5S 
CH!CAGO. ILLINOJS 60681-0355 

TAXPAYER ID# 36-2&1342& 

FOR BILLING INQUIRIES CONTACT ACCOUNTING AT(312) 56.1·3100 o,l. 261 

June 2, 2014 
Billing through 05/31/2014 

Invoice No. 34944 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

3801 W. LAKE A VENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
05/02/2014 WORK ON NEW ADMINISTRATOR 

CONTRACTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 

05/05/2014 

05/05/2014 

0510612014 

05/06/2014 

05/07/2014 

05107/2014 

WITH RE: SAME 

ATI"END GEA NEGOTIATIONS 

REVIEW OPTJONS RE: 457 PLAN AND TRS 
CMS 

~FERENCE WITH 
__.RE: STUDENT ABSENCE 

DRAFT OR REVISE NINE ADMINISTRATOR 
SUCCESSOR CONTRACTS AND DRAFT 
SCRIPT FOR BOARD MEETING RE: FINAL 
ACTION ON SAME IN LIGHT OF RECENT 
ATIORNEY GENERAL OPEN MEETINGS 
ACT DECISION 

WORK ON NEW ADMINISTRATOR 
CONTRACTS 

REVISE AND REVIEW ADMINISTRATOR 
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACTS; REVIEW 
BI;NEFIT POLJC!ES; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCES WITH A SISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH 
DRAFT CORRESPOh'DENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDEN~RE: 
ADMINISTRATOR EMPLOYMENT 

Client Number 
Matter Number 

26670 

00000 

-"' 0.60 hrs. r · $138.00 

5.80 hrs. 'Jr,/!. $1,334.00 

0.20 hrs. W' $46.00 

0.30 hrs. -,n? $69.00 

4.00 hrs. -,nfl- $920.00 

0.10 hrs. ""J'YIL s161.oo 

. .fl 
2.70 hrs. ytl $621.00 



26670 

05/07/2014 

05/0812014 

05/09/2014 

05/1212014 

05/1212014 

05/1212014 

05/13/2014 

05/13/2014 

05/)412014 

05/15/2014 

05/1912014 

05/2012014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK COUNTY Invoice Number ]4944 P,g, 2 

CONTRACTS 

DRAFT ADMINISTRATOR CONTRACTS 

FINAL REVIEW OF CONfR~ 
CORRESPONDENCE TO._...... 
RE: ADMINJSTRATOR CONTRACTS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WllH 
RE: ADMINISTRATOR 

CONTRACTS 

PREPARE FORAND ATTEND BOARD 
MEETJNG RE: GEA NEGOTIATIONS AND 
ADMINISTRATOR CONTRACTS 

'~ERENCEWilH 
~:ADMINJSTRATIVE 
CONTRACT 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT­
AND ASSISTANT SUPERIJ\'TENDENT 
~ REVIEW PAY OPTIONS RE: 
ADMIJ\'ISTRATOR CONIRACJ'S 

REVIEW DOCUwlENTS AND BARGAINING 
AGREEMENT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
~SOCIA~RlNTENDENT 
~~REMEDIATJON 
PLAN 

REVJEW STANDARDS AND OPTIONS; 
DRAFT CORRESPO~O ASSOCTA TE 
SUPERINTENDENT-RE: SUPPORT 
STAFF BARGAINING UNIT POSITION 

DRAFT REVISIONS TO REMEDIATION PLAN: 
DRt\FT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSOCIATE 
SUPERINTENDENT .... RE:~ 
REMEDIATION 

DRAFT GEA LANGUAGE RE: 
COMPENSATION AND ERO PARTICIPATION 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSOCIATE SUPERINTENDENT i....­
RE: TENURE QUESTION 

REV JEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ~ 

ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT~ 
REVIEW BARGAINING AGREEMENT AND 

2.10 hrs. '1>1-f!?. $483.00 

0.50 hrs. 1"'1--{!._ $1 l S.00 

0.20 hrs. 7"1-t. $46.00 

4.50 hrs. -,,.,.-ie. $1,035.00 

0.30 hrs. ,....-e S69.00 

0.50 hrs . .,./c__ Sl 15.00 

0 90 hrs".">(C::_ $207.00 

0.30 hr~c $69.00 

0.70 h~c__ S161.00 

2.40 hrs. {'112. $552.00 

0.20 hr~(_____ 546 00 

l.10hrs. ""' 5253.00 



Z667tl 

05/21/2014 

0512812014 

05/28/2014 

05129/2014 

05/29/2014 

DlSTRICT 225 - COOK COUNTY 

BOARD POLICJES; DRAFT CONTRACT 
TE,\.:IPLATE RE: TEACHER RETrREMENT 
CONTRACT 

FINAL REVIEW OF CONTRACT; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT .... RE: TEACHER 
RETIREMENT CONTRACT 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSOCIATE SUPERlNTENDENT-­
AND ASSOCIATE PRJNCIPAL .... RE: 
CUSTODIAN ABSENCES 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE THE F A.MlL Y AND 
MEDICAL LEAVE ACT AND ITS 
REGULATIONS RE: WHETHER EMPLOYEE 
MUST NOTIFY SCHOOL DISTRICT LEA VE IS 
FMLA-RELATED 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSOCIATE PRINC!P~ DRAFT 
RESPONSE; REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM 
DISTRICT; REVIEW BOARD POLICIES AND 
OPTIONS RE: CUSTODIAN ABSENCES 

R.EVJEW AND ANALYZE FMLA 
REGULATIONS RE: SCHOOL DISTRICTS 
DESIGNATION OF LEA VE AS 
F.MLA-QUALJFYJNG BASED ON EMPLOYEE 
NOTICE 

TOTAL PEES FOR THIS MATTER 

BILLJNG SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOT AL CHARGES FOR Tl-!JS BILL 

Page l 

0.20 hrs. ~ $46.00 

o.so hrs.Ac__.. s115.oo 

0.50 hrs4- $115.00 

0.90 hrso{'C.. $207.00 

1.00 hrsqc_..... $230.00 

$7,153.00 

$7,153.00 
$357.65 

$7,510.65 



,s~c~A~RI=A~N~O"'-, ~H~!Me,,E~S~·~"~·~P£E"-'T~RA,,.,R~C~A"------·-E_c_F_•_r_,_r_~.~4Y~2~2~2~0~15,__/= 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

JJOARD OF EDUCATION 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

COST ALLOWANCE 

May 1, 2015 
Billed through 04/3012015 
Invoice No. 

Client number 
Matter number 

36397 
Z6670 
00000 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO: 
Scariano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

,or 

P.O BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60681-0315 

TAX PA YER ID# 36-2813423 

$22,344.00 
$1,117.20 

$23,461.20 

INVOICE APPROVAL 

For Billing or Payment Inquiries; contact Accounting al (3 12) 565-3 I 00 ext. 235 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW CHARTERED 

P.O BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, 11-LINOIS 60681 ·0355 

TAX PA YER 10 ~ )6·2813428 

fOR mLLING INQUIRTES CONTACT ACCOVNTJl'-'G AT (]12) 565·3100 ox, 235 

May 1, 2015 
Billing through 04/30/2015 

Jnvoice No. 36397 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DIST CT NO. 225 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
04/0312015 WORK ON REVISIONS TO BOARD POLICY 

RE: STUDENT DISCIPLINE 

04/03/2015 

04/03/2015 

04103120 IS 

04/06/2015 

04/06/2015 

04106/2015 

04/06/2015 

04/0712015 

WORK ON REVISIONS TO RETIREMENT 
POLICIES 

REVIEW AND REVISE RETIREMENT 
POLICIES RE: EMPLOYEE RETIREMENT 
POLICY REVISIONS 

WORK ON REVISIONS TO BOARD POLICIES 
8460, 8410, AND 8410 PRO 

REVIEW FINAL DRAFT MODIFICATIONS TO 
BOARD POLICIES RE: STUDENT DISClPL!NE 

PREPARE l-'OR GESPA Nt::GOTlATIONS, 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH \VITI I !EA 
REPRESENTATIVE RE: SAME 

DRAFT POLICY REVISIONS; TELEPHONE I 
CONFERENCE WITH ~TANT 
SUPERJNTENDENT~RE: 
RETIREMENT POLICY REVISIONS 

IMPLEMENT FINAL SUGGESTED REVISIONS 
TO BOARD POLICIES 8460, 8410, AND 
8410PRO 

PREPARE FORAND ATTEND GESPA 
NEGOTIATIONS AND COST CONTAINMENT 

Client Number 
Maller Number 

-.f'. 0.30 hrs. f" 

Z6670 

00000 

S72.00 

0.30 Ins. '"/'"A.f2- $72.00 

0.90 hrs. '--fyl-/=.. $216.00 

0.50 hrs.~ $120.00 

1.00 hrs. '7>'1-f:.. $240.00 

0.60hr~ $144.00 

0.60 hrs. ~ $144.00 

2.80 hrs. fWiZ- $672.00 

10.00 11~ $2,400.00 



ZM70 

04/07/2015 

04108/2015 

04/09/2015 

0410912015 

04/10/2015 

04/1012015 

04/l3/2015 

04/14/2015 

04/14/2015 

04/15/2015 

DCSTRJCT 22, - COOK COUNTY 

MEETING 

REVIEW AND DRAFT POLICY LANGUAGE 
RE: RETIREMENT PROGRAMS 

WORK ON REVISIONS TO EMPLOYEE 
RETIREMENT POLICY 

REVIEW FEDERAL REGULA TJONS AND 
APPLICATION TO INSURANCE POLICIES RE: 
ACA ANNUAL OUT OF POCKET 
LIMITATIONS 

REVIEW MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE 
f-ROM ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN 
RIGHTS RE: CHARGE OF DTSCRIMINA Tl ON 
FILED BY CUSTODIAN~ DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSOCIATE 
~ AND PLANT OPERATOR 
RE: SAME; REVIEW VIDEOS OF 

REVIEW FEDERAL GUIDANCE ON OPM 
LIMITS; PREPARE FOR BOARD MEETING 
RE: SAME 

DRAFT FINAL REVISIONS TO RETIREMENT 
POLICTIOS 

A ITEND BOARD MEETING RE: INSURANCE 
ISSUES 

TELEPHONE CONf-ERENCE WITH IEA 
REPRESENTATIVE RE GESPA EVALUATION 

T LEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: STUDENT 

EXPULSION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
WJTH A ITORNEY FOR STUDENT; 
TELEPHON~~RENCE WITH 
PRINCIPAL._. RESEARCH 
COMPUTER MA LEW ARE; REVIEW 
DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM PRINCIPAL ._ 
PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING AT 
DISTRICT TO PREPARE FOR EXPULSION 
HEARING FOR STUDENT- REVIEW 
DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE FOR SAME; 
TEL PHONE CONFERENCE WITH 

RE: SAME; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH FAMILY 
ArfOR.,',/EY RE: SAMC 

Page :, 

0.50 hrs. f/i .,,_ $120.00 

0.40 hrs. 7"-tz $96.00 

1.70 hrs. 
/pl $408.00 

2.00 hrs. $480.00 

'rJ" 

0.40 hrs. 
{oJ 

$96.00 

0.30 hrs. '7YI e. $72.00 

5.00 hrs. le, $1,200.00 

0.40~ $96.00 

4.00 hrs.';~ $960.00 

8.50 hrs. r>1-.e $2,040.00 



Z6670 

04/l6/20l5 

0411612015 

04/1712015 

0411712015 

04/17/2015 

04/2012015 

0412012015 

0412112015 

04/21/2015 

0412112015 

04121/2015 

DlS"rRICT 125. COOK COUNTY lavOI" Nombec 16197 

PREPARE FORAND ATTEND GESSA 
NEGOTIATIONS 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE FOR 
STUDENT EXPULSION HEARING' 
TELEPHONE ~NCE WITH 
PRJNCIPAL~RE: SAME; 
Tl;'.LEPHONE CONFl:'.RENCE WITH 

RE: SAMI:'.; 
Tl;'.LEPHONE CONFERENCE \VITI! OPPOSING 
COUNSEL RE: SAME 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND GESPA 
Nl:'.GOTIA TJONS 

REVIEW STATUS OF STUDENT DISCIPLINE 
MATTER 

REVIEW VOLUNTARY WAIVER OF 
DISCIPLINARY HEARING FORM AND 
IMPLEMl:'.NT REVISIONS !'OR POTENTIAL 
BOARD REVIEW 

DR.APT FINAL REVISIONS TO PARENT,\L 
WAIVER OF DISCIPLINARY HEARINGS 

REVIEW RESULTS OF EMPLOYEE 
DISCJPLJNE JNVESTlGA TION 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WJTII 
AND ADMJNJSTRA TORS; 

REVIEW CONTRACT RE: EMPLOYEE 
DISClPUNE MATTERS 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ATTORNEY FOR FAMILY OF STUDENT. 
RE: EXPULSION HEA~IN · FT 
-~PONDENCE 
~AND PRINCIPAL RE: 
SAME 

NFERENCE WITH 
RE: HEARING 

BEFORE BOARD OF EDUCATION RE: 
RECOMMENDATION or EXPULSION FOR 
STUDENT._. 

r,g, 1 

7.30 hrs.~ St,752.00 

3.20 hrs. "7"£. $768.00 

4.50 hrw $1,080.00 

0.30 hrs. y,1..,Z.. $72.00 

0.40 hrs. ),-\ £ 596.00 

0.40 hrs.7"\,e. S96.00 

0.30 hrs. '"f'Yi£ $72.00 

o.30 hrs. 7'1 f!.. sn.oo 

1.40 hrs. 771-,e $336.00 

OAO hrs. f1'1,f2. 596.00 

0.30 hrs. ';1,1-£. $72.00 



Zo670 

04/2212015 

04/22/2015 

04/22/2015 

0412312015 

04/23/2015 

04/2312015 

04/23/2015 

0412312015 

04124/2015 

04/24/2015 

04124120 15 

DISTRJCT ,25 - COOK COlJNTY 1"''0"' N,mb<, 36)97 

PREPARE FOR BOARD MEETING RE: 
STUDENT DISCIPLINE /l.1ATTER 

REVIEW SCHOOL CODE REQUIREMENTS 
FOR PLAN RE, EMERGENCY 
MANAGEMENT PLANS 

TELEPHONE C NFERENCE WITH 
RE: EXPULSION 

OF STUDENTI9 TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH PRINC!PAL RE: SAME; 
PLAN STRATEGY FOR CONDUCTING 
BOARD HEARING RE: SAME 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND GESSA 
NEGOTIATIONS 

REVIEW GESSA CONTRACT AND OPTIONS; 
REVIEW BOARD POLICIES; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT-RE: TECH 
EMPLOYEE DISCIPLINE 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND BOARD OF 
EDU CATTON MEETING RE: PERSONNEL 
MATTER 

CONTINUE REVIEW OF EMERGENCY 
MANAGEMENTPLAN;DRAFT 
NEGOTIATIONS MEMORANDUM RE: 
TEACHER NEGOTlA TlONS 

PREPARE FOR ANO ATTEND MEETING OF 
l:lOARD OF EDUCATION RE: EXPULSION Of 
STUDENT-

REVIEW RESULTS OF EMPLOYEE 
DJSClPLINE MATTER 

REVIEW OPTIONS; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE \VITI-I 
AND ADMINISTRATORS RE: TECH 
EMPLOYEE MATTER 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTH 
PRINCIPAL RE: EXPULSION OF 
STUOENT.,,TELEPHONECONFERENCE 
WITH RE: SAME; 
REV JEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: APPEAL OF 
DISCIPLINE; REVIEW POLICIES; RESPOND 
TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM ATTORNEY; 
REVIEW FILES 

0 30 hrs. yr' fZ_ $72.00 

0.60 hrs~ $144.00 

I.SO hrs. ,,i12 $360.00 

5.50 hrs.~ $1,320.00 

0.60 hrs.~ $144.00 

4.40 h~ $1,056.00 

t.50 llrs1s:> $360.00 

3.50 hrs. r1£ $840.00 

0.30 hrs. !'1,ie. $72.00 

0.90 hrs. f'>'I-£... $216.00 

I.SO hrs. )'11-;e: $360.00 



ZM70 

04/24/2015 

04/27/2015 

04/2712015 

04/2712015 

04/27/2015 

04/27/2015 

04/28/2015 

04/29/2015 

04/29/2015 

DISTRJCT ,,s ·COOK COUNTY 

STRATEG!ZE RE: BOARD POLICY 8410PRO 
VOLUNTARY WAIVER OF HEARING FORM 
AND IMPLEMENT SUGGESTED REVISIONS 
TO SAME 

CONTAINMENT RECS, REVIEW MEMO RE: 
SAME 

ATTEND BOARD MEETING RE: INSURANCE 
PLAN CHANGES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
~RE:TECHNOLOGY 
EMPLOYEES 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE AND 
DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM THE 
ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF HUl'vlAN RIGHTS 
RE: FACT FJNDlNG CONFERENCE FOR 
SUPPORT STAFF EMPLOYEE~ 
RESPOND TO DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN 
RIGHTS; FORWARD DOCUMENTS TO 
DISTRICT 

REVIEW POLICIES AND PROCEDURES; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT .-i 
RE: TECH EMPLOYEE MEETING STRATEGY 

DRAFT AND REVIEW AGREEMENT; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO !EA 
REPRESENTATIVE; ORA~ 
CORRESPONDENCE TO_. 
AND ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT 

._.RE: TECH EMPLOYEE 
RESIGNATION 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MAT!'ER 

1.20 hrs. ·7"\{L $288.00 

0.70 hrs. ?)11:: $168.00 

3.70 Ins. '-J'vl {2.. $888.00 

O.JO hrs. 7"1-f!. $72.00 

0.60 hrs '"}'1'1,-e $144.00 

l.20hr~ $288.00 

0.50 hrs:fff: $120.00 

4.40 hrs.~ $1,056.00 

0.90~ $216.00 

$22,344.00 



26670 Dl5TR1CT 225 • COOK COUNTY 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CllARGES FOR THIS BILL 

lavokeNumb« )6)97 Page I 

$22,344.00 

$1,117.20 

$23,461.20 



SCARIANO HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAI'/ CHARTERED 

April I, 2015 
Billed through OJ/3112015 

Invoice No. 

Client number 

Mauer number 

36214 

26670 

00000 

!DP 

P.O. BOX &1355 
OfiCAOO, ILUNOIS 606lll--0Jj, 

TAXPAYER ID ~ J6-2! I 34211 

/ 
RECEJVEJl APR 1 5 ?015 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGE.S FOR 11-llS MATIER 

""" ACCT. No. 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO: 
St.Miano, Himes&. f'cn=ca, 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, 1L606Sl-0355 

"""' 

Sl4,016.l)O 

$700.80 

$14,716.80 

NOP.O. 

for Billing or hymo:nt [nq,.itri01; cont~CI Acrooonng l!1 (3 12) ~S---3 I 00 nL 235 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW CHARTERED 

P.O. BOX 81J5S 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 606Bl·0355 

TAXPAYER ID H 36·2813428 

FOR BILLING INQUIRIES CO~TACT ACCOUNTING AT (312) 56S·Jl00cxt. 2)5 

April 1, 2015 
Billing through OJ/31/2015 

Invoice No. 36214 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATJON 

SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

P£1 w. LAKE AVENUE, ~200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
03102/2015 DRAFT POSITION ST A TEMENT FOR 

RESPONSE TO CHARGE OF 
DISCRIM!NA TION FILED BY~ 

OJ/OJ/2015 

0310312015 

0310412015 

0JIOM2015 

03/0512015 

OJ/0612015 

03106/2015 

-
REVIEW DATA RE: NEGOTIATIONS, 
FINANCIAL DATA PRESENTATION 

DRAfT RESPONSE TO QUESTIONNAIRE RE: 
CHARGE OF DJSCRlMINA TION FILED WITH 
ILL!NO!S DEP/\RTMENTOF HUMAN RIGHTS 
BY 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND Gl3SSA AND 
GESPA DATA SESSION; CONFERENCE MR. 

- RE: EMPLOYEE DISABILITY 

REVIEW PROPOSED CHANGES TO TEACHER 
RETIREMENT AGREEMENT 

DRAFT POSITION STATEMENT IN 
RESPONSE TO CHARGE OF 
D!SCRIMINATJON l'lLED WITH ILLINOIS 
DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN RIGHTS BY 
CUSTODIAN 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND GESS A AND 
GESPA NEGOTIATIONS 

WORK ON DRAFT GESSA CONTRACT 
LANGUAGE RE: EVALUATION 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

26670 

00000 

1.50 hrs. 11'< f:... $360.00 

0.40 hrs~ $96.00 

6.30 hr~ $1,512.00 

4.00 hrs~ $960.00 

O.JO hrs. ,.,.._-(!. $72.00 

6.00 hrs~ $1,440.00 

7.00 hrs~ $1,680.00 

0.40 hrs~ $96.00 



z,,,10 01STR1C1· 22' - COOK COUNTY [nvo,ceN,mb<c )6214 e,,, 2 

0310612015 MAKE CHANGES TO POSITION 3.50 hrw $840.00 
STATEMENT, RESPONSE TO 
QUESTIONNAIRE, AND VERIFIED 
RESPONSE RE: CHARGE OF 
DISCRlMINA Tl ON FILED BY __ AT 
GLENBROOK NORTH 

03/08/2015 DRAFT GESSA CONTRACT LANGUAGE RE: 1.70 hrs~ $408.00 
EVALUATION AND PROBATIONARY 
PERIOD 

0310912015 A TT END GESPA AND GESS A 14.00 hrs. "JN\ .i:;3,360.00 

~ONFERENCE WITH 
AND BOARD MEMBERS 

RE: BOARD POLICY REV!EW, A TT END 
BOARD MEETING RE: NEGOTIATIONS 

OJ/l\12015 WORK ON GESSA AND GESPA CONTRACT 0.40 hrs.i,r $96.00 
LANGUAGE 

03/11/2015 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 0.30 h~ $72.00 

ASSIST ANT SUPERINTENDENT -
DRAFT RESPONSES RE: PDP QUESTIONS 

0311112015 REVIEW AFF!OA vrr RECEIVED FROM 0.50 h'* $120.00 
ASS!STANTSUPERINTENDENT-
PREPARE DOCUMENTS !'OR FILING 

OJ/ll/2015 WORK ON REVISIONS T~ 0.60 llrs. J"l-t:. $1~~ 00 
RETIREMENT AGREEMENT 

03111/2015 FILE POSITION STATEMENT AND 0.80 I,~ $192.00 
QUESTIONNAIRE AT IOHR RE~ 
DlSCRlMINA TION 

03/12/2015 REVIEW FINAL DRAFT TEACHER 0.30 hr~ S72.00 
LEAVE/RETIRSMSNT AGREEMENT 

03/12/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. '-yY!-L $72.00 
RE: EMPLOYSE 

EVALUATION 

03/1212015 REVIEW TEACHER EV ALUA T!ON 0.80 hrs~ $192.00 
DOCUMENT; CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. 
-RE:SAME 

0311212015 WORK ON GESSA CONTRACT LANGUAGE 0.80 hrs~ $192.00 

03/12/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.20 hrs. J,yt,£ $48.00 
._RE: ..... AOREEMENT 



l6610 

03/12/2015 

03/13/2015 

03/lJ/2015 

03/1312015 

03/13/2015 

03/2,1/2015 

03/24/2015 

03124/2015 

03/2412015 

0312712015 

03/2712015 

03/27/2015 

DISTRICT'25 -COOK COUNTY lnvok, Numb« 36214 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ..... 
RE: ..-S.AGREEMENT 

REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT GESSA 
LANGUAGE RE: COMMITTEE FORMATION 
AND IMPASSE PROCEDURES 

TELEP! IONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT_ 
RE: HARASSMENT INVESTIGATION 

DRAFT UPDATE TO 
- RE: CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION 

FILED llY CUSTODIAN WITH ILLINOIS 
DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN RIGHTS 

REVIEW LA \V RE: IMPASSE; DRAFT GESSA 
CONTRACT LANGUAGE 

\VORK ON REVJSIONS TO BOARD POLICY 
RE: STUDENT SUBSTANCE ABUSE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE,TEACHER 

RETIREMENT AGREEMENT 

REVIEW SUGGESTED REVISIONS RE: 
BOARD POLICIES 8460, 8410, AND 8410 PRO; 
BEGIN IMPLEMENTING REVISIONS RE: 
SAME 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MR. 
- RE: STUDENT GROWTH 
ASSESSMENTS; REVIEW AND ANALYZE 
ISBE ADMINISTRATIVE RULES AND 
GUIDANCE RE: STUDENT GROWTH 
ASSESSMENTS; DRAFT OPINION RE: SAME 

REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT GESS,\ 
LANGUAGE RE: IMPASSE PROCEDURES 
AND CREATION OF COMMITTEES; 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATORS 
AND !EA REPRESENTATIVE RE: SAME 

REVIEW AND REVISE TEAC!IER 
RETIREMENT AGRE~ 
CORRESPONDENCE~ RE: 
SAME 

WORK ON REVISIONS TO EMPLOYEE 
RETIREMENT POLICIES 

0.20 hrs. rf' 1?-- $48.00 

0.60 hr~ $144.00 

0.40 hrs~ $96.00 

0.50 hrs. 7"1£.. $120.00 

$192.00 

0.30 hrs. -r,r,-fl.- $72.00 

0.30 hrs. )YI£ $72.00 

l.00 hrs. -ytl f!.- $240.00 

l.50 hrs . $360.00 ..,-

0.70 hrs. $]68.00 

"11" 

0.50 hrs. )'Yi-,e:. $120.00 

0.30 hrs. ·--,vi£ $72.00 



Z661-0 

OJ/27/2015 

03/27/2015 

DISTR[CT2'S -COOK COUNTY '"'""' Numl><, J,214 

DRAFT AND REVIEW RETIREMENT 
AGRl:'.EMENT RE 
RETIREMENT AGREEMENT 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

!JJLLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

Paso 4 

0.70 hrs. /Y'""'f::.. $168.00 

0.50 hrs. 

-if 
$120.00 

$1~,016.00 

$14,016.00 
$700.80 

S14,716.80 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW CHARTERED 

Maren 2, 2015 
Billed through 02/28/2015 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

Invoice No. 

Client number 
Matter number 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL Li\\V 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THJS MA TIER 

36063 
Z6670 
00000 

SIGN 
DATE ~ 

JDP 

J 
P.O. BOX 81355 

ClllCAGO, ILLINOIS 61M8 l-0355 
TAXPAYER ID# 36-2813428 

$8,832.00 
$441.60 

$9,273.60 

ACCT No. -~LL~!Jl.'.._~~~­
O PARTIAL 0°f1NAL 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO; 
Scariano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

For Billing or Payment Inquiries; contact Accounting al (312) 565-3100 ext. 261 



SCARIANO HIMES and PETRARCA 
"TTORNEYSAT LAW· CH,.RTERED 

P.0 BOX BlH'I 
CHICAGO, ILUNO!S 61)(;B 1.03'1'1 

TAX PA YER ID~ l0---2111J.42S 

FOR BILLING INQUJRJES COITTACT "CCQlJNT[l',"(l AT (]12) '165.3100 c:<I. 261 

March 2, 2015 

Bill!ng through 02/28/2015 
Invoice No. 36063 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

3801 W.LAKEAVENUE, 200 
GLENVIEW, !L 60026 

• 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
01/02/2015 RE"' :,,wc(_it?,~A"~~;;-..;a::t FROM 

0210Jno1s 

02/0312015 

02104120\5 

0210512015 

02/1112015 

02/12/2015 

02/12/2015 

STATUSOFPAREN, 
SPORTS1'>1ANSHIP MATTER 

RE: 

REVIEW AND REVISE OPfNJON LE TIER RE: 
STIJDENT DISCIPLINE OPTIONS 

REVIEW AND REVISE FINAL SEcnON OF 
STUDENT OISCll'UNE POLICY 

MAKE FINAL SUGGESTED REVISIONS TD 
IlOARD POLICY S460 (SECTION E TO END), 
S4 I 0, AND 8410 PRO; DRAFT Et-.1A1L WITI I 
ATTACHED REVISIONS TO 

E: SAME 

~Qtlli_(QNfERENCE WITH 
,--.RE: STIJDENT 
DISABILITY ACCOMMODATION 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING AT 
DISTRICT TO PREPARE RESPONSE TO 
DJSCRJMINA TION COMPLAINT FILED BY 
SUPPORT STAFF F.MPLOYEE-

TELEPHONE CONFEREJ,,'CE WITH !EA 
REPRESENTATIVE RE: GE.SSA AND GESPA 
N£GOTJATJONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH..., 

Client Number 

Maner Number 

26670 
00000 

0.20 hrs. ~iJ,, $48.00 

0.50 hrs.'i'rt-.2. $120.00 

0.90 hr,. '-p,,.,e.. 5216.00 

l.00 hrs. ';-""- {!... $2 4 0 . 00 

0.30 hrs. ',tlf2_ S72.00 

4.~ 
Sl,080.00 

0.40~ S%.OO 

0.30 hrs. jt}/ S-72.00 



Z6610 

02/12/2015 

02/13/2015 

0211312015 

0211612015 

02/16/2015 

0211712015 

02117/2015 

02117/2015 

02/17/2015 

02/18/2015 

02/2312015 

02/23/2015 

DISTRlCT n5 . COOK CDUNTY fm·ooc, N,mbec ]606) Page i 

RE: IMRF RETIREE I I EAL TH INSURANCE 
ISSUES 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: IMRF RETIREE 
INSURANCE COVERAGE; WORK ON 
OPINION RE: SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
........ RE: ADMINISTRATOR 
CONTRACTS AND TEACHER DISABIL!TY 

DRAFT PR.lNClPALS' CONTRACTS (2) 

REVIEW INSURANCE CODE PROVISIONS 
AND IMRF REGULA TlONS RE: 
POST·RETIREMENT INSURANCE 
OBL!GA TJONS 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE 
CORRESPONDENCE RECEIVED FROM 
DISTRICTS 

INSURANCE OFFERINGS; REVIEW AND 
ANALYZE JLLlNOIS INSURANCE CODE 
PROVISIONS RE: SAME 

REVIEW AND REVISE FINAL DRAFT 
PRINCIPAL CONTRACTS; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE \VITI-I RE: 
SAME 

REV!EW RESEARCH R.E: lMRF RETIREE 
INSURANCE OPTIONS 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND GESSA AND 
GESPA NEGOTIATIONS 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE FOR 
MEETING WIT~ 

RE: ILLlNOJS DEPARTMENT OF 
HUMAN RIGHTS COMPLAINT FILED BY 

PREPARE FOR AND A1TEND MEETING AT 
DISTRICT RE: D!SCRIMINA TION CLAIM BY 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: TEACHER LEAVE 

REQUEST AND POLICY REVISION 

WORK ON TEACHER LEA VEIRETIREMl;NT 

~ 0.70 hrs. $168.00 

0.40 hrs. yr,,£ $96.00 

2.00 hrs. /'>'1 f2- $480.00 

0.60 hrs. \tJI $144.00 

3.90 hrs.~ $936.00 

0.70 hrs. r,'.fl $168.00 

0.60 hrs. ii?' $144.00 

5.00~ Sl,200.00 

1.20 hrs. $288.00 

~ 

3.50 hrs. $840.00 

~ 
0.40 hrs .. .,,..,. Yi! $96.00 

0.40 hrs. ",Yi-R.. $96.00 



26610 

02/23/2015 

02/23/2015 

02/25/2015 

02/25/2015 

0212512015 

02127/2015 

02/2712015 

02127/2015 

02127/2015 

DlSTRICT :Ill . COOK COUNTY [m·ooc, N,mbec 3606) 

AGREEMENT 

WORK ON REVISIONS TO POLICY 6432 

WORK ON REQUEST FOR DEPARTMENT OF 
INSURANCE OPINJON RE: RETIREE 
INSURANCE BENEFITS 

REVIEW AND REVISE TEACHER 
RESIGNATION AGREEMENT; 
CORRESPONDENCE 
SAME 

RE 

DRAFT AND REVIEW AGREEMENT; REVIEW 
BOARD RETIREMENT POLICY R,.... 
RETIREMENT 

WORK ON RETIREMENT POLICY 
REVISIONS; DRAFT REVISIONS TO POLICY 
RE: TEACHER RfiTIREMENT 

CREA TE GESSA NEGOTIATIONS 
NOTEBOOK 

CREATE GESPA NEGOTIATIONS 
NOTEBOOK 

REVIEW TENTATIVE AGREEMENT AND 
NOTES FROM 2/25 GESSA NEGOTIATIONS 
SESSION 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE 
RESPONSE TO CHARGE OF 
D!SCJUMJNA TION FILED B~ 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

$96 00 

0.40 hrs. $96.00 

1.50 hrs. /,JtJ fe. $360.00 

1.20 hrs. '"]'Y' fZ. $288.00 

0.70 hrs. ,..-.---J2.$168.00 

0.40~ S96.00 

0.40 hrs. $96.00 

~ 
0.30~ S72.00 

4.00 hrs. $960.00 

~ 

$8,832.00 



Z6670 DISTRICTl1.I -COOK COUNTY 

!llLL!NG SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR TJ-IIS BILL 

lavo," Numb" 16063 

$8,832.00 
5441.60 

$9,273.60 



SCARIANO, Hll\1ES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW CHARTERED 

FebruaJ)' 2, 20 15 

Billedthrougll 01/31/2015 

Invoice No. 
Client number 
Maner number 

35920 

Z6670 
00000 

JDP 

1'0.lJOX i1HS 
CHICAGO ILLINOIS60U81-0:i5; 

''7,;y,e,,.a,;S 

BOARD OF EDLJCA TION 
SCHOOL DISTRICT NO ns , ·.; ''Lil' ii.EC1·:1v,·.: r_,; " ...•. 

SCIIOOL LAW 

TOTAi. Fl:ES 
TOTAi. DIS[lURSEMENTS 

COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR nus MATTER 

!'LEASE R~~fff l'A YMEN"I ·1 0: 
Scanano, Himes & Pctrn,ca 

l'.0. BOX 8135'.\ 
Cl I IC1\GO. 11. 6068 I -OJ 5 5 

for ililling OL' Paymcnl lnquinc.s; cnn,otl Accountrng 01 (J 11) 565-J I 00 c.,l. 26 I 

$6,000.00 
$307.51 

$300.00 

S(,,607.51 



SCARIANO, Hll\1ES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW CHART~R~O 

l'.O BOX 81155 
Cl·IIC -\(;()_ 11.LINOIS 606~ 1-0)55 

T ,\Xl'A \TR 11) S J6-2S I :J.J28 

fOR GI LLINCi INQUIRTES CONT ,\CT ACCOUNTl:-IG AT I J 12) 56J-.l I 110 "' ~6 I 

Fcb,u~ry 2, 201.5 

Bi 11 i 11g through O I /J 1/20 I 5 

Invoice No. 35920 JDP 

l\OARDOF EDUCATION 

.OOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, lL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVJCES RENDERED 
01/05/2015 REVIEW CORRIOSPONDENCE FROM .... 

--REVIEW ISSUES AND OPTIONS 
RE: TRS AND SOCl,\L SECURITY 
QUESTIONS 

01105/2015 

01/05/2015 

01/06/2015 

01/06/2015 

01/0612015 

01/0612015 

REVIEW AND REVISE POLICIES 8460, 8410, 
AND 8110 l'RO 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE ILLINOIS AND 
FEDERAL LAW RE: PRINCIPAL 
ENDORSEMENT 

WORK ON REVISIONS TO STUD[NT 
D!SCIPLINE POLICY LANGUAGE 

REVIEW SCIJOOL CUDE REQUIREMENT<; 
FOR PRINCIP,\L LICENSURE: TELEPH0C\11C 
CONFERENCE WIT! I RE: 
SAME 

TELEl'HOr\'l:. CONFERENCE WITH IASA 
GENERAL COUNSEL RE: PRINCIPAL 

LICENSURE ISSUc'.S; TELEl'H0 0IIINiiC••• 
CONFERENCE WITJ-1 • RE; 
Si\Mt 

CONFIRM AUTHORITY or STATUTF,S c1n::n 
!N POLICY 8460: REVIEW PORTIONS OF 
POLICIES 8410 ANO 8·110 l'RO RErERENCING 
MA.TOR DJSCIPL!NARY REVIEW 
COMMI-ITEE FOR CONS1s·1 ENCY 

Cliem Number 

Malter Number 

Z:6670 

00000 

0.80 hrs. (/] S 192.00 

1.20 hrs. 1'Yl--/? $288.00 

1.10 hrs. 'rn,-,2 $264JJO 

0.30 hrs. 7VI iZ. $72.00 

0.70 hrs. 'rJ(l'f': $168.00 

0.80 h,·s. 7"1,1'<2'. $192.00 

0.50 hrs. f'>'l 72: $120.00 



26610 

01/07/2015 

01/08/2015 

01109/2015 

01/0912015 

01112/2015 

01113/2015 

()1/1312015 

01/14/2015 

01/1,1/2015 

01114/20!5 

D1.1rn,cr n, -coo~ COUNTY """"' N""'"" -''~'" ''""' .' 

REVIEW ISSUES IN CONl'LJC l"ING IKS AND 
TRS DOCUMENTS: DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE ·1 0 STA rs SOCIAL 
SECURJTY ADMINISTRATOR; TELEPIJONE 
CONFERENCE WITH SOCIAi, SECURITY 
ADMINISTRATOR RE: TRS AND SOCIAL 
SECURITY WITHHOLDll\'G QUES rlONS 

REVIEW SECTION 218 AGREE~lENT 
EXCEPTION: DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
STA TE SOCIAL SECURITY ADMINISTRATOR 
RE: TRS AND SOCIAL SECURITY 
WITHHOLDING QUESTIONS 

WORK ON OPINION RE: INTC:RPLAY 
BETWEEN SOCIAL SECURITY AND TRS 
EARNINGS 

RF.VIE\\' OPTIONS FOK ADDRESSING TRS 
AND SOCIAL SECURJTY W!Tl-!HOLDJNG 
ISSUES: REVIEW CORRESPONLJH,'CE CROM 
ST A TE SOCIAL SECURITY ADMINlSTRA TOR 
RE· TRS AND SOCIAL SECURITY QUESTION 

REVI I:. W SEC rlON 218 AGREEMENT 
BETWEEN IMRF AND SOC!AL SECURITY 
ADMINISTRATION RE, SOCIAL SECURITV 
AND TRS WITJ-fHOLDING QUESTIONS 

REVIEW !DI-JR Cl-JARGL WORK ON 
RESPONSE TO SAME 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE l'ROM 
ASSJSTANTS!JPERINTENDENT~ 
REVIEW COMPLAIC\'T: DRACT RESPONSE; 
DRAFT LITfGA TJON HOLD LETTER; 
TEI.EPHONE CONFEl{F.r-.'Cl' WITH 
ASSIST ANT SUPERINTENDENT._ 
l{F,~ 101-!R. CHARGE 

TELEl'l-!ONlc CO:-:l'!~RENCES WITH 
N NO 

TRESPASS NOTICE TO PA KENT FOR 
8,\SKETBALL GAMES: REVIEW 
DOCUMrcNTS CROM~\Nll 
WORK ON HEARJNG NO'llCE TO PARENT 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE. P,\RENTAL 
TRC:SPASS ISSUE 

Rl:::VI!:. W AND REVISE l'ROPOSU) 
PARENTAL TRESPASS NOTICE 

1.30 hrs. C/J $11200 

0.20 hrs. (/) $48 00 

0.50 hrs. C'.) Sl20.00 

O.lO has. S72.00 

0.50 hr,. ~ $120.nO 

0.80 l,,-~192.00 

1.70 1,¥'' $408.00 

1.50 hrs. yrt£ $360.IJU 

0.60 hrs. f"l'R_ 

0.50 l1rs. 'y--.t'/2.. S 120.00 



L61i70 

01129120]5 

01/30/2015 

OIIJ0/2015 

o,,rn,c, 21,. coo, COl"NTY ''""'' Nwuhu J59'U 

STUDENT HOMELESS CLAIM AND ABUSE 
Cl.AIM: WORK ON OPINION I.ETTER RE: 
SAME 

REVIEW SCHOOL CODE AND CASE LAW RE: 
IOXPULSION REQUIREMENTS RELATED TO 
POSSESSION OF KNIFE 

PREPARE GESSA AKO GESPA 
NEGOTIATIONS 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
SUPEIONTENDENT RlGGLE RE: STUDENT 
t.Xl'ULSIONS 

TOTAL l'ElcS l'OR THIS MATTER 

0.60 l1r,.fl'1'£ $1.J4.00 

0.50 hrs 'fj S 120.00 

1.60 hrs. "J'Yl;e'..$3811.00 

56,000 00 

DISBURSEMENTS 
LEGAL RESEARCH CHARGES- SD 22~ COOK EXPULSIO,\' 

LEGAL RESEARCH CI-IARGl::S- SD 225 COOK- NO TRESPASS 

LEGAL RESICARCH CHARGES- SD 225 COOK POLICY REVISION 

rOTAI. DISEJURSEMENTS fOR THIS MATITR 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOT AL DISBURSEMENTS 

COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL Cl-!ARGES FOR TIIIS BILL 

$212.10 

S76.33 

SJ07.51 

S6,000.0U 

$307.51 

$300.UO 

$6,607.51 



SCARIANO, HIMES und PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW CHARTEREO 

BOARD OF EDUCA T!ON 

SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

January 5, 20 15 

Billed through 12131/2014 

Invoice No. 
Clicm I\Umbcr 

Matte,· number 

35770 
26(,711 

00000 

380 I \V. LAKE A VENUE, SUITE 200 
GLf'"1Vlfc\\/, IL 60026 

SCIIOOL LAW 

TOTAi. FfcES 

COST ,\I.LOW ANCE 

TOTAL CH,\RGES FOR Tl US MATTER 

PLEAS~. R~Ml'I l'AY~11Cl\-l 10. 
Scariano, Hrnics & Pclr.irca 

l'.0.BOX&i3J:\ 
CIIICAGO. IL 6060 1-0.155 

.IDP 

i'.0 IJO~ Xl.155 
CHIC1GO. 11.L INOI S 601,X 1 ·0355 

TA XPA Yl-:R IIJ , J0-2H I J428 

$13,680.00 

$68,1.00 

SU,36-t,00 

,_,.. 
11J31,f 

, ' 

for Billing or Payment Inquiries: contact Acco111111ng m (i 12) 565-3100 e~t. 261 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW CHARTEREO 

1'.0 BOX ~115, 
Cflll' AGO. ILLINl)I~ (,06~ 1-0J.<.I 

r,,Xl'A Yrn Ill I .l6-2~1.<H8 

FlW !lll I 1:-1(, INQUIRIE'i CONT,\CT ACCOU"I I l~'(i .\ I ( ll:ll 51,5-Jl'J~ "" :l61 

Ju11uary 5. 2015 

Billi11g through 12/"l 112014 
Invoice No. 35770 JDP 

llOARO OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

:180 I W. LAKC A VENUE, sun E 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
12/0112014 ATTl:NDGESSA/Gi::SPA IBl3 TRAINING, 

CONFERENCE WITH--- RE: 

1210112014 

12102/2011 

]210212014 

12102120 14 

12/0312014 

12105/201'1 

1210512014 

SULlSTANCE ABUSE POLICY REVISION 

REVIEW Ht:ARING OFFICl;R'S REPORT RE: 
-SUSPENSION 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND ESP !BB 
TRAINING: CONFERENCE 

AND BOARD MEMBERS 
RE: ROA RD POLICY REVISIONS 

PEND!N(i 
PERSONNEL MATfERS 

DRAFT AND RfoVIEW Rlcl'RIMAND: DR,\I· I 
CORRESPONDENCE TO­,..... ,c_ 

REVIEW DRAFT TEACHER LETTER OF 
Rl'PRIMAND 

ORAi' r FINAL MODIFICATIONS 1-0 l'HASE l 
OF BOARD POLICY RE: ILLEGAL 
SUllS l"ANCES; CORRESl'ONDl.'.NCI-. 

Cl1enl Number 
Matter r-.•umber 

/6670 
00000 

12 00 hrs.11'1.f!... $2,8 80.00 

0.50 hrs. r{'-.f!. $120.IJ() 

o.so ltrs.J> r/ t120.oo 

0.70 1t1·s-i,')\/ $1(,x.oo 

0.30 i,i·s. f'Yl,12.. $72.nO 

0.30 hrs-'J/i/ $72.00 

0.50 hrs. "}>1.£. 5120.00 



DISl l!l('C 221 - ('()00 ( <lL~·TY 

1210512014 

1210812014 

1210812014··.., • 

12110/201~ 

12110120 H 

121101201~ 

12111/2014 

12111/2014 

1211112011 

121121201,1 

121121201,1 

12/12/201·1 

RE: SA:VIE 

REVIEW REPORT OF !!EARING OFFICER RE. 
STUl)ENT Sl ISPF.NSJON: PR['l'ARF FOR 
BOARD MEETING RE: SAME 

~ERENCES(2) WITH 
~RE: RESIGi\'ATIOC\' 01· 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND BOARD 
MEE I ING RE: fcSP NCGO I'll\ TIONS_ 
PERSOJ\'NEL ISSUES AND STUDENT 
lllSCll'LINE MA TfER 

TEI.ICPHONE CONFERliNCE WITH 
RE: TEACl-lER 

RC:SIGNATION 

TEI.EPHONE CONFF.Rl'.NC[ WITH 
~RE:COACl-1 
RESIGNATION 

WORK ON REVISIONS TO REM EDI A rlON 

PLAN; DRAfTCORRES~(:,)NIIIIIDIEINIC.E TO 

REME[)JAT!ON 

l ELEPl-lONE CONFEREl\'CES (2) WIT! I 
i\l)MINISTRAI ORS RE: COACI I'S 
RESIGNATION 

FINAL REVISE AND REVIEW Of 
RF.MEDIATION l'LAN; [)~AFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO 
~{E:.-.REMEOIATIOC\ 

Dl I FR,\.111'C EDITOR'S llJCNTI I"\'.\ 1· 
ESPN.COM'S Cl-JICAGO OFFICE RE: 
REl'OR"I ER THRC:ATENl~f-! __ 
STORY CONCERNING._._...... 
CH,\NGC IN DISTRICT 

ru .l:l'HONE CONFEREN(T WITH 
iiiiiilimiiiiiiiiRE: ST A TUS OF.-, 
RESIGNATION INVESTIGA l'ION 

Tt:UOl'HONE CONfEREoNCE WI rH 
ASSIST ANT SUPERlNTENDENT­
RI;; Pl'.RSONNEL MATTF.RS 

RlcVIE\V DOCUMENTS FROM ASSISTANT 

o.80 ltrs. 7fi-l!... sin.on 

0.60 hr,. ]Yl,e_ $144.00 

0.30 ilro. ';h1.t2 $72.00 

0.30 ilrs.'pl-12'.. ~72.UO 

0.50 hrs."~i/ $1]0.00 

0.70 llrs. 7..i-ie. $168.00 

0.50 hrs.~ $12000 

0.80 hr->. ;wf!... $192.00 

0.30 hrs. ,>11Z.. sn.oo 

OJO hr~ $72.00 

0.80 hr@ $19~.oo 



Zf670 

12/15/2014 

12115.'2014 

12/!512014 

12/151201,1 

!211612014 

121161201·1 

12117120H 

12/18120[,1 

12118/2014 

1211912014 

12/1912014 

12119120"1 

Dl.', TRll" r 22; - (00~ l'OLINTY '""""N"n,hc, .1<170 

SUPERINTENDENT ..... RE:­
Rl::.rvlfDIA TION 

RfVILW flOARD Ml::MBER MICMOS RIO: 
HEAL Tl! INSURANCE COST CONTAINMENT 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND BOARD 
MEl,rlNG RE: cos·1 CONTAINME1'' I 
COMMJTTEE ISSUES 

DRAFT AND REVIEW REMEDIATION PLAN, 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCF, TO ASSIST,\NT 

SUPER!NTENDENT .-,ii RE: -­
REMtl)IATION 

REVIICW EVALUATION: DRAfT 
CORRESPONDENCE ~ST ANT 
SUl'ERIN"I C:NOENT-RF: 
COl!i'lSELOR. EVALUATION QIJESTIO:-IS 

ATTEND MEETl1''G OF COST CONTAINMENT 
COMM1rrEE 

IMl'I.EML:NT RL:VISIONS TO !30AIUl 
POLICIES 8460 (SECTION E TO END); 841 0: 
1\ND84101'RO 

WORK ON OPINION RE: APPLICArlON 01· 
TRS AND IRS RUL[S TO MULTIPLE 
l'OSITION EMPLOYEES 

DRAFT RfoVISIONS TO PHASE 2 OF ILI.LGAI 
SUBSTANCE POLICY 

CONTINUE TO IMPLEMENT REVJSION<i TO 
IJOi\RI) l'OUCIES 8%0 (SCC-1 ION I· l'O l:Nl) 
OF f'OLJCY): 841 O: AND R4 IO PRO 

WORK ON OPINION RE· REVlSION<i TO IA 
.IOll [)FSCRIPTION AND ROl.E OI' Tl:ACHIOR 
IN JA EVALUATION 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSISTANT SUPF.RINTE>,'DENT~ 
REVIEW AND REVISE JOB DESCRIPTION: 
llRAF I' RESl'ONSC. IO ,\SSIST ANT 
SUPERINTENDENT REc SPECIAL 
ICDUCAI ION ASSIST AN r J0l3 OESCRI l'TION 

REVIFW CORRICSPONOENCI' !'ROM 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDEN~ 
RE\111::W OPTIONS: DRAFT RESPONSC. R[: 

,,.,,,, -' 

0.50 hr,;. ---,.r'--/2. S 120.00 

1.10 hrs~ SH,4.UO 

0.30 hr.s~ $72.00 

4.00 his~ :!,960.00 

1.50 his. yll-12. $360.00 

0.30 hrs. ~ $12.00 

1.50 hrs. ,-'1-f:;. SJ60.00 

1.50 ilr.s. 'M .f!... $360.00 

0.40 hrs.~ S% uo 

o.60 hrs~ Sl4~.oo 

0.20 hrs c:fJ.S s,rn.oo 



ZMJO 

1212212014 

12122/2014 

12/301201 ~ 

DI', THIO '1.' . (,()()>: l OL!'J l Y '"''"""'""'"'' '"'" 
AIDE EVALUATION QUEST!Ol·> 

\VORK ON RESPONSE TO CANCELLATION 
OF SOCCER TEAM PARTICIPATION IN 
TOURN,\MENT 

WORK ON PHASE 3 OF BOARD POLICY RE· 
ll"LEGAL SUBSTANCES 

REVlEW AND REVISE DUE PROCE5S 
POLICIES RE: STUDENT DISCIPLINE 

TOTAL FEES FOR Tl-!lS MATTER 

Bii.LiNG SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CI-JARGES FOR Tl IlS BILL 

0.30 hr:s. 7fl {2. sn.oo 

0.40 hrs. ,i'l -fZ.$96.00 

2.20 hrs. ;rt fl_ 5528.00 

$13,(,80.00 

$13,680.00 

5684.0() 

:i,14,3M on 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
:ITIORNEYS AT LAW· C>-'AR<EREG 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

December 1 , 2014 

Billed through i 1/3012014 

Invoice No. 
Client number 

Matter number 

35724 

26670 

00000 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO 
Scariano, Hmic.s & Pecrarea 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ll 60681-0355 

JDP 

P.O BOX 81355 
CHICAGo(ILLINOIS 60681-0355 

~AYER!D#36-261342S 

1 '- ?01,1 . J' 

$9,840.00 

S492.00 

$10,332.00 

For Billing or Payment Inquiries, con tac• Accoun,ing at (312) 565-3100 ext 26 l 



SCARIANO,HIMESandPETRARCA 
,\lTOP.N~YS i\T Li\W · CHA'>T~RCO 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINQIS 60681-0315 

TAX PA YER ID# 36-2813428 

FOR BILLING INQVJRIES CONTACT ACCOUNTING AT (312) 565-3100 e" 261 

December l, 2014 
Billing through 11/30/2014 

Invoice No. 35724 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
l 110312014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 

11/04/2014 

11/07/2014 

1110712014 

1110712014 

11107/2014 

1111112014 

RE: STUDENT 
SUSPENSION APPEAL 

B,zy..U,..'Y CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
~AND PARENT RE: 
S"J1JDENT SUSPENSION APPEAL 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
AND 

ADMINISTRATORS RE: TEACHER 
MTSCO/'.'DUCT 

WORK ON DOCUMENT AND WITNESS 
REQUEST ISSUES AND OPTIONS RE: 
sn Jf)FNT <;!JSPFNSJON APPF A.I_ HFA.RT"IC: 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE FOR 
SUSPENSION HEARING FOR STUDENT-

REVIEW EXISTING BOARD POLICY ON 
ILLEGAL SUBSTANCES AND 
PARAPHERNALIA IN ORDER TO 
STRATEGIZE REVISIONS TO SECTION D • 
V!OLA TIO NS AND CONSEQUENCES: 
REVIEW AND ANALYZE SIMILAR BOARD 
POLICY FOR BACKGROUND ON 
AJ'l'ROACHlNG REVISIONS 

PREPARE FOR MEETJNG WITH 
SUPERINTENDENT AND BOARD MEMBERS 

Clicnc Number 
Malter Number 

26670 
00000 

0.20 hrs. /Yl? $48.00 

0.20 hrs. bff $48.00 

0.50 ~ $!20.00 

·~"' 0.40 hrs. I· · $96.00 

2.20 hrs. '1"1-(2.. 5528.00 

2.00 hrs. '7>'1-f:!. $480.00 

0.40 hrs. 7"'1 fZ. $96.00 



] l/] l/2014 

I I/I I/2014 

ll/1112014 

ll/12/2014 

11/12/2014 

11/13/2014 

1 l/13/2014 

11/14/2014 

11/1712014 

11117/2014 

11118/2014 

l l/19/2014 

11/19/2014 

DlSTRlCT 221 - COOK COUNTY 

RE: REVISIONS TO BOARD POLICY 

ATTEND MEETING WITH.....-.. 
AND BOARD MEMBERS RE: POLICY 
DEVELOPMl;NT 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE FOR 
1119, SUSPENSION HEARING; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITHFATHEROl'9.; SEl'·.'D 
DOCUMEJ\~STOFATHER 

., 
IMPLEMENT SUGGESTED REVISIONS TO 
SECTION D OF BOARD POLICY ON ILLEGAL 
SUBSTANCES/PARAPHERNALIA 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE FOR 
SUSPENSION HEARING FOR-; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH FATHER 
0 •. RE: HEARING 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE OTHER SCHOOL 
DISTRJCTS' BOARD POLICIES ON 
DISCIPLINE FOR ILLEGAL SUBSTANCE 
VIOLATIONS FOR INSIGHT RE: REVISIONS 
TO CURRENT BOARD POLICY ON JLLEGAL 
SUBSTANCES/PARAPHERNALIA 

TELEPIIONE CONFERENCE WITH !EA REP. 
RE: ESP NEGOTIATIONS 

PREPARE FOR.SUSPENSION !!EARING 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE 
TESTIMONY FOR- SUSPENSION 
HEARING 

PREPARE FOR STUDENT EXPULSION 
HEARING 

PREPARE FOR AJ\'D ATTEND MEETING 
WITH AND OTHER 
DISTRICT STAFF TO PREPARE TESTIMONY 
FOR- SUSPENSION HEARING 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SUSPENSJON 
HEARING FOR STUDENT9' 

REVIEW RESULTS OF STUDENT EXPULSION 
HEARING 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: 

Pa,, l 

4.00 hrs. ']1'\ .#., S960.00 

3.00 hrs. '-pvi!, $720.00 

2.50 hrs. -yr1--;Z. $600.00 

2.30 hrs. --r,,t -f!. $552.00 

0.50 hrs. ,"l-t2.. $120.00 

0.30 hrs.~ S72.00 

1.30 hrs. 7'>'\.f! $312.00 

2.30 hrs.'?""~ SSS2.00 

0.40 hr,. T" {Z. $9(,.(,(l 

3.00 hrs. rt< $720.00 

~,12. 
5.50 hrs.,. $1,320.00 

0.30 hrs. 1'1'1 fZ- $72.00 

0.30 hrs.Y"' .R._ $72 00 



ZOfi70 

ll/19/2014 

l l/2012014 

1112012014 

11121120!4 

IJ/2212014 

1112412014 

11/25/2014 

11/2512014 

11/25/2014 

11/25/2014 

l li2G/2014 

DlSTR[CT225 -COOK COW.TY [m·o[ce Numb" J57" 

SUSPENSION HEARING FOR ... 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM FATHER 
OF STIJDENT,9JRE: SUSPENSION 
HEARING 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
• ) 5 RE: BOARD POLICY 
REVISIONS 

CORR.ESPOJ\'DENCE TO ADMINISTRATJON 
RE: ESP NEGOTIATIONS PLANNil\'G 

REVISE ILLEGAL SUBSTANCE POLJCY 
DEFINITIONAL SECTION; WORK ON 
ILLEGAL DRUG POLICY PENALTY SECTION 

TELEPHONE CONFER.ENCE WITH 
~RE: PERSONl\'EL 

MATTER 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT ..... 
REVIEW OPTIONS FOR DOCTOR NOTES 
AND COLD WEATHER; REVIEW DUI ISSUES 
AND OPTIONS; DRAFT RES PON~ 
ASSISTA.t"IT SUPERINTENDENT._,. 
RE: PERSONNELMATfERS 

DRAFT CHANGES TO PENALTY SECTION OF 
STUDE1''T SUBSTANCE ABUSE POLICY 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSJSTANTSUPERJNTE}.'DENl~ 
RE: PERSONNELMATIERS 

TELEPl-101\r' CO/\iFERENCE WlTl-i 
~E· RCQUESTBY 
PARENT TO HA VE AN ATIOR:-IEY PRESENT 
DURING QUESTIONJNG OF STuOENT RE: 
POSSIBLE DISCIPLINE; RESEARCH ISSUE 

STRATEGJZE AND COMPLETE FINAL 
REVISIONS TO SECTION D OF BOARD 
POLICY 8460 (ILLEGAL 
SUBSTANCES/PARAJ'HERNALIA; EMAIL 
COPY OF SAME TO 

PREPARE FORGESSAAND GESPA !BB 
TRAINING 

P,g, l 

0.30 hrs ·-yr. .fZ. $72.00 

0.30 hrs. T" '(!.. $72.00 

0.30 hrs~ $72.00 

"" 2.00 hrs. ,r\ $480.00 

0.30 hr,.'T"'-fc. $72.00 

0.40 hrs. r1 i?.. $96.00 

0.50 hrs. -r,'112- $120.00 

0.40 hrs. f/jf' $96 00 

0 50 hrs. f> i( Sl20.00 

1.20 hrs. 7'1 f?. $288.00 

l.70 h~ $408.00 



Z6670 

ll/2612014 

11126/2014 

DISTRICT 2l! - COOK COUNTY 

PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE WITH 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: STUDENT 
SUBSTANCE ABUSE POLICY PENALTIES 

REVIEW BOARD POLICY 8460, 8410, AND 
8410PRO A1''0 MAKE NOTES RE: FUTURE 
REVISION OF SAlv!E 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

E!LLING SUl',1MARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

r,gc 4 

0.50 hrs. 1""--¢ $120.00 

1.00 hrs.,'1¢ 5240.00 

S9,840.00 

$9,840.00 
$492.00 

$10,332.00 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

November 3, 2014 

BilledUU"Ough 10131/2014 

Invoice No. 35601 

Client number 
Matter number 

Z6670 

00000 

.• ,.w.. -

JDP 

RECElVF!· !Jtf' 03 2014 
3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTALCI!ARGES FOR THIS MAn"ER 

INVOICE APPROVAL 
MATERIAL NT APPROVED 

SIGN 

DATE Dcl71/: P.O. No .. _----
ACCT. No. J;.fe;f 
O PARTIAL (lFrNAL 13No P.O. 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO: 
Scariano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

For Billing or Payment Inquiries; conlact Accounung at (312) 565-] 100 exl. 261 

$3,408.00 

Sl 70.40 

SJ,578.40 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60681--0355 

TAX?A YER ID~ 36-2813428 

FOR 8ILLING INQUJRIES CONTACT ACCOUNTING AT (312) 565·3100 c". 261 

November 3, 2014 
Billing through 10/31 /2014 

Invoice No. 35601 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

3801 W. LI\KE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
10101/2014 T • I • ONE CONFERENCE WITI! 

RE: 
CORRESPONDENCE TO JOB APPLICANT 

10/06/2014 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FR......_ 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT 
REVIEW REVISED AGREEMENT; DRAFT 
RESPONSE RE: .... RESIGNATION 

10107/2014 REVIEW CORRESPOl\'DENCE FROM 
ASSOC IA TE PRTNC!P Allllmt REVIEW 
DOCTOR NOTE; DRAFT RESPONSE RE: 

10/10/2014 WORK ON OPINION RE: TEACHER 
DISCIPLINE 

to/1012014 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT-
REVIEW INTERVIEW NOTES; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: 
EMPLOYEE HARASSMENT COMPLAINTS 

1011412014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
: STUDENT 

DISCIPLINE FOR DRUG OFFENSE 

10/14/2014 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSIST ANT SUPERINTENDENT -
DRAFT RESPONSE RE: TEACHER 

Client Number 
Matter Number 

0.30 hr:s. "1Yl ,R.. 

0.20~ 

OW ':!j'~ 

0.30~ 

Z6670 

00000 

sn.oo 

$48.00 

$48.00 

S72.00 

o.~ 
$168.00 

0.30 hrs. 
,,,e 

$72.00 

0.2~ 
$48.00 



Z66JO 

10/15/2014 

10/15/2014 

10/16/2014 

10/20/2014 

10121/2014 

I 0122/2014 

10123/2014 

10/28/2014 

1012812014 

1012912014 

1013012014 

DISTRICT ns -COOK CO!Jl,.'TY 11woice Numb<,- 15601 Page 2 

REPRIMAND 

DRAFT AND REVIEW REPRIMAND; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDE~:-

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITI-l 
RE: STUDENT 

DISCIPLINE ISSUES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WlTl-1_ _ 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDEN~ 
RE: SUPPORT STAFF ISSUES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
AND ASSISTANT 

SUPERINTENDENT RE: STUDENT 
DJSCJPLINE AND EMPLOYEE DJSCJPLINE 
ISSUES 

REVIEW POLICIES AND PROCEDURES RE: 
STUDENT DISCIPLINE AND APPEAL 
PROCESS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTH 
ADMINISTRATOR WITNESSES TO PREPARE 
FOR HEARING; REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM 
DISTRICT; PREPARE WITNESS TESTIIV!ONY 
OUTLINES RE: STUDENT DISCIPLINE 
APPEAL 

REVIEW PRESENTATION MATERIALS; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PRINCIPAL 
...... PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR 
HEARING; TELEPHOJ\'E CONFERENCE WITH 

RE: STUDENT 
SUSPENSION APPEAL HEARING 

PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: BOARD POLICY 

REVJSJON 

REVIEW SUGGESTED REVISIO;-.'S RE: 
BOARD POLICY ON ILLEGAL SUBSTANCES 
AND PARAPHE I IA' EMAIL SAME TO 

CONFERENCE \VITI-! RE: 
BOARD SUBSTANCE ABUSE POUCY 

WORK ON REVISIONS TO ILLEGAL 
SUBSTANCE POLICY 

0.60 hrs. $144.00 

~ 
0.30 hrs. y,t.C.. S72.00 

0.40 hrs. $96.00 

0.60 hrs. 7""-j?.. $144.00 

0.50 hrs. t 1' $120.00 

$600.00 

1.10 hrs. "f::, ry,{ $264 00 

0.70hrs.1fl"l£ $163.00 

0.40 hrs. 7'1-£. $48.00 

3.50 hrs. 'JYl-,Z. $840.00 

0.60 hrs. m;e.. $144.00 



Z66"10 

10/3012014 

1013112014 

10/3112014 

DISTRICT llS • COOK COIJNTY ln,o;coNumbcr Jl601 

TELEPHONE COl\'FERENCE \VITH IEA 
REPRESENTATIVE RE; ESP NEGOTIATIONS 

REVIEW FINAL DRAIT POLICY RE: 
ILLEGAL SUBSTANCES 

REVISE AND SUPPLEMENT BOARD POLICY 
ON ILLEGAL SUBSTANCES AND 
PARAPHERNALIA; EMAIL FINAL DRAFT OF 
POLICY WITH REVISIONS AND T CK.ED 
CHANGES TO • 

TOTAL FEES FOR ll-llS MATTER 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR IBIS BILL 

Page l 

0.40~ S96.00 

0.30 hrs. pif?.. $72.00 

0.60 hrs. 7'11--fl. $72.00 

$3,408.00 

$3,408.00 
$170.40 

$3,578.~0 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETR~_Rt;:A 
ATTORNEYS Al LAW CHARTERED 

October I, 2014 

Billedlhrough 09/30/2014 

Invoice No. 35422 

Client number Z6670 JDP 

Matter number 00000 

BOARD OF EDUC,\ TJON 

1'.0. llOX ~1355 
Cl I ICAGO. ILLINOIS !,0681--0355 

TAXl'A YER ID~ J6-2Sl312~ 

RECEfVED OCT 2 1 2014 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LA\V 

TOTAL f'EES 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 

COST ALLOWANCE 

TO rAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO 
Scari,1no. Hi,nes & Pe1rarta 

P0.BOX81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

/ 

$9,396.00 
$1,254.74 

$469.80 

Sll,120.54 

For Billi11g or Payment lnq,11ries; co11tact Accounting at (312) 565-} 100 ext. 261 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW CKARTEREO 

I' 0. llOX BIJ55 
Cl I IC,\00, ILLINOIS GOGB 1-0355 

I AXI' AYER I IJ a 36·2~ 13428 

!'Ott BILLING INQUIRIES CONTACT ACCOUNTING AT (Jl2) 565-3100 "" 261 

Octoberl,2014 
Billing through 0913012014 

Invoice No. 35422 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

3801 W. LAKE A VENUE, SUITE200 
GLENVIEW. IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAIV 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SIORVICES REXDERED 
09102/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 

09/0212014 

09/03/2014 

0910412014 

09104/2014 

0910512014 

09/0712014 

09108/2014 

PRINCIPAL RE: STUDENT PHONE 
SEARCH QUESTIONS 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASS!ST ANT SUPERINTENDEl\'T 
REVIEW JOB DESCRIPTION RE: 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
E: TECHNOLOGY 

EMPLOYEE RELEASE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WIT! I 
ASSJST ANT SUPERINTENDEN r­
RE: PERSONNEL MA TIERS 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
REVIEW LETTER; 

DRAFT RESPONSE RE: TECI INOLOGY 
EMPLOYEE RELEASE 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FRIOIM!lll!!!I• 
ASSIST ANT SUPERINTENDENT 
REVIEW DOCTOR NOTE RE.-

DRAFT PERA JNSERVICE POWERPOI1'T; 
PREPARE FOR PRESENTATION 

Client Number 

Malter Number 

26670 

00000 

0.30 hrs. J> 11/ $72.00 

I 00 hrs. '-p1 {Z. $240.00 

0.30 h,~ $72.00 

0.20 hrs. ')Ni£ $48.00 

0.40 ilrs~ $96.UO 

0.20 hrs. ft\£ S48.00 

0.20 br~ S48.00 

1.80 ilrs. '"y)'l -;t::'.S432.00 



ZM70 

09/09/2014 

09/09/2014 

09/1012014 

09/1012014 -

09/1012014 

09/11/2014 

09111/201<1 

0911112014 

09/1212014 

09112/201·1 

09/1512014 

09/1512014 

091151201,) 

DISTRICT2l5 ·COOK COUNTY l">o,cc Nt1111lx,c )$412 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
EMPLOYEE 

DISCIPLINE MATTER 

TELEPHONE CONFEREN,.c,c•'•'•"•" 
~ltE:11 

PREPARE FOR ADMINISTRATOR· UN JON 
INSERV!CE RE: PERA ISSUES 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSOCIATE PRINCIPAL- REVIEW 
NOTE; DRAFT RESPONSE RE: 

WORK ON JNSERVICE PRESENTA TJON 
POWERPOJNT AND OUTLINE [NO CHARGE 
PER A TIORNEY PETRARCAJ 

PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND lNSERVICE RE: 
TEACI IER EVALUATION 

TELEPI IONE CONFERENCE WJTI-I 
ADMINISTRATORS; REVIEW 
CORRESPONDENCE FROM ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTE<SDENT REVIEW 
INTERVIEW NOTES; OUTLINE CHARGES: 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENl' RE--

PREPARE FOR AND PRESENT PERA ANlJ 
SENATE BILL 7 INSERVICE [NO CI-IARGE 
PER ATIORNEY PETRARCA] 

WORK ON-NOTICE TO REMEDY 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTI-! 
ASSiSTA.;,;1 SlJPEhINTEJ..;u,:',;T­
RE: CUSTODIAN DISMISSAL OPTIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: PERSONNEL 

MATTERS 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ATTO_~ REVIEW RESPONSE OPTIONS 
RE: ........ 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
A TIORNEY REPRESENTING FOR/v!ER 
DISTRICT EMPLOYEE WHO APPLIED FOR 
TUTORING POSITION WITl-1 DISTRICT: 

0.30 hrs. -,-.,v? $72.00 

0.20 hrs . ..,........,e. $48.00 

2.30 hrs . ...,,.,..-f. $552.00 

0.20 hrs. crf $48.00 

3.00 hrs 'y,1-(:.. NIC 

6.00 lus. "'7"-,t~l,440.00 

1.40~ 

--t:. 7.40hrs. , .. 

0.50 hrs.&-

$336.00 

NIC 

$96.00 

Sl20.00 

0.20 hrs. fi1/fl£... $48.00 

030 hrs~ S72.00 

1.10 hrs~ $264.00 



l6(,70 

0912512014 

09/2612014 

0912612014 

0912612014 

09126/2014 

09/2612014 

09129/2014 

0912912014 

0912912014 

0912912014 

0912912014 

0913012014 

09/3012014 

01,rn1CT n, · COOK COUNTY 

WORK ON REVlEW AND REVISION OF 
STUDENT DRUG POLICIES 

WORK ON OPJN!ON RE. EMPLOYMENT 
RIGHTS OF UNAUTHORIZED TEACHER 

PREPARE FOR AND A TT END MEETING 
WJTH ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT 
....._. RE: JOB APPLICANT 

COMPLAINING HE WAS NOT HIRED; MEET 
WITH RE: SAME 

REVIEW CURRENT BOARD POLICY ON 
ILLEGAL SUBSTANCES AND 
PARAPHERNALIA RE: REVISION OF POLICY 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE LAW AND 
RESOURCES APPLICABLE TO BOARD 
POLICY ON ILLEGAL SUBST,\NCES AND 
PARAPHERNALIA RE. REVISION OF POLICY 

DRAFT RECOMMENDED REVISIONS TO 
BOARD POLICY ON ILLEGAL SUBSTANCES 
AND PARAPI IERNALJA KE: REVISION OF 
POLICY 

WORK ON REVISION TO STUDENT DRUG 
POU CY 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS !'ROM DJSTR!CT, 
REVIEW HANDBOOK PROVISIONS: 
-ARGUMENTS FOR DISMISSAL RE: 

REVIEW AT1'0RNEY GENERAL OPINIONS 
REGARDING DISCLOSURE OF NOTICE TO 
REMEDY DOCUMENTS RE: -

PREPARE !'OR ANO ATTEND BOARD 
MEETING AT GLENBROOK SOUTH RE: 
PERSONNEL MA TIERS 

REVISE DRAFT OF RECOMMENDED 
REVISIONS TO BOARD POLICY ON ILLEGAL 
SUBSTANCES AND PARAPHERNALIA RE: 
REVISION OF POLICY 

REVIEW PRELIMINARY DRAFT REVISION 
TO DISTRICT ILLEGAL SUBSTANCE POUCV 

DRAFT AND REVIEW AGREEMENT AND 
RELEASE; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 

0.40 hrs. '1,,y]-t'- $96.00 

0.30 hrs.'"/1'1-{2 $72.00 

1.30 hr~ SJ 12.00 

0.40 hrs. -r'{Z. $48.00 

1.50 hrs. ,.-v1f,::'.. $180.00 

3.50 hrs. r-te. $420.00 

0.30 lirs. ",I\ fl $72.00 

0.40 hr~ $96.00 

$144.00 

4.10 hr~, $984.00 

0.50 llrs. 'fr\£ $60.00 

O.GO hrs. pi-£. $144.00 

1.20 hrs.~ $288 00 



Z60JO 

09/30/2014 

09/30/2014 

09130/2014 

Dl5"1 RIC I '25 ·COOK COUNTY 

ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT~ 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSIST ANT SUPERINTENDENT 
RF.:.~ 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY 
RE: CLAIM OF BREACH OF EMPLOYMENT 
CONTRACT 

REVISE DRAFT OF RECOMMENDED 
REVISIONS TO BOARD POLICY ON ILLEGAL 
SUBSTANCES AND PARAPHERNALIA RE: 
REVISION OF POLICY 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE RESOURCES RE: 
REVISIONS TO BOARD POLICY 
PROHlBlTlNG USE OF ELECTRONIC 
SMOKING PRODUCTS; DRAFT 
Ri=TOMMENDATIONS RE: SAME 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

DISBURSEMENTS 
SEPTEMBER 2014 LEGAL RESEARCH CHARGES RE: WELTY 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS FOR THIS MATTER 

BILLING :>UJviMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

1.90 hrs.?}"' $<156.00 

0.20 l11s. ',Yl 'fZ.. $24.00 

1.20 hrs. 7>"-f2- $144.00 

S9,3%.00 

$1,254.74 

Sl.254.74 

$9,396.00 
$1,254.74 

$469.80 

$11,120.54 



SCARIANO HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYSATLAW·CHARTEREO 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

September 2, 2014 
Billed through 08131/2014 
Invoice No. 
Client number 
Matter number 

35278 
Z6G70 
00000 

roe 

AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

REC:EIVED SEP 18 2014 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATIER 

$5,496.00 
5274.80 

$5,770.80 

q.f/Jlll!IIIIII: ,, .. 
. ~J.31! ,/-. -.,) 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO: 
Scariano. Hime.< & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, lL 60681·0355 

For Billing or Payment lnquiries; contact Accounting al (312) 565-3100 ext 261 



SCARIANO HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CrlARTERED 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO. ILLINOIS 60681-0355 

TAXPAYER ID # 36-281 J428 

FOR BILLTNG INQUIRIES CONTACT ACCOUNTING AT (312) 56S·ll00 c,1. 261 

September 2, 2014 
Billing through 08/3112014 

Invoice No. 35278 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

3801 W. LAKE A VENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LA \V 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
08/04/2014 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 

ASSIST ANT SUPERINTENDENT 

08105/2014 

0810512014 

08105/2014 

08/06/2014 

08/06/2014 

08107120!4 

REVIEW EVALUATION AND DOCUMENTS; 
REVIEW BARGAINING AGREEMENT RE: -
REVIEW REGULATIONS AND OPTIONS FOR 
ADDRESSING APPLICANT ISSUES; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSOCIATE 
PRINCIPAL-RE: APPLICANT 
QUALIFICATIONS 

REVJEW STATUS AND OPTIONS; DRAFT 
LETTER TO EMPLOYEE FROM ASSOCIATE 
PRINCIPAL-RE: 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSIST ANT SUPERINTENDENT­
AND ASSOCIATE PRINCJPA~RE: 
PERSONNEL MATTERS 

ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF ADA GUIDANCE 
AND SECURITY GUARD HJRING CASES RE: 
HIRING QUESTION 

REVIEW FMLA STANDARDS; REVISE 
EVALUATION; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT 
-RE: EVALUATION 

REVIEW STANDARDS AND OPTIONS RE: 

Client Number 
Mauer Number 

26670 
00000 

0.70 hrs. S168.00 

~ 

0.501~ $120.00 

l,120.00 

I.to hrs~ $26400 

0.50 hrs~ $120.00 

1.00 hr~ S240.00 

0.30 hr~ $72.00 



7,6670 

08/08/2014 

0811112014 

08/11/20!4 

081\312014 

0811412014 

08/15/2014 

08118120\4 

0811812014 

0811912014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK COUNTY lnvo,e< Numb" Jll7! 

APPLICANT AND HIRING ISSUES 

REVJEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSOCIATEPRlNClP REVIEW 
DOCTOR NOTE; DRAFT RESPONSE TO 
ASSOCIATE PRINCIPAL--DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO GIVE TO EMPLOYEE 
RE 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSOCIATEPRINCJPAL DRAFT 
RESPONSE RE: 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WIIB 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT....., 
RE: PERSONNEL MATTERS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT­
RE: HIRING RETIREES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
DRAFT RESIGNATION 

AGREEMENT:DRAFTCORRESPONDENCE 
TO RE: .... 
RESIGNATION 

DRAFT AND REVIEW REMEDIA TJON PLAN; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: ... 
REMEDIATION 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE 
?? ?? RE: REVISIONS TO 
BOARD POLJCIES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
AND ASSISTANT 

SUPERINTENDENTS; REVIEW 
AGREEMENT; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO RE: PERSONNEL 
MATTERS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTH 
~AND ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT-REVISE 
AGREEMENT, DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO RE:--
RESIGNATION 

l'>ge l 

0.601rr~ $144.00 

0.20~ $48.00 

0.80 lrrs.~ S192.00 

0.20hr~ $48.00 

0.90 hrs. i,,ti'.. $216.00 

0.90 hr"70 $216.00 

4.00 hrs. ;-n,f!.. $960.00 

0.60 hrs. -r'1 i<-. $144.00 

0.40 hrs. '-yvt--f=. $96.00 



DISTRJCTl2'i. COOK COUNTY 

BJLLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

$5,496.00 
S274.80 

$5,770.80 



SCARJANO, HTh:IES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYSATLAW·CHARTERED 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

SCHOOL DISTRICT NO, 225 

August I, 2014 
Billed through 07/31120 14 
Invoice No. 
Client number 

Matter number 

35165 
Z6670 
00000 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUJTE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER 

"-' .. 

" i .. 

' 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO. 
Sc,,riano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.0 lJOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

JDP 

P 0. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60681,0355 

'''"'"""7 

$2,784.00 
$[39.20 

$2,923.20 

RECE!VFn ,iUG 192014 

For Billing or Payment [nquines; contact Accountrng at (312) 565-3100 ext 261 



SCARIANO HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

P.0. l;lOX &1355 
CHICAGO. JLLINOIS 60681 ·0355 

TAXPAYER ID# 36-2813428 

FOR BILLING INQUIRIES CONTACT ACCOUNT!ISG AT (312) 565·3100 e,L 261 

Augustl,2014 
Billing through 0713l/2014 

Invoice No. 35165 JDP 

GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
07/01/2014 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 

ASSOCIATE PRINCIPAL DRAFT 

07/02/2014 

07/02/2014 

07103/2014 

07/03120!4 

07/07/2014 

07/10/2014 

RESPONSE; REVIEW BOARD POLICY RE: 
ABSENCES 

WORK ON OPINION RE: DJSMISSAL OF 
DISABLED EMPLOYEE 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS, BOARD POLICIES 
AND EMPLOYEE HANDBOOK; PREPARE 
QUESTIONS FOR Eiv1PLOYEE; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WJTH ASSOCIATE PRINCIPAL 

- DRAFT LErfER TO EMPLOYEE; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO AS SOCIA TE 
PRINCIPAL~VIEWRESPONSES; 
DRAFT REPLIES RE· 

TELEPHONECONFERENCEWTTH 
llllliilillllllRE: SENATE BILL 7 

ISSUES AND EMPLOYEE REINSTATEMENT 
TO ESP POSITIONS 

REVIEW AND REVISE LETTER TO 
EMPLOYEE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
WITH AS SOCIA TE PR!NCIPA~RE. 

~ 

WORK ON REVISJONS TO COPYRIGHT 
POLICY 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH-

Client Number Z6670 
Matter Number 00000 

0.30 hrs. ~F' 872.00 

0.30 hrs. 71" 1<.. $72.00 

1.90 hrs. :}Y $456.00 

0.40 l,r.s. --p1-.fl.. $96.00 

/ 
0.20 hrs("Jr $48.00 

0.40 hrs. ](11?... $96.00 

1.20 hrs.fl1£ $288.00 



2.6670 

07/14/2014 

07/15/2014 

07/18/2014 

07/18/2014 

07/18/2014 

07/22/2014 

07/2212014 

07/23/2014 

07/23/2014 

07125/2014 

DISTRICT22S - COOK COUNTY lnvoiccNumb" JIIDS 

-WORK.ON REVISIONS 10 
COPYRIGHT POLICY AND PROCEDURES 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSOCIATE PRINCIPAL~REVIEW 
OPTIONS; REVIEW DOCTOR NOTE AND 
LETTER; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
ASSOCIATEPRINCIPAL .... REVIEW 
RESPONSE; DRAFT REPLY RE: .... 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSOCIATEPRINCIPAL~REVJEW 
AND REVISE LEJ'IER; DRAFT RESPONSE 
RE:-

REVIEW EVALUATION DRAFT; REVIEW 
BOARD POLICIES; REVIEW FMLA 
RETALIATION STANDARDS RE:--

REVJEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSOCJATEPRINCIPA DRAFT 
RESPONSE RE:-. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTH 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT ..... 
RE: PERSONNEL MATTERS 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSOCIATEPRINCll'AL-REVIEW 
DOCTOR NOTE; DRAFT RESPONSES TO 
ASSOCIATEPR!NCIP RE: -
REVIEW STATUS OF EMPLOYEE 
DISABILITY MATIER; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE Willi RE: 
TECHNOLOGY EMPLOYEE DISABILITY 

REVIEW COPYRlGHT LAWS AND 
GUIDANCE; REVIEW AND REVISE 
COPYRIGHT POLICIES 

REVIEW FINAL DRAFT OF BOARD 
COPYRIGHT POLICIES 

REVIEW COR.RESPOJ\'DENCE FROM 
ASSOCIATE PRINCIPAL~ REVIEW 
REVISED DOCTOR NOTE AND OPTIONS RE: 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

0.60 hrs(S"°Y $144.00 

0.20 hrs~ $48.00 

1.40 hr~ $336.00 

0.20 hrscSf" $48.00 

0.50 hr~ $120.00 

0.40 hrs.-_r, S96.00 

0.20 hrs. /Yli'.. $48.00 

2.50 hrs. ',(!£. $600.00 

0.70 hrs. 7vifE- S\68.00 

0.20 hrs.1B' $48.00 

$2,784.00 



26670 DISTilJCT 221 • COOK COUNTY 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

lns·o,c, Number )5165 fag, J 

$2,784.00 
$139.20 

$2,923.20 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

July!, 2014 
Billed through 06/30/2014 

Invoice No. 35036 
Client number 
Malt CT number 

26670 

00000 

m, 

UECEJVED 

GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR TIIIS MA TIER 

' ' 

PLEASE REMIT PA YMENTTO: 
Scariano, Hime< & Petrarca 

P.0.130X81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

/ 
PO.BOX 81355 

CHICAGO, JLLINOIS 60681-0355 
TAXPAYER ID # 36--281 )428 

152014 

$506.00 
S25.30 

SS31.30 

- ·-· . 

' ·- ' 
/ ' ... " ,.o ' 

For Billing or Payment Inquiries, contact Accounti<1g at (312) 565-3 I 00 ext. 261 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CKARTEREO 

P.O. IJOX R1355 
CKICAGO, JLLINOIS 60681-0355 

TAXPAYER ID # 36--2813428 

FOR BILLING INQUIRIES CONTACT ACCOUNTl:,/0 AT (312) 565-3100ext. 261 

July l, 2014 
Billing through 06130/20 14 

Invoice No. 35036 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSJONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
06104/2014 REVIEW STATUS OF CUSTODIAN 

ABSENCES MATTER; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH ASSOCIATE 
SUPERINTENDENT-

06/1212014 

06/18/2014 

0611912014 

06.'24/2014 

06/2612014 

06/2612014 

0612712014 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: EMPLOYEE 

D!SABJLITY QUESTIONS 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSOCJATE SUPERINTENDENT._. 
RE: FOTA REQUEST 

TELEPHONE CONfERENCE WITH 
RE: LJNION DUES FOIA 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: EMPLOYEE 

HARASSMENT CHARGE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: ELECTRONIC 

SURVEILLANCE MATTER 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
REVIEW OPTJONS; 

TELEPHONE COl\'FERENCE WITH 
....... RE: ... ABSENCE 
MATTER 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE Willi 

Client Number 
Matter Number 

Z6670 
00000 

0.30 hrs. 7'11-f!.. S69.00 

0.30 hrs. ,...,,..f!.. S69.00 

0.20 llrs. /Tl-£. $46.00 

0.20 hrs. t"-(2. $46.00 

0.30 hrs. f'YI fl $69.00 

0.30 hrs. 'fVl-£!.. $69.00 

O 40 hrs. '-;'YI. f2. S92.00 

0.20 hrs. f"'"',12. S46.00 



26610 DISTRICT 22> - COOK COUNTY [n,ofo, ~umb" JIOJ6 

R.E:_.ABSENCE 
OPTIONS 

TOTAL FEES FOR nns MATTER 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR IBIS BILL 

Page 2 

$506.00 

$506.00 
$25.30 

$531.30 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

April 1,2016 
Billed through 03/31/2016 

Invoice No. 
Client number 
Matter number 

37785 
26670 
00000 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUlTE200 
GLENVIEW,IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO: 
Scariano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, !L 60681-0355 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, JI.U1'0IS 60681-0355 

TAXPAYER ID# 36-2813428 

RECEIVEJl APR 2 91016 

JDP / 

$6,936.00 

---46-:8'"--

S7,282.80 

For Billing or Payment Inquiries; u,ntacl Accounting at (3 12) 565·3 I 00 ext. 235 



SCARIAN07 HIMESandPETRARCA 
ATTORNeYSATLAW·CHARTERED 

l'.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINO!S 60631--0355 

TAXPAYER ID# 36-2813428 

FOR BlLLINO INQUlR]ES CONTACT ACCOUNTING AT (l 12) 515.5--J 100 on 235 

April 1,2016 

Bllli11g through 03111/2016 

Invoice No. 3n85 IDP 

BOARD Of EDUCATION 

5-~1 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
03!01/2016 WORK ON OPrNION RE: FlCA PAYMENTS 

0310112016 

OJ/01120!6 

03/0112016 

0]11)3/2016 

03/03/2016 

ON CONTRACT 
COMPENSATION ITEMS 

REVIEW AND ANAL Y2E STRATEGY AND 
OPTIONS RE: SITTI.EMENT Of UNIFCRST 
DISPUTE BASED ON O??OSINO COUNSEL'S 
RECENT CORRESPONDENCE 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
OPPOSrNG COUNSEL TO AMERICAN 
ARBITRATION ASSOCIATION AND SEND 
CONTIRMATION EMAJL TO AMERICAN 
ARBITRATION ASSOC IA TIO."! RE: 
CONTINUING ABEYANCE OF lJNlflRST 
DISPUTE 

DRAIT CORRE.SPONDENCE TO OPPOSING 
COUNSEL RE: CONTINUING ABEYANCE OF 
ARBITRATION PROCEEDrNOS RB: UNJFJRITT' 
DISPUIB 

REVIEW UNIFIRST SETJ1,EMENT 
PROPOSAL; WORK ON RESPONSE TO SAME; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 

RE: SAME 

REVIEW DRAFT SETll..EMENT AGREEMENT 
AND RELEASE SENT BY COUNSEL FOR 
UNlFIRST; OUTLINE! SUGGE.STED 
REVISIONS AND STRATEGY RE: SAME 

Client Nmnber 26670 
Mattel" Number 00000 

030 Im,. ,.bl m.oo 

020 hrs. 'rf',+- $48.00 

0.20 hrs. 'r,vf?, $48.00 

1.10 !ITT.~ S:264.00 

l. 0 0 hrs . 'f.". ,{: S2 4 0 . 00 



l6670 DISTRICT 225 • COOK COUNTY ln'o'oiceN•mb<, 37185 "'' ' 
03/03/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.20 hrs. .,,."12- $48.00 

,_....., RE: UNIFJRST DISPUTE 

03/0312016 CORRESPOND WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL 0.20 hrs. 1YVf[, $48.00 
RE: SETILEMENT AGREEMENT AND 
RELEASE RELATED TO UNJFIRST DISPUTE 

03/0412016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.50 hrs. '}yl-re. $120.00 
AND ASSISTANT 

SUPERINTENDENT.-.RE: 
PERSONNEL MATTERS 

03/0412016 REVIEW AND ANALYZE IRS REGULATIONS 1.30 hrs. 
(ll/ 

$312.00 
RE: WHETHER EXCESS TRAVEL 
ALLOWANCE AMOUNTS WOULD BE 
SUBJECT TO FICA WITHHOLDING; DRAFT 
OPINION CORRESPONDENCE RE: SAME 

03/06/2016 WORK ON OPINION RE:~ 0.30 hrs.~ $72.00 
COMPENSATION FICA CONTRIBUTION 

03/07/2016 REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED UNll'IRST 0.40 hrs. """' $96.00 
SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT 

03/07/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. 7"<' $72.00 
RE: ADMIN. SALARY 

CALCULATIONS 

03/07/2016 REVIEW AND ANALYZE 2.00 hrs.,""-? $480.00 
CORRESPONDENCE FROM ILLINOIS 
DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN RIGHTS 
DISMISSING 
SECOND CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION; 
REVIEW PREVIOUS CHARGE OF 
DISCRJMJNAT!ON; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO 
~RE:SAME 

03/07/2016 WORK ON SETTLEMENT 0.30 hrs. ~--/?_. S72.00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSIN"G 
COUNSEL RE: UNI FIRST CONTRACT 
DISPUTE 

03/07/2016 CONTINUE TO WORK ON REVISIONS TO 0.40 hrs. ,vi-fZ__ S96.00 
SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND RELEASE; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE AND SUBMIT 
SAME AND SUGGESTED REVISIONS TO 
AGREEMENT TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: 
UN!FIRST DISPUTE 

03/07120!6 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO~ 0.20 hrs. -;-wf2. $48.00 

.... RE: CONFIRMATION OF FINAL 



26670 

03/11/2016 

03/14/2016 

03/!412016 

03/1512016 

03/1512016 

03/!512016 

03/1512016 

03/!512016 

03/16/2016 

03/1612016 

DISTRICT 225 • COOK COU:,JTY 

WORK ON LETIER TO BOARD OF 
EDUCATION AND RE: 
SETTLEMENT OF UNIFIRST DISPUTE AND 
EXECUTION OF SETILEMENT AGREEMENT 

CORRESPOND Willi OPPOSING COUNSEL 
RE: UNIFIRST DISPUTE 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE SCHOOL CODE 
PROVISIONS AND ONLWE PUBLICA T!ONS 
RE: VIABILITY OF ESTABLISHJNG SMALL 
BUSINESS WCUBATOR 
ENTREPRENEURS[,![P PROGRAM AT 
DISTRICT 

REVIEW UNI FIRST SETTLEMENT 
AGREEMENT 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT_ 
DRAFT RESPONSE RE; SUPPORT STAl'f RIF 
QUESTIONS 

MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
OPPOSING COUNSEL REGAR.D!NG 
FINALIZATION Of SETTLEMENT 
AGREEMENT RE: UNIFJRST DISPUTE 

MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
BUSINESS OFFICE REGARDING 
FINALIZATION OF PAYMENT AMOUNT JN 
SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RE: UNIFIRST 
DISPUTE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: EXTENSION 01' 

DEADLINE FOR PAYMENT IN SETTLEMENT 
AGREEMENT AND UPCOMING BOARD 
MEETING RE: UNIFIRST DISPUTE 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT~ 
REVIEW REVISED REMEDIATION PLANS; 
DRAFT REVISIONS; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT ..... RE: 
REMEDIATION PLANS 

P•se 4 

0.50 hrs. ?n--f2. $120.00 

0.20 hrs. -,..,,,-f!. $48.00 

2.90 hrs. ·,-,,.-fZ- $696.00 

0.40 hrs. n1Z. $96.00 

0.20 hrs.lfl $48.00 

0.50 hrs.~ $120.00 

0.50 hrs. ~ $120.00 

0.20 hrs. ·'fYI iZ $48.00 

0.40 hrs.~ $96.00 

0.20 hrs. 'yVl'°12 $48.00 



031nno16 

03mno16 

03nJnOl6 

03illn016 

mnsno16 

mnsno16 

0Jn&12016 

03(28!2016 

03!23!2016 

03/28/2016 

=nucTZl5 -OXlK COUNTY 

AGRFBMFNT RE: UNI FIRST DISPUTE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WI1H 
ASSIST ANT SUPFJillITENDENT ~ 
RE: REMEDIATION PROCESS QUESTIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ADMrNISTRATION RE; TBA CHER 
INVESTIGATION 

INVESTIGATION 

SUGGESTED REVISIONS TO SITTTIEMENT 
AGREEMENT RE: UNIFIRST DISPUTE; 
ANALYZE OPTIONS RE: NEGOTIATING 
SAME 

IMPLEMENT 
SI.KiGESTEO REVISIONS TO SITT"ILEMENT 
AGREEMENT RE: UNIFIRST DISPUTE; 
DRAFf CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING 
COUNSEL CONTAINING SAME 

REVIEW EEOC DATA REQUEST R~ 
DISMJSSAL 

WORK ON FINAL REVISIONS TO UNIFIRST 
AGREEMENT 

CORRESPOND WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL 
RE: SUGGESTED 
REVISIONS TO SITT"TLEMENT AGREEMENT 
RE: UNJFJRST DISPlITE 

WORK ON INVESTIGATION OF TEACHER 
MISCONDUCT 

WORK ON OPINION RE: STIJDENT 
BUSINESS PROORAM 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO-AND 
RE: OPPOSrNG 

CO!S~<:,SEL'S ACCEPTANCE OF-
SUGOESlED REVISIONS TO 

SE1'WL£ME'iI AGREEMENT 

0.20 bl"I .• $48.00 

0.50 bl.. 't,rl!- $120.00 

030 hri. [Yl-?- $72.00 

020 hro. r,1-rl. SM!.00 

020 hrs. -rr,--1':- $48.00 

O.«I hrs.fs\ $96.00 

0. 3 0 br.i . f"'c --fl. S 71. 0 0 

020 hrs. --pt-r2. $48.00 

030 11rs. ~ m.oo 

0.40 1rrs.(l'r. $96.00 

0.20 br.i. ,.-,-e... $48.00 

0.20 hrs. ,-V,-fl. W.00 



26670 

03/28/2016 

03/29/2016 

03/3112016 

03131120!6 

03/3112016 

DISTRICT 221 • COOK COUNTY 

SUGGESTED REVISIONS FOR ACCURACY 
RE: UN!FIRST DISPUTE 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO EEOC 
INVESTIGATOR REGARDING DOCUMENT 
REQUEST DEADLINE RE:-EEOC 
CHARGE OF OISCRIMINATION 

CONTACT ......... RE: 
SETILEMENT AGREEl\1ENT IN UNIFIRST 
DISPUTE 

REVIEW UNIFIRST SETILEMENT 
REVISIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE:TEACHER 

MISCONDUCT INVESTIGATION 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
AN~RE: 

REVISED UNIFIRST AGREEMENT 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

Pago 6 

0.30 hrs. '!f" s12.oo 

0.20 hrs. fYl-iZ- $48.00 

0.30 hrs. 'y,'t~ $72.00 

0.30 hrs. {11-IZ. $72.00 

$6,936.00 

$6,936.00 
$346.80 

$7,282.80 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTEREO 

March I, 2016 
Billed through 02/29/2016 
Invoice No. 37661 
Client number Z6670 JDP 
Matter number 00000 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

/ 
P.O. BOX 81355 

CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60681 ·0355 
TAXPAYER ID# 36·2813428 

-3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
RECEIVED MAR 112015 

GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATIER 

!M1Efil!,I F 

SIGN _ 

DATE .J~LIJ_-I~ .. -·,, ;,,, ----
1.CCT. ;10 __ __1/LJA .. ~~ 
I D P,\RTI!'.:._ [{FINAL_~ P.O. 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO: 
Scariano. Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

$5,040.00 
$252.00 

-~r$mv 
"---=· 

!'or Ililling or Payment Inquiries; comae! Accouming at (3 12) 565-3 I 00 ext. 235 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTEREO 

P.O.BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60681·0355 

TAXPAYER ID~ 36·2813428 

FOR BILLING INQUIRTES CONTACT ACCOUNTING AT(J12) S65·3100 ext. 235 

March l, 2016 
Billing through 02/29/2016 

Invoice No. 3766! JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

SCHOOL DISlRICTNO. 225 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE. S 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
02/01/2016 ANALYZE PROJECTION OF EARLY 

TERMINATION ACCOUNTING RE: 

02/03/2016 

02/03/2016 

02/03/2016 

02103/2016 

02/05/2016 

02/08/2016 

GLENBROOK NORTH/UNIFIRST; 
CORRESPOND WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL 
RE: CONFJRMA TION OF SAME 

WORK ON TEACHER REMEDIATION 
OPTIONS 

REVIEW EVALUATION ANO OPTIONS; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDEN~ 
RE:-REMEDIATION 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCI:'. WITH 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT~ 
RE: EMPLOYEE START TIME CHANGE 
REQUEST 

AND·--· PROJECTION OF EARLY TERMINATION OF 
GLENBROOK NORTH RELATIONSHIP RE: 
UNI FIRST DISPUTE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASS/STANT SUPERINTENDENT~ 
RE: TEACHER MISCONDUCT 
INVESTIGATION 

REVIEW EVALUATION COMMITTEE DA TA 

Client Number 
Mauer Number 

Z6670 
00000 

0.60 hrs. l-111,e. $144.00 

0.30 hrsit $72.00 

0.70 hr~ $168.00 

0.30 h~ $72.00 

0.20 hrs. 'J.-vt -f.?. $48.00 

0.20 hr1p- $48.00 

~· 
1.00 hr~ $240.00 



26670 

02/08/2016 

02/08/2016 

02/08/2016 

02/09/2016 

02/09/2016 

02/09/2016 

02/10/2016 

02/10/2016 

02/10/2016 

02/10/2016 

02/10/2016 

D!SIRJCT 225 • COOK COUNIT 

AND QUESTIONS RE: PERA 
IMPLEMENTA'J10N; TELEPHONE 

]o,~ice Noml><r 37661 

CONFERENCE WITII RE: 
SAME 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF CUSTODIAL 
SUPPLY DISPUTE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE; TEACHER 

MISCONDUCT 

REVJEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
liiillliliiiiiilill RE: SUBMISSION OF 

BID FOR PURCHASING; REVJEW OPTIONS 
RE: PERMISSIBILITY OF SAME; DRAFT 
RESPONSE 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT.-.. 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTH 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT~ 
RE: TEACHER MISCONDUCT 

CORRESPOND WITH 
REGARDING CONFJRMATION OF 
OUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS AND 
MERCHANDISE RE: UNI FIRST DISPUTE 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING 
COUNSEL RE; UNIFIRST DISPUTE 

REVIEW DRAFT TEACHER REMEDIATION 
DOCUMENTS 

REVJEW DOCUMENTS FROM DISTRICT; 
PREPARE OUTLINE OF NOTICE TO REMEDY 
RE: TEACHER MISCONDUCT 

DRAFT AND REVIEW NOTICE TO REMEDY; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDEN~RE: TEACHER 
NOTICE TO REMEDY 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO 
CORRESPONDENCE FROM AMERICAN 
ARBITRATION ASSOCIATION CASE 
l\iANAGER AND OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: 
ADDillONAL PERIOD OF ABEYANCE IN 
UNIFIRST DISPUTE 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 

Pago 1 

0.30 hrs. 'J'Vl..e_ $72.00 

0.20 hrs. 11'"1. f2... S48.00 

0.50 hrs. ~ $120.00 

0.50~ $120.00 

0.20 hrs. l>I $48.00 

0.20 hrs. --yvv;e. $48.00 

0.50 h~ $120.00 

1.10 hrs~ $264.00 

1.30 hrlr $312.00 

0.20 hrs. ')vt.f,2. $48.00 

~,12-0.20 hrs. , , • $48.00 



0211212016 

02/1512016 

0211612016 

0211612016 

02/1712016 

0211712016 

02/1812016 

02119/2016 

02/1912016 

0212412016 

DISTRICT ns -COOK COUNTY lovoiceNumb" 3766! 

OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: UNIFIRST 
DISPUTE; REVIEW OPTIONS RE: 
PROCEEDING WITH SETfLEMENT 
DISCUSSIONS 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: SUPPORT 
STAFF PRESENTATION 

REVIEW FINAL DRAFT OF NOTICE TO 
REMEDY RE- NOTICE TO REMEDY 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM DISTRICT; 
PREPAREFO~ 
QUESTIONS RE: TEACHER NOTICE TO 
RE!vfEDY 

ATTEND BOARD OF EDUCATION MEETING 
AT DISTRICT OFFICES RE: TEACHER 
NOTICE TO REMEDY 

REVISE NOTICE TO REMEDY; DRAFT 
COVER PAGE; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO RE: NOTICE TO 
REMEDY 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT~ 
ANO DIRECTOR-.RE: SUPPORT 
STAFF PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT 
PLANNING 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT­
RE: TEACHER EVALUATIONS 

REVIEW SUMMA TIVE EVALUA T!ON; 
REVIEW SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT ~EVJEW 
RESPONSE; DRAFT REPLY RE: TEACHER 
EVALUATION AND REMEDIATION 

SEVERAL CORRESPONDENCES WITH. 
RE: EMPLOYEE COMPLAINT 

INVESTIGATIONS AND RESOLUTIONS; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE Willi .. 
-RE: SAME; WORK ON FINDINGS 
REPORTS 

0.20 h~ S4&.00 

0.20h~ $48.00 

0.50~ $120.00 

3.50 h~ $840.00 

0.50 hrs. ·j-'Vl-e. Sl20.00 

0.601~ $144.00 

0.20. $48.00 

1.10 h'fv $264.00 

I.SO Ii> $360.00 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM ASSISTANT 
SUPERJNTENDENT~REVJEW 
AND REVISE SUMMATIVE EVALUATION 

2.30 hrs. $552.00 
,:,-



26610 

02/25/2016 

02/26/2016 

02/26/2016 

02/29/2016 

DISIRJCT 225 • COOK COUNTY !avoi"Numbor 37661 

DRAFT RE: TEACHER EVALUATION 
REVIEW 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE AMENDED 
CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION FILED BY 
FORMEREMPLOYE~D~ 
CORRESPONDENCE TO~ 

-RE:SAME 

FINAL REVIEW OF AND REVISIONS TO 
TEACHER SUMMATNEEVALUAT!ON RE: 
TEACHER EV ALUA TJON DRAl'T 

CONTACT OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: STATUS 
OF SETTLEMENT IN UN!FIRST DISPUTE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT-. 
RE: EVALUATION AND RJF QUESTIONS 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATfER 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

""' . 
0.70 hrs:g, $168.00 

$120.00 

0.20 hrs. 'rf'--t£ $48.00 

0.50h~ $120.00 

$5,040.00 

$5,040.00 
$252.00 

$5,292.00 



SCARIANO,HIMESandPETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

RECFTV1<.n FFH 1 fi :>nm 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

February 1, 2016 
Billed through 01/3112016 
Invoice No. 
Client number 
Malter number 

37566 
26670 
00000 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATIER 

PLEASE REMIT PA YMENTTO: 
Scariano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

JDe 

P.O. BOX SllS5 
CHICAGO. ILLINOJS 60681--035S 

TAXPAYER ID# 36-2813428 

$5,064.00 
$253.20 

$5,317.20 

For Bilting or Payment Inquiries; contac! Accounting at (312) 565-31 00 est. 235 



SCARIANO, JilMES and PETRARCA 
ATTOR~EYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60681-IHSS 

TAXPAYER ID# 36-2813428 

FOR BILLING INQUIRIES CONTACT ACCOUNTING AT (312) 565-3100 «t. 235 

February 1, 2016 
Billing through 01/31/2016 

Invoice No. 37566 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE200 
GLENVIEW, JL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
01/04/2016 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 

ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN RIGHTS 

01/06/2016 

01/06/2016 

01/06/2016 

01107/2016 

01107/2016 

RE: CHARGE OF 
DlSCR!MlNATION 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ILLINOJS DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN RJGHTS 
RE:-SECOND CHARGE OF 
DISCRIMINATION; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO DlSTRICT RE: SAME; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE Willi~ 

RE: SAME; REVIEW 
DOCUMENTS RE: SAME 

REVIEW UNIFIRST CONlRACT CLAIM AND 
STRA TEGIZE DEFENSE OF SAME 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: SETTLEMENT OF 
UNIFIRST DISPUTE 

WORK ON RESPONSE TO CUSTODIAL 
SUPPLY VENDOR RE: CLAIM FOR 
REIMBURSEMENT FOR BATHROOM 
SUPPLIES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCES (2) WITH 
RE: CUSTODIAL SUPPLY 

ISSUE AND TEACHER RJF TIEBREAKER; 
WORK ON RESPONSE TO VENDOR DEMAND 
FOR PAYMENT FOR CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES 

Client Number 
Matter Number 

0.30 h~ 

1.20 hi 

0.20 hrs. ~ 

0.20 hrs. ii>' 

·w 0.40 hrs. 

Z6670 
00000 

$72.00 

S288.00 

$48.00 

$48.00 

S96.00 

1.10 hrs.f\.'\-r,Z, $264.00 



26670 DISTRTCT 2l>. COOK CO\JNTY lm·oiec Numb<r 37566 Pa,go 2 

01/07/2016 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM EEOC 0.30~ $72.00 
RE:-- CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION 

0110712016 REVIEW PURCHASE LEDGERS BETWEEN 0.50 hrs. ~ $120.00 
DISTRICT BUILDINGS AND UNIFIRST TO 
CONFIRM PURCHASE ALLEGED IN 
OPPOSING COUNSEL CORRESPONDENCE; 
CORRESPONDENCE WJTH DISTRICT 
BUSINESS OFFICE TO CONFIRM SAME 

01/07/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING 0.30 hrs. w $72.00 
COUNSEL RE: UNIFIRST DISPUTE 

01/07/2016 REVIEW OPTIONS TO MOVE FORWARD 0.30 hrs. 
;{)' 

$72.00 
WITH SETTLEMENT AFTER TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL 
RE: UNIFIRST DISPUTE 

01/0812016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.20 hr~ $48.00 
ASSISTANTSUPERINTENDENT.-i 
RE: CUSTODIAN RETIREMENT 

Ol/11/2016 WORK ON RESPONSE TO ATTORNEY 0.40 hrs. ~ $96.00 
DEMAND TO SETILE CUSTODIAL SUPPLY 
ARRANGEMENT 

Ol/!112016 DRAFT AND REVIEW AGREEMENT: DRAFT 0.80 hr~ $192.00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT ... RE: 
CUSTODIAN RESIGNATION 

01/1312016 REVIEW .... FILES TO PREPARE 2.20 hr{3r $528.00 
RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL 
INFORMATION RECEIVED FROM THE 
!LLINOJS DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN RIGHTS 

01/13/2016 3.50 hrs. $840.00 

1' 

01/1912016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.30 h~ $72.00 
~RE: RJF PROCEDURES 

01/!9/2016 DRAFT RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR 4.30 h~ $1,032.00 
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FROM 
ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF HUJl.1AN RIGHTS 
RE: --SECOND CHARGE OF 
DISCRIMINA T!ON 

01/20/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH .. 0.30 hrJS{ $72.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 22.1 • COOK COUNTY )JJ>O~O Numbi:r 37566 rage J 

-RE: RIF PROCEDURES 

01/20/2016 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO DISTRICT 0.30 hrs. $72.00 
RE, SECOND CHARGE OF 'll' 
DISCRIMINATION 

01/20/2016 DRAFT REQUEST TO OPPOSING COUNSEL 0.20 hrs. /0' $48.00 
FOR SETTLEMENT DEMAND BEFORE 
FEBRUARY BOARD MEETING RE: UNIFIRST 
DISPUTE 

01/21/2016 WORK ON TERMINATION OF CUSTODIAL 0.50 h'?} $120.00 
SUPPLY CONTRACT 

01/2112016 ANALYZE UNIFIRST POSITION RE: RENTAL 0.30 hrs. I.> $72.00 
OF TOWEL DISPENSERS AND STRATEGIZE 
RESPONSE RE: SAME; WORK ON 
CONTRACT CLAIM DEFENSE 

01/21/2016 CORRESPOND WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL 0.20 hrs. W"' $48.00 
RE: UNIFJRST DISPUTE 

0!/22/2016 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 0.20 h~ $48.00 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT-
REVIEW AGREEMENT AND OPTIONS; 
DRAFT RESPONSE RE: CUSTODIAN 
RETIREMENT AGREEMENT 

01/26/2016 0.60 hrs.·("),£. $144.00 

01/26/2016 WORK ON TEACHER REMEDIATION 0.40 hrs. efj-1 $96.00 
OPTIONS 

01/26/2016 REVIEW STATUS OF REMEDIATION 0.201~ $48,00 
l'vlA ITER R.WREMEDIA TION 

01/27/2016 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 0.20~ $48.00 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT--
REVIEW REMEDIA T!ON PLAN; DRAFT 
RESPONSE RE:.REMEDIATION 

01/27/2016 CORRESPOND WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL 0.20 hrs. ~ S48.00 
RE: EXPECTATION FOR ESTIMATE OF 
AMOUNTS OWED AT GLENBROOK NORTH 
AT END OF RELATIONSHIP RE: UNIFIRST 
DISPUTE 

01/28/2016 REVIEW AND ANALYZE REQUEST l'vlADE 0.50~ $120.00 
BY EMPLOYEE~TO HA VE 



Z6670 

0!12912016 

DISTRICT 225 • COOK COUNTY lm·oico Number 37%6 

ILLINOIS HUMAN RIGHTS COMMISSION 
REVIEW DECISION TO DISMISS HIS 
CHARGES BY ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF 
HUMAN RIGHTS 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
RE .... 

DISCRIMINATION MATIER 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS lllLL 

Pag, 4 

0.50 hrs. '7"1"~$120.00 

$5,064.00 

$5,064.00 
$253.20 

$5,317.20 



SCARIANO, H™ES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

January 4, 2016 
Billed through 12/31/2015 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

Invoice No. 
Client number 
Matter number 

3801 \V. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, JL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER 

37399 
Z6670 
00000 

I : .', -

' . ' ~,., 
or.•, 

JDP 

-----

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO: 
Scariano. Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 6068Hl3SS 

TAXPAYER728 

$6,504.00 
$325.20 c $6,8292?) 

For Billing or Payment Inquiries; contact Accounting at (3 12) 565-31 00 ext. 235 



SCARIANO,HIMESandPETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT lAW · CHARTERED 

P.O BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 606Sl-0355 

TAXPAYER ID# 36-2813428 

FOR llJLL!NG JNQUIRJES CO:-ITACT ACCOUNTING AT(312) 565·3100e,c. 235 

January 4, 2016 
Billing through 12/31/2015 

Invoice No. 37399 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
12101/2015 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 

ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT 

12102/20!5 

12(0212015 

12(0212015 

1210212015 

1210212015 

COMPLETE RETIREMENT AGREEMENT; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASS!STANT 
SUPERINTENDENT -RE: 
CUSTODIAN RETIREMENT 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF DISPUTE WITH 
CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT~ 
REVISE AGREEMENT; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT-RE: 
CUSTODIAN RETIREMENT 

PREPARE FOR FACT FINDING CONFERENCE 
FOR~SECOND CHARGE OF 
DISCRIMINATION; TELEPHONE 
C_QNJ:ERENCE WlTJJ 

RE: SAME 

EEOC CLAIM 

ANALYZE UNIFIRST SETTLEMENT 
DEMAND AND STRATEGIZE RESPONSE; 
REVIEW DISTRICT OFFICE UNIFIRST 
CONTRACT EXPIRATION AND RENEWAL 

Client Number 26670 
Matter Number 00000 

0.50 hrs~ $120.00 

. ,R. 
0.30 hrs. 'yl'\ $72.00 

0.20~ $48.00 

l.20h~ $288.00 

~,{c 
0.30 hrs. , ' ' $72.00 

0.70 hrs. )'vi,£ $168.00 



Z6670 

12/02/2015 

12/02/2015 

12/03/2015 

12/03/2015 

12/03/2015 

[2/03/2015 

12/03/2015 

12/03/2015 

12/04/2015 

]2/07/2015 

12/07/2015 

12/07/2015 

DISTRICT ns -COOK COUNTY Invoice Numb<r 37399 Pago 2 

EXPOSURE; WORK ON CORRESPONDENCE 
TO RE:SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL 
FOR UNIFIRST CORPORATION RE: 
SETILEMENT; REVIEW AND ANALYZE 
OPTIONS MOVING FORWARD 

WORK ON FIRST DRAFT OF 
CORRESPONDENCE TO~ 
-RE: CONVERSATION WITH 
COUNSEL FOR UN/FIRST AND SETILEMENT 
OPTIONS MOVING FORWARD 

REVIEW AND REVISE OPINION LEITER RE: 
CUSTODIAL SUPPLY CONTRACT 

PREPARE FOR~FACT FINDING 
CONFERENCE 

REVIEW MESSAGE FROM EEOC RE: 
CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION FILED BY 
FORMEREMPLOYE~ 

DRAFT SAMPLE LE TIER TO BE PUT ON 
DISTRICT LETIERHEAD TO NOTIFY 
COMPANY OF NON-RENEWAL OF 
AGREEMENT RE: UNJFJRST DISPUTE 

ANALYZE AND REVISE OPTIONS 
PRESENTED IN CORRESPONDENCE TO 

-RR 
CONVERSATION WITH COUNSEL FOR 
UN!FIRST AND SETILEMENT OPTIONS 
MOVING FORWARD 

CONTACT ATIORNEY FOR UNIFIRST RE: 
FURTHERING SETILEMENT DISCUSSIONS 

WORK ON TERMINATION OF CUSTODIAL 
SUPPLIER ARRANGEMENT 

WORK ON UPDATE TO RESPONSE TO 
AUDITOR LETTER 

.,-~ERENCE WITH 
~RE:STATUSOF 

RELATIONSHIP \VITI! CUSTODIAL SUPPLY 
CONTRACTOR 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
AND 

0.60 hrs.~ $144.00 

2.30 hrs. r-9-- $552.00 

0.40 hrs. />'\.1Z-- $96.00 

0.80 hrs-at $192.00 

0.30 hr~ $72.00 

0.20 hrs. 1v,,{l.. $48.00 

0.50 hrs. '7'1-f?.- $120.00 

0.20 hrs. ;'"11.,-12. $48.00 

0.40 hrs. $96.00 

0.30 hrs. $72.00 

0.40 hrs. -pv'(l... $96.00 

0.40 hrs. J>t .'(2._ $96.00 



12/07/2015 

12107120!5 

12/07(20]5 

12/0712015 

!2/08/2015 

12/0S/2015 

12/09/2015 

12/10/2015 

12/10/20]5 

12/10/2015 

12/10/2015 

DtS11llCT ru · COOK COUNTY 

ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT~ 
RE; FORMER.E'MPLOYEE~ 

REVIEW UNIFIRST SETILEMENT 
PROPOSAL AND ANALYZE COMPLIANCE 
WITH BIDDING STATUTE 

lELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: UNlF!RST 

DISPITTE [NO CHARGE PER ATIORNEY 
PETRARCA] 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WTilf OPPOSING 
COUNSEL RE: UNIFlRST DISPLITE AND 
FURTIIBRING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSION 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: Ui'.'IFIRST DISPUTE 
AND FURTIIBRJNG SETTLEMENT 
DISCUSSION 

WORK ON ATIORNEY CLAIM RE: 
CUSTODIAL SUPPLY CONTRACT DISPUTE 

TELEPHONE MESSAGE TO EEOC RE: 
REQUEST TO MEDIATE DISCRJMINA TION 
CHARGE FILFD BY FORMER EMPLOYEE -
CORRESPOND WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL 
FORUNIFIRSTRE;SCHEDUUNG 
CONFERENCE CALL TO FURIBER 
SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS 

WORK ON OPINION RE PERA GOAL 
SETTING REQUIREMENTS 

PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND~<;J_b.T 
DIS1RICTTO PREPARE FOR-. 
FACT FINDING CONFERENCE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VlTH 
ATTORNEY FOR UNIFIRST RE: 
SETTLE!.ffiNT DISCUSSIONS 

-.,, 
O)NV2RSATION WJlli A1TORNEY FOR 
UNIF!RST AND SUBSTANTIATING CLAIM 
THAT NO AMOUNTS ARE OWING FOR 
MA.TFlUALS 

0.50 hr,,. 7(1 {!. $120.00 

0.20 tn,,, ,..,,.,--f2.. NIC 

0.20 Im. [>"\12. $48.00 

0.20 hri. 'J"I\ -f2.. $48.00 

o.3o hr.. ·'"'fY\..£ sn.oo 

0.20 hn.\+ $48.00 

0.20 ho. yr\~ $48.00 

0.50 hrsv $120.00 

3.oo hrs'*" rno.oo 

0.30 hrs. yn~ $72.00 

0.20 hrs. p,..-fZ.- S4&.oo 



12110/2015 

12111/2015 

12/11/2015 

121!5/2015 

12/16/20]5 

12/1612015 

12/18/2015 

12/21/2015 

12/21/2015 

12122/20]5 

DISTRJCT 2.ll • COOK COUNTY lllVoJce 1'umber J7J'l9 Page 4 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ATIORNEY 
FOR UNIFIRST RE: SUMMARY OF 
SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS TO THIS POINT, 
AND ATTEMPTS TO GATHER 
DOCUMENTATION REGARDING 
OUTSTANDING ISSUES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH­
.-RE: PERA COMMIITEE 
~ENDATION 

WORK ON .-CHARGE OF 
DISCRIMINATION MATTER 

PREPARE FOR.-FACT FINDING 
CONFERENCE; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO DEPARTh1ENT OF HUMAN RIGHTS RE: 
SAME 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT._._ 
REVIEW RETIREMENT AGREEMENT; 
LEAVE VOICEMATL FOR ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT-RE: 
CUSTODIAN RETIREMENT AGREEMENT 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND FACT FINDING 
CONFERENCE AT THE ILLINOIS 
DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN RIGHTS RE: 
SECOND CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION 
FILED BY CUSTODIAN ..... 

REVIEW STATUS OF UNI FIRST DISPUTE 

WORK ON OPINION RE: EXCLUSION OF 
PARENT FROM EXTRACURRICULAR 
EVENTS 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
RE, 

DISRUPTIVE PARENT; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO RE: 
SAME 

REVIEW REQUEST FROM ILLINOIS 
DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN RIGHTS FOR 
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION RE:_. 
SECOND CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION; 
REVIEW DOCUMENTS; DRAFT---·-­
CORRESPONDENCE TO...--. 

0.50 hrs. ,'11-1- $120.00 

0.40 hrs"i?' $96.00 

!.20 hr~ $288.00 

2.30 hr~ $552.00 

0.20 h~ $48.00 

5.00 !~ $1,200.00 

0.20 hrs. 'J'Y"l,12. $48.00 

0.30 hrs. t>i-f2.. $72.00 

0.20 hrs. 0 ~ , $48.00 

0.60 hr~ 

' 
$144.00 



12/28/2015 

12/29/2015 

12n9/2015 

DISTRICT 22S - COOK COUNTY Jn,..,;" t-lumber 37399 

~RE:SAME 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
AMERICAN ARBITRATION ASSOCIATION 
CASE MANAGER RE: UNIFIRST DISPUTE 
AND CONTINUING ABEYANCE OF 
ARBITRATION PROCEEDINGS 

CORRESPOND WITI:l CASE MANAGER AT 
AMERICAN ARBITRATION ASSOCIATION 
RE: CONTINUING ABEYANCE OF 
ARBITRATION PROCEEDINGS 

CORRESPOND WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL 
RE: PROGRESSION OF SETTLEMENT 
DISCUSSIONS AND CONTINUING 
ABEYANCE OF ARBITRATION 
PROCEEDINGS 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

0.20 hrs. {"\ .-/2. $48.00 

0.20 hrs. J"' 12'.- $48.00 

0.20 hrs. '"')'1112- $48.00 

$6,504.00 

S6,504.00 
$325.20 

$6,829.20 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNE:YS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

Decemberl,2015 
Billed through 11130/2015 
Invoice No. 37335 
Client number 
Matter number 

26670 
00000 

3801 W, LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 

COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTALC!IARGES FOR Tl!IS MATIER 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO: 
Scariano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

JDP 

P.O. BOX 8J3SS 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60681-0355 

TAXPAYER ID# 36-281J428 

$13,656.00 
$1,117.28 

$682.80 

$15,456.08 

' " 

For Billing or Payment Inquiries; contact Accounting at (312) 565-3 lOO ex!. 235 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYSATLAW·CHARTERED 

P.O. HOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60681-0355 

TAXPAYER ID II 36-2813428 

FOR IIILL!NG 11':QUIRIES CO).ITACT ACCOUNTING AT (J 12) 565-3100 ext. 235 

December I, 2015 

Billing through 11/30/2015 

Invoice No. 37335 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
l l/0212015 PREPARE FORAND ATIEND STUDENT 

EXPULSION HEARING AT DJ STRICT 
OFl'ICES RE-EXPULSION HEARING 

1110212015 

l l/02/2015 

11104/2015 

11/05/2015 

11/05/2015 

11/05/2015 

REVIEW HEARING ISSUES; REVIEW 
PROCEDURESTOPREPAREFORBOARD 
HEARING RE; STUDENT EXPULSION 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN RIGHTS 
RE: .... CHARGE OF 
DISCRIMINATION 

WORK ON UPDATE TO AUDIT LETl"ER 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
SUPEPJNTENDENT RE: STUDENT 
SUSPENSION REVIEW QUESTIONS 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
AMERICAN ARBITRATION ASSOCIATION; 
T LEI' ONE CONFERENCE WITH 

RE: SAME 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ILLJNOIS DEPART OF HUMAN RIGHTS RE: 
TNITIAL ..... CHARGE OF 
DISCRIM!NA T!ON; RESPOND TO SAME; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENC~ 
.... RE:SAME 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

26670 

00000 

5.60 hrs. ,n.,Z.$1,344.00 

0.60 hrs. rrt-fZ. $144.00 

0.20 hrs~ $48.00 

0.30 hrs. w $72.00 

0.50 hrs. y{l,~ $120.00 

0.30 hrs. f"'l./2.. $72.00 

-/ 
0.50 hrs. ) f $120.00 



Z6!170 

ll/0612015 

I l/06/20!5 

11106/2015 

11109/2015 

11109/2015 

1110912015 

ll/0912015 

11110/2015 

1111012015 

1111012015 

DISTRICT 225 • COOK COUNTY Jm-oi«Numh« JlJll 

REVIEW DEMAND FORARBITRA TION 
MADE BY UNIFIRST CORPORATION; 
RESEARCH LEGAL ISSUES· TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE Willi 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
RE: INITIAL 

CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION 

RE:SAME 

WORK ON OPINION RE: CLAIM FOR 
ARBITRATION RE: CUSTODIAL SUPPLY 
CONTRACT 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: MANDA TED 

REPORTING QUESTION 

TELEPl!ONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: DEMAND 

FOR ARBITRATION MADE BY UNIFIRST 
CORPORATION; REVIEW RULES AND 
GUIDELINES OF AMERICAN ARBITRATION 
ASSOCIATION 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ILLlNOlS 
DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN RIGHTS RE: 
-MATIER 

WORK ON RESPONSE TO DEMAND FOR 
ARBITRATION RE: CONTRACT FOR 
CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND 
CORRESPONDENCE RE: UNIFIRST DISPUTE; 
REVIEW AND ANALYZE LAW AND 
OPTIONS RE: VALIDITY OF AGREEMENT, 
AVOIDING ARBITRATION, AND 
PROCEEDING IN STATE COURT ON 
DECLARATORY JUDGMENT ACTION 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
AMERICAN ARBITRA TJON ASSOCIA I/ON 
RE: OBTAINING EXTENSION FOR 
SUBMISSION OF ANSWERING STATEMENT 
IN UNIFJRST DISPUTE 

rag< 2 

2.50 hrs.~ $600.00 

0.20~ $48.00 

0.50 hrs.j"{ $120.00 

0.40 hrs. '1'Yt f!.... $96.00 

0.20 hrs. f""'\.-fC. $48.00 

2.00 hrs. 71'\-fl. $480.00 

0.30 h~ :.r( $72.00 

l.30 hrs. i"".£. $312.00 

3.00 hrs. ,,......-re. $720.00 

0.20 hrs. ']'{If:- $48.00 



Z6u70 

11/1012015 

11/11/2015 

11/11/2015 

11/11/2015 

11111/20] 5 

lllll/2015 

11/11/2015 

]l!]]/2015 

] ]/11/2015 

1111212015 

DISTRICT ll5. COOK COUNTY !m,;ce Numl>er 31335 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
······-RE:UNIFIRST 

DISPUTE AMOUNT 

WORK ON RESPONSE TO DEMAND TO 
ARBITRATE CUSTODIAL SUPPLY 
CONlRACT 

REVIEW RECENT !SBE GUIDANCE RE: PERA 
REQUIREMENTS 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE: DEMAND 
FOR ARBITRATION BY UNIFIRST 
CORPORATION RE: TOWEL SERVICE 

REVIEW UN!FIRST CONTRACT CLAIM AND 
ARBITRATION DEMAND; ANALYZE 
CONTRACT VALIDITY AND FJLING 
DECLARATORY JUDGMENT LAWSUIT TO 
DECLARE CONTRACT NON-BINDING; 
WORK ON I.ETIER TO OPPOS!NG COUNSEL; 
WORK ON LITIGATION STRATEGY 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO CASE 
MANAGER AT AMERJCAN ARBITRATION 
ASSOCIATION REGARDING EXTENSION TO 
FILE ANSWERING STATEMENT RE: 
UNIFIRST DISPUTE 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE LAW RE: ABILITY 
OF BOARD OF EDUCATION TO BE BOUND 
BY CONTRACT EXECUTED OUTSIDE OF 
PUBLIC MEETING AND ABILITY OF 
COURTS TO VOID SUCH AGREEMENTS IF 
NOT BID UPON; ANALYZE STRATEGY OF 
FILING DECLARATORY JUDGMENT ACTION 
IN STA TE COURT TO VOID CONTRACT AND 
AVOID ARBITRATION; WORK ON 
CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING 
COUNSEL; ALL RE: UNIFIRST DISPUTE 

WORK ON FIRST DRAFT OF DEC LARA TORY 
JUDGMENT COMPLAINT RE: UNJFIRST 
DISPUTE 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE JLLlNOIS LAW RE: 
PERA REGULATIONS AND 
NON-REGULATORY GUIDANCE 

WORK ON RESPONSE TO ARBITRATION 
DEMAND RE: CUSTODIAN SUPPLIES; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 

0.20 hrs. \bJ $48.00 

0.30 hrs.1"'12- $72.00 

$312.00 

0.50 hrs. ilY 5120.00 

3.30 hrs. 71\. ~ $792.00 

0.20 hrs. ']Y. -f2.. $48.00 

3.60 hrs."i"',~ $864.00 

1.20 hrs.-p\~ S288.00 

0.40 hrs. ),1\-fZ.. $96.00 

1.20 hrs. f">'°"•ii-, $288.00 



l l/J2/l015 

l l/12/lOIS 

llf12/l015 

l l/12/l0l5 

ll/1212015 

11/12/lOlS 

1 l/12/l015 

11/13/2015 

11/13/2015 

11/13/2015 

11/13/2015 

DISTRICT ill · CDOK COUNTY 

RE: SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE Wlllf 
RE: CUSTODIAL SUPPLY 

USAGE; WORK ON REPUDIATION OF 
CONlRACT RE: SAME 

[NO CHARGE PER ATTORNEY PETRARCA] 

ENiilCIOECEFROM 
: UNIFIRST 

DISPUlE [NO CHARGE PER ATTORNEY 
PETRARCA] 

WORK ON CORRESPONDENCE TO 
OP?OSING COUNSEL RE: UNIFIRST DISPUTE 
[NO CHARGE PER ATTORNEY PETRARCA] 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE OPTIONS MOVING 
FORWARD WITH CORRESPONDENCE TO 
OPPOSING COUNSEL AND FIUNG 
DECLARATORY JUDGMENT ACTION RE: 
UNlFJRST DISPUTE [NO CHARGE PER 
A TIORNEY PETRARCA] 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE IA W RE: POWER 
OF ILLlNOIS COURTS TO ST A Y 
ARBfffiATION PROCEEDINGS; ANALYZE 
OPTIONS RE: RUNG MOTION TO STAY 
ARBITRATION RE: UNIFlRST DISPUTE 

REVIEW AND ANAL VZE LAW RE: 
DE-CLARA TORY JUDGMENT ACTIONS AND 
WORK ON FIRST DRAFT OF COMPLAINT RE: 
UNIFJRST DISPUlE 

PREPARE MA TERlALS AND CONTENT FOR 
PERA COMMITIFE MEETING 

WORK ON UNIFJRST CO Nm.ACT 
REPUDlATION STRATEGY, LEITER TO 
OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: DEMAND FOR 
ARBITRATION AND DECLARATORY 
JUDGMENT ACTION RE: SAME 

WORK ON COMPU..!NT RE: UNI FIRST 
DISPUTE 

WORK ON AND SEND CORRESPCJNDEl\'CE 

0.70 hn.1"\,t.. $168.00 

020hn. w NIC 

020 hrs. 7"'.f;- NIC 

0.50 hn. 1-v\-f?.... NIC 

0.40 hr..~ NIC 

0.40 hrs. -r,vf!-. S96.00 

420 hrs. '1"#s1,oos.oo 

2.50 hn. ~? $600.00 

1.30 hrs. ~ 1312.00 

0.60 hrs. 'r"-~$144.00 

0.40 !ITT. 'r't -(2... S96.00 



Z6670 

ll/16/2015 

11/16/2015 

ll/18/2015 

11/18/2015 

ll/18/2015 

11/18/2015 

11/18/2015 

11/18/2015 

11/19/2015 

I !/19/2015 

ll/\9/2015 

DISTRICT 225 • COOK COUNTY lavoi«Numb<c Jl)Jj Pa,ie 5 

TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: UNIFIRST 
DISPUTE 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING OF 
PERA COMMITTEE 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE LAW RE: 
AUTIIORITY OF CIRCUIT COURT TO STAY 
ARB!TRATION PROCEEDINGS; WORK ON 
FIRST DRAFT OF MOTION TO STAY 
ARBITRATION RE: UNIFIRST DISPUTE 

DRAFT DECLARATORY JUDGMENT 
COMPLAINT AND MOTION TO STAY 
ARBITRATION PROCEEDINGS RE: UNIFTRST 
CONTRACT CLAIM 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE OPTIONS MOVING 
FORWARD WITH CORRESPONDENCE TO 
OPPOSING COUNSEL, ARBITRATION 
PROCEEDINGS, AND STATE COURT 
PROCEEDINGS RE: UNlFIRST DISPUTE 

CORRESPOND WITH AMERICAN 
ARBITRATION ASSOCIATION RE: DEMAND 
FOR ARBITRATION AND ACCOMPANYING 
CONTRACT RE: UNI FIRST DISPUTE 

RE: UNIF!RST DISPUTE 

CORRESPOND WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL 
REGARDING HOLDING ARBITRATION IN 
ABEYANCE, POSTPONING FILING OF 
CHANCERY ACTION, AND SETTLEMENT 
NEGOTIATIONS RE: UNIFIRST DISPUTE 

WORK ON DRAFT OF COMPLAINT AND 
MOTION TO STAY ARBITRATION RE: 
UNIF!RST DISPUTE 

REVIEW IDHR NOTICE OF DISMISSAL ON 
~CHARGE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
••••• REVIEW DOCUMENTS; 

PROVIDE fNFORMA TION TO ATTORNEY RE: 
STUDENT DISCIPLINE MATTER 

REVIEW AND ANALYZE DISMISSAL ORDER 

4.00 hrs. 'rf,.f!.. $960.00 

1.80 hrs. j11:f2. $432.00 

1.20 hrs."Jl'I,£. $288,00 

0.30 hrs. '7""-f!.. $72.00 

0.40 hrs. 1>1,-f:.. $96.00 

0.50 hrs. w SI20.00 

0.60 hrs. 7"',1Z,. $144.00 

0.50 hrs. -y,-o.1Z. $120.00 

0.80 hrs.122' $192.00 

0.60 hrs.7'1,.¢. $144.00 

l.30 hrs. 'f'tt,e._ $312.00 



'"" 

l l/l9f2015 

l l/19!2015 

!1/19/2015 

11/20/20\5 

llf23/2015 

l 1/2412015 

I 1124120 I S 

11/24/2015 

11/30/2015 

Jlf3W2015 

D!SIRJCT ru · COOK COUlffY 

RECEIVED FROM n.LINOIS Q~TMENT 
OF HUMAN RIGITTS RE: - INITIAL 

CHARGE OF DISCRlM.INA'ijTiilOINli: DRAFT' 
CORRESPONDENCE TO" 
~SAME 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING 
COUNSEL RE: UNIFIRST ARBITRATION 
DEMAND AND D!STRJCTS PROPOSED 
DECLARATORY JUDGMENT ACTION; 
SlllA TEOlZE RE: SAME 

. }iD ANALYZE 
OPTIONS MOVING FORWARD RE: UNIFIRST 
DISPUTE 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
AMERICAN ARBITRATION ASSOClATION 
RE: ABEYANCE OF PROCEEDINGS AND 
DEADLINE TO FILE ANSWERING 
STATiiMENT 

REVIEW BOARD POLICY; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY; PROVIDE 
INFORMATION TO ATTORNEY RE: 
STIJDENT EXPULSION 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN RJGHTS 
RE: SECOND~~CR™JNATION 
FILED BY~ 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE Wl~ 
ASSJSTANTSUPERINTEND~ 
RE: F.SP RETIREMENT REQUEST 

REVIEW REQUEST FROM UNIFIRST 
COUNSEL RE: STAY OF DECLARATORY 
JUIXiMENT FILING AND ANALYZE 
RESPONSE 

CORRESPOND WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL 
RE: EXTENSION OF DEADLINE TO FTLE 
DEC LARA TORY JUDGMENT ACTION RE: 
UNIF!RST DISPUTE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE ,;,,.'JIB 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTEND~ 
RE: PERSONNEL MATI'ERS 

REVIEW STATE ANO FEDER.AL MILITARY 

"" . 

0.50 hrs. 7l'v£... $120.00 

0.20 lira. ;,vj2.. S48.00 

0.20 hrs. ..,...,,,fl... S48.00 

0.30 hrs. 7'1-f;! $72.00 

0.30 h~ S72.00 

0.20 hn;. ;,t-fZ- S48.00 

0.20 hrs. '1Y\,.. $,18.00 

0.20 hrs,iV $48.00 

0.60h~ $144.00 



Z66JO 

11/30/2015 

llfJ0/2015 

DTSTRJCT ns -COOK COUNTY ln>oieo Number 37335 

LEAVE AND REINSTATEMENT STATUTES 
AND REGULATIONS; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE !M§fil_STANT 
SUPERINTENDENT- RE: 
REINSTATEMENT AFTER MILITARY 
SERVICE 

REVIEW BOARD POLICY; REVIEW IMRF 
REGULATIONS; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT 

BEGIN DRAFT OF RESIGNATION 
AGREEMENT RE: CUSTODIAN RETIREMENT 

;.CliE.;W~ITH 
• :EEOC 

CHARGEBYFORMEREMPLOYEF.tlillllla 
REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RECEIVED 
FRO, ....... 

TOTAL fEES FOR THIS MATIER 

Poge 7 

0.60 lrrs.41" $144.00 

0.40 hrs. 'fll.,f!.. $96.00 

$13,656.00 

DISBURSEMENTS ~ 
LEGAL RESEARCH CHARGES- NOVEMBER2015; SCHOOL DISTRICT $350.52 
225 COOK- UNIFIRST 

LEGAL RESEARCH CHARGES - NOVEMBER 2015; SCHOOL DISTRICT ytl 
225 COOK - UN!FIRST DISPUTE 

LEGAL RESEARCH CHARGES - NOVEMBER 2015; SCHOOL DISTRICT 
225 COOK - UNIFJRST DISPUTE 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS FOR THIS MA TIER 

$569.59 

$197.17 

$1,117.28 



Z6670 DISTRICT 121 • COOK COUNTY 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

Page 8 

$13,656.00 
$1,117.28 

$682.80 

$15,456.08 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINOJS 606SHl3SS 

TAXPAYER ID# 36.2813428 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

November2,2015 
Billed through 1013112015 
Invoice No, 
Client number 

Matter nnmber 

37180 
26670 
00000 

JDP 

380 I W. LAKE A VENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATIER 

I_ • 1rwo1cE I\PrF:oVAL·-·--, 
J.,loTF,ali-·' , .. 

I
SIGti ___ ,f"',·C'.'eS 

DATE __l_}._-J_-I _; , , , --
ACC r 1; 0 --._JJ.f3Jf._- --~-

I D P,\flT.~- r.:--' ·- _,,~ 
.. ,., bl [.'!fNO i'O ------------------' 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO; 
Scariano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

v' 

$9,768.00 
$488.40 

$10,256.40 

For Billing or Payment Inquiries; contact Accounting at (312) 565-3100 ext. 235 



=m DISTlllCT m · COOK COUNTY rm~~- l711ll ·~ ' 
CORRESPONDEl\'CE TO 

AND ....... RE: 
SAME 

10/06/2015 REVIEW AND REVISE CORRESPONDENCE 0.30~ ~.t, $7200 
TO PARENTS RE: GBN FOO'IBALL HElMET 
SAFETI 

10/07/2015 WORK ON TEACHER REMEDIATION PLAN 0.40 h~~ $96.00 

10/07/2015 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 0.90 lira. $216.00 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT~ 11,4' 
REVIEW IXlCU/'-.fENTS AND OPTIONS; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASS!STANT 
SUPERINTENDENT~: 
EMPLOYEE REMEDIATION 

10/03/2015 REVIEW OPTIONS FOR ADDRESSING 0.20 hn. S48.00 
TEACHER PERFORMANCE ISSUFS RE: %1-
TEACHER REMEDIATION 

I0/0&/2015 REVIEW IXlCUt-.fENTS RECEfVED FROM ,.5-0 ""W $500.00 
DJSTRJCT RE: CHARGE OF 
D!SCRIMlN Tl F 
FD 
POSITTON STATEMENT 

10/09!2015 DRAFTPOSITTON STATEMENT IN 7.00 hrs. Sl,680.00 
RESPONSE TO EEOC CHARGE OF V' 
DISCRIMINATION FILED BY FORMER 

10112n0]5 DRAFf POSffiON STATEMENT FOR 6.00~ $!,440.00 
RESPONSE TO CHARGE OF 
DISCRIMINATION FILED WITH TI-IE EEOC 
BY DISCHARGED EMPLO~ 

10/13/2015 REVTEW COURT DECISION REOARDJNO I .SO hrs. $360.00 
REMEDIATION PLAN DELAY; REVIEW 'Qr 
ARGUMENT'S AND OPTIONS; REVIEW 
BOARD POLICY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
WITH ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT 
~E:-REMEDIATION 

10/15/2015 WORK ON OPINION RE: TEACHER 0.30 hrs. S72.00 
REMEDIATION w--

1011sno1s INITIAL DRAFTING OF REM.ED1ATION PL\N 0.50 IITT. $120.00 
RE:. RE).{EJ)JATION 1!Y 

10/1512015 REVJEW C{;e'fl?.~~J!JeEi'e'.::;'.E_.fROM 0.50 '¥" S120.00 • --- 5 ft£..ili9 
CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION; MAKE 



10/15/2015 

10/1612015 

10121l201S 

10n3!20I5 

1on3no1s 

10/2312015 

10nmo1 s 

10!28/2015 

10/30/2015 

10/30/2015 

D!SllUCT :121 • = CU1JNTY 

CHANGES TO POSITION STATE.MF.NT 

REVlEW DRAFT TEACHER RE MEDIA. TION 
PLAN 

DRAFT AND REVIEWREMEDIA.TION PLAN; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTEND~:­
REMEDIA TION 

DRAFTPOSffiON STATFMENT IN 
RESPONSE TO EEOC CHARGE OF 
D!SCRIMINA TION FILED BY FORMER 
EMPLOYEE--

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE Willl 
~:TRANSPORTATION 
LEVY, STUDENT DISCIPLINE AND Pl:RA 
COM:MITIEE 

rW:f&ONE c-~CES WI:: 
S'IUDENT EXPULSION 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TIJE EEOC 
RE: CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION 

STIJDENT EXPULSION MATIER 

WORK ON STIJDENT DISCIPLINE MATIER 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
............. N:J)ATIORNEY; 
TELEPHONE COr"fEliLNCES V1I1H 

INITIAL REVIEW OF 
Hl:ARING PROCEDURES; REVIEW 
EXPULSION PACKET; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY RE:. 
EXPULSION 

TOTAL FEES FOR TIIIS MATIER 

- ' 

0.<0~ '96.00 

I.SO~ S360.00 

S.00~ Sl,200.00 

030 hrs. ,1\4 $7200 

. «-
0.40 hra.7'1 $96.00 

030~ $72.00 

0.20 hrs. 

030 hra.\}.L, $72.00 

0.30 hrs. 7Yl-f2 $72.00 

!.SO hrs. ,YI f2.. $360.00 

$9,763.00 



26670 DISTRICT 22l - COOK COUNTY 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

P,~e 4 

$9,768.00 
$488.40 

$10,256.40 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

Octoberl,2015 
Billed through 09/30/2015 
Invoice No. 37130 
Client number 26670 
Marter number 00000 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

3801 W. LAKE A VENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MAITER 

JDP 

I INVOIC~ 
j ,.<A - [I·· • 

SIG'> 

v I 
P.0.BOX 81l55 

Cl IICAGO. JLLINOIS 60631--0355 
TAXPAYER ID# 36-2813428 

·1:•(",--',,:.· 

$4,824.00 
$241.20 

$5,065.20 

o,,rc .{~~~~-1_.[__ ·,a:-,,, 
ACCl ,,,, __ ,_ lt.81J?----=----= 
I O Pi,~·-1. _,_.;(c",w,1 __ [3No ~_5l_l 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO: 
Scariano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

For Billing or Pa1ment Inquiries; contact Accouming at (312) 565-3 100 ext. 235 



SCARIANO HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYBATLAW·CHARTERED 

P.O. BOX 31355 
OilCAOO, lU-INOJS l\06l!J.O:J5, 

TAXPAYER ID~ 36-2Sl342S 

FOR Bii.UNO INQUIRlES CO.'ff ACT ACCOUNTING AT (311) 3/il-31 00 at. 235 

Octobcrl,2015 

Billing through 09r.J0/20 15 

Invoice No. 37130 IDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

3&01 W. LAKE A VENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
09/01/2015 REVTEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 

OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: SETILEMENT OF 
....... LmGATION; RESPOND TO 
SAME; REVIEW REPLY FROM OPPOSING 
COI.,"},j;;JE.t.: DJlAFT COR!H!S.PONDENCE TO 

09/01.11015 

09/03/2015 

09/09/2015 

09/10/2015 

09/1012015 

ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT~ 
_...RE,SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE, 

SEJTLEMENT DEMAND FROM OPPOSING 
COUNSEL CONCERNING···· 
CHARGE OF DISCRlMINATION 

REVIEW FINAL EXECUTED DRAFT GESS 
AND GESPA CONTRACTS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITI-1 
RE: SUPPORT 

STAFF EMPLOYEE~ 

WORK ON RESPONSE ~EEOC 
CHARGE 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
TELEPHONE 

CONFERENCEWIIB~ 
DRAFT AND REVIEW LITIGATION HOLD 
LEilERRE OCCLAlM 

26670 
Matter Number 00000 

1.20 hrs. $28S.OO 

030 trr... $72.00 

0.60 hrs. $144.00 

0.30 hrs. $72.00 

0.30 hrs. sn.oo 

1.10 hrs. S264.00 



09/11/2015 

09/14/2015 

09116/2015 

09/1612.015 

09/18/2015 

09/22/2015 

09/2212015 

0912212015 

09/23/2015 

09123!2015 

D!5UJCT 22:l - COOK COIDm' 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO EEOC; 
REVIEW DEFENSE PREPARATION NEEDS 
RE: EEOC 

REVIEW DOCUMENT NEEDS; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TQ-A§SISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT-RE: .. 
EEOC 

DRAFT SUBMISSION FOR AUDITOR'S 
LETTER RE: .. EEOC 

'IBLEPHONE CONF_EW£NCE WITI:I 
- RE: POSSIBLE 

SETTLEMENT OF 
DISCRIMJNATION CHAR OE 

REVIEW CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION 
FILED WITH EEOC BY DISCHARGED 

REV<EW 
CORRESPONDENCE FROM ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: SAME; 
RESPOND TO SAME 

DRAIT tX:~: ... ~t".:.'t>.iDEi-¥.:E TO ATTORNEY 
~,. • - RE: POSSIBLE 
SE1TLEMENT£ef ;--;,;,; C~SCR~UNATION 
Cl.AIMS 

DRAIT CORRESPONDENCE ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTEND~RE: 
j ~CHARGE OF DISCRJMINATION; 
REVIEW RESPONSE 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN RIGHTS 
(IDHR) RE: CHARGE OF 
D1SCRIMINATION; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE ASSIST ANT 
SUPERJITTEND~AND 
~E:SAME;REVIEW 
DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE RESPONSE TO 
IDHR 

fu::-VIEW IX>CUMENTS; 
DRAFT RESPONSE RE: BGA FOJA 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
OPPOSING OJUNSEL RE:-. 
SETTLEMENT DEMAND_;J?~-­
CORRESPONDENCE T~ 

0.50 hn. !120.00 

0.50 Ml. $120.00 

0.20 hrs. S4S.OO 

030 h:rs. $72.00 

1.20 hrs. $288.00 

0.30 hn. S72.00 

0.4{) hrs. $%.00 

2.20 m, $528.00 

0.4() hrs. S96.00 

0.8(1 hrs. ~192.00 



26670 

09/24120!5 

09/24/2015 

09/25/2015 

09/25/2015 

09/29/2015 

09/29/2015 

09/30/2015 

09/30/2015 

09130/2015 

09/30/2015 

DISTRICT il>. COOK COUNTY m,·oic<Numb" 37130 

~: SAME; DRAFT RESPONSE TO 
OPPOSING COUNSEL; REVIEW REPLY FROM 
OPPOSING COUNSEL 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: FORMER 
- CHARGE OF 
DISCRIMINATION 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING 
COUNSEL RE: POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT OF 
.-. CHARGE OF DISCRIMTNA TION; 
REVIEW RESPONSE; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE ............ 
--E:SAME 

RESEARCH AND DRAFT RESPONSE TO 
AUDITOR LETTER 

WORK ON.-DISCRIMINATION 
MATTER 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO••••• 
--AND ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT 
~RE: .. CHARGE OF 
DISCRIMINATION; REVIEW RESPONSE; 
REVIEW FILE 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM 
DISTRICT RE:-EEOC CHARGE 

WORK ON RESPONSE TO IDHR DATA 
REQUEST RE: CUSTODIAN 
DISCRIMINATION CHARGE 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE FOR 
MEETING WITH DISTRICT EMPLOYEES RE: 

BARGE OF DISCRIMINATION 

WORK ON RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR 
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION RECEIVED 
FROM THE ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF 
HUMAN RIGHTS RE~ CHARGE OF 
DISCRIMINATION; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO INVESTIGATOR RE: 
PROTECTIVE ORDER FOR REQUESTED 
INFORMATION 

2.30 hrs. 

0.70 hrs. 

l.JO hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.70 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

l.50 hrs. 

l.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

P,go J 

$552.00 

$168.00 

$264.00 

$96.00 

$168.00 

$120.00 

$72.00 

$360.00 

$360.00 

$120.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 215 • COOK COUNTY 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

ln,'Oi<:<: Nmnber 17130 Page 4 

$4,824.00 

$4,824.00 
S24!.20 

$5,065.20 



SCARIANO, HTh1ES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

September 1,2015 
Billed through 0813112015 
Invoice No. 36934 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

Client number 
Matter number 

3801 \V. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE200 
GLENVIEW, TL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTALC!JARGES FOR THIS MATTER 

26670 
00000 

JDP 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CH!C,\GO, lLL!NOIS 60681·0355 

TAXPAYER ID# 36-2813428 

SI 1,592.00 
$579.60 

j INVOICE APPROVAL 
I .JATrnlA' . 

SIGt< _ 

DATE 9.~L,(_ PO 'h _ 

ACCT. Nu. __ ___Jj_.{.,3J_I_ ~~ 

[~ D PART1A__1:__ 0"F1riAL_[1No r.o. 

PLEASE REMIT PA YMENTTO: 
Scariano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, JL60681-0355 

For Billing or Payment Inquiries; contact Accounting at (3 12) 565-31 00 ext. 235 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYSATLAW·CKARTeReD 

P.O. BOX 3u~, 
ClilCAOO, D.Lll..'OIS 606I I-OJ,, 

T AXP /\ YER I o I 36-2ll I ).(2i 

FORB!llJNG INQUIRIES COITTACT ACCOUNTING AT (312) ~3100 CU 2H 

Scpte,rnba 1,2015 
Billing through 08.IJ 1!1015 

lnvoi~ No. 36')34 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

3S01 W. LAKE A VENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVJCES RENDER.ED 
08/0J/2015 WORK ON OPINION RE: .... 

OS/03!.2015 

08/04/2015 

08/04/2015 

M/04!2015 

0&/04!2015 

RF.S!GNATION AND LENGTI:l OF CONlRACT 

TEJ....ePHONE CONFERl!NCE wrrn 
~VlEW 
CORRESPONDENCE FROM ATTORNEY: 
REVIEW STAlUTE; DRAFf 
CORRFSPONDBNCE TO~­
CORRESPONDENCE TO--

RE, -

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH !EA 
REPRESENTATIVE RE: GESSA AND GESPA 
NEGOTIATIONS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
WITH--RE: SAME 

1_E!-,fil'liQ___NL C9...ill'ERENCE WIIB 
.___.RE: STIJDENT 

DISCIPLINE POLICY 

REVIEW FILES FOR CONlRACT; REVIEW 

~g~~~~~~~ 
REVIEW DOCUMENTSR~ 

REVIEW POLICIES AND BAROAININO 

~~1't~~~~ 
SUPERI'."JTfil,j[ifilf~E: 
PERSONNEL MATTERS 

Clknt Number 26'70 
Matter Nomba 00000 

--,,,-e 
030 hrs. m.oo 

0.60 ~ ·-,.,.-£.. $144.00 

0.70 Im. :pi $16!.00 

030 IITT. ']'l"-,e_ Sn.OO 

1.20 hn. ,..,...12.. $288.00 



SCARIANO, HThfES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CKARTERED 

P.O. BOX 813SS 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 6068!·03S5 

TAXPAYER ID# 36·2813428 

FOR BILLING INQUIRIES CONTACT ACCOUNTING AT (J !2) 565-3 lOO ext. 235 

September I, 2015 
Billing through 08/J 1 /20 l 5 

Invoice No. 36934 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUJTE200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED ~ 
08/03/2015 WORK ON OPINION RE:­

RESIGNATION AND LEN GIB OF CONTRACT 

08/03/2015 

08/04/2015 

08104/20!5 

08/04/2015 

08104/2015 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
;REVIEW 

CORRESPONDENCE FROM AITORNEY; 
REVIEW STATUTE; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO A1'TORtJ_E)';_D)0FT 

~~:...._DENCE TO 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH !EA 
REPRESENTATIVE RE: GE SSA AND GESPA 
NEGOTIAT!ONS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
WITH~RE:SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: STUDENT 

DISCIPLINE POLICY 

REVIEW FILES FOR CON1RACT; REVIEW 
BOARD POLICIES; TE<IL.EP.HO)'JE _ 
CONFERENCE WITH 
REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: ..... 

REVIEW POLICIES AND BARGAINING 
AGREEMENTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
WITH AND ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDEN,._RE, 
PERSONNEL MATTERS 

Client Number 26670 
Matter Number 00000 

0.30 hrs. 711-R.. $72.00 

0.60 hrs. f'1'1 i!... $144.00 

0.70 hrs. 
\<)' 

$168.00 

0.30 hrs. '11'1,/Z. $72.00 

0.70 hrs. 'JYl-f'. $168.00 

1.20 hrs. /'111:: $288.00 



U610 

08/05/2015 

08/06/2015 

08/07/2015 

08/07/2015 

08/10/2015 

08/10/2015 

08/11120\5 

08/11/2015 

08/ll/2015 

08/ll/2015 

08/12/2015 

DIS fRICT 215 • COOK COUNTY 

WORK ON PREPARATION OF RESPONSES 
TO CHARGE OF DISCRIMrNATION FILED 
WITH THE ILLINOIS DEPARTh1ENT OF 
l-lUl'v1AN RIGHTS BY SUPPORT STAFF 
EMPLOYEE ...... 

DRAFT VERIFIED RESPONSE AND 
RESPONSE TO QUESTIONNAIRE TO 
RESPOND TO CHARGE OF DIS CRIMIN A TJON 
FILED WITH THE [LUNOJS DEPARTMENT 
OF HUMAN RIGHTS BY SUPPORT STAFF 
EMPLOYEE••••• 

REV JEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ATIORNEY; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO -RE•-
DRAFT POSITION STATEMENT FOR 
RESPONSE TO CHARGE OF 
DISCRIMINATION FILED BY SUPPORT 
STAFF EMPLOYEE ....... 

REV JEW CORRESPONDENCE AND OPTIONS; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO A TIORNEY; 
OUTLINE RESPONSE; REVIEW 
CORRESPONDENCE FROM 

-- DRAFT RESPONSE RE: 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
AND ASSISTANT 

SUPERINTENDENT.-. RE: 
PERSONNEL MA 1TERS 

REVIEW DRAFT GESS A CONTRACT 
LANGUAGE DRAFT 

ATIENDGESSA ANDGESPA 
NEGOTIATIONS 

REVIEW CASES REGARDING CONTRACT 
CLAIMS; DRAFT LETTER TO ATTORNEY; 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 

VIEW RESPONSE; 
REVISE LETTER TO ATTORNEY RE:-
MAKE CHANGES TO POSIT!ON 
STATE!v!ENT; QUESTIONNAIRE, AND 
VERIFIED RESPONSE TO RESPOND TO 
CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION FILED BY 
SUPPORT STAFF EMPLOYEE-

REVIEW STATUTES AND REGULATIONS RE: 

Pa,ge 2 

1.50 hr1f $360.00 

2.30 hr?Jt $552.00 

0.20 hrs. yv1 £. $48.00 

4.00 hrs~ $960.00 

0.90 hrs. -;-vi,{!_ $216.00 

0.40 hrs. 71'1,€ $96.00 

0.80 hrs.?J., $192.00 

6.50 hrsW{ $1,560.00 

1.30 hrs,71'1£. $312.00 

3.30 hrs. $792.00 

o/ 

\I()' 
0.50 hrs. $120.00 



7.6670 DISTRICT 225 • COOK CDUJ,.'TY lavoi« N•mbcr 169)4 '"' ' 
EMPLOYER FLEX PLAN CONTRIBUTIONS 

08/1212015 REVJEW AND ANALYZE 0.50 hrs'JY S120.00 
CORRESPOND~ 
COUNSEL RE: 
D!SCRJM!NA TlON; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCET~ 
AND ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT 

RE: S/ul.1E 

08/12/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.20 hrs.1¥[ 1=- $48.00 
RE: STUDENT 

RESIDENCY MATTER 

0811312015 PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH l.60 hrs.'--y,1 £'.. $384.00 
ADMINISTRATORS RE: REVISIONS TO 
BOARD POLICY 8460 

08/14/2015 ATTEND MEETING WITH BUILDING 4.00 hrs.'-Y•1,:2. $960.00 
ADMINISTRATORS RE: NEW BOARD 
POLICIES RE: STUDENT DJSCJPLINE 

0811412015 DRAFT GESPA CONTRACT LANGUAGE RE: 1.20 hrs"t" $288.00 
SALARY INCREASES, COMPENSATION 
RE-OPENER AND NEW HIRE SALARY 
CALCULATIONS 

08/1712015 REVIEW FINAL DRAFT GESPA CONTRACT; 0.60 hrs~ $144.00 
CORRESPONDENCE -RE: SAME 

081!712015 WORK ON OPINION RE: RESTRICTING USE 0.70 hrs. \k)J $168.00 
OF SUBSTITUTE TEACHERS BASED UPON 
AGE 

08/]712015 REVIEW INSURANCE BROKER MEMO RE: 0.80 hrs. \I()' $192.00 
CAP ON EMPLOYER FLEX PLAN 
CONTRIBUTION DUE TO INSURANCE 
WAIVER; WORK ON OPINION RE: SAME 

0811712015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ...... 0.30 hrs. 
i(), 

$72.00 
RE: HJ RING OF SUBSTITUTE TEACHERS 
AND BOARD CONTRIBUTJON TO FLEXlBLE 
SPENDING ACCOUNT 

08/17/2015 REVIEW DOCUMENTS; REVIEW IRS 0.90 hrs. ~ $216.00 
REGULATIONS; REVIEW EBC GUIDANCE 
RE: EMPLOYER FLEX PLAN CONTRIBUTION 
LIMITATIONS 

08/18/2015 WORK ON ON OPINION RE: TRANSFER OF 0.30 h~ $72.00 
INJURED CUSTODIAN TO GESPA POSITION 



26670 

0812712015 

08/28/2015 

08131120!5 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK COUNTY Invoice Number 36934 

ISSUE 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING 
COUNSEL RE: POSSIBLE SETfLEMENT OF 

~CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION 

REVIEW VERIFICATION RECEIVED FROM 
ASSIST ANT SUPERINTENDEN 
RE:-.ilfc;HARGEOF 
DISCRIMINATION; MAKE CHANGES TO 
VERIFIED RESPONSE 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

Page 5 

0.30 hrs. fYtf:. $72.00 

0.30 hrs~ 

0.50~ 

$72.00 

$]20.00 

$11,592.00 

$11,592.00 
$579.60 

$12,171.60 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

August 3, 2015 
Biiled through 07131/2015 
Invoice No. 
Client number 
Mltter number 

36760 
26670 
00000 

JDP 

P.O. llOX 81355 
HICAGO, ILLINO!S 60681.QJSS 

TAXPAYER ID# 36-281342& 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

$2,592.00 
$]29.60 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR TllIS MATIER 52,721.60 

r--·- INVOICE ~.PPAOVAL 
: ~Mf.<"' " ""'"'"' '_,.,,,.,r/JI 1,POROVEO. 

SIGIJ 

DATE .L-1 .. J.=t.£;,,, r:.- __ 
ACCT No _____ IL.[,i/.f.. __ _ 

I D PAR~11,L [:f"F;rJAL (3'ii'o ro.o. ------------

PLEASE REMITPAYMENTTO: 
Scariano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

For Billing or Payment Inquiries; contact Accounting at (3 12) 565-3 I 00 ext. 235 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PE'IRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINOJS 60681-0355 

TAXPAYER ID# 36-2813428 

FDR BILLING INQUIRIES CONT ACT ACCOUNTING AT (312) 565·3 100 ext_ 235 

August3,2015 
Billing through 07/3112015 

Invoice No. 36760 IDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DIS TRI . • 225 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
07/0112015 REVISE DRAFT GESS A LANGUAGE RE: 

A TIENDANCE ON "CALAM!TY" DAYS 

07/0712015 PREPARE FORAND ATTEND GESPA 
NEGOTIATIONS 

07/08/2015 DRAFT GESPA CONTRACT LANGUAGE 

07/22/2015 REVIEW~HARGEOF 
DISCRJMrNATION AND RELATED VIDEOS 
TO PREPARE FOR MEET!NG WITH MR. 
,_.. RE: REVIEW OF VIDEOS; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE I~ 
RE: SAME 

07123/2015 PREPARE FOR AND A TT END MEE11NG TO 
REVIEW VIDEO OF SUPPORT STAFF 
EMPLOYE~RE: J-IIS CHARGE OF 
DISCRJMrNA TION 

07/3012015 WORK ON RESPONSE TO SUPPORT STAFF 
EMPLOYE~HARGEOF 
DISCRTMrNA TION 

07/31/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
·: ADOPTION OF 

BOARD MINUTES AND TEACHER CONDUCT 
INVESTIGATION 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATrER 

Client Number 
Mauer Number 

0.30 hr~ 

4.00h~ 

0.70 hrs'¢r 

1.30 hrs'W{ 

3.00 hrs:\;, 

1.00 hr¥\i::-

0.50 hrs. 

'W 

26670 
00000 

$72.00 

$960.00 

$168.00 

$312.00 

$720.00 

$240.00 

$120.00 

$2,592.00 



Zt\670 DISTRICT lll • COOK COUNTY 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

ln,ok<NLlmber ]6160 rage 2 

S2,S92.00 
$129.60 

$2,721.60 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW· CHARTERED 

July 1,2015 
Billed through 06/30/2015 
Invoice No. 36688 
Client number 26670 
Matter number 00000 

BOARD OF EOUCATJON 
SCHOOL D\S_JRJCT 0. 225 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 

COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATIER 

!DP 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CJ!tCAGO, lLLINOIS 60681-0)55 

TAXPAYER lD # 36-2813428 

RECEIVED c!UL 2 2 201!'i 

$14,064.00 
$21.78 

$703.20 

Sl4,788.98 

INVOICE APPROVAL 

SIGrl 

DATE ~./._.[ P.C,,f:10. ---­
ACCT. No //J~,f-~-­

O PARTIAL ffF1NAL o-(o P.O. 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TOc 
Scariano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

For Billing or Payment Inquiries; contact Accounting at (3 12) 565-31 00 ext. 235 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYSATLAW-CHARTERED 

P.0.BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60681·0355 

TAXPA YERID # 36·2813423 

FOR BILLING JNQU!ll!ES CONT ACT ACCOUNTING AT (312) 565-310-0 ext. 235 

July 1, 2015 
Billing through 06130/20 I 5 

Invoice No. 36688 JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

' 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
0610112015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SUSPENSION 

HEARINGS FOR STUDENT.m,AND 
STUDENT .. 

0610112015 

06102/2015 

0610212015 

06/02/2015 

06/04/2015 

06/04/2015 

0610412015 

PREPARE FOR FACT FINDING CONFERENCE 
FOR REVIEW 
CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSTh'G 
COUNSl:'.L; RESPOND TO SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ADMINISTRATION RE: REVISIONS TO 
BOARD RETIREMENT POLICIES 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND FACT FINDING 
CONFERENCE AT THE ILLINOIS 
DEPARTh1ENT OF HUMAN RIGHTS FOR 
1!512•--- .-. . 
REVIEW REPORTS ISSUED BY HEARING 
OFFICER RE: SUSPENSION HEARINGS FOR 
STUDENTS9AND-~_I___ 
CORRESPONDENCE TO----.. 
-.RE:SAME 

ATTEND GESSA NEGOTJA TIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: STUDENT 

SUSPENSIONS 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

26670 
00000 

5.30 hrs.!"",-£.. $1,272.00 

1.20 hrs. 

6.00 hrs. 

'<' 
$288.00 ~" 

$1,44o.oo,1"V 

1.00 hrs. )vl.-..,e_ $240.00 

10.00 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

1.30 hrs. 

$2,400.0~ 

,....,-.-fl- $72.00 

/ 
$312.oo")r 



06/05!2015 

06/08/2015 

06/09!2015 

06/15/2015 

06/16/2015 

015/16!2015 

06/16/2015 

06/18/2015 

06/18/2015 

06/J!/2015 

06/18/2015 

Dl.nl!ICT ru · COOK COUNTY 

TEL<Cs>"f-lONE CONFEN..8',K:'.E WITH - - ----- -- . - . -. 'C.E: 

CHARGE OF DISCRJMrNATION 

CHARGE OF DISCR11'1TNATION 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: NON.-UNION 

SALARY INCREASES 

DRAFT INDEMNITY AGREEMENT RE: 
DEDUCTION OF GLENBROOK 
EDUC.". TIONAL SUPPORT 
PARAPROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION 
MEMBERS UNION DUF.S AND VOLUNTARY 
CONTRIBUTIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTii 
RE: DETACHMENT 

PETITION AND RETIREMENT POLICY 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO • 
~: INITIAL CHARGE OF 
DISCRJMINATION; REVJEW R.£.PL Y !'ROM -
REVIEW SECOND CHARGE OF 
DISCRIMINATION FILED BY SUPPORT 
STAFF EMPLOYEE--- PREPARE 
DOCUMEl'ITS FOR FILING RESPONSE TO 
SAME; DRAfT CORRESPONDENCE TO 

RE: SAME 

REVIEW DETACHM"ENT OClCUMENTS 

REVIEW DRAFT "SrnA W DESIGN" RE: 
GE.SSA NEGOTIATIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITil 
RE: EMPLOYEE 

CONTRACT NON-RENEWAL NOTICE 

030 hrs. m.oo a< 

0.30 Im. m.ooif 

0 3 0 hr,. 'JYI 1f!.. $7 2. 0 0 

2.90 hn. $696.~ 

0.50 hri. $120.oo:{r 

3.00 h-rs. mo.oo{( 

0.4-0 hr!!. ,n1Z- $%.00 

0.70 hrs. $163.00~ 

0 .2 0 hrs . "',-('- -f!-- $4 8 . 0 0 

0.8-0 hrs. 



26670 DISTRICT 225 • COOK COUNTY 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

Pag< • 

$14,064.00 
$21.78 

$703.20 

$14,788.98 



SCARIANO, HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORNEYSATLAW·CHARTERED 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

June 1, 2015 
Billed through 05!31/2015 
Invoice No. 36486 
Client number 26670 
Matter number 00000 

3801 W. LAKE AVENUE, SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER 

i11.Dil' {•H.w 
4 /f()6lf {.f3l,.(tl 

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO: 
Scariano, Himes & Petrarca 

P.O. BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, IL 60681-0355 

JDP 

P.O.BOX 81355 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60681-0355 

TAXPAYER ID# 36-2813~28 

$9,672.00 
$483.60 

SI0,155.60 

For Billing or Payment Inquiries; oontaol Accounting at (312) 565-31 00 ext. 235 



SCARIANO HIMES and PETRARCA 
ATTORt,!EYS AT LAW CHARTl!Rl!D 

P.O. BOX 813" 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 606ll.Ql3' 

TAXPA Yill ID t :J6.21B(2!1 

FOR l:IILUNO Ih'QUIRIES CONTACT ACCOUNTING AT (312) 361-3100 rn_ 21, 

Jo.ne I, 2015 
Billing through 051:J 1/2015 

lrrvoice No. 364U JDP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 225 

3801 W.IAKEAYENUE,SUITE200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 
05101/2015 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM IF.A 

REPRESENTATIVE; REVISE AGREEMENT; 
DRAFT RESPONSE RE: -RESIGNATION 

05/01/2015 

05/04/2015 

05/05/2015 

05/0612015 

05/07/2015 

05/0Sf20]5 

TELl::PHO!fE.(_:;_QiffERE-s~~E WITH 
RE: EXPULSION 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
: EXPULSION 

OF STIJD~REVIEW 
CORRESPONDENCE FROM~ 

-·RE:SAME; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OFFICE OF 
FORMERATIORNEYFOR FAM!LYOF. 

REQUEST FOR STUDENT RECORDS FROM 
FAMILY OF STUD~ 

TELEPHONE Q)NfERENCE WIIB 
RE: ESP RETIRE-lv!ENT 

Client Number 
Mlllter Numbl'r 

26670 
00000 

0.40 hrs. ',vt-f2- $96.00 

0.20 lira. r,'l -t2. $48.00 

0.30 hri. '?rt f!. $7200 

0.30 hri. '-},vi-r.2. $72.00 

o.9o m. 1'11--;<Z. $216.oo 

0.50 hrs.~ $120.00 

0.30 hrs. "'Jyt-,2.., $72.00 



05/08/2015 

05111/2015 

05/11/2015 

0511112015 

05/11/2015 

05/11/2015 

0511W015 

05/lWOlS 

05113/2015 

05/1312015 

05/13/2015 

05/IJ/2015 

DISTlllCT ID· CO'.JK C\JUT'<TY ---
OPTIONS 

EFROM 
RE, 

HEARING FOR STIJDEmiitRRESR POND ro 
SAME 

REVIEW DR.AFT REVISIONS TO STUDENT 
DISCIPLINE HEARING WANER POLICY 

PREPARE GE.SSA NEGOTIATIONS; DRAFT 
TENTATIVE AGREEMENT LANGUAGE RE: 
CALAMITY DAYS AND INITIAL SALARY 
PLACEMENT 

REVIEW F1NAL DRAFT DISTRICT 
EMPLOYEE RETIREMENT POLICIES; 
CORRESPONDEh'CE TO AND 

RE: SAME 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
: REVISIONS 

ro POLICIES 8460, 8410, AND S410PRO 

REVIEW REVISIONS 1D VOLUNTARY 
WAIVER OF HEARING FORM IN POLICY 
8410PRO FOR ACCURACY; SEND SAME AND 
CORRESPONDENCE RE: SAME TO 

A1TEND GE.SSA NEGOTIATIONS AND COST 
CONTAINMENTCOMMJlTEEMEETING 

PREPARE FOR GESPA NEGOTIATIONS 

DRAFT GE-SSA MOU RE: TECH 
DEPARTMENT REORGANIZATION 

REVIEW FINAL DRAFT BOARD POLJCY 
6100j CORRESPONDENCE TO 

175 81\ND ASSISTANT 
SUPERJNTENDENT RE: SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE wrrn 
RE: EXPULSION 

... ' 

0.30 Im. f}j.J $72.00 

0.-40 hrs. f"Yl 12- S96.00 

1.30~ Pl2.00 

1.10 !mi. f'Y\--e. $264.00 

0.20 hn. ~ $48.00 

0.50 hn. ~-,2. S120.00 

9.00 ru-s:0" $2,160.00 

O.&O hrs.(;f,u $192.00 

0.40 hrs.~ 

0.40 hrs.~ 

S96.oo 

S96.0o 

0.40 hrs. ',Y,-t'- S96.00 

0.30 !mi. ,..,..-f!... S7200 



26670 

05/14/2015 

05/18/2015 

05/19/2015 

05/20/2015 

05/22/2015 

05/22/2015 

05/26/2015 

05/26/2015 

05/26/2015 

05/27/2015 

05/28/2015 

DISTRICT 225 • COOK COUNTY 

ATIEND GESSA AND GESPA 
NEGOTIATIONS 

lnvo,co Number J6<86 

PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND MEETING OF 
BOARD OF EDUCATION RE: EXPULSION OF 
STUDENT-

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: EXPULSION 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ATIORNEY REPRESENTING SUPPORT 
STAFF EMPLOYEE RE: HIS 
CHARGE OF DISCRIMINATION PENDING 
BEFORE THE ILLlNOIS DEPARTMENT OF 
HUMAN RIGHTS; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE .............. ... 

RE: SAME 

PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND GESSA 
NEGOTIATIONS SESSION 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DISTRJCT 
OFFICE RE: PERSONNEL FILE OF SUPPORT 
STAFF EMPLOYEE : HIS 
REQUEST FOR A COPY OF HIS PERSONNEL 
FILE 

WORK ON OPINION RE: PARENTAL 
EDUCATIONAL RIGHTS POST DIVORCE 

REVIEW RECORDS FROM PERSONNEL FILE 
OF SUPPORT STAFF EMPLOYE 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO OPPOSING 
COUNSEL RE: SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCIEIWIIITIHii-
RE: 

PARENTAL DISPUTE CONCERNING 
ATHLETICS CONSENT; DRAFT·---
CORRESPONDENCE TO RE: 
SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: 

SUSPENSION HEARING FOR STUDENT ... 
REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
... RE: SUSPENSION HEARING FOR 
STUDENT~REVlE\V DOCUMENTS RE: 

P,g, ' 
8.SOhr~ $2,040.00 

2.70 hrs.W $648.00 

0.30 hrs.7"'/Z- $72.00 

0.70 hr~ S168.00 

5.00 hrs.~ $!,200.00 

0.30 hr~ $72.00 

0.30 hrs. 'f"l--f( $72.00 

1.30 hrs.ef' $312.00 

0.30 hrs. ~ ,l, $72.00 

1.20 hrs. ("'\-fc- $288.00 

Qflo 



26670 

0512812015 

0512912015 

DISTRICT 225 • COOK COUNTY lnYoicoNumb" )64!~ 

SAME; PREPARE FOR HEARING 

REV JEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM l 
RE: 

RESOLUTION OF PARENT DISPUTE 
CONCERNING FOOTBALL PARTICIPA TJON 
CONSENT; DRAFT RESPONSE RE: SAME 

REVJEW DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM 
: SUSPENSION HEARING 

FOR .. PREPARE FOR SUSPENSION 
HEARING 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER 

1311.UNG SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
COST ALLOWANCE 

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL 

0.20 hrs. 8· t I $48.00 

""'"" 1.00 hrs. '\(,\'.:> S240.00 

$9,672.00 

$9,672.00 
$483.60 

$10, 155.60 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauscrizzo.com 

July 08, 2015 
BHI Through 06/30/2015 

Invoice# 15369 ™I 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Z6670 

01 

$9,357.60 

$9,357.60 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

July 08, 2015 
Bill Through 06/30/2015 
Invoice# 15369 ltvl..I 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

Client Number 26670 

Maner Number 01 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CG'IFIDEIITIAl 
ATTURIIEf-CUEliT 
l'Rl'l1LEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

06/0112015 

06/01/2015 

()610112015 

06101/2015 

06/01/2015 

06/02/2015 

06/02/2015 

0610212015 

06/0212015 

06102/2015 

06/02/2015 

REVIEW REVISED EXPERT RESTRICTED 
USE REPORT RE: 2013 3170 MAC A RIB UR, 
LLC 

UPDATE ALE WITH PTAB PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE DATE RE: 2009 3170 MAC 
ARTHUR,LLC 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: PRELIMINARY ANALYSIS 
OF MARKET VALUE FOR 3170MAC 
ARTHUR, LLC 

UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE DATE RE: 2009 FCL 
FOUNDERS DRIVE 

UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE DATE RE: 20()9 PROLOG!S 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY GROUP; 
WORK ON LEAD DISTRICT SELECTION RE: 
LIMITED BONDS OBJECTION 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: REVISED REPORTFOR2CJl3 
3170 MAC ARTHUR, LLC 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: 2()]3 NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

WORK ON ALLSTATE SPO WITH STATE'S 
ATTORNEY 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATIORl\'EY RE: THE BARKING 
LOT 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: MACY'S 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

$84.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$210.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 • COOK Invoice# 15369 Page 2 

06/03/2015 EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WTIH- 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
-RE: RATE OBJECTJONSSTATUS 

06!03/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 3170 MAC ARTHUR, ,,c 

06/0312015 APPRAISER RENZI APPRAISAL ESTJMATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
LOW: DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
APPRAISER KLESCYNSKI FOR 
PRELIMINARY ESTIMATE OF VALUE ON 
3170 MAC ARTHUR, LLC 

06/03/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 FCL FOUNDERS 
DRIVE 

06/03/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. 5105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 PROLOGJS 

06/0312015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 he. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: 2013 NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

06/0312015 CALCULATE AV VALVES AND REVIEW 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
EXPERTS REPORT AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDEtW RE: FULL APPRAISAL 
REPORT FOR 2013 NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

06/0312015 DRAFT CORRESPONDEi'>:CE TO APPRAISER 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TO PREPARE FULL APPRAISAL REPORT 
FOR 2013 NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

06/0412015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE W!TH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2009 HILLINGER 

06/05/2015 PREPARE FOR AND A"rfEND COURT DATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ON MOTION TO COMPEL RE: LEVEL OF 
ASSESSMENT CONSOLIDATED CASES 

06/0512015 WORK ON MACY'S SETTLEMENT 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

06/08/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY AND PREPARE FOR 
PTAB PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE RE: 2009 
3170 MAC ARTHUR, LLC 

06/08/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REV JEW 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2013 MACY'S 

06/0812015 WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT FOR LOO hrs. $210.00 
ALLSTATE 

06/0812015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAXPAYER A TIORNEY AND PREPARE FOR 
PTAB PR&HEARING CONFERENCE RE: 2009 
fCL FOUNDERS DRIVE 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Io voice# 15369 Page 3 

06/08/2015 TELEPHONECONFERENCE\VITH 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY AND PREPARE FOR 
PTAB PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE RE: 2009 
PRO LOG IS 

06/08/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERE,'<CE WITH 0.30 I=. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2009 LORD & 
TAYLOR 

06/09/2015 PREPARE FOR ?REHEARING CONFERENCES 0.36 hrs. $75.60 
RE: DOWN YORK AND EARL GREY 
Et'ITERPRISES. LTD. 

06/09/2015 REVIEW FILE AND PREP ARE FOR PT AB 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
?REHEARING PROPERTY RE: DOWN YORK 
& EARL GREY PROPERTY 

06/09/2015 REVJEW TAXPAYER'S COMMERCIAL 3.00 hIB. 5630.00 
APPEAL AND SUPPORTING MATERIAL; 
PREPARE 0011.JNE FOR L\lTERVENOR'S 
BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF BOARD OF REVIEW'S 
DENIAL OF OPEN SPACE ASSESSMENT RE: 
MISSION HILLS GOLF COURSE 2013 
ASSESSMENT APPEAL 

06/I0/2015 WORK ON SUMMARY CHART FOR LIMITED 0.50 hrs. $!05.00 
BONDS OBJECTIONS; COMPARE 
OBJECTIONS TO FINANCIAL RECORDS 

06/I0/2015 APPEAR AND ATfEND PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: PTAB, DOWN YOUR & 
EARL GREY ENTERPRISES, LTD PROPERTY 

06/10/20!5 DRAFT MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN 7.00 hrs. $1,470.00 
OPPOSITION TO COMMERCIAL APPEAL 

06!11/2015 DRAFf MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN 2.00 hra. $420.00 
OPPOSillON TO COMMERCIAL APPEAL RE: 
MISSION HILLS COUNTRY CLUB 
COMMERCIAL APPEAL 

06/12/2015 WORK ON BONDS CHART AND NOTES RE: 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
WORKING CASH OBJECTIONS; EMAIL 
BOND COUNSEL 

06/12)2015 COMPLETE DRAFT OF MEMORANDUM OF 1.50 hrs. $315.00 
LAW IN OPPOSITION TO COMMERCIAL 
APPEAL RE: MISSION HILLS GOLF COURSE 
COMMERCIAL APPEAL 

06116/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATfEND TELEPHONE 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
CONFERENCE WITH ATIORNEY GROUP; 
REVIEW STRATEGIES RE: LIMITED BOND 
RATE OBJECTIONS 

06/17/2015 PREPARE FOR ALLSTATE COURT DATE 1.00 I=. $210.00 

06/17/2015 REVIEW AND EDIT LEGAL ARGUMENT RE: 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
2012 MISSION HILLS GOLF COURSE 



26670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 15369 Page 4 

06/17/2015 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
wrrn PROPOSED SEITLEMENT AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: PROPOSED 
SETILEMEl\'T OF 2011 FRANK ALLGAUER 

06/1712015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE wrrn 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYERATIORNEY RE: 2011 COM ED 

06/18/2015 PREPARE FOR AND AITEND STATUS 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
HEARING ON PROPERTY TAX RATE 
OBJECTIONS 

06/18/2015 EMAIL--- RE: 2005 AND 2006 RATE 0.20 he. $42.00 
OBJECTIONS 

06/1812015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH TAXPAYER'S 
ATIORNEY RE: 2009 3170 MAC ARTIIUR. 
LLC 

06/18/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH TAXPAYER'S 
A TIORNEY RE: 2009 RCL FOUNDERS DRIVE 

06118/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH TAXPAYER'S 
ATIORNEY RE: 2009 PROLOGIS 

06/!8/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH TAXPAYER'S 
ATTORNEY RE: 2009 l·TILLINGER 

06/19/2015 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TO PERFORM FULL APPRAISAL REPORT 
FOR 2013 3170 MAC ARTIIUR, LLC 

06/19/2015 WORK ON SETILEMENT OF NEJMAN 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
MARCUS 

06/19/2015 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND REV JEW 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
EXPERT RESTRICTIVE ESTIMATE REPORT 
AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
TREASURER RE: 2013 3170 MAC ARTHUR, 
LLC 

06/19/2015 PREPARE FOR AND AITENDSTATUS 3.00 ho. $630.00 
COURT DATE RE: ALLSTATE 

06119/2015 WORK ON SETILEMENT OF 2009 LORD & 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAYLOR 

06/23/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYERATIORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

06/23/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: 2009 PROLOG!S 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 15369 Page s 
06/2312015 SELECT AND PREPARE EXHIBITS FOR 1.90 hrs. $399.00 

ATTACHMENT TO MEMORANDUM OF LAW 
IN OPPOSITION TO COMMERCIAL APPEAL 
RE: MISSION HILLS COUNTRY CLUB 
C0!-&1ERCIAL APPEAL 

06/24/2015 UPDATE FlLE WITH ORDER RE: ALLSTATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
SPO 

06/24/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYERATIORNEY'WITHOFFER m 
SETILE 2012 KAMAmVIC 

06/25/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 3170 MAC ARTHUR, 
LLC 

06/25/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 3170 FCL FOUNDERS 
DRIVE 

06/2512015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 PROLOGJS 

06/25/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT AND PROPOSE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
OFFER RE: NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

06125120!5 ORGANIZE EXHIBITS FOR ATTACHMENT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TO MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN OPPOSITION 
m COMMERCIAL APPEAL RE: MISSION 
HILLS COUNTRY CLUB COMMERCIAL 
APPEAL 

06/26/2015 TELEPHOl\'E CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: MACY'S 

06126/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND COURT DATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ON MOTION TO COMPEL RE: LEVEL OF 
ASSESSMENT CONSOLIDATED CASr:S 

06/29/2015 WORK ON ALLSTATESPO I.00 hrs. $210.00 

06/30/2015 WORK ON POTENTIAL AGREEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
MACY'S 

06/30/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR THE BARKING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
LOT 

-----------~---
Total Fees $9,357.60 

BILLING SUi\IMARY 

TOTAL FEES $9,357.60 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER $9,357.60 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $9,357.60 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Govern(j.S Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

July 08, 2015 
Blll Through 06/3012015 

Invoice# 15366 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 \VEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 
i.:J/( <·.)\ I· It ,[J· '2 I /[I]•; 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

/ 
26670 

0 

---,-,-,c,c,cc,c,c;>pROVAL 

SIGN 

DATE .2,:::},,L_-/c _ l'IJ t;c ---­

ACCT No / __ .{.3t1'_ --~-­
O PARTIAL [1F1r.1,._ ~o r.o. 

$378.00 

$378.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite JO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

July 08, 2015 
Bill Through 06/30/2015 
Invoice# 15366 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 \VEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CC':F:DENTIAL 
ATlORNCY-CUEIH 
PRIVILEGE 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

06/03/2015 

06/15/2015 

06/23/2015 

06/24/2015 

REVIEW BILL AMENDING TAX 
ASSESSMENT APPEAL PROCEDURES; 
EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITH DR. 
SIENA 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM 
~REGARDING CHANGE ORDERS 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM 
COUNSEL TN HENRY BROTHERS CASE; 
DRAFI'EMAIL TO~WORKON 
SCHEDULING DEPOSITIONS 

REV JEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM 
CLIENT REGARDING HENRY BROTHERS 
MATIER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITI:l 
COUNSEL FOR HARTFORD INSURANCE 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.60 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

$126.00 1..1:Y" 

$63.00~ 

$105.00 \~ 

$84.00 \~ 

$378.00 

$378.00 

$378.00 

$378.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

August 06, 2015 
Bill Through 07/31/2015 

Invoice# 15572 JMI 

BOARD OF EDU CA T!ON Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 \VEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUJTE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR TIIIS MA TIER 

Z6670 

01 

lbJVOICE APPROVAL 

/ 

$5,817.00 

$5,817.00 

1~:~~·;~r~i'RO\'ED. 
jDAT[ .f::/Js:1_,C_ PO fh ---­

'1,;CCT No. !'L-C:J:~lf~-~­
_UPAWl,\L _ [3'j1N,\L ~o ?.o. 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

August06,2015 
Bill Through 07/31/2015 
Invoice# 15572 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

MattcrNumbcr 01 

SUITE 200 .:· , .. , :111 <I 

GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 .Ir ,LIL!lf 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

07101/2015 

07/01/2015 

07/01/2015 

07/01/2015 

07/0l/2015 

07/02/2015 

07/06/2015 

0710612015 

07/07/2015 

07/07/2015 

PREPARE FORAND APPEAR AT STATUS ON 
DISCOVERY AND STATUS OF MOTION TO 
COMPEL RE: LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT 
CONSOLI DA TED CASES 

WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT FOR 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING AND 
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE RE: 2009 3170 
MAC ARTHUR, LLC 

PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING AND 
SE1TLEMENT CONFERENCE RE: 2009 FCL 
FOUNDERS DRIVE 

PREPARE FOR PTAl3 PRE HEARING AND 
SETI LEM ENT CONFERENCE RE: 2009 
PROLOGICS 

WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT FOR 
ALLSTATE SPO 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER A 1TORNEY; CALCULATE 
LOSSES WITH SETILEMENTVALUE AND 
AV VALUES; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
ASS!STANT SUPER!NTENDENT Rl3: 2009 
J 170 MAC ARTI [UR, LLC POTENTIAL 
SETTLEMENT 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 
HILLJNGER, ROBERT 

REVIEW SUMMARIES FROM BOND 
COUNSEL 

REVIEW AND EDIT MEMORANDUM OF 
LAW AND LEGAL ARGUMENT RE: 2012 
MISSION HILLS COUNTRY CLUB 

0.40 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

LOO hrs. 

0.60 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.50 !us. 

$84.00 

$105.00 

$105.00 

$105.00 

$!05.00 

$210.00 

$126.00 

SlOS.00 

$42.00 

$105.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 15572 Page 2 

07/07/2015 REVIEW ALL CHARTS AND TOTAL ALL 0.50 ms. $105.00 
OPEN CASES POTENTIAL LOSS FOR 
AUDITOR'S LETTER 

07/07/2015 WORK ON POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT OF 2009 IJ.50 hrs. $105.00 
PROLOGIS FOR PTAB PRE HEARJNG 
CONFERENCE TOMORROW 

07/07/2015 WORK ON POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT OF 2009 0.50 hrs. 5105.00 
FCL FOUNDERS DRIVE fOR PTAB PRE 
HEARING CONFERENCE TOMORROW 

07/0712015 WORK ON POTENTIAL SETfLEMENT OF 0.50 ms. $105.00 
MULTI YEAR COM ED 

07/07/2015 PREPARE MEMORANDUM AND EXHIBITS 0.70 hrs. $147.00 
FOR SUBMISSION TO PTAB RE: MISSION 
HILLS COUNTRY CLUB COMMERCIAL 
APPEAL 

07/0812015 PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT PTAB 3.50 ,~. $735.00 
PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE AND 
NEGOTIATE SETTLEMENTS FOR 2009 MAC 
ARTHUR, LLC, 2009 FCL FOUNDERS, AND 
2009 PROLOGJS 

07109120\5 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
SUPERINTENDENT RE, 2009 FCL 
FOUNDERS, LLC WITHDRAW AL 

07/09/2015 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
WITH SETTLEMENT AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: 2009 PROLOGIS 
POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT 

07/09/2015 WORK ON ALLSTATE MULTI YEAR l.00 ha. 5210.00 
SETfLEMENT 

07/10/2015 PREPARE FOR AND A TT END COURT DA TE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT 
CONSOLIDATED CASES 

07/14/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.10 ms. 521.00 
ATTORNEY GROUP RE: LIMITED BONDS 
RATE OBJECTIONS 

07/15/2015 EXECUTE STJPULA TION AND DRAFT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
ATTORNEY RE: 2009 PROLOGJS 

07115/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH DATE FOR PTAB PRE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
HEARING CONFERENCE RE: 2009 LORD & 
TAYLOR 

07/15/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 ms. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2009 LORD & 
TAYLOR 

07/16/2015 WORK ON RESPONSE TO LIMITED BONDS 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
RATE OBJECTIONS 
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07116/2015 REVIEW AND EDIT DRAFT APPRAISAL 0.50 !us. $105.00 
REPORT FOR 2011 PATRIOT COURTYARDS 

07/1612015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.50 hrs. 5105.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY, WORK ON 
POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT AND PREPARE 
FOR PTAB PRE HEARING CONFERENCE RE: 
2009 LORD& TAYLOR 

07116/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hra. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: MACY'S 

07/1712015 REVIEW FINANCIAL RECORDS; WORK ON 0.40 !us. $84.00 
LEAD DISTRICT SELECTION 

07/17/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
FOR LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT 
CONSOLIDATED CASES 

07/17/2015 MEETING WITH STATE'S AlTORNEY RE: 1.50 !us. $315.00 
STATUS OF CASE AND SE'M'LEMENT 
NEGOTIATIONS ON ALLSTATE 

07/20/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH FULLY EXECUTED 0.30 hra. $63.00 
STIPULATION ON 2009 NORTHBROOK 
COURT PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS 

07120/2015 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAl3 WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2011 PATRIOT COURTIARDS CONDO 
ASSOCJA TlON 

07/21/2015 PREPARE FOR STATUS HEARING; WORK ON 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
LEAD DISTRICT RE: RATE OBJECTIONS 

07/21/2015 WORK ON SET!'LEMENT NEGOTIATIONS 0.50 hra. $105.00 
WITH TAX PA YER ATTORNEY FOR 2009 
LORD& TAYLOR 

07/22/2015 WORK ON LEAD DISTRICT ISSUES FOR 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
LIMITED BONO RATE OBJECTIONS 

07/2212015 PREPARE FORAND A1TEND STATUS 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
HEARING ON RA TE OBJECTIONS; 
CONFERENCE WITH STATE'SATfORNEY 

07/22/2015 PARTICIPATE IN SE'J"J'LEMENT 0.50 !us. $105.00 
NEGOTIATIONS RE: 2009 LORD & TAYLOR 

07/2212015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
APPRAISER RE: PROGRESS ON REPORT FOR 
2013 NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

07122/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hP.1. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: PROGRESS ON REPORT FOR 
2013 3170 MAC ARTHUR, LLC 

07/2312015 WORK ON MOTION ON WORKING CASH 0.10 hra. $21.00 
BONDS OBJECTION; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH BOND COUNSEL AND 
LEAD DISTRICT 
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07/23/2015 TELEPHONE CONfERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2009 LORD& 
TAYLOR 

07/24/2015 PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT COURT 0.4() ms. $84.QO 
DATE FOR MOTION TO COMPEL RE: LEVEL 
OF ASSESSMENT CONSOLIDATED CASES 

07/2412015 PREPARE FORAND ATTEND MEETING 1.00 ho. $210.00 
WITH STATE'S ATTORNEY RE: ALLSTATE 
SPO 

07/27/2015 TELEPHONE CONFEREN"CES WITH 0.30 ho. $63.00 
ATTORNEY GROUP; WORK ON JOINT 
MOTION ON LIMITED BONDS OBJECTION; 
WORK ON AFFIDAVITS IN SUPPORT 

07127/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.60 hrs. $126.00 
CONFERENCE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
W!TI ! STATE'S ATTORNEY RE: COUNTER 
OFfER ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 LORD & 
TAYLOR 

07/27/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB FINAL ORDER 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND VERJFY DECISION WITH STIPULATION 
AGREED TO RE: 2009 NORTHBROOK COURT 
PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS 

07/28/2015 WORK ON JOINT MOTION AND AFFlDA VITS 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
RE: LIMITED BOND TAX OBJECTIONS 

07/28/2015 CALCULATE LOSS OF ALL PTAB OPEN 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
CASES FOR AUDITOR'S LETTER 

07128120!5 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH Q.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: LORD AND 
TAYLOR 

07/28/2()15 WORK ON SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL FOR n.5n ho. $105.00 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

07/30/2015 CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY RE: 0.10 hrs. $21.0() 
COP JES OF OBJECTIONS FOR JOINT 
WORKING CASH BONDS OBJECTION RE: 
PROPERTY TAXES 

()7/3()/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH Q.60 hrs. $126.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY, CALCULATE AV 
VALUES, CALCULATE LOSSES IN 
SETfLEMENT SCENARIOS; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: POTENTIAL 
SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 LORD & TAYLOR 

07/30/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.QO 
APPRAISER RE: STATUS OF REPORT ON 
2013 3170 MACARTHUR, LLC 

07/30/2015 EXECUTE STIPULATION AND DRAFT TO 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2009 LORD & 
TAYLOR 



Z6670 

07/31/2015 
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07131/2015 

07/31/2015 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: THE BARKING 
COT 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE'S 
ATTORNEY RE: LORD & TAYLOR 
SETTLEMENT 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 
ON MOTION TO COMPEL DEPOSITIONS RE: 
LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CONSOLIDATED 
CASES 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THJS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.30 hrs. S63.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

$5,817.00 

$5,817.00 

SS,817.00 

SS,817.00 



/ 
HAUSER IZZO, LLC 

I9730GovemorsHighway-Suile10 ,,,,-l-~!\-l<JJ 1\lll, 1 /(I'" 

Flossmoor, lllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.b.auscri220.com 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

August 05, 2015 
Bill Through 07/31!1015 

lovoice# 15479 CLP 

GLENBROOK 1-flGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE A VENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW,IL 60026--1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client NI.ITTIOOr 

M2tler Numbflr 

SIGI< __ _ 

26670 

0 

DML 4~lc.i..•- _ //Ji 

$714.00 

S714.DO 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, lllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

August 05, 2015 
Bill Through 07/31/2015 
Invoice# 15479 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 \VEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

er<. r' c,:·,,,.,L 
:.1, ·i 1·r i-C&IIT 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

07/2312015 

07/30/2015 

07/3112015 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM 
...... REGARDING ILLINOIS BONE AND 
JOINT AGREEMENTS; REVIEW AGREEMENT 
AND MODIFICATIONS 

REVIEW CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE; 
WORK ON 
AGREEMENT WITH BONE AND JOINT 
SURGEONS 

REVJl::W INSURANCE CERTIFICATE; 
RESEARCH - ACT; 
RESEARCH COVERAGES OF COMMERCIAL 
GENERAL LIABILITY POLICIES AND 
ERRORS AND OMISSIONS POLICIES 

Total Fees 

DILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MA rrER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

1.00 hrs. 

0.80 hrs. 

1.60 hrs. 

S210.00 ,/' 

$16s.00V' 

$336.00 ,/' 

$714.00 

S714.00 

$714.00 

$714.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 . Fax: (708) 799;9~?6, 

www.hausenzzo.com · '· 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

September 08, 2015 
Bill Through 08/31/2015 

Invoice# 15651 JMI 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

• ·, I , 

Z6670 

01 

/ 
'·'!,' 

TOTAL FEES $8,190.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER $8,190.00 

j INVOICE APPROVAL ·-, 

I,,,,,,~··· ., ., .. · 1 ' " •. ,,, ,•,-J 
SIG/1 _ 

0,\Tf' 9.d&f:_ ,,, i,, --
l'sCCT No ____ //Jd.tf_ -----1 

/ 0PARr1,,L Ci:{,i, 1,11 efNor.o, 
-·---------> 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauscriz.zo.com 

September 08, 2015 
Bill Through 08/31/2015 
Invoice# 15651 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

MattcrNumber 01 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

u;r:FID[';TIAL 
HI ( .. i; ,E'I-CCIEIH 
h,:;iLtGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

08/0312015 

08/03/2015 

08/0312015 

08/03/2015 

08/03/2015 

08/04/2015 

08/04/2015 

08/04/2015 

08/05/2015 

08/05/2015 

08/05/2015 

08/05/2015 

08/06/2015 

08/06/2015 

WORK ON JOINT MOTION ON L1\1ITED 
BONDS OBJECTIONS 

UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 201 ! PATRIOT 
COURITARDS 

WORK ON SETILEMENT FOR MACY'S 

WORK ON POSSIBLE NORTIIBROOK COURT 
MALL SETrLEMENT 

UPDATE FILE WITH STATUS OF 
STIPULATION ON 2009 PROLOGIS 

WORK ON JOINT MOTION AGAINST 
LIMITED BONDS OBJECTIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE, 2010 CHICAGO 
CAPITAL HOLDINGS 

PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 HTLLINGER, ROBERT 

WORK ON JOJNT MOTION AGAINST 
LIMITED BONDS OBJECTIONS 

WORK ON SETILEMENT OF MULTI-YEAR 
MACY'S 

EXPLORE SETILEMENT OPPORTUNITIES 
FOR MULTI-YEAR NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 
TAXPAYER'S ATIORNEY RE: MACY'S 

WORK ON JOINT MOTION AFADA VJTS AND 
EXHIBITS ON WORKING CASH BONDS 

WORK ON MACY'S 201 l, 2012 AND 2013 
SETTLEMENT 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.70 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

LOO hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

$84.00 

$63.00 

$147.00 

$105.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$105.00 

$21.00 

$2!0.00 

$105.00 

$42.00 

$63.00 

$210.00 
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08/06/2015 REVIEW MOTION TO COMPEL TESTJMONY 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
OF HORBAS AND DEPOSITION OF DAVIS 
RESPONSE AND REPLY BRIEFS Ai'l"D 
PREPARE FOR COURT ON LEVEL OF 
ASSESSMENT CONSOLIDATED CASES 

08/06/2015 WORK ON ALLSTATESPO 1.00 !us. $210.00 

08/06/2015 WORK ON MULTI-YEAR SEITLEMENT RE: 0.50 hrs. S105.00 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

08/06/2015 DRAFf REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF TIME 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
TO FILE INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 2013 
3170MACARTHUR, LLC 

08/07/2015 WORK ON AFF!DA VITS FOR JOINT MOTION 0.40 ho. $84.00 
ON WORKING CASH BONDS OBJECTION 

08/10/2015 WORK ON JOINT MOTION AND AFFIDAVITS 0.30 hrs. 563.00 
ON WORKING CASH BONDS; PREPARE FOR 
AND ATTEND TELECONFERENCES WITH 
ATTORNEY GROUP 

08/10/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.70 hrs. 5147.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY TO NEGOTIATE 
SETTLEMENT FOR 2010 THROUGH 2015 
MACY'S 

08/10/2015 UPDATE l'JLE WITII NOTICE FORM PTAB 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
HEARING OFFICER RE: FCL FOUNDER'S 
DRIVE 

08/10/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 0.50 hrs. $!05.00 
HILLINGER, ROBERT 

08110/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 030 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

08/11/2015 PREPARE STIPULATION FOR PTAB PRE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
HEARING CONFERENCE RE: LORD & 
TAYLOR 

08/l l/2015 NEGOTIATIONS WITH TAXPAYER 0.70 hrs. $147.00 
ATfORNEY RE: MULTI-YEAR SETTLEMENT 
FOR NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

08/11/2015 WORK ON SETILEMENTFOR 2012 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
WALGREEN CO. 

08111/2015 WORK ON SETILEMEJ\'T FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

08/1112015 WORK ON MACY'S MULTI-YEAR 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
SETTLEMENT 

08/1212015 WORK ON JOINT MOTION AFFJDAVITS ON 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
WORKING CASH BONDS OBJECTIONS 

08/1212015 PREPARE FOR AND ATIBND PTAB PRE J.00 h". $210.00 
HEARING CONFERENCE RE: 2009 LORD & 
TAYLOR 

08/12/2015 WORK ON MACY'S SETTLE.\1ENT 0.50 he. $!05.00 
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08/13/2015 WORK ON JOINT MOTION 0.40 hrs. $84.00 

08/13/2015 WORK ON POlENTIAL SEITLEMENT OF 1.10 hrs. $231.00 
ALLSTATE SPO WJTH STATE'S ATIORNEY 
AND POSSIBLE SETILEMENT OF ONE OF 
TI:lREE PARCELS 

08/13/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITII 0.30 I=. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: THE BARKING 
LOT 

08!1312015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER ATIORNEY RE: 2013 3170 
MACARTHUR REPORT STATUS 

08/13/2015 DRAFT EXTENSION REQUEST TO FILE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
INTERVENOR EVJDENCE RE: 2013 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

08!14/2015 WORK ON JOINT MOTION ON WORKING 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
CASH BONDS OBJECTIONS 

08/14/2015 NEGOTIATE POTENTIAL SETILEMENT 0.50 hrs. 5105.00 
WITH TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: MULTI 
YEAR MACY'S 

08!1712015 WORK ON JOINT MOTION AGAINST 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
WORKING CASH BOND OBJECTIONS 

08fl7f2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND HEARING ON 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
MOTION TO COMPEL DEPOSITION RE: 
LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

08fl7{2015 WORK ON MACY'S MULTI YEAR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
SETTLEMENT 

08/17/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. 563.00 
TAX PA YER ATIORNEY RE: THE BARKING 
LOT 

08![8/2015 DRAFT EXTENSION REQUEST FROM 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER RENZI ON 2013 NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

08/18/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: MACY"S 
QUESTION 

0811912015 WORK ON JOJNT MOTION AGAINST 0.20 he. $42.00 
WORKING CASH FUND OBJECTIONS 

08/1912015 WORK ON ALLSTATE SPO WITH STATE'S l.30 hrs. $273.00 
ATTORNEY 

08!19/2015 UPDATEF1LE WITH PTAB FINAL ORDER RE: 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
WITHDRAWAL OF APPEAL FOR 2009 FCL 
FOUNDER'S DRIVE 

08/19/2015 WORK ON MULTI YEAR SETILEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL WITH 
TAXPAYER A TIORNEY 

08!1912015 WORK ON MACY"S PAYMENT PLAN 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
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0812012015 WORK ON JOJNT MOTION AGAINST 0.20 hes. $42.00 
WORKING CASH BONDS TAX OBJECTIONS 

08/20/2015 MEETING WITH STATE"S ATTORNEY RE: 2.80 hrs. $588.00 
ALLSTATE 

08/2112015 WORK ON JOINT MOTION AGAINST 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
WORKING CASH BONDS OBJECTIONS AND 
EXHtBITS 

08121/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: STATUS OF REPORT ON 
2013 3170 MACARTifUR LLC 

0812112015 PREPARE FORANDATIEND STATUS ON 0.30 hrn. $63.00 
DISCOVERY COURT DATE RE: LEVEL OF 
ASSESSMENT CASES 

08124/2015 WORK ON AFADA VITS AND EXHIBITS FOR 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
JOINT MOTJON AGAINST WORKING CASH 
BOND OBJECTJONS: WORK ON LEGAL 
STRATEGIES 

08124/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB FINAL ORDER 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND VERIFY VALUE OF ORDER WITH 
ST!PULATJON RE: 2009 

08/2412015 UPDATE FILE WITH PT AB FJNAL ORDER 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND VERIFY VALUE OF ORDER WITH 
STIPULATION RE: 2009 

08124/2015 UPDATE ALE WJTH PTAB ANAL ORDER 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND VERIFY VALUE OF ORDER WITH 
STIPULATJON RE: 2009 JOHN'S COURT 
BUILDINGS (2075) 

08/24/2015 UPDAIB FILE WITH PTAB FINAL ORDER 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND VERIFY VALUE OF ORDER WITH 
STIPULATION RE: 2009 JOJJN"S COURT 
BUILDINGS (2025) 

08/24/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB FINAL ORDER 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND VERIFY VALUE OF ORDER WITH 
STJPULATION RE: 2009 DOWN YORK AND 
EARL GREY EJ\'TERPRISES 

08/24/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB FINAL ORDER 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND VERIFY VALUE OF ORDER WITH 
STIPULATJON RE: 2011 EVERGREEN 
ALLIAi'ICE GOLF, LTD. 

08/25/2015 WORK ON MACY'S SETTLEMENT 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

08/25/2015 WORK ON MUL Tl YEAR SETTLEMENT 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
WITH TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

08/26/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND RATE 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
OBJECTIONS STATUS HEARING 

08/26/2015 CONFERENCE AND EXCHANGE EMAIL 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
MESSAGES WITH ATIORNEYS RE: JOINT 
MOTION ON RAIB OBJECTIONS 
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08126/2015 WORK ON NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
SETTLEME.t'ff WITH TAXPAYER ATTORNEY 

08126/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 he. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2012 

0812612015 WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
WALGREENS 

08/26/2015 UPDATE FILE AND CHART WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION AND 
REVJEW PAST FILINGS OF SAME PROPERTY 
RE: 2014 MACY'S 

08126/2015 UPDATE FILE Al\'D CHART WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION AND 
REVIEW PAST FILINGS OF SAME PROPERTY 
RE: 2014 NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

08126/2015 DRAFT E-MAIL TO TAXPAYER A RE: 0.30 he $63.00 
LATEST COUNTER OFFER FOR 2011 
NEIMAN MARCUS 

08/2712015 REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.60 hrs. $126.00 
OF NORTHBROOK COURT MALL; WORK ON 
REVENUE CALCULATIONS; EXCHANGE 
EMAIL MESSAGES WITH DISTRICT 

0812712015 REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
ON MACY'S; WORK ON REVENUE LOSS 
CALCULA T!ONS; EMAIL DISTRICT 

08/2712015 PREPARE FOR SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE LOO hrs. $210.00 
RE: ALLSTATE 

08127/2015 TELEPHONE CONl'ERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYERATIORNEY RE: MULTI YEAR 
MACY'S 

08/27/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE Will{ 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

08(27/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITif 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: REQUEST FOR FINANCIAL 
INFORMATION ON NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

0812812015 WORK ON JOINT MOTION AND AFFIDAVITS 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
FOR WORKJNG CASH BONDS OBJECTIONS 

08/28/2015 PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT STATUS 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
DATE RE: LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

0812812015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
NORTifBROOK COURT MALL 

08128/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR MULTI YEAR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
WALGREEN CO. 

08/28(2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 .......... 

0.50 ms. $105.00 



26670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 15651 Page 6 

08/3112015 

08/3112015 

WORK ON JOINT MOTION RE: LIMITED 
BOND OBJECTIONS 

WORK ON MULTI YEAR POTENTIAL 
SETILEMENT FOR NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMi\IARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.10 hrs. $21.00 

0.50 hrs. 5105.00 

$8,190.00 

$8,190.00 

$8,190.00 

$8,190.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

/ 
www.hauserizzo.com 

September 08, 2015 
Bill Through 08/3112015 

Invoice# 15637 CLP 

. ' ,· : '. ; • . 1· ·,,, "'. ''•11:' 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

0 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW,IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

S1,Jf31J' Y!.3.flO 
,P: 11fJ1J' f; 9.f'3.0 

I 
- I 

' 
ACCT No. _______ ···-- i 

L~O~P~A~R~Tl~AI~. ~/;:]=Fl~NA~.L~ )d ~r, ,, c 

$2,436.00 

$2.436.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 
September 08, 2015 

Bill Through 08/31/2015 
Invoice# 15637 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION ClientNumber Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 

SUITE 200 CC'MIDU!llAl 
GLENVIE\V, IL 60026-1241 A1TG~,\CY-Cllt1H 

PRh'ILEGE 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

08/03/2015 

08/04/2015 

08/05/2015 

08/06/2015 

08/10/2015 

08/12/2015 

08112/2015 

08117/2015 

08/18/2015 

08/20/2015 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL 
FOR BONE AND JOINT SURGEONS; REVIEW 
PROFESSIONAL LIABILITY COVERAGES; 
REVIEW BOARD POLICIES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITJJ­
~EVIEW MODIFIED INSURANCE 
CERTIFICATE: REVIEW PROTOCOL 
DOCUMENT 

REVJEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM 
REGARDING OPINION OF 

COUNSEL LETTER; DRAFT OPINION OF 
COUNSEL LETTER; REVIEW ORIGINAL 
MASTER LEASE 

WORK ON ILLJNOIS BONE AND JOINT 
INSURANCE MA TIER 

l{EVJEW EMAIL REGARDING CLAIMS 
COMPENSATION BUREAU; REVIEW 
CORRESPONDENCE AND PROPOSED 
SERVICE AGREEMENT; RESEARCH CLAIMS 
COMPENSATION BUREAU 

REVIEW INSURANCE POLICY; REVIEW AND 
REVISE PROPOSED AGREEMENT WITH 
ILLINOIS BONE AND JOINT SURGEONS 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS SEJ\'T BY ATIORNEY 
AND PERFORM CASE SEARCH SUMMARY 
RE~ESIDENCY 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH­
~E:-RESIDENCY 

WORK ON 
AGREEMENT 

1.20 hrs. ~252.00 

LOO 

0.70 hrs. \~47.00 

0.50 

1.20 

hrs. ~05.00 

hrs. :p; $252.00 

2.20 hrs. ~62.00 

0.30 hrs. 7'1.J?.... $63.00 

0.50 !us. r<l $105.00 

0.30 hrs.~ $63.00 

0.50 hrs.~105.00 



26670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

08/21/2015 

08/24/2015 

08/25/2015 

08/25/2015 

08/28/2015 

08/30120[5 

08/31/2015 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT 
RE: RESIDENCY INQUIRIES Ai"lD REDUCED 
FEES INQUIRES 

REVIEW SHORT TERM GUARDIAN PAPERS 

WORK ON 
AGREEMENT 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
RE: ORDER OF 

TEMPORARY CUSTODY 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
~E: JS YEAR OLD 
STUDENT 

••• LICENSES 
AND MEMORANDA OF 1NSURANCE; 
REVJEW AND REVISE 
AGREEMENT 

Total Fee, 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

15637 Page 2 

0.30 hrs.~ $63.00 

0.30 hrs. -;4 $63.00 

0.40 hrs. ~84.00 

0.30 !us. ;z:il $63.00 

0.30 hrs. -/), $63.00 

l.00 hrs.~0.00 

0.60 hrs. ~126.00 

----------------
$2,436.00 

$2,436.00 

$2,436.00 

$2,436.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

www .hauserizzo.com 

October07,2015 
Bill Through 09/30/2015 

Invoice# 15885 JMI 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKEAVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

01 

''i"I'' ·· ll l~I 

/ 

56,993.00 

$6,993.00 

1/f3J/' 
,/ / 

• 

...• 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

October 07, 2015 
Bill Through 09/30/2015 
Invoice# 15885 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

MatterNumber OJ 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONl'ID~NTIAl 
ATTOR:ffV-CUENT 
P~IVILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

09/01/2015 

0910112015 

09/0112015 

09/0212015 

09/02/2015 

09/0212015 

09/02/2015 

09/02/2015 

09/04/2015 

09/04/2015 

09/04/2015 

09/08/2015 

PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION OF APPRAISER 
~E: LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT WITH 
TAXPAYERATIORNEYRE: MULTI-YEAR 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY REGARDING 
RESPONSE ON SETTLEMENT OFfER RE: 
NEIMAN MARCUS 

WORK ON PTAB INTERVENTION FOR 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

WORK ON PTAB INTERVENTION FOR 
MACY'S 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ATIORNEY GROUP; WORK ON JOINT 
MOTION AGAINST WORKING CASH BOND 
RATE OBJECTIONS 

WORK ON MACY'S SETfLEMENT 

WORK ON GLOBAL SETILEMENT FOR 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

WORK ON JOINT MOTION ON AGAINST 
WORKING CASH BOND OBJECTIONS 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND STATUS 
HEARING FOR DISCOVERY ON SALES 
RATIO CASES 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING 
WITH STATE'S ATTORNEY RE: POTENTIAL 
FOR SETTLEMENT ON ALLSTATE SPO 

WORK ON JOINT MOTION AGAINST 
WORKING CASH BOND OBJECTIONS 

0.10 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

$21.00 

$105.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$21.00 

$105.00 

5210.00 

$42.00 

$84.00 

$210.00 

$63.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 15885 Page 2 

09/08/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB PRE HEARING 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CONFERENCE DA TE RE: 2010 JR JP REAL TY 

09/08/2015 WORK ON MACY'S SETILEMENT 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

09/09/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND PTAB 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE AND 
PARTICIPATE IN SETILEMENT 
NEGOTIATIONS RE: 2009 THE BARKING LOT 

09/10/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE-HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2010 JR JP REALTY, LLC 

09/11/2015 WORK ON JOINT MOTION AGAlt\/ST 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
WORKING CASH BONDS OBJECTIONS 

09/11/2015 WORK ON MACY'S SETILEMENT AND 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
PAYMEl\'TPLAN 

09/11/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF NORTI·IBROOK 0.50 ha. $105.00 
COURT MALL 

09/11/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER A'JTORNEY RE: THE BARKING 
LOT 

09/11/2015 PREPARE FORAND ATIEND STATUS DATE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
FOR LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

09/ll/2015 PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION OF APPRAISER - 0.10 hrs. 521.00 

09/14/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
ATTORNEY GROUP; WORK ON FINALIZING 
JOINT MOTION ON LIMITED BONDS 
OBJECTION 

09/15/2015 WORK ON JOINT MOTION AGAINST 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
WORKING CASH BOND OBJECTIONS; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ATTORNEY GROUP 

09/15/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH FINAL DATE TO FILE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 2013 317~ 
~LLC 

09/15/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH FINAL DATE TO FILE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 2013 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

09115/2015 DRAFf CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
~TO NOTIFY OF FINAL DATE 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TO FILE INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 2013 
3170 MAC ARTHUR, LLC 

09/15/2015 DRAFf CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
-AND REVIEW APPRAISER ENRIGHT 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TO NOTIFY OF FINAL DATE TO FILE 
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 2013 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 



26670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 15885 Page 3 

09/15/2015 UPDATE FILE WJTH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
Ai''<D DA'IE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW APPRAISAL 
REPORT RE: 2014 NORTI:lBROOK COURT 
MALL 

09/15/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 0.40 I=. S84.00 
AND DA TETO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDE,\l"CE AND REVIEW APPRAISAL 
REPORT RE: 2014 MACY'S 

09/15/2015 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2014MACY'S 

09/15/2015 DRAFfCORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
-AND REVIEW APPRAISER-

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TO PERFORM PRELIMINARY ESTIMATE OF 
MARKET VALUE AND ABILITY TO REVIEW 
NEW APPRAISAL RE: 2014NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

09/15/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE Willi 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: YrAB PRE 
HEARING CONFERENCE ON 2009 JR JP 
REALTY 

09/16/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND DEPOSITION 
OF APPRAISER - RE: LEVEL OF 

0.90 hr~. $189.00 

ASSESSMENT CASES 

09/16/2015 PREPARE FOR RULE 10.8 COMMITIEE 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
MEETING RE: RATE OBJECTIONS 

09/16/2015 ATIEND RULE 10.8 COMMITIEE MEETING 0.20 hrs. $42.00 

09/1612015 ATIEND STATUS HEARING RE: RATE 0.20 hr~. $42.00 
OBJECTIONS 

09/17/2015 EMAIL DISTRICT RE: LITIGATION OF 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
WORKING CASH BOND OBJECTION 

09/17/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
NEGOTIATIONS WITH TAXPAYER 
A1TORNEY RE: SETILEMENT FOR 
TRIENNIAL AND BEYOND NORIBBROOK 
COURT MALL 

09/!712015 UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 0.20 he. $42.00 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2012 M!SS!ON HILLS 
GOLF COURSE 

09/17/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 JR JP REALTY 

09/17/2015 TELEPHONE CONFEREN"CE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

09/1812015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DA TE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 
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0912112015 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 0.30 ho. $63.00 
TO DO FULL APPRAISAL REPORT ON 2014 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

0912112015 WORK ON SETTLEMENTFOR2011 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TIIROUGH 2015 MACY'S WITI·I TAXPAYER 
ATIORNEY 

09121/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2011 0.50 "''· $105.00 
TIIROUGH 2015 NORTHBROOK RACQUET 
CLUB WITH TAXPAYER ATTORNEY 

09/21/2015 UPDATE FrLE Willi EXPERT REPORT ON 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
PRELIMINARY ESTIMATE OF MARKET 
VALUE, REVIEW REPORT AND DRAFf 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: FULL APPRAISAL 
REPORT ON 2014 NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

09/2112015 UPDATE FILE AND CHART WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION AND 
RESEARCH PAST FILINGS AND 
SETTLEMENTS RE: 3170 MAC ARTHUR 

09/21/2015 UPDATE FILE AND CHART WJTH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION AND 
RESEARCH PAST FILINGS AND 
SETILEMENTS RE: 2014 THE BARKING LOT 

09/2112015 WORK ON POTENTIAL SETILEMENT WITH 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAXPAYER A TIORNEY RE: 2009 JR JP 
REALTY 

09/22/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER AITORNEY RE: COUNTER 
OFFER ON MACY'S 

09/22/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF NORTHBROOK 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
COURT MALL 

09/22/2015 WORK ON SETILEMENT OF 2010 BARTON 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
MANAGEMEl\'T 

0912212015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB NOTICE OF 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
HEARING AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT RE: 
HEARINGON2010~ 

09/22/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: HEARING AND REPORT FOR 
2010 

09/22/2015 UPDATEFJLE WITH PTAB NOTICE OF 0.50 ho. $105.00 
HEARING AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT RE: 
HEARING ON 2009 

09/22/2015 PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION OF-
~F COLLECTOR'S OFFICE RE: 

0.10 hrs. $21.00 

LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT 
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09/23/2015 REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 hra. $105.00 
ON 3170 MACARTHURLLC; WORK ON 
REVENUE LOSS CALCULATION; EMAIL 
DISTRICT 

09/23/2015 REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
ON THE BARKING LOT (2014): WORK ON 
REVENUE LOSS CALCULATION: EMAIL 
DISTRICT 

0912312015 REVIEW RESPONSE TO COLLECTOR'S FIRST 0.20 ms. $42.00 
SET OF INTERROGATORIES RE: LEVEL OF 
ASSESSMENT CASES 

09123120!5 ANALYZE FILE, CALCULATE AV VALUES 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND SETILEMENT LOSSES AND DRAFf 
E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
ATTORNEY WITH OFFER TOSETTLE20IOJR 
JP REALTY 

09/2312015 PREPARE FOR PT AB HEARJNG ON 2009 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

09/23/2015 WORK ON ALLSTATE POTENTIAL 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
SETTLEMENT WITH STATE'S ATIORNEY 

09124/2015 WORK ON PTAB INTERVENTION ON THE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
BARKING LOT 

09/24/2015 WORK ON PTAl3 INTERVENTION ON 3170 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
MACARTHUR LLC 

09/24/2015 DR,\Fr CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
FOR FULL APPRAISAL REPORT FOR 2014 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

0912412015 REVIEW FILE FOR FILING DATE AND 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
AUTHORITY RE: NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

09/24/2015 EXECUTE STIPULATJON AND DRAFT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
ATIORNEY WITH INSTRUCTIONS TO GET 
BOARD SIGNATURE RE: 2010 JR JP REAL TY 

09/24/2015 WORK ON MACY'S SETILEMENT AND 0.50 hr,. $105.00 
PAYMENT SCHEDULE 

09/24/2015 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES 0.50 hrs. 5105.00 
WITH SETTLEMENT AND DRAFf 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: POTENTIAL 
SETTLEMENT FOR 2010 JR JP REAL TY 

09125/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
FOR ASSESSMENT CASES 

09/28/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB ACCEPTANCE OF 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 2014 MACY'S 

09/28/2015 WORK ON SETILEMENT OF NORTHBROOK 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
RACQUET CLUB 



26670 DTSTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

09/2812015 

09128/2015 

09/29/2015 

09/29/2015 

0913012015 

09/30/2015 

IULLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VITH 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEYRE: MACY'S 
NEGOTIATIONS 

MEETING WITH TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: 
SETILEMENT NEGOTIATIONS FOR 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

WORK ON POTENTIAL SETfLEMENT 
VALUES WITH TAXPAYER A TIORNEY RE: 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: THE BARKING 
LOT 

MEE'ONG WITH TAXPAYER A TO 
NEGOTIATE MULTI-YEAR SETTLEMENT ON 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: PROGRESS 
REACHING CLIENT ON NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

Total Fees 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

15885 

0.30 

Page 6 

lrrs. $63.00 

1.00 hrs. $210.00 

LOO hrs. $210.00 

0.40 hrs. $84.00 

LOO hrs. $210.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

$6,993.00 

$6,993.00 

$6,993.00 

$6,993.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illi11ois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

October 07, 2015 
Bill Through 09/30/2015 

Invoice# 15882 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIE\V, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

/ 

26670 

0 

SI.5 

$1,512.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

October 07, 2015 
Bill Through 09/30/2015 
Invoice# 15882 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HTGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

Maller Number O 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW.IL 60026-1241 

COliflOENllAL 
ATTOmif.Y-CUrnT 
PRlilLEGE 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

09/14/2015 

09/17/2015 

09122/2015 

0912912015 

0912912015 

09/3012015 

09/30/2015 

09/30/2015 

WORK ON 
AGREEMENT 

REVIEW AND REVISE SERVICES 
AGREEMENT WITH JLLINO!S BONE AND 
JOINT SURGEONS 

WORK ON AGREEMENT WITH ILLINOJS 
BONE AND JOINT 

WORK ON CORRESPONDENCE ION 
RESPONSE TO AUDITORS 

REVIEW GIFT BAN ISSUE FOR CHOIR TOUR 

REVIEW GIFT BAN ISSUE 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS PROM 
COUNSEL FOR !LL!NOIS BONE AND JOINT; 
REVISE AGREEMENT 

WORK ON GIFT BAN ACT QUESTION 
INVOL VINO CHOIR TRIP 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.40 hrs. 

2.00 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

\ul('S84.00 

\cli.'(l''° 00 

\i.9,t $84.00 

LOO hrs.v $210.00 

~ $84.00 

\!'\'.$126.00 

0.80 hrs. _ ·,r,$168.00 
\>"1 

0.40 hrs. 

0.60 hrs. 

1.60 hrs.\~ $336.00 

$1,512.00 

$1,512.00 

$1,512.00 

$1,512,00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

www.hauserizzo.com 

November 10, 2015 
Bill Through !0/31f20!5 

Invoice# 16068 JMI 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW,IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

I~ 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

• :.,A]s,,; F 

SIGN 

26670 

01 

DATE /C/. ;- __ " . ., , -­
ACCT tlo -· _j/.{JJl_- -­
O P,1RTIAL 1§1c,A1 ~o P.O. I ------------

$7,833.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite JO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

November 10, 2015 
Bill Through 10131/2015 
Invoice# 16068 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 \VEST LA.KE AVENUE 

Malter Number OJ 

SUITE200 tollf1Cfti111,L 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 HIG~liCY·CllrnT 

PR,V!LEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVTCES RENDERED 

10(01/2015 

J0/01/2015 

10/01/2015 

IO!Ol/2015 

10/01/2015 

J0/02/2015 

I 0102/2015 

10/02/2015 

10/02/2015 

l 0/02/2015 

10/05/2015 

ATTEND STATUS HEARING ON RATE 
OBJECTIONS 

ATIEND RATE OBJECTIONS RULES 
COMMITTEE MEETING 

PREPARE FOR PTAB HEARING RE: 2009 

MEETING WITH TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 
GLOBAL SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS FOR 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

PREPARE FOR COURT DA TE AND 
EVIDENTIARY HEARING RE: ALLSTATE 

DRAFf DOCUMENT FOR STATE'S 
ATIORNEY SUPPORT OF JOINT MOTION ON 
wcrBONDS 

WORK ON SETfLEMENT WITH TAXPAYER 
ATIORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT WITH TAXPAYER 
ATIORNEY RE: JOHN'S COURT BUILDINGS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTH 
APPRAISER RE: PROGRESS ON REPORT FOR 
2013 3170 MACARTHUR, LLC 

PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND COURT DATE 
RE: SALES RATIO LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT 
CASES 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND DEPOSITJONS 
OF SUPERVJSOR AND DIVISION CHIEF OF 
ASSESSOR'S OFFICE RE: SALES RATIO AND 
LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

0. IO hrs. 

0. IO hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

LOO hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.90 hrs. 

$21.00 

$21.00 

$2!0.00 

$210.00 

$210.00 

$42.00 

$105.00 

$105.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$189.00 
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10/0612015 WORK ON REVISED DRAFT STATE'S 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
ATfORNEY FILING; EXCHANGE EMAIL 
MESSAGES WITH ATfORNEYS; EXCHANGE 
EMAIL MESSAGES wrrn STATE'S 
ATIORNEY 

10/06/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND DEPOSITIONS 0.90 hrs. $189.00 
OF SUPERVISOR AND DIVISION CHJEF OF 
ASSESSOR'S OFFICE RE: SALES RATIO AND 
LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

10/0712015 EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES Willi 0.10 ho. $21.00 
STATE'S ATTORNEY Al'IDCO-DEFENDANTS 
RE: LANGUAGE OF FILING ON JOINT 
MOTION: WORK ON INTERVENTION ISSUES 

10/07/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH NOTICE OF PTAB PRE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
HEARING CONFERENCE FOR 2010, 2011 AND 
2012 NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

10/0712015 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2014 THE BARKING LOT 

10/0712015 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPA YE!{ EVIDENCE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND DATE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW APPRAISAL 
REPORTOFTAXPAYERRE: 2014 3170 
MACARTHUR 

10/07/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDEt'-CE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND DATE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW APPRAISAL 
REPORTOFTAXPAYER RE: 2014 THE 
BARKING LOT 

10/07/2015 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES IN 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
REVENUE FOR EACI! TAX YEAR AND 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSIST ANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: PROPOSED 
SETILEMENT FOR 2011. 2012, 2013 AND 2014 
MACY'S 

10/08/2015 WORK ON STATE'S ATTORNEY SUGGESTED 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
RESPONSE TO JOINT MOTION ON BOND 
RATE OBJECTIONS; REVIEW DISTRICT 54'S 
RESPONSE 

10/08/2015 PREPAREFORPTAB PRE HEARING LOO ho. $210.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2010, 2011 AND 2012 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

10/08/2015 1.00 hrs. $210.00 

10/0S/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND DRAFf E-MAIL TO 

E: TRIENNIALS FOR 
MACY'S 
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1010912015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITH 
CO-COUNSEL RE: RESPONSE BY DISTRICT 
54 TO WORKING CASH BOND OBJECTIONS 

10/09/2015 EXECUTE STIPULATIONS FOR 2011 0.30 h". $63.00 
THROUGH 2014 MACY'S AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
ATTORNEY RE: ACCEPTANCE AND TO 
SEND TO BOARD OF REVIEW 

1010912015 PREPARE FOR PTAB HEARING WITH l.00 hrs. $210.00 
STATE'S ATTORNEY RE: 2009 -10/09/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

10/1212015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: THE BARKING 
LOT 

1011212015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
'IHROUGH 2018 NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL WITH TAXPAYER ATTORNEY 

10/14/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATfEND PTAB PRE 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
HEARING CONFERENCE AND MEETING 
WITH TAXPAYER'S ATIORNEY FOR 
STIPULATION RE: 2009 JR JP REALTY 

10/14/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE Will-I 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ASSIST ANT SUPERINTENDEi\ff RE: 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

10/15/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
ATTORNEY GROUP RE: FORMAL 
INTERVENTIONS: DEPOSITJON, AND 
REQUEST TO ADMIT IN WORKING CASH 
BOND OBJECTION MATIER 

10/15/2015 WORK ON NORTHBROOK COURT 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
SETTLEMENT AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO 
ASSISTANT SUPERTNlENDENT RE: TAXES 
PAID 

10/15/2015 WORK ON PAYMENT SCHEDULE wrrn 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: MACY'S 

10/15/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB HEARING AND WORK 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT RE: 2009 ..._.. 

10116/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
RE: LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT MOTIONS 

10/19/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB HEARING ON 20!0 1.00 h". $210.00 

10/19/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: 2013 3170 MACARTHUR 
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10f!9/2015 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 !us. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY WITH RE-SENT 
STIPULATION RE: 2009 JR JP REALTY 

10119/2015 WORK ON POTENTIAL SETI"LEMENT WITH 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAXPAYER A FOR 

10/19/2015 WORK ON THREE YEAR PAYMENT PLAN 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
FOR MACY'S 

10/20/2015 PREPARE FOR Al\'D ATTEND DEPOSITIONS 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

10/21/2015 TELEPHONE CONFER&"iCE WITH 0.30 hra. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

10/21/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 ho. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: 20 l 3 AND 2014 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

10/21/2015 WITNESS PREPARATION AND PREPARE 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
FORPTAB HEARING ON ...... 

10/21/2015 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
\VITI! SETTLEMENT VALUES AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: POTENTIAL 
SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 

10/21/2015 WORK ON POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT FOR 
2009 ...... 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

10/2212015 EXECUTE STWULAT!ON AND DRAFT 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
ATTORNEY TO SEND TO BOARD OF 
REVIEW RE: 2009-.-, 

10/22/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR l.00 hrs. $210.00 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY 

10/23/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
FOR LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT PENDJNG 
CASES 

10/23/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTH 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAXPAYER A ITORNEY TO FINALIZE 
NEGOTIATJONS FOR 2010- 2018 
SETI"LEMENT ON NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

1012312015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAXPAYER A TIORNEY TO NEGOTIATE 
3-YEAR PAYMENT SCHEDULE ON MACY'S 
AND LOGISTICS OF IMPLEMENTATION 

1012612015 EXCHANGE OF E-MAILS WITH ASSISTANT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 
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10/26/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: WITNESS PREPARATION 
FOR 2010 

10/26/2015 CONTINUE SETILEMENT TALKS AND 1.00 '" $210.00 
SCHEDULE OF PAYMENTS AND 
CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES AND 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTA.t"-T 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: 2010 THROUGH 2018 
NORTIIBROOK COURT MALL 

10/26/2015 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 hr,. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY WITI-1 TAX RATE 
FOR 2010 TI:lROUGH 2014 RE: MACY'S 

10/27/2015 EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WlTH 0.10 '" $21.00 
ATIORNEY GROUP RE: FORMAL 
lli'TERVENTION ON RATEOBJECT!ONS 

IOfl1!2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER TO STOP WORK ON 2014 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

10/27/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF2010 CHICAGO 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CAPITOL HOLDINGS 

10/27/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISERRE:201~ 

0.30 hr,. $63.00 

-10/27/2015 TELEPHONE COl\'FERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: MACY'S 

10/2812015 WORK ON PAYMENT SCHEDULE RE: J.00 hrs. $210.00 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL MUL Tl-YEAR 
SETTLEMENT 

10/28/2015 WORK ON ALLSTATE SPO 0.80 hrs. $168.00 

10/28/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT ON THE BARKING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
1.0T 

10/29/2015 EXCHANGE OF EMAILS \VITH REVIEW 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

10/29/2015 1.50 hrs. $315.00 

10/29/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2013 3170 
MACARTHUR, LLC 

J0/30/2015 REVIEW OBJECTORS' MOTION ON 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
BRIEFING SCHEDULE; EXCHANGE EMAIL 
MESSAGES WITH ATIORNEY GROUP 

10/30/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATfEND COURT DATE 0.40 ho. $84.00 
ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES AND 
MOTION TO RECONSIDER 

10/30/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: WALGREEN CO. 
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Total Fees $7,833.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $7,833.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER S7,833.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $7,833.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizw.com 

November 10, 2015 
Bill Through 10/3112015 

Invoice# 16015 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 \VEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Z6670 

0 

ACCT No ~ :(/_4Jf_ _____ _ 
j D 1•,,H,1,;L [1F111AL_ ~o r.o. 

/ 

$1,323.00 

$1,323.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauscrizzo.com 

November JO, 2015 
Bill Through 10/31/2015 
Invoice# 16015 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

c1·,·. f 11:F II TIH 
Id ll1ill:EY-CL1E:n 
ffll'.'.l[GE 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

Client Number Z6670 

Matter Number O 

10/02/2015 REVIEW AMERICAN EAGLE WEB HOSTING 1.50 hrs. ~ $315.00 
AGREEMENT 

10/05/2015 DRAFf AMERICAN EAGLE CONTRACT I.50 ho. $315.00 

10(07/2015 WORK ON ILLINOIS BONE AND JOINT 0.50 ho. $105.00 
AGREEMENT 

10/20/2015 REVIEW AND REVISE MASTERY MANAGER 2.00 hrs. $420.00 
AGREE:S1ENT 

10/21/2015 REVIEW AND REVISE IlIDEMNIFJCATION 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
PROVISION OF SERVICES AGREEMENT 

10126/2015 REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL; REVIEW 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
MODIFJED AGREEMENT FROM HERITAGE 

---------
Torn! Pees 1.323.00 

RILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL PEES $1,323.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER $1,323.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $1,323.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Hlinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

December 04, 2015 
Bill Through 11/30/2015 

Invoice# 16138 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK FUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Z6670 

0 

$798.00 

----------------



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserilzo.com 

December 04, 2015 
Bill Through 1113012015 
Invoice# 16138 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATIORIIEY-Cll[NJ 
PRIVIU:G.E 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

I 1/0512015 

I lf05/20!5 

REVIEW BIDDING ISSUE 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO BUS BID 
QUESTJON; RESEARCH FOTA 

Mauer Number O 

0.20 hrs. \[!?. S42.00 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

11/05/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE Will~ COUNSEL 0.60 hrs. $126.00 

J lf05120!5 

11/06/2015 

l l/09/2015 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

FOR REVISE 
AGREEMENT 

REVIEW TRANSPORTATION BID 
SPECIFICATIONS 

WORK ON AUDIT UPDATE 

WORK ON TRANSPORTATJON BID 
SPECIFICATIONS: DRAFT' ADDENDUM 

Total Fees 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.60 hr~. $126.00 

0.40 

1.50 

hrs. r,o./ $84.00 

hrs.~$315.00 

$798.00 

$798.00 

$798.00 

$798.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

December 04, 2015 
Bill Through l 113012015 

Invoice# 16140 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIE\V,IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

26670 

01 

/ 
-,-· 

$5,775.00 

-------------
$5,775.00 

! 
~------

i ,.1Alc'"' 
SIGN .• 

••; 'I ;El 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

December 04, 2015 
Bill Through I 1130/2015 
Invoice# 16140 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 01 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

cn~flDrnTIAl 
ATTORflEV-CL1£NT 
PRIVILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSJONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

11/02/2015 

11102/20!5 

11/03/2015 

11/03/2015 

11103/2015 

l I/03/2015 

11/03/2015 

11104/2015 

11/04/2015 

11104/2015 

11/05/2015 

REVIEW OBJECTORS' MOTION; EXCHANGE 
EMAIL MESSAGES WITH ATTORNEY 
GROUP RE: NEW THEORIF.S AND PROPOSED 
AMENDMENT 

DRAFT E-MAIL TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

WORK ON NEW RULES FOR INTERVENTION 
IN RATE OBJECTION CASES 

WORK ON RESPONSE TO OBJECTORS' 
FILINGS; PREPARE FOR COURT HEARING; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ATTORNEYS 

REVIEW AND EDIT APPRAISAL REPORT 
fOR 2013 3170MACARTI~UR 

UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE DATE RE: 2010 JOHN'S 
COURT BUILDING 

PREPARE FORAND ATTEND COURT 
HEARING ON JOINT MOTION BRIEFINGS; 
OBJECTION AMENDMENTS, DJSCOVERY 
AND PLEADING 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: WITNESS PREPARATION 
FOR 

PREPARE FOR PTAH PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE RE: 2010 JOHN'S COURT 
BUILDING 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND WITNESS 
PREPARATION RE: ALLSTATE SPO 

0.10 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hr~. 

0.50 hrs. 

1.50 hrs. 

$21.00 

$63.00 

$21.00 

$21.00 

$105.00 

$63.00 

$105.00 

$84.00 

$63.00 

$105.00 

$315.00 
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11/05/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2013 AND 2014 0.50 ho. $105.00 

3l70MACARIBUR 

11/06/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING ON 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
MOTION TO RECONSIDER RE: SALES RATIO 
LEVEL OF ASSESS1',1ENT CASES 

11/06/2015 EXCHANGE OF EMAILS AND COUNTER 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
OFFERS AND WORK ON SETILEMENT WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2010 

11/06/2015 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES 0.40 hrn. $84.00 
WITH SEITLEMENT VALVES AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: PROPOSED 
SETTLEMENT FOR 20 1 0 -11/09/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: -11/09/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF 2010 JOHN"S 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
COURT BUJLDINGS 

11/09/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITII 0.30 hrn. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 3170 
MACARTHUR 

11/09/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYERATTOM'EY RE: NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL SETTLEMENT 

11/09/2015 WORK ON ALL<;TATESPO l.00 hrs. $210.00 

11/09/2015 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB TO 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
AOOPT EVIDENCE OF THE BOARD OF 
REVIEW RE: 2013 3170 MACARTHUR 

1110912015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEYRE: 

11/11/2015 WORK ON STIPULATION AND PAYMENT 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
SCHEDULE FOR NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

11/11/2015 EXECUTE STIPULATION AND DRAFT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAX PA YER 
ATTORNEY RE: 2010.._. -11111/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2010 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CHICAGO CAPITAL HOLDINGS 

11/12/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2012, 2013 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
AND 20143170MACARTHUR 

11/12/2015 MEETJNG WITH STA TE"S ATTORNEY RE: 1.50 hrs. $315.00 
STATUS OF CASE AND APPELLANT 
EVIDENCE AND STRATEGY FOR 
SETTLEMENT AND TRIAL ON ALLSTATE 
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1111312015 PREPARE FOR AND ATfEi~D COURT DATE 0.30 hrn. $63.00 
ON MOTION FOR LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT 
CASES 

I 111312015 WORK ON SETILEMENT FOR 2010 AND 2011 1.00 hrs. $210,00 
PTAB AND SPORE: NORTIIBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

1111312015 WORKO~AYMfu'>IT 0.50 ho. $105.00 
SCHEDULE 

[lf!612015 WORK ON ALLSTATE POTEt\'TIAL 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
SETILEMENT 

1111612015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 lrrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

l lfl6f2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2010 JOHN'S COURT 
BUILDINGS 

1111712015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
ATTORNEY GROUP RE: WORKfNG CASH 
BONDS OBJECTIONS 

11!1712015 WORK ON PAYMENT PLAN AND 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
IMPLEMENTATION FOR NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL SETILEMENT 

l lfl7f2015 WORK ON GLOBAL SETTLEMENT FOR THE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
BARKING LOT 

1111812015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND PROPERTY 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
TAX RA TE OBJECTIONS STATUS HEARING 

1111812015 ATrEND PROPERTY TAX OBJECTIONS 0.10 he. $21.00 
RULE COMMITTEE MEETING 

11!1812015 PREPARE FOR ANDATfENDPTAB l.50 hrs. $315.00 
!'REHEARING CONFERENCE AND WORK ON 
SETTLEMENT WITH STATE'S ATTORNEY 
AND TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2010-2018 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

11118/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATrEND PTAB 1.50 hrs. $315.00 
HEAR!N"G ON 2010 ;.ND 
PRESENT STIPULATJON TO HEARING 
OFFICER AND STATE'S ATTORNEY FOR 
BOARD OF REVIEW APPROVAL 

1111912015 REVIEW FILE AND DRAFT E-MAIL 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
RESPONSE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: APPRAISALS 

11123/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB FINAL DECISION 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND VERIFY VALUE WITH STIPULATION 
RE: 2009 PRLOGIS 

1112312015 UPDATE FILE WITI-l PTAB FINAL DECISION 0.00 hrs. N/C 
AND VERJPY VALUE WITH STJPULATION 
RE: 2009 
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11/23/2015 UPDATE FJLE WITH PTAB FJNAL DECISION 0.40 hrs. $84.00 

AND VERIFY VALUE WITH STIPULATION 
RE: 2009LORD & TAYLOR 

11/23/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB FINAL DECISION 0.40 ho. $84.00 
AND VERIFY VALUE WITH STIPULATION 
RE: 2009 3170MAC ARTHUR 

11/23/2015 PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH BOARD OF 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
REVIEW RE: NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

11/24/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2013 AND 2014 
3170MACARTHUR 

0.50 /us. $105.00 

11/24/2015 PREPARE FOR AND A"ITEND MEETING AT I.SO hrs. $315.00 
BOARD OF REVIEW RE: 2015 NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

11/25/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

0.70 hrs. $147.00 

11/25/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR THE BARK.JNG 0.60 hrs. $126.00 
LOT 

11/30/2015 WORK ON SETfLEMENT AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAX PA YER 

0.40 hrs. $84.00 

ATTORNEY RE: 2013 3170MACARHUR 

----------------
Total Pees $5,775.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $5,775.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER $5,775.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $5,775.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

January 08, 2016 
Bill Through 12/31/2015 

Invoice# 16433 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES POR THIS MATIER 

Z6670 

0 

$945.00 

.. -- .-----) 
/ $945.00 

L----------

I 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

January 08, 2016 
Bill Through 12/31/2015 
Invoice# 16433 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 \VEST LAKE AVENUE 

ClienLNumber 

Matter Number 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CDrlFiDENTIAl 
AlTOR:iEY-CU<NT 
P~1VIL£GE 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVTCES RENDERED 

12/02!2015 

12104/2015 

12/0712015 

1211512015 

12/2912015 

12131/2015 

REVIEW EMAILS AND BID SPECIFICATIONS 
FROM REGARDING 
TRA.t'\'SPORT A TION SPECIFICA T!ONS 

RESEARCH SCHOOL CODE REGARDING 
COMPETITIVE BIDDING; DRAFT EMAIL TO 
.... REGARDING TRANSPORTATION 
CONTRACT 

EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITH 
AUDITOR RE: UPDATE 

WORK ON FIRST STUDENT AND QUEST 
FOOD SERVICES CONTRACTS 

REVIEW PENDING LEGAL MA TIERS; 
EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITH 
AUDITOR RE: AUDIT UPDATE 

REVIEW BID SPECIFICATIONS FOR 
STUDENT TRANSPORTATION; REVIEW 
GENERAL CONTRACTS 

ToL'.!l Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.60 

1.00 

O.IO 

1.00 

0.30 

1.50 

Z6670 

0 

hrs. \;f( $126.00 

hr$. \c?gro.oo 

hrs. 
~ 

$21.00 

hrs. '~210.00 

hrs.~ $63.00 

$945.00 

$945.00 

$945.00 

$945.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

January 08, 2016 
Bill Through 12/31/2015 

Invoice# 16437 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

! 
I 
S 11_,' ' 

Z6670 

01 

-----, 

11.f31f -- -_--: I 
/ ;.{.-; r'(' I I '-, L. ',,, ' [ ' 

. ' 

$4,242.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: {708) 799-6866 

www .hauscrizzo.corn 

January 08, 2016 
Bill Through 12131/2015 
Invoice# 16437 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 \VEST LAKE AVENUE 

MatterNumber 01 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

cm:CSDnl!IAL 
ATrnrmEY·CUENT 
Pitl'.'1LEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

12/0112015 

12/02/2015 

12102/2015 

12/03/2015 

12/03/2015 

12/04/2015 

12/04/2015 

12/07/2015 

12/08/2015 

12/08/2015 

1210912015 

EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGE,S WITH 
DISTRICT RE: UPCOMING TAX APPEAL ON 
LENNER; RESEARCH STATUS !NPTAB AND 
COURT 

WORK ON PAYMENT SCHEDULE FOR 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATIORNEY TO FOLLOW UP 
ON SETILEMENT OFFER 

REVIEW AND RECORD TAX OBJECTIONS 
FOR 2011, 2012, AND 2013 

WORK ON MACARTHUR SETILEMENT 

PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT COURT 
DATE FOR LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT MEETING 
IN ASSESSOR'S OFFICE RE: NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

WORK ON SETILEMENT AND PREPARE 
FOR PTAB PRE- HEARING CONFERENCE RE 
JOHNS COURT BUILDINGS 

UPDATE FILE AND REVIEW FILE FOR PTAB 
PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE RE: 2010, 2011 
AND 2012 NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: 2013 3170 MAC ARTHUR 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND PTAB 
PREHEARING CONFERENCE AND 
NEGOTIATIONS WITH STATE'S ATIORNEY 
AND TAXPAYER ATIORNEYRE: 2010 
JOHN'S COURT BUILDINGS 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

J.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

$63.00 

S!05.00 

$63.00 

$210.00 

$105.00 

$63.00 

$315.00 

$105.00 

$105.00 

$63.00 

S2!0.00 
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1211012015 PREPARE FOR ALLSTATE COURT DATE 1.00 he. $210.00 
AND SETILEMENT CONFERENCE WITH 
STATE'S ATTORNEY 

1211012015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF 2010 CHICAGO 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CAPITAL HOLDINGS 

12/14/2015 PREPARE FOR COURT AND MEETING WITH 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
STATE'S ATTORNEY RE: ALLSTATE SPO 

12/1412015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE-HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2010. 201 J AND 2012 
NORTHBROOK COURT ll-1ALL 

12115120!5 WORK ON SE'ITLEMENT RE: 3170 MAC 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
ARTHUR 

12/15/2015 WORK ON PAYMENT SCHEDULE FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
NORlHBROOK COURT MALL 

1211612015 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB WITH 0.30 lu·s. $63.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2014 3170 MAC ARTHUR 

12117/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH COOK COUNTY BOARD 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
OF REVIEW NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2013 
3170 MAC ARTHUR 

12/17/2015 UPDATE FlLE WITH COOK COUNTY BOARD 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
OF REVIEW NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2013 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

12/1712015 UPDATE FILE WITH COOK COUNTY BOARD 0.30 he. $63.00 
OF REVIEW NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2014 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

12117/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH COOK COUNTY BOARD 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
OF REV JEW NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 20!4 
MACY'S 

12/17/2015 UPDATE FJLE WITH COOK COUNTY BOARD 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
OF REVIEW NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2014 
THE BARKING LOT 

1211812015 REVIEW DRAFT RESPONSE TO OBJECTORS" 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
MOTION TO AMEND 

12118/2015 0.40 hrs. $84.00 

12/18/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 1.50 hrs. $315.00 
ON ALLSTATE 

12118120!5 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2010 COM ED 

12/21/2015 WORK ON SETILEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

12121/2015 ASSIST STATE'S ATTORNEY IN DISCOVERY 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
ANSWERS RE: LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT 
CASES 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 16437 Page 3 

12/22/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH 2013 EVIDENCE RE: 0.30 hrn. $63.00 
20!43170 MAC ARTHUR 

12/22/2015 EXCHANGE OF E-MAILS IN NEGOTIATION 0.50 !ITT. $105.00 
FOR POTENTIAL SETILEMENT FOR 
MULTI-YEAR NORTHBROOK RACQUET 
CLUB 

12/23/2015 WORK ON ALLSTATE SPO SETTLEMENT 1.00 hrs. $210.00 

12/23/2015 TELEPHONE CONFEREi"l"CE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: TI-IE BARKING 
LOT 

12/29/2015 UPDATE FJLE WITH PTAB PRE-HEARING 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
CONFERENCE DATE RE: 2010 JOHN'S 
COURT BUILDINGS 

12/29/2015 WORK ON PAYMENT AGREEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

!2129/2015 WORK ON ALLSTATE SPO LOO hrs. $210.00 

12/31/20]5 REVIEW WITNESS LIST FROM TAX.PA YER 0.30 hrn. $63.00 
RE: NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

12/31/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE-HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2010 JOHNS COURT 
BUILDING 

12/3 l/2015 EXCHANGE OF E-MAILS WITH ATIORNEY 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
RE: SErrLEMENT ON 2011 ALLGAUER 

----------------
Total Fees $4,242.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $4,242.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $4,242.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $4,242.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

February 05, 2016 
Bill Through 01/31/2016 

Invoice# 16509 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 

OJ GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER 

Matter Number 

,,,,-::_-·~.lL6Jl(l__ 
\_______ $4,116.00 

1·--- ------;;,,,-,;,<:[ · :·.,-,;",I - , ·-·1 

1;:;· ..........__ ! 

l
'rJ,,I_ 2,~- -r 
!,C,,' l_/.f'3)f __ ----, / 
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HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 
February OS, 2016 

Bill Through 01131/20!6 
Invoice# 16509 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

MatterNumber 01 

SUITE 200 CUi>IDE~TJAl 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 A'I IC ·dil f-CU)ff 

PHl\'ILEI,£ 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

01/04/2016 

01/0512016 

01/05/2016 

01/06/2016 

01/0812016 

01108/2016 

01/1112016 

01/12/2016 

01/12/2016 

01/12/2016 

01/12/2016 

DRAFT WITNESS LIST RE: 2010, 2011 AND 
2012 NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

PREPARE FOR PTAB HEARlt'IG ON 2010 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB AND 
EXPLORE SETTLEMENT OPPORTUNITIES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE'S 
ATTORNEY RE: ALLSTATESPO 

MEETING AT BOARD OF REVIEW RE: 
FUTURE YEARS NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 20143170 MAC 
ARTHUR 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER A TIORl\'EY RE: 2010 JOHN'S 
COURT BUILDINGS 

PREPARE FOR AND ATrEND COURT DATE 
ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

REVIEW OBJECTORS' REPLY ON MOTION 
TO AMEND WORKING CASH RATE 
OBJECTIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL PREHEARING CONFERENCE 
TOMORROW 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2010 ARMON 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY A.t'<DWORKON 
MULTI-YEAR SETTLEMENT RE: THE 
BARKING LOT 

0.30 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

$63.00 

5210.00 

$63.00 

$210.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

563.00 

$84.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$105.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 16509 Page 2 

01/1312016 EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WTI1I 0.10 I=. $21.00 
ATTORNEY GROUP RE: OBJECTORS' REPLY 
ON MOTION TO AMEND WORKING CASH 
OBJECTIONS 

01/1312016 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND PREHEARING LOO hrs. $210.00 
CONFERENCE AND NEGOTIATE POTENTIAL 
SETTLEMENT RE: 2010, 2011 AND 2012 
NORTIIBROOK COURT MALL 

01/14/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: NORTIIBROOK 
COURT MALL 

Ol/1512016 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.40 hrn. $84.00 
ON MOTION TO RECONSIDER MOTION TO 
ALLOW DEPOSITIONS OF PLAINTIFFS' 
ATTORNEYS ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT 
CASES 

01/1512016 WORK ON ALLSTATESPO LOO hrs. $210.00 

01118/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
TELECONFERENCE Willi ATTORNEY 
GROUP RE: OBJECTORS' REQUEST TO 
AMEND RATE OBJECTJONS 

01/18/2016 WORK ON SETILEMENT AND PREPARE 0.50 hrn. $105.00 
FOR PTAB PREHEARJNG CONFERENCE RE: 
2010JOHN'S COURT BUILDING 

01/18/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: MEETING ON 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

0111912016 WORK ON ALLSTATESPOWITIJ STATE'S 0.80 hrs. $168.00 
ATTORNEY 

01/21/2016 WORK ON SETILEMENT FOR 2010 JOHN'S 0.50 hrn. $105.00 
COURT BUILDING 

01/22/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.30 I=. $63.00 
ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

Olf2ll20l6 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB FINAL ORDER 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND VERIFY VALUE W!TIJ EXECUTED 
STIPULATION RE: 2010 JR JP REAL TY 

01/2212016 PREPARE FOR BOARD OF REVIEW 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
HEARING ON 2015 NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

01/25/2016 WORK ON ADDffiONAL RESPONSE TO 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
PROPERTY TAX OBJECTORS' REQUEST TO 
AMEND 

01125/2016 WORK ON SETI'LEMENT RE: NORTHBROOK 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
RACQUET CLUB 

0112512016 WORK ON SETILEMENT RE: 2010 JOHN'S 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
COURT BUILDING 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 16509 Page 3 

01/26/2016 REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
ON AT&T SERVICES; WORK ON REVE..'\'UE 
LOSS CALCULATJONS; EMAIL DISTRICT 

01/26/2016 WORK ON GLOBAL SETTLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
NORTIIBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

01/26/2016 PREPARE FOR BOARD OF REVIEW 0.50 hrs. SJ05.00 
HEARING RE: 2015 NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

01/27/2016 WORK ON PTAB L.\JTERVENTJON ON AT&T 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
SERVICES 

01/27/2016 PREPARE FORAND ATTEND TAX 0.20 /us. $42.00 
OBJECTIONS STATUS 

01/27/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND MEETING OF 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
COMMITIEE TO RE-DRAFfTAX 
OBJECTIONS RULES 

01/27/2016 UPDATE FILE AND CHART WITH AT&T 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
PTAB APPEAL AND SEARCH PRIOR YEARS 
FOR PREVIOUS REDUCTION 

01/27/2016 EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITH 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
TAXPAYERS' ATTORNEY RE: PAYMENT 
PLAN ON MACY"S 

01/27/2016 WORK ON ALLSTATE SPO WITH STATE'S 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
AITORNEY 

01/27/2016 WORK ON MULTI-YEAR SElTLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
THE BARKING LOT 

01/27/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

01/27/2016 DRAFf REVISIONS TO MACY'S PAYMENT 0.30 ""· $63.00 
PLAN 

01/28/2016 PREPARE FOR PTAB ?REHEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 20!0 JOHN'S COURT 
BUILDING 

01/28/2016 PREPARE FOR PTAB PREHEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2010 NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

01/28/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYERAITORNEY RE: 20!0 CHICAGO 
CAPITAL HOLDINGS 

01/29/2016 WORK ON SETILEMEl\'T OF THE BARKING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
LOT 

01/29/2016 PREPARE FOR Al'\'D ATfEND COURT DATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
RE: LEVEL OF ASSESSMEl'<T DISCOVERY 
STATUS 

01/29/2016 TAX ASSESSMENT LITIGATION SEARCH RE: 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
04-18-40 l-040-0000 

-~-------------



26670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

Invoice# 16509 
Total Fees 

Page 4 
$4,116.00 

S4,l 16.00 

$4,116.00 

$4,116.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC ~t<:cRn'1<:r1 Ft8 162016J 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

February 05, 2016 
BillThrough Ol/31/2016 

Invoice# 16504 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 \VEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 

SUITE200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER 

.--'"-·-~. 
I 
J ,.,:. T • ' 

' I SIG I. 

O!,TI· 

11,C~, 'I 

' 1._o_'.~~-:._, 

Z6670 

0 

$1,092.00 

$1,092. 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, 111inois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

February 05, 2016 
Bill Through 01/31/2016 
Invoice# 16504 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

CONFIDENWl 
AHORNEY·CllHff 
PRl'l:LEGE 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

Client Number 26670 

Matter Number O 

01/2612016 REVIEW AND REVISE SOFI'WARE 
SUBSCRIPTION AGREEMENT 

WORK ON QUEST FOOD SERVICE 
MANAGEMENTCO~~RACT 

2.00 hrs. 'J.\>$420.00 

01/26/2016 

01/27/2016 RESEARCH FAMILY EDUCATIONAL RIGHT 
TO PRIVACY ACT; RESEARCH FEDERAL 
REGULATIONS; RESEARCH ILLINOIS 
STUDENT RECORDS ACT RE: MASTERY 
MANAGER SOFfWARE SUBSCRIPTION 
AGREEMENT 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.60 hrs. $126.00 

2.60 hrs. $546.00 

$1,092.00 

$1,092.00 

$1,092.00 

Sl,092.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

March 08, 2016 
Bill Through 02/29/2016 

Invoice# 16734 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Malter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DIS1RICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIE\V, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MA TIER 

Z6670 

0 

$483.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

March 08, 2016 
Bill Through 02129/2016 
Invoice# 16734 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW.IL 60026-1241 

,:,·11:ir·;:r ,1L 
.·.1, .•l.l:'-1,L,lliT 

SCHOOLLA\V 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

02/04/2016 

02n9/2016 

REVIEW INTERGOVERNMENTAL 
AGREEMENT WITH VILLAGE OF 
NORTHBROOK 

REVIEW FOOD MANAGEMENT 
SPECIFICATIONS 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

Maller Number O 

I.SO hrs. 'rY1 f:.- $315.00 

0.80 ~800 

~------
$483.00 

$483.00 

$483.00 

$483.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC nr::cr,;iv,,;i, :1tif"' !. 3 ;1/··~ 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Rossmoor, I1linois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

March 08, 2016 
Bill Through 02/29/2016 

Invoice# 16752 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number 

26670 

01 GLENBROOK ffiGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 \VEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

\ 
$4,536.00 

----,---··1 
( $4,536.00 / 

~~ 

•.. ------ -------- ---
1r:vo1,:: 0 ·"'.'fiOv1,1_ j 

,,'·\T"·< .,.....,.-... ·r ,,. ·, 
js,u11 -~-~ ·_ 

l
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HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

March 08, 2016 
Bill Through 0212912016 
Invoice# 16752 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

Mauer Number 01 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

1:r1t:'! !" '.: 11•\' 
,T,:,r:;11, CLIUIT 
fkl'.'ILLG[ 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

02/0112016 

02(0212016 

02/02/2016 

02(02/2016 

02/03(2016 

02/03/2016 

02/04/2016 

02/04/2016 

02108/20!6 

02/09(2016 

02/09/2016 

UPDATE FILE WITH LEITER TO ASSESSOR 
FROMTAXPAYERATIORNEY RE: 2016 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

REVIEW TAX OBJECTORS' A'ITORNEY'S 
FILINGS ON DISCOVERY AND PLEADINGS 
AMENDMENTS 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 
ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 
AND DATE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW APPRAISAL 
REPORT OFTAXPA YER RE: 2014 AT&T 
SERVICES 

DRAFT CORRESPONDEN"CE TO APPRAISER 
TO PERfORM PRELIMINARY ANALYSIS OF 
MARKET VALUE FOR 2014 AT&T SERVICES 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2012 
WALGREEN'S 

WORK ON SETILEMENT FOR 2011 LAKE 
COOK TERRACE 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND BOARD OF 
REVIEW HEARING RE: 2015 NORIBBROOK 
COURT MALL 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE'S 
ATIORNEY RE: SETILEMENT SCENARIOS 
FOR THE BARKING LOT 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2010 
CHICAGO CAPITAL HOLDINGS 

UPDATE FILE \VJIB PTAB PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE DATE RE: 2009 LAKE COOK 
TERRACE 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

1.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 !us. 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$84.00 

$84.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$105.00 

$315.00 

$105.00 

$105.00 

$63.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 16752 Page 2 
02109/2016 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB PRE HEARING 

CONFERENCE DATE RE: 20!0, 2011 AND 
0.30 hrs. $63.00 

2012 NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

02/10/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATfEND PTAH 0.50 ho. $105.00 
PREHEARING CONFERENCE AND 
NEGOTIATE FOR SE1TLEMENT RE: 2009 
LAKE COOK TERRACE 

02/10/2016 PREP ARE FOR Ai'>ID A TIEND PT AB 1.00 filS. S210.00 
?REHEARING CONFERENCE AND 
NEGOTIATE FOR SETILEMENT RE: 2010 
JOHN'S COURT BUILDINGS 

02/10/2016 PREPARE FOR A.t"\JD ATJ'END PTAB 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
?REHEARING CONFERENCE AND 
NEGOTIATE FOR SETILEMENT RE: 2010, 
2011, AND 2012 NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

02/11/2016 PREPARE FOR PTAH PREHEAR!NO 
CONFERENCE AND WORK ON SEITLEMENT 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

FOR20lOCOMED 

02111/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 
ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

02/12/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ATTORNEY GROUP; WORK ON RESPONSE 

0.20 ho. $42.00 

TO EFFORTS TO AMEND TAX OBJECTIONS 

02/12/2016 WORK ON MULTI-YEAR SE1TLEMENT FOR 
THE BARKING LOT 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

02112/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 '"· $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

0211512016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER RE: 2015 MACY'S 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

02/15/2016 WORK ON PAYMENT PLAN LE1TER FOR 
MACY'S 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

02/15/2016 WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT FOR 
2010 LAKE COOK TERRACE AND PREPARE 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

FOR PTAB PREHEARTNG CONFERENCE 

0211512016 WORK ON POTENTIAL PAYMENT PLAN FOR 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

02/l 6/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHIEF 
EXECUTOR OFFICER OF TREASURER RE: 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

02117/2016 MEETING WITH STATE'S ATTORNEY RE: 
ALLSTATE 

1.00 hrs. $210.00 

02/17/2016 PREPARE FOR TREASURER MEETING ON 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

0.40 hrs. $84.00 

02118/2016 WORK ON SElTIEMENT RE: WALGREEN 
co. 

0.50 !us. $105.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 16752 Page 3 
02/18/2016 WORK ON SETILEMENT FOR LAKE COOK 0.50 1~. $105.00 

1ERRACE 

02/18/2016 WORK ON MULTI-YEAR SETILEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
NORIBBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

02/19/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND COURT DA1E 0.30 he. $63.00 
ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

02/22/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND HEARING ON 
MOTION TO AMEND RATE OBJECTIONS 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

02/22/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING 2.00 he. $420.00 
WITH ASSESSOR'S OFFICE RE: GLOBAL 
NORTHBROOK COURT SETILEMENT 

02/23/2016 WORK ON SETILEMENT FOR 2010 LAKE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
COOK TERRACE PRIOR TO PTAB 
PREHEARING CONFERENCE 

02/23/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND BOARD OF 
REVIEW HEARING ON 2015 MACY'S 

1.50 hrs. $315.00 

02/25/2016 1ELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER AlTORNEY RE: THE BARKING 
LOT 

02/25/2016 EXCHANGE OF E-MAILS WITH TAXPAYER 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
ATIORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

02/26/2016 WORK ON NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 
SETILEMENT AGREEMENT AND PAYOUT 

0.50 hrn. $105.00 

SCHEDULE 

02/26/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND COURT DATE 
RE: RULING ON MOTIONS 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

02/29/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ON STATUS OF DISCOVERY RE: LEVEL OF 
ASSESSMENT CASES 

02/29/2016 PREPARE FOR AND A1TEND PTAB 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
?REHEARING CONFERENCE RE: 20!0 LAKE 
COOK TERRACE 

02/29/2016 PREPARE FOR ANDATrEND PTAB 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
PREHEARING CONFERENCE RE; 2010, 20! l, 
AND 2012 NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

----------------
Total Fees $4,536.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $4,536.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER $4,536.00 



26670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK 
TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

Invoice# 16752 Page 4 
$4,536,00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, lllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

April 08, 2016 
Bill Through 03/31/2016 

Invoice# 16819 JMI 

RECEIVED 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number 

26670 

01 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER 

,-- ---~-----
1 !NVOl<;E /lf"l-'ROVf,L --

/

, .P>eo,·,-,, , ,,, ,, 
SIGIJ __ 

D,1H _JI . . - -­
!,CCI ,,-;-_--_-_/J,{J/j_· ------

! 0 1·~~'''" ~,,.,,· [jrw r;; 
--·- ------ - - ----- - ___ _I 

h.PR 1 9 2016 

$5,071.50 

$5,071 .50 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Hlinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

April 08, 2016 
Bill Through 03/31/2016 
Invoice# 16819 nu 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 \VEST LAKE AVENUE 

ClientNumber 26670 

Matter Number 01 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CGf!FIDc:1TIAL 
I, 11 G,!i, l 1-Ci..lrnT 
PHli.Li:UE 

PROPERTY TAXES 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

03/01120!6 

03/01/2016 

03/01/2016 

03/01/20]6 

03/02/2016 

03/02/2016 

03{02/2016 

03/0212016 

03/02/2016 

03/04/2016 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETILEMENT 
NEGOTIATIONS FOR ALLSTATE SPO 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: THE BARKING 
LOT 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TREASURER'S OFFICE RE: NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND ATIORNEY 
CONFERENCE RE: WORKING CASH BOND 
OBJECTIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2016, 2017 AND 
2018 NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

REVIEW AND EDIT LETTER TO 
JACKONEIT! OF 2013 TRIENNIAL 
SETTLEMENT FOR NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VITI-I 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2014MAC 
ARTI-lUR 

CALCULATE LOSSES WITH SETILEMENT 
VALUES, NEGOTIATE SETILEMENT AND 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO BUSINESS 
MANAGER RE, POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT 
FOR 2010 JOHN'S COURT BUILDINGS 

WORK ON ALLSTATE SETTLEMENT 

1.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

$273.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$42.00 

$63.00 

$84.00 

$63.00 

$105.00 

$210.00 
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03/04/2016 EXEClITE STIPULATION AND DRAFT 

CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
0.30 hrs. $63.00 

ATTORNEY wrrn AGREEMENT RE: 2010 
JOHN'S COURT BUILDINGS 

03/04/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MOTION TO 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
RECONSIDER COURT DATE RE: LEVEL OF 
ASSESSMENT CASES 

03/07/2016 WORK ON SETfLEMENT wnn TAXPAYER 
ATIORNEY RE: 2010LAKECOOK TERRACE 

0.50 hrs. $]05.00 

03/07/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND 
EXCHANGE OF E-MAIL MESSAGES WITH 

0.50 ho. $105.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 20 l 6 TRIENNIAL 
VALUE FOR NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 
A.t"\JD EFFECT 

03/07/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER"S ATIORNEY RE: 2010 MACY'S 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

03/08/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE'S 
ATTORNEY TO CHECK STATUS OF 

0.30 /us. $63.00 

STIPULATION ON 2009 LAKE COOK 
TERRACE 

03/09/2016 PREPARE FORAND ATTEND PTAB 
PREHEARING CONFERENCE AND MEETING 

2.00 hrs. $420.00 

WITH TAXPAYERATIORNEY RE: 2016 
TRIENNIAL ON NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

03/09/2016 PREPARE FOR AND A1TEND PTAB 
PREHEARING CONFERENCE AND 

l.50 hrs. $315.00 

NEGOTIA1E SETTLEMENT RE: 2009 LAKE 
COOK TERRACE 

03/10/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE Will-I 
TAXPAYERAITORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

COURT MALL 

03/10/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: MEETING WITH 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER ON NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

03/10/2016 MEETING AT BOARD OF REVIEW WITH 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: FUTURE 

0.60 hrs. $126.00 

MACY'S 

03/11/2016 PREPARE FOR COURT APPEARANCE ON 
JOINT MOTION TO DISMISS WORKING 

0.20 hrs. $42.00 

CASH BOND OBJECTIONS 

03/11/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND COURT DATE 
RE: LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

03/11/2016 WORK ON MULTI-YEAR SETILEMENT RE: 
THE BARKING LOT 

0.50 ho. $105.00 
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03/13/2016 EXCHANGE OF EMAJLS WITH BOARD OF 

REVIEW AND TAXPAYER RE: 2015 
0.50 hrs. $105.00 

NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

03/14/2016 TELEPHONECONFERENCE\VITH 
TAXPAYER AND DRAFrE-MAIL 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

CORRESPONDENCE TO BOARD OF REVIEW 
RE: 2015 NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

03/14/2016 WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF 2016 
1RIE.."\!NIAL FOR NORTHBROOK COURT 

1.00 hrs. $210.00 

MALL 

03/15/2016 WORK ON ALLSTATE SETTLEMENT TERMS 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
03/15/2016 WORK ON NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

GLOBAL SETTLEMENT 
LOO hrs. $210.00 

03/1612016 PREPARE FOR AND ATI'END STATUS 
HEARING ON RATE OBJECTIONS; DRAFf 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

ORDER FOR BRIEFING SCHEDULE ON 
WORKING CASH BONDS; EMAIL COUNSEL 

03116/20!6 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE, NORTHBROOK 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

COURT MALL 

03117/2016 WORK ON NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 
20!6SEITLEMENT 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

03/17/2016 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 
BUSINESS MANAGER RE: MEETING ON 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

03/17/2016 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB TO 
ADOPT EVIDENCE OF COOK COUNTY 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

BOARD OF REVIEW RE: 2014 AT&T 
SERVICES 

03118/2016 RESEARCH FINANCIAL STATEMENTS FOR 
BOND HISTORY RE: RATE OBJECTIONS 

0.40 hrs. $84.00 

03/18/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 
RE: LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT TAX APPEAL 

0.30 hrn. $63.00 

CASES 

03/18/2016 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB FINAL ORDER 0.40 he. $84.00 
AND VERIFY VALUE WITH AGREED-TO 
STIPULATION RE: 2009 

03/18/2016 EXECUTE 2013 AND 2014 STIPULATfONS 
AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

TAXPAYER ATIOfu'IEY A.t'ID BOARD OF 
REVIEW RE: 2013 AND 2014 NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

03/22/2016 PREPARE FOR MEETING TOMORROW RE: 
2016 TRIENNIAL NORTHBROOK COURT 

0.40 he. $84.00 

MALL 

03/22/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 3170MAC 

0.30 he. $63.00 

ARTHUR 
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I=. 03/23/2016 

03/24/2016 

03/24/2016 

03/24/2016 

03/25/2016 

03/25/2016 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING 
WITH ASSISTANT SUPERIN1ENDEtWS RE: 
NORTI-lBROOK COURT MALL 

PERFORM CALCULATIONS AND DRAFf 
CORRESPONDENCE TO BUSINESS 
MANAGER RE: 2016 TRIENNIAL OF 
NORTIIBROOK COURT MALL 

1ELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITII PTAB RE: 
FINAL ORDER ON 2009 VALLEY LO 

1ELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITII PTAB RE: 
FINAL ORDER ON 2009 TECHNY ESTATES 

REVIEW OBJECTORS DOCUMENT REQUFST 
RE: WORKTh'G CASH BOND OBJECTIONS 

PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND STATUS OF 
DISCOVERY COURT DATE ON LEVEL OF 
ASSESSMENT CASES 

Total Fees 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

1.75 $367.50 

0.80 hrs. $168.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.10 hrs. $21.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

$5,071.50 

$5,071.50 

$5,071.50 

$5,071.50 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

/ 

April 08, 2016 RECEIVED APR 1 9 ?Om 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

Bill Through 03/31/2016 
Invoice# 16818 CLP 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, JL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

0 

$2,793.00 

---------------, 

$2,793.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

April 08, 2016 
Bill Through 03/31/2016 
Invoice# 16818 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKEAVENUE 

Matter Number O 

SUITE200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CllrnT 
PRl'lllEGE 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

03/01/2016 

03/01/2016 

03/01/2016 

03/01/2016 

03/02/2016 

03/03/2016 

03/I0/2016 

03/14/2016 

03/14/2016 

03/14/2016 

03/15/2016 

DRAFf QUEST FOOD SER VICE CONTRACT 

RESEARCH ERA TE REQUIREMENTS FOR 
NEW PARTIES TO INTERGOVERi'!MENTAL 
AGREEMENT 

REVIEW ERA TE DOCUMENTS RE: NEW 
PARTIES TO JNTERGOVERNMENTAL 
AGREEMENT 

REVIEW INTERGOVERNMENTAL 
AGREEMENT RE: ERA TE CONSORTIUM 

FINISH SUMMARIZING ERA TE 
CONSORTIUM INTERGOVERNMENTAL 
AGREEMENT RECOMMENDATIONS 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM 
-; REVISE QUEST FOOD SERVICE 
AGREEMENT 

REVIEW Ai''<D REVISE SOFT\\' ARE 
LICENSING AGREEMENT 

REVIEW ORIGINAL INTERGOVERNMENTAL 
AGREEMENT FOR THE TECHNOLOGY 
CONSORTIUM; DRAFr WRITTEN CONSENT; 
DRAFr ADDENDUM TO 
INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT 

REVISE CONSENT FOR TECHNOLOGY 
CONSORTIUM; REVISE ADDENDUM TO 
INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT; 
DRAFfEMAlL TO-

SUMMARIZE RECOMMENDATIONS RE: 
ERA TE CONSORTIUM 
INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT 

ORAFfWAIVER AND RELEASE FOR5K 
RUNfWALK 

2.00 

0.30 

hrs.'{9f $420.00 

hrs. $63.00 

0.40 hrs. $84.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

l.70 hrs. $357.00 

2.80 hrs. $588.00 

0.80 hrs. $168.00 

0.70 hrs. $147.00 

2.00 hrs. $420.00 



26670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

03/17/2016 

03/2112016 

03/23/2016 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO FLOORING 
MATIER INVOLVING SSCRMP 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL 
REGARDING 
CONTRACT; REVIEW ORIGINAL CONTRACT 

REVIEW BIDDING ISSUES 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUM!\.'IARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

16818 

0.50 

0.60 

Page 2 

hrs.~ $105.00 

hrs. $126.00 "'\ t~ 

0.20 hrs. $42.00 

$2.793.00 

52,793.00 

$2,793.00 

$2,793.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone; (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauscrizzo.com 

May 06, 2016 
Bill Through 04/30/2016 

Invoice# 17039 JMI 

RECEIVED MAY 1 2 2016 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number 

26670 

01 GLENBROOK I-flGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

$2,982.00 

$2,982.00 

1-·- !NVOICE APPROVAL -­

i '-'"'"' ... "' - '· "V""'" "·'.0[•',H 
'srs·i _ __ 
OAT', ___ • .• ,, __ ----

ACCT Nu //./';]_1,,,_-C~-
1 0 PARTIAL ~INAL 0-~0 P.O. 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

May 06, 2016 
Bill Through 04/30/2016 
Invoice# 17039 ™I 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 01 

SUITE 200 c:i11,1r,nrnAL 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 Al f0 ;i, EY-CllrnT 

PRl'ilLEGE 
PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSTONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

04/04/2016 

04/04/2016 

04/04/2016 

04/04/2016 

04/05/2016 

04/05/2016 

04/05/2016 

04/05/2016 

04/0612016 

04/07/2016 

04/08/2016 

0411 J/2016 

UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB PREHEARING 
CONFERENCE SCHEDULE RE: 2010, 2011 
AND 2012 NEIMAN MARCUS 

DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT RE: 
PROPERTY TAX BILLS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2014 AT&T 
SERVICES 

DRAFT E-MAIL TO REVJEW APPRAISER RE: 
2010 THROUGH 2012 NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

REVIEW TAX OBJECTORS' REQUEST FOR 
COUNTY CLERK DOCUMENTS RE: 
WORKING CASH BONDS OBJECTIONS 

WORK ON SETfLEMENT RE: NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT RE: 2010 CHICAGO 
CAPJTAL HOLDINGS 

WORK ON SETILEMENT RE: 2010 BARTON 
MANAGEMENT 

MEETING WITH STATE'S A TIORNEY RE: 
STATUS OF ALLSTATE SPO 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF2010 
TRIENNIAL FOR NEIMAN 11ARCUS 

PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND COURT DATE 
ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: 2015 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL BOARD OF 
REVIEW DECISION 

0.40 hrs. 

0.20 hr~. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

2.00 hrs. 

0.60 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

584.00 

$42.00 

$63.00 

542.00 

$42.00 

$105.00 

5105.00 

5105.00 

$420.00 

$126.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 
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04/11/2016 WORK ON ERROR OF BOARD OF REVIEW 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
RE: 2015 NORTI-IBROOK COURT MALL 

04/1112016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: l\'EIMAN 
MARCUS 

0411112016 UPDATE FILE WITH MOTION TO FILE 0.10 ha $21.00 
ADDITIONAL EXHIBIT TO MOTION TO 
RECONSIDER LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT 
CASES 

04/1212016 TELEPHO~'E CONFERENCE WITH 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: 2010 WELLS 
FARGO 

0411412016 UPDATE FILE WITH AND REVIEW BOARD 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
OF REVIEW NOlF.S ON APPEAL RE: 2014 
AT&T SERVICES 

04/1512016 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
RE: MOTION TO RECONSIDER ALLOWING 
PLAINTIFFS ATTORNEY TO BE DEPOSED 

04/18/2016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NEIMAN 
MARCUS 

04/19/2016 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.30 hr&. $63.00 
FOR STATUS ON DISCOVERY ON LEVEL OF 
ASSESSMENT LITIGATJON 

04/19/2016 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR NEIMAN 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
MARCUS 

0411912016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NOTICE OF 
HEARING FROM PTAB ON NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

0412012016 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2010 ARMON 0.50 ha. $105.00 

04/2112016 PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION 0.10 hr&. $21.00 

0412112016 WORK WITH STATE"S ATTORNEY ON 1.00 hr&. $210.00 
SETTLEMENT AND STRATEGY ON 
ALLSTATE 

04/2212016 PREPARE FORAND ATIBND DEPOSITION 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
OF SHERRI FERRIS OF ASSESSOR'S OFFICE 
RE: LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

04/2612016 WORK ON TRIENNIAL SETTLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
NEIMAN MARCUS 

0412712016 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR MULTI-YEAR 0.50 ha. $105.00 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

0412712016 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CO-INTERVENOR ATTORNEY RE: 2016 
TRIENNIAL ON ALLSTATESPO 

04/28/2016 WORK ON OBTAINING 2014RATE 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
OBJECTIONS 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 17039 Page 3 

04129/2016 

0412912016 

BILLING SUMl\1ARY 

TOTAL FEES 

PREPARE FOR Ai'!D ATIEND STATUS DAIB 
ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT CASES 

MEETING wrrn STATE'S ATIORNEY RE: 
ALLSTATE STATUS 

Total Fees 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

1.00 hrs. $210.00 

$2,982.00 

$2,982.00 

$2,982.00 

$2,982.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, lllinoi; 60422 

j 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

wv,w.sragahauser.com RECEIVED OCT 13 2014 
October 07, 2014 

Bill Through 09/30/2014 
Invoice# 13791 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL fEES 

TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

26670 

01 

S6,216.00 

$6,216 00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799·6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

October07,2014 
Bill Through 09/30/2014 
Invoice# 13791 JMJ 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 01 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026·1241 

·,: :>[l'iil.SL 
,.:, :<J'i1'LY·CLIEIIT 
Pil,l'ILlGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVJCES RENDERED 

09/03/2014 

()9/0312014 

09/03/2014 

09/04/2014 

09/04/2014 

09/04/2014 

09/04/2014 

09/04/2014 

SITE VISIT ON MACY'S 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S AITORNEY, CALCULATE AV 
VALUES AND LOSSES IN SETTLEMENT 
SCENARIOS AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO BUSINESS 
MANAGER RE: POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT 
FOR 2012 PATRJOTCOURTYARDS CONDO 
ASSOCIATION 

PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT COURT 
DATE ON STATE'S MOTION FOR 
ENLARGEMENT OF TIME IN 
CONSOLJDA TED CASES RE: PROPERTY 
TAXES 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 EEC 
PARTNERS 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER'S 
ATTORNEY RE: STIPULATION ON 2012 
PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDO 
ASSOCIATION 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY WITH 
SETTLEMENT OFFER ON 2009 
NORTHBROOK COURT PROFESSIONAL 
PARTNERS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY WITH 
SETTLEMENT OFFER ON 2009 !PM PLUS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE'S 
ATTORNEY RE THE BARKING LOT 
TRIENNIAL 

0.60 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

$126.00 

$105.00 

$105.00 

S84.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 
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09/04/2014 PROPOUND DISCOVERY AND WORK ON 2.00 hrs. $420.00 
RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY REQUESTS ON 
SPO ALLSTATE 

09/05/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: POTENTIAL 
SETTLEMENT FOR NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

09/08/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 !us. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: OFFER ON 
2009 !PM PLUS 

09/08/2014 DRAFT E-MAIL TO TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY 0.30 hrs. 563.00 
TO SEND STfPS ON PA TRJOT COURTYARDS 

09/08/2014 PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING 0.60 hrs. 5126.00 
CONFERENCES AND SETTLEMENT 
NEGOTIATIONS FOR PROPERTY 
DYNAMICS, !PM PLUS AND NORTHBROOK 
COURT PROFESSJONAL PARTNERS 

09/08/2014 PARTICTPATE IN SETTLEMENT 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
NEGOTIATIONS WIT! I TAXPAYER'S AND 
STATE'S ATTORNEY ON 2009 EEC 
PARTNERS 

09/08/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: 2012 AND 2014 RECENT 
DALES OF SUBJECT PROPERTY HARBOR 
TECH CENTER 

09/08/2014 WORK ON DISCOVERY FOR SALES RATIO 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
CASES RE: PROPERTY TAXES 

09/09/2014 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY WITH OFFER TO 
SETTLE 2009 NORTHBROOK PROFESSIONAL 
PARTNERS 

09/0912014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATfORNEY RE: NEIMAN 
MARCUS 

09/0912014 EXCHANGE OF E-MAILS WITH TAXPAYER 0.50 hrs. $ !05.00 
IN A TT EMPT TO SETTLE NORTHBROOK 
COURT PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS 

09/10/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND PTAB PRE 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
HEARING CONFERENCE AND AFTER 
PARTICIPATE IN SETTLEMENT 
NEGOTIATIONS WITH TAXPAYER'S 
ATTORNEY AND STATE'S ATTORNEY RE: 
2009 PROPERTY DYNAMJCS ,LLC XVII I 

09/10/2014 PREP AR[ FORAND ATl'END PTAB PRE 1.20 hrs. $252.00 
HEARING CONFERENCE AND AFTER 
PARTICIPATE IN SETfLEMENT 
NEGOTIATIONS WITH TAXPAYER'S 
ATTORNEY AND ST A TE'S ATTORNEY RE: 
2009 lPM PLUS, LLC 
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09/1012014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND PTAB PRE 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
HEARING CONFERENCE AND AFTER 
PARTICIPATE IN SETTLEMENT 
NEGOTIATIONS WITH TAXPAYER'S 
ATTORNEY AND STATE'S ATTORNEY RE: 
2009 NORTHBROOK COURT PROFESSIONAL 
PARTNERS 

0911112014 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
WITH PROPOSED SETTLEMENTS AND 
VALUES SET FOR PRIOR YEARS AND 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSIST ANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: PROPOSED 
SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 !PM PLUS 

0911112014 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES 0.60 hrs. $126.00 
WITH PROPOSED SETTLEMENTS AND 
VALVES SET FOR PR!OR YEARS AND 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: PROPOSED 
SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 NORTHBROOK 
COURT PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS 

09111/2014 MEETING WITH STATE'S A TTOR.i"\/EY RE: 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
ALLSTATE 

09112/2014 DRAFT ANSWER TO ALLSTATE AMENDED 1.00 he S210.00 
COMPLAINTS 

09/1212014 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 h<s. S63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY FOR STIPULATIONS 
ON PA TRI OT COURTYARDS 

09112/2014 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES IN 0.60 hrs. $126.00 
REVENUE IN SETTLEMENT SCENARIO FOR 
2009 AND 2010 TAX YEARS; DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSJSTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: 2009 AND 2010 
POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT OF PROPERTY 
DYNAMICS XVlll 

0911512014 EXECUTE STIPULATION AND DRAFT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CORRESPO:-:DENCE TO TAXPAYER 
A TTORN£Y WITH ACCEPTANCE RF.:· 2009 
NORTHBROOK COURT PROFESSIONAL 
PARTNERS 

09/1512014 EXECUTE STIPULATION AND DRAFT 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
ATTORNEY WITH ACCEPTANCE RE: 2009 
IPM PLUS 

09/1512014 UPDATE l'lLE WITH PROPOSED 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
STJPULATION FROM PTAB RE: 2010 
ARCHITEX 



Z6670 DISTRJCT 225 - COOK Invoice# 13791 Page 4 

09/15/2014 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES 0.50 ms. $105.00 
WITH SETTLEMENT VALUES AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: POTENTIAL 
SETTLEMENT FOR 2010 ARCHITEX 

09/16/2014 C:XECUTE STlPULA TION AND DRAFT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB WITH 
STJPULA TION RE: 2010 ARCHITEX 

09/1612014 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 hrs. $63.IJO 
PTAB HEARING OFFICER RE: PROPER TV 
DYNAMICS AND NORTHBROOK COURT 
PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS 

09/16/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 h;;. $63.IJO 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORJ>JEY RE: 
STIPULATIONS FOR THE BARKING LOT 

09/1612014 REVIEW STATE"S ATfORNEY'S COLLECTOR 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
RESPONSE TO INTERROGATORIES AND 
REQUEST TO PRODUCE ON SALES RA TIO 
CONSOL!DA TED CASES R.E: PROPERTY 
TAXES 

09/17/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH PRE HEARING 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 HARilOR TECH 
CENTER 

09/17/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: MULTI-YEAR 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

09/1712014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2010 
WALGREEN CO. 

09117/2014 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 
STIPULATIONS ON 2012 PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS 

09/18/2014 EXECUTE STIPULATION AND DRAPT 0.30 h,. S6l00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER'S 
A TTORNF,Y WITH ACCEPTANCE AND TO 
FILE RE: 2009 PROPERTY DYNAMICS 

09118/2014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE ON 2009 HARBOR TECH 
CENTER 

09/19/2014 REVIEW ALLS TA TE DISCOVERY 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
RESPONSES AND RESPONSES PROVIDED 
BY STATE'S ATTORNEY 

09/19/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB FINAL ORDER: 0.40 he. S84.00 
REVIEW FINAL ORDER AND VERIFY VALUE 
WITH STIPULATION RE: 2010 VON MAUR 

09/2212014 UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2012 THE NEIMAN 
MARCUS GROUP 



26670 DISTRICT 225 • COOK [nvoicc# 13791 Page 5 
09/22/2014 UPDATE FJLE WITH BOARD OF REVJE\V 0.00 hrs. NIC 

NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2012 THE BARKING 
COT 

09/2212014 UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD Of REVIEW 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2012 MACY'S 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

09/22/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH CORRESPONDENCE 
FROM TAXPAYER RE: WAITING FOR 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

CLIENT APPROVAL FOR SETTLEMENT ON 
2010, 2011 AND 2012 PATRIOT COURTYARDS 

09/22/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: LAKE COOK 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TERRACE 

09/22/2014 WORK ON STIPULATION FOR EEC 0.30 ms. $63.00 
PARTNERS 

09124/2014 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 EEC 0.50 hrs. $ l 05.00 
PARTNERS 

09/24/2014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING AND 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE RE: 2009 
HARBOR TECH CENTER 

09/24/2014 EXECUTE STIPULA TJON AND DRAFT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER'S 
ATTORNEY RE: 2010 PROPER1Y DYNAMICS 
SETTLEMENT 

09/24/2014 TELEPI-IONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2010 
PROPERTY DYNAMICS STIPULATION 

09125/20]4 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2010 AND 2011 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

09/25/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: PENDING 
YEARS NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

09125/2014 PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE 
ON CONSOLIDATED CASES 

09/26/2014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE AND CALCULATE 
SETTLEMENT SCENARIO LOSSES FOR 
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE RE: 2009 
HARBOR TECH CENTER 

09/2612014 UPDATE FILE WITH ORDER ON 0.30 ms. $63.00 
CONTJNUJNG STATUS ON DISCOVERY TO 
OCTOBER 3rd 

09/29/2014 WORK ON SETTLEMENT VALUES AND 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TOT AXPA YER 
ATTORNEY RE, POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT 
FOR 2010, 2011 AND 2012 NEJMAN MARCUS 



Z6670 

09129/2014 

DISTRJCT 225 - COOK Invoice# 13791 Page 6 

09/29/2014 

09/29/2014 

09/29/2014 

09/30/2014 

09/30/2014 

09/30/2014 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WlTH 
TAXPAYER'S ATIORNEY RE: STIPULATION 
FOR2010, 2011 AND 2012 THE BARKING LOT 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATIORNEY RE: 2012 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATIORNEY RE: EEC 
PARTNERS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: WAITING ON 
CLIENT SIGNATURE ON PA TRI OT 
COURTYARDS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ATTORNEY RE: HARBOR TECH 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: NEGOTIATE 
POTENTIAL SETILEMENT FOR 2009 
HARBOR TECH 

CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES !N 
SETILEMENT SCENARIOS AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: PROPOSED 
SETILEMENT FOR 2009 HARBOR TECH 
CENTER 

Total Fees 

TOTAL FF.ES FOR THIS MATIER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.10 hrs. $21.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

$6,216.00 

$6,216.00 

$6,216.00 

$6,216.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, lllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

W\\w.sragahauser .com 

BOARD Ol' EDUCATJON 

October 07, 2014 
Bill Through 09/30/2014 

Invoice# 13792 JMI 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

TAX OBJECTOR IDENTITIES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

26670 

10 

$500.00 

$500.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

WW\\'.srngahauser.com 

October07,2014 
Bill Through 09/30/2014 
Invoice# 13792 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Maner Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRJCT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, JL 60026-1241 

TAX OBJECTOR IDENTITIES 

r~!"'DCIHIAL 
.It', i'.' If:, CY· C LI EIIT 
PillY1LcGf 

Z6670 

10 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED REGARDJNG TAX O!UEC'TOR IDENTITIES 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $500.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $500.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE SS00.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, lllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

j 
www.srngahauser.com 

October 03, 2014 
Bill Through 09/30/2014 

Invoice# 13639 ATS 

RECEIVED OCT 1 3 2014 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTR1CT225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matler Number 

26670 

0 

$399.00 

$399.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, lllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

October 03, 2014 
Bill Through 09/30/2014 
Invoice# 13639 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HJGH SCHOOL DJSTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKEAVENUE 

Matter Number O 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

LrWiTPHIAl 
Al i(" · '!_ ''-CLiE;IT 
PRl\'ILtGE 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

09/0912014 

09/11/2014 

09/29/2014 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

REVIEW STUART PHOTOGRAPHY 
CONTRACT; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO 
EMAILS FROM-. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH._ 
REGARDING PHOTOGRAPHY CONTRACT 

WORK ON AUDITOR LETTER 

Total Fees 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

1.1 0 

0.20 

0.60 

hrs. \~J23 l .OO 

hrs. ~42.00 

hrs. $126.00 ~ 

$399.00 

$399.00 

$399.00 

$399.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite l O 

Flossmoor, Iliinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

RECEIVED OCT 14/ 

October 03, 2014 
Bill Through 09/3012014 

Invoice# 13640 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-124 l 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES fOR THIS MATTER 

' : , . , 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

26670 

03 

$5,712.00 

----------------
$5,712 00 



Z6670 

09/04/2014 

09/04/2014 

09/04/2014 

09/05/2014 

09/05/2014 

09/0812014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

REV!EW E-MAIL FROM PARENTS' 
A T'TORNEY REGARDING STATUS OF 
RESPONSE TO DISTRICT'S SETTLEMENT 
OFFER RE,. REVIEW INCOMPLETE 
RELEASE FORM RECEIVED l'ROM PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY AND E-CORRESPONDENCE 
WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME RE: 

-REVIEW FILE MATERIALS IN 
PREPARATION FOR 9/5/l4 !EP MEETING RE: -REVIEW LETTER FROM !SBE'S ...... 
REGARDING REAPPOINTMENT OF .. 
._TO SERVE AS IHO AND 
PRE-HEARING PROCEDURES; DRAFT 
E-MAIL TO ~EGARDING 
ASSIGNED ST A TUS CONFERENCE AND 
PRE-llEARING CONFERENCE DATES AND 
REVIEW RESPONSES TO SAME; DRAFT 
E-MAIL TO~REGARDING 

SAMER~ 

REVIEW ISBE SCHEDULING ORDER RE:­

TRAVEL TO AND ATTEND IEP MEETING RE: 
-CONFER WITH 
REGARDING OTHER PENDING SPECIAL 
EDUCATION MATTERS 

REVIEW LETTER FROM ISBE'S~ 
REGARDING REQUIRED RESOLUTION 
SESSION; PREPARE RESOLUTION 
TRACKING FORM AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO 

REGARDING SAME RE­
REVJEW I IOSPITAL PSYCH IA TRY 
INl'ORMAT!ON AND LETTER FROM 
PRIVATE PSYCHOLOGIST; REVIEW F!LE 
MA TER!ALS AND PREPARE FOR 918114 IE!' 
MEETING RE-REVIEW NOTIFICATION 
OF9/101l4 IEP MEETING RE--

TRAVEL TO AND ATTEND IEP MEETING RE: -

13640 

0.40 

Page 2 

hrs. ?'V'fZ $84.00 

0.20 hrs.C'f? S42.00 

0.10 

3.00 

hrs.qf $21.00 hrs.gr S630.00 

\. l O hrs. gf $231.00 

3.50 hrs. qf sns.oo 



Z6670 

09/08/2014 

09/09/2014 

09/\012014 

09/l l/2014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

REVIEW E-MAIL FROM PARENT 
REGARDING RELEASE FOR DISTRICT TO 
COMMUNICATE WITH RESIDENTIAL 
TREATMENT FACILITY RE:-REVlEW 
PARENT E-MAIL REGARDING LATEST 
REQUEST FOR NON-SCHOOL ATTENDANCE 
OPT!ONS, RESOLUTION TRACKING FORM 
RECEIVED fROM~AND 
PARENTS' WlTHDRA WAL OF DUE PROCESS 
REQUEST RE:.REVIEW AND EDIT NOTES 
OF TODAY'S IEP MEETING AND DRAFT 
E-MAlL TO REGARDING 
SAME RE:-TELEPHONECONFERENCE 
WITH PARENTS' ATIORNEY REGARDING 
ST A TUS OF RESPONSE TO DISTRICT'S 
OFFER OF SETILEMENT AND 919114 STATUS 
CONFERENCE RE:-

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING COURT 
ORDER FOR SOLE CUSTODY ASSIGNMENT 
TO MOTHER; REVJEW 9/10/14 IEP MEETING 
CANCELLATION 13-MA!LS FROM PARENT 
AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME 
RE:. £-CORRESPONDENCE WITH IHO 
AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
SCHEDULED STATUS CONFERENCE RE. 
REVIEW IHO'S ORDER OF DISMISSAL AND 
DRAFT E-MAILS TO AND-
..... REGARDING SAME RE:. 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH • 
._REGARDING PENDING SPECIAL 
EDUCA Tl ON MATTERS 

REVIEW DRAFT DOMAIN/CONSENT FOR 
REEVALUATION FORM AND 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH --­
REGARDING SAME; REVIEW ADDITIONAL 
PRIVATE FACILITY MATERIALS AND 
UNILATERAL PLACEMENTNOT!CE 
RECEIVED FROM PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO~ 
REGARDING SAME RE:- RE~V 
PARENT LETrER T~ 
REGARDING UNILATERAL PLACEMENT OF 
STUDENT AND REQUEST FOR IEP MEETING, 
AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO~ 
REGARDING SAME RE:----­

DRAFT E-MAIL TO PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDJNG DOMAIN/CONSENT FORM RE: .. 

13640 

1.00 

Page 3 

hes qr $210.00 

0.80 hrs.qf $168.00 

0.40 hrs. qf $84.00 

0.10 hrs.~ $21.00 



Z6670 

09112/2014 

0911212014 

09114nOJ4 

09/15/2014 

0911612014 

0911sno14 

DlSTRJCT 225 - COOK lnvoice# 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY AND 
REGARDING ACCEPTANCE OF DISTRICT'S 
SETTLEMENT OFFER AND AGREED 
FOLLOW-UP; DRAFT E-MAIL TO !HO 
REGARDING SAME RE:. 

REVIEW E-MAlL FROM lHO REGARDING 
REQUEST FOR JOINT CONTINUANCE AND 
PREPARE JOINT MOTION AND E-MAIL IN 
RESPONSE TO SAME RE- PREPARE 
DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND 
RELEASE AND E-MAIL TO AND 

REGARDING SAME RE:­
REVIEW E-MAILS REGARDING PARENT'S 
RETURN OF SIGNED CONSENT FOR 
REEVALUATION FORM RE:-DRAFT 
E-MAIL TO PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING ST A TUS OF AGREED 
REVISIONS TO IEPRE:-

REVIEW ORDER FROM I HO-­
GRANTING JO!NTR .. UEST FOR 
CONTINUANCE RE: 

DRAFT E-MAIL TO PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING STATUS OF DRAFT 
SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; 
E-CORRESPON DENC"EIAiNi!D TELEPl-!ON E 
CONFERENCE WITH~ 
REGARDING SAME RE:.REVIEW 
UNILATERAL PLACEMENT LETTER 
RECEIVED FROM PARENT'S ATTORNEY RE: -£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH~ 
AND REGARDING TUITION 
COST OF PRIVATE FACILITY AND POSSIBLE 
AL TERNA TE PAYMENT ARRANGEMENT IN 
SETrLEMENT RE:-REVIEW ORDER OF 
DISMISSAL RECEIVED FROM !HO RE­
REVJEW E-MAIL FROM PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING 
CUSTODY/EDUCATIONAL 
DECISION-MAKING ORDER RE:-

REVIEW ISllE CONTINUANCE ORDER RE: 
-REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL 
FROM~EGARD!NG PRIVATE 
FACILITY REQUEST FOR STUDENT 
WITHDRAWAL FROM DISTRICT 222 RE:-

13640 

0.40 

Page 4 

hrs. qf $84.00 

1.00 hrsqf $210.0() 

0.10 hrs.qf $21.00 

0.20 hrs. 7fl £ $42.0() 

0.30 hrs. Y>'l-,2. 563.00 

0.10 hrs. ~$21.00 



Z6670 

09/19/2014 

09/20/2014 

09/22/2014 

09/23/2014 

09/24/2014 

0912512014 

09!26/2014 

09!27/2014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING-ANae 
MA TIERS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
~GARDING PENDING 
SPECIAL EDUCATION 1v1A TIERS ~ 
-; DRAFT E-MAIL TO PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING FINAL REVISED 
IEPRE,. 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING STATUS 
OF DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RE: 

• REVIEW E-MAIL FROM PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING PAYMENT 
PROVISIONS OF PROPOSED SETTLEMENT 
RE4itREVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL 
FROM PARENT'S ATTORNEY REGARD!l\'G 
STATUS OF REEVALUATION RE'9 

REVIEW E-MAIL FROM PARENT 
REGARDING STUDENT EEG RESULTS RE: .. 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING TUITION 
CA LC ULA Tl ON FOR UNILATERAL 
PLACEMENT AND NEEDED FOLLOW-UP RE: 
.REVIEW E-MAIL FROM~ 
REGARDING SPECIAL EDUCATION 
STUDENT ATTENDANCE/WITIIDRAWAL 
ISSUES 

PARTICIPATE IN STATUS CONFERENCE 
WITH IHO AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY; 
DRAFT JOINT MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE 
AND RELATED E-MAJL TO !HO; REVIEW 
AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING TUITION 
CALCULATION ISSUE RE:­

l"ELEPHONECONFERENCE W!TH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDlNG CASE UPDATE RE: -REVIEW ORDER FROM !HO REGARDING 
PARTIES' JOINT MOTION FOR 
CONTINUANCE AND NEW PHC DATE RE-

13640 

0.40 

0.10 

Page 5 

hrnq{ $84.00 

hrs.qf $21.00 

0.10 hrs.q.f $21.00 

0.10 

0.30 

hrs. qr7 $21.00 

hrs. qf $63.00 

0.40 hrs.qr $84.00 

0.20 hrs.qf $42.00 

0.10 hrs.qp$21.00 



Z6670 

09/2912014 

D!STRlCT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

09129/2014 

09/30/2014 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WlTH. 
-.REGARDING PENDING SPECIAL 
EDUCATION MATTERS~ 
AND AITENDANCE/WITHDRA WAL AND 
HOMEBOUND TEACHER CERTlFICA TION 
ISSUES; PREPARE REVISIONS TO DRAFT 
SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
SAME RE:. REVIEW E--MAIL AND 
PRIVATE FACILITY MATERIALS RECEIVED 
FROM PARENT'S ATTORNEY RE:-

BEGIN REVIEW OF PRIVATE 
NEUROPSYCHOLOGICAL EVALUATION 
REPORTS, MIDWEST CENTER EVALUATION 
AND RELATED RECORDS, AND HPH 
RECORDS RECEIVED FROM PARENTS' 
A TfOR.'lEY RE:-

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH AND 
REVIEW E-MAILS FROM PARENT'S 
A TfORNEY REGARDING PRJY A TE 
FACILITY JEP CONFERENCE AND REQUEST 
FOR DISTRICT PAYMENT OF TUITION 
PORTION OF STUDENT'S UNILATERAL 
PLACEMENT: TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
WITH REGARDING SAME RE: -

Total Fees 

TllLLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES !'OR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

13640 

1.40 

Page 6 

hrs.qf $294.00 

3.00 hrs.qf 5630.00 

0.50 hrs.qf $105.00 

$5,712.00 

SS,712.00 

$5,712.00 

$5,712.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

v.ww.sragahauser.com 

Jul)' 10, 2014 
Bill Through 06/3012014 

Invoice# 13036 JMI 

BOARD OF EDU CA Tl ON Client Number 

Maller Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUJTE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

Z6670 

01 

$4,179.00 

TOTAL l'EES FOR THIS MATTER R.ECEJ v El: JUL 2 2 2014 $4,179.00 

. ·. :-:~et:! -- ' 
u_.fJ1f_ -

v' . .,. 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

VNiw.sragahauser.com 

July 10,2014 
Bill Through 06/30/2014 
Invoice# 13036 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O I 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW,JL 60026-1241 

CONflOt.NTIAt 
ATTORNEV-CllOO 
PRIVILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

06102/2014 

06/02/2014 

06/02/2014 

06/03/2014 

06/03/2014 

06/03/2014 

06103no14 

06/0412014 

06/04/2014 

061osno14 

WORK ON EVALUATION OF SETTLEMENT; 
RESEARCH PENDING ISSUES FOR 2005 AND 
2006 RA TE OBJECTIONS: TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH~ 

CALCULATE AV VALUES AND POTENTIAL 
LOSSES AND REVIEW EXPERT'S 
PRELIMINARY ANALYS!S REPORT AND 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO BUSINESS 
MANAGER RE: 2012 PATRIOT COURTYARDS 
CONDO. ASSOCIATJON 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNTY 
RE: 2009 DUNDEE ALBANY 

REVIEW CAFR'S RE: RA TE OBJl:'.CTIONS 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
TO PERFORM FULL APPRAISAL REPORT 
FOR 2012 PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDO. 
ASSOCJA T!ON 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: PATRIOT COURTYARDS 

CALCULATE LOSSES AND VALUES AS 
COMMERCIAL PROPERTY AND AS 
RESIDENTIAL PROPERTY RE: 2009 DUNDEE 
ALBANY 

UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE DA TE RE: 2009 
NORTHBROOK COURT PROFESSJONAL 
PARTNl:'.RS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BOARD 
OF REV JEW ATTORNEY RE: 2009 DUNDEE 
ALBANY 

PREPARE FOR AND A TT END MEETING ON 
CONSOLI DA TED CASES 

1.80 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

$378.00 

SlOS.00 

$63.00 

$105.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

S63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

563.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 13036 Page 2 

06/05/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.50 ms. $105.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY TO NEGOTJA TE 
SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 DUNDEE ALBANY 

06/0512014 PREPARE FOR PT AB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE ON 2009 NORTHBROOK 
COURT PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS 

06/09/2014 REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 hrs. Sl05.00 
ON THE 13ARK1NG LOT (2012); WORK ON 
REVENUE CALCULATIONS; EMAIL 
DISTRICTS 

06/09120]4 DRAFT E·MAI L CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: POTENT JAL 
SETTLEMENT RE: 2009 DUNDEE ALBANY 

06/0912014 TELEPHONE CONFEREl\'CE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 
DISCREPANCY BETWEEN BRIEF PIN AND 
APPRAJSAL PrN ON 2012 PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS 

06/0912014 CALCULATE AV VALUES Al\'D LOSSES AND 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
SETTLEMENT SCENARIOS AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDEl\'CE TO BUSINESS 
MANAGER RE: POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT 
ON 2009 DUNDEE ALBANY 

06/09/2014 CALCULATE VALUES AND POTENTIAL 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
LOSS IN REVENUE BY \VAY OF REFUND RE: 
2012 MACY'S 

06/09/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXl'A YER EVIDENCE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND DATE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW APPRAISAL 
REPORT OF TAXPAYER RE: 2012 MACY'S 

06/0912014 UPDATE FILE AND Cl IART WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION RE· 
2012 TI!E BARKING LOT 

06/10/2014 WORK ON PTAB INTERVENTION ON THE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
BARKING LOT 

0611112014 REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
ON NEIMAN MARCUS; WORK ON REVENUE 
CALCULATION; EMAIL DISTRICT 

06/11/2014 WORK ON PTAIJ INT[RVENTION FOR 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
NEJMAN MARCUS 

06/11/2014 UPDATE FILE AND er !ART WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION RE: 
2012 NEIMAN MARCUS 

06112/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 
DISCREPANCY ON REPORT AND BRIEF FOR 
l'A TRlOT COURTYARDS 
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06/1212014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DA TE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 

ON CONSOLIDATED CASES 

06112/2014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB WITH 0.30 Ins. $63.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR 1::VJDENCE RE. 
2012 MACY'S 

06116/2014 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND CALCULATE 0.30 lus. $63.00 
POTENTIAL LOSS DY REFUND RE: 2012 THE 
BARKING LOT 

06/1612014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATfORNEY RE: WALGREEN 
CO. POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT AND BOARD 
REJECTION OF PREVIOUS YEAR'S 
STIPULATION 

06118/2014 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND CALCULATE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
LOSSES IN REVENUE BY REFUND RE, 2012 
NEIMAN MARCUS GROUP 

06119120!4 REVIEW COLLECTOR"$ MOTION ON 0.50 hrs. 5105.00 

ALLSTATE 

06/19/2014 WORK ON POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $ I 05.00 
MUL Tl YEAR NEIMAN MARCUS 

06/19/2014 WORK ON POSSIBLI:: SETTLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
MULTI YEAR MACY'S 

06/20/2014 PREPARE FOR AND A TT END COURT DATE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
RE: MOTION TO COMPEL ON DISCOVERY 
REQUESTS ON PENDING CONSOLIDATED 
SPO CASES 

06/2312014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT 0.50 hrs. $]05.00 
CONFERENCE ON SPO CASES 

06/2312014 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 0.40 hrs. S84.00 
AND DATE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW APPRAISAL 
REPORT OF TAXPAYER RE: 2012 THE 
BARKING LOT 

06/23/2014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB WJTH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
F!LING OF EVIDENCE R£: 2012 THE 
BARKING LOT 

06/24/2014 PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING CONFERENCE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
RE: 2009 NORTHBROOK COURT 
PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS 

06/2412014 REVIEW CERTAIN INTERVENORS' 0.10 he. $21.00 
RESPONSES TO PLAlNflFF'S MOTION AND 
REPLY BY STATE'S ATTORNEY RE: SALES 
RA TJO STUDY CONSOLIDATED CASES 

06125/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND RATE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
OBJECTIONS STATUS HEARING FOR 2005-06 
AND 2007-08 
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06/25/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 ho. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: POTENTIAL 
FOR SETTLEMENT OF MUL Tl YEAR 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

06/2512014 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND DA TE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW TAXPAYER'S 
APPRAISAL REPORT RE: 2012 NEIMAN 
rv!ARCUS 

06/25/2014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB WITH 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2012 NEJMAN MARCUS 

06/26/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH SECOND APPRAISED 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
PRELIMINARY VALUE RE: 2011 LAKE COOK 
TERRACE 

06126120 !4 UPDATE FILE WIT!! OUR OFFER TO SETTLE 0.3;) hrs. $63.00 
2011 THE BARKING LOT 

0612612014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE'S 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ATTORNEY RE: NEXT COURT DATE ON 
ALLSTATE 

06127/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DA TE 0.60 hrs. $126.00 
ON MOTION TO COMPEL AND 
COURT-CONDUCTED SETTLEMENT 
CONFERENCE ON LARGER SPO CASES 

06/30/2014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 l\'ORTHBROOK 
COURT PROF!;'.SSIONAL PARTNERS 

0613012014 PREPARE FOR !'TAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 NORTI !BROOK 
COURT MALL 

06/30/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH DISPOSITION FOR 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
HEARING RE: 2009 LOUNDY 

----------------

Total Fees $4, 179.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES S4, 179.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $4,179.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $4,179.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

RECEIVED AUG 1 2 2014 

BOARD OF EDVCA TION 

www.sragalmuser.com 

August 06, 2014 
Bill Through 07/31/2014 

Invoice# 13223 JM! 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SU!TE 200 
GLENVIEW,IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY T.t..XES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

01 

$4,263.00 

$4,263.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Jllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

August 06, 2014 
Bill Through 07/31/2014 
lnvoice# 13223 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 01 

SUJTE 200 
GLENVIEW, !L 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNH-CllENT 
PRIVlltGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
fOR PROFES:.JONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

07/0112014 

07/0112014 

0710212014 

0710212014 

07/02/2014 

07/0712014 

07/0812014 

07/08/2014 

07/08/2014 

07108/2014 

PREPARE FOR ARGUMENTS ON MOTIONS 
RE: SALES RATIOS 

WORK ON ALLSTATE OFFER OF 
SETTLEMENT VALUES 

REVIEW REPLY MEMORANDUM IN 
SUPPORT Of PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR 
CONSOLIDATION FOR ALL PURPOSES 
RELATING TO LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT 
ISSUES, THROUGH AND INCLUDING TRIAL, 
AND FOR ENTRY OF DEFJNITlVE CASE 
MANAGEMENT ORDER 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: ST A TUS OF APPRAJSAL 
REPORT ON 2012 PATRIOT COURTYARDS 
AND ISSUES THAT HA VE ARISEN 

WORK ON PAST AND PRESENT POTENTIAL 
STJPULATIONS FOR WALGREEN CO. 

PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE !!EARING 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 NORTHBROOK 
COURT PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS 

REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 
ON NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB (2012); 
WORK ON REVENUE CALCULATIONS; 
EMAIL D!STRICT 

UPDATE FILE AND CHART WITH 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION RE: 
2012 NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

TELEPHONE cO;,,'FERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY TO NEGOTIATE 
FOR NORTHBROOK COURT PROFESSIONAL 
PARTNERS 

WORK ON ALLSTATE OFFER 

0.20 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

$42.00 

$210.00 

$ I 05.00 

S63.00 

$63.00 

$105.00 

$105.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$210.00 
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07/0812014 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND CALCULATE 0.30 lrrs. S63.00 
LOSS IN REVENUE BY WAY OF REFUND RE: 
2012 NEIMAN MARCUS GROUP 

0710812014 UPDATE FILE WITH EVIDENCE RE: 2012 0.30 lrrs. $63.00 
MACY'S 

0710812014 ~WITH EVIDENCE RE: 2012 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

07/0912014 WORK o;-,• PTAB JNTERVENT!ON ON 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

07/09/2014 PREPARE FOR AND A TT END TAB PRE 0.80 he. $168.00 
HEARING CONFERENCE ON NEGOT!AT!ONS 
FOR SETTLEMENT ON 2009 NORTHBROOK 
COURT PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS 

0710912014 A TT END SITE INSPECTION TO MACY'S 0.70 lrrs. $147.00 

0711012014 PREPARE FOR ARGUMENT ON MOTIONS TO 1.00 hrs. $2 \ 0.00 
CONSOLIDATE FOR TRIAL AND MOTION TO 
COMPEL AND MOTION TO LIFT STAY ON 
ALLSTATE 

07/1012014 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB RE-HEARING 0.30 lrrs. $63.00 
CONFERENCE DATE ON 2009 HARBOR 
TECH CENTER 

07/10/2014 UPDATE FILE \VITI! PTAB RE-HEARING 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CONFERENCE DA TE ON 2009 ECC 
PARTNERS, LLC 

07/1112014 EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES \VITH 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
OBJECTORS' COUNSEL 

07111/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITII 0.30 he. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S A 1TORNEY RE: THE BARKING 
COT 

07/14/2014 REVIEW ALL OPEN PTAB CASES FROM 2008 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
AND DRAFT PARAGRAPH FOR RESPONSE 
TO AUDJTOR'S LE'I'fER 

0711512014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 HARl30R TECH 

07/15/2014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 ECC PARTNERS 

07/15/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER REJECT OF 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
OFFER TO SETTLE BY INTERVENORS ON 
2009 NORTHBROOK COURT PROFESSIONAL 
PARTNERS 

07116/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SEn-LEMENT 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
CONFERENCE WITH LEAD OBJECTORS" 
ATTORNEY RE: PROPERTY TAX RATE 
OBJECTIONS 
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07/16/2014 CALCULATE AV AND POTENTIAL 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
SETTLEMENT SCENARIO LOSS BY \VAY OF 
REFUND RE: 2012 NORTHBROOK RACQUET 
CLUB 

07/17/2014 WORK ON SE1TLEMENT IMPACT 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
CALCULATIONS 

07/17/2014 PREPARE FOR COURT DATE TOMORROW 1.00 ms. $210.00 
AND ARGUMENT ON MOTIONS RE: 
ALLSTATE 

07/1712014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 ho. S63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE; POSSIBLE 
SETTLEMENT FOR THE 13ARKJNG LOT 

07/1812014 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND DA TE TD FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW APPRAISAL 
REPORT OF TAXPAYER RE: 2012 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

07118/2014 PREPARE FOR AND A TIENO COURT 0.50 hrs. 5105.00 
APPEARANCE FOR STATUS ANO 
ARGUMENT ON PLAINTII'F TAXPAYER 
MOTIONS FOR CONSOLIDATION OF TRIAi, 

07/2112014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB WIT! I 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2012 NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

07122/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NEIMAN 
MARCUS GROUP 

0712212014 TELEPHONE co;,..•f£RENCE \VITI! 0.30 !us. S63.00 
APPRAISER RC;;: STATUS OF REPORT RE: 
2012 PATRIOT COURTYARDS 

07/22/2014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE ON 2009 HARBOR TECH 
CENTER 

07122/2014 PREPARE fOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE ON 2009 ECC PARTNERS 

07/2812014 REVIEW DRAFT OF APPRAISAL REPORT 0.50 hrs. Sl05.00 
FOR 2012 PATRIOT COURTYARDS 

0712812014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE, HARBOR 
TECH CENTER 

07129/2014 TELEPHONE CONfERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE, ECC 
PARTNERS 

07/2912014 PREPARE FOR ARGUMENT ON MOTION OF 0. 10 hrs. $21.00 
INTERVENOR ON CONSOLJDA TED SALES 
RA TIO CASES RE: PROPERTY TAXES 

07/30/20!4 WORK ON SETTLEMENT EVALUATION 0.50 hrs. $105.00 



26670 

07/30/2014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 13223 Page 4 

07/30/2014 

07/30/2014 

07/30/2014 

07/31/20!4 

07/31/2014 

07131/2014 

07131120!4 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2012 THE 
DARKING LOT 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2009 
NORTHOROOK COURT PROFESSIONAL 
PARTNERS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: MACY'S 

PREPARE AND APPEAR AT COURT DATE 
RE: ARGUMENT ON THREE MOTIONS ON 
SALES RA TIO CASES/PROPERTY TAXES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATl'ORNEY RE: OFFER OF 
SETTLEMENT FROM lNTERVENORS ON 
20\0,2011 AND 2012 THE PARKING LOT 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB WITH 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2012 PATRJOTCOURTYARDS CONDO. 
ASSOCIATION 

UPDATE FILE WITH SUMMARY RE: 2012 -WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF WALGREEN'S 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MA TIER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.30 hrs. 563.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

0.30 hrs. 563.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.30 hrs. 563.00 

54,263.00 

$4,263.00 

$4,263.00 

$4,263.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauscr.com 

130ARD OF EDU CA TJON 

July 10, 2014 
Bill Through 06130/2014 

Invoice# 13035 ATS 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DJSTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 

Client Number Z6670 

Matter Number 03 

GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 RECEIVED AUG l 1 2014-

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

.. -, 

Sl,092.00 

$1,092.00 

.. .1!@1!__ --·-·- / 
. ,.Y . .,. ,-, ,. 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

WW\V.sragahauser.corn 

July 10,2014 
Bill Through 06130/2014 
Invoice# 13035 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

MatterNumber 03 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

06/01/2014 

06/02/2014 

06102/2014 

06/03/2014 

06104/2014 

06105/2014 

E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY AND~ 
REGARDING FINAL PROPOSED 
CLARIFICATION/REVISION TO 
SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RE: -

TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND 
E-CORRESl'ONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 

iAITTIOIRINICl·Y.AND ___ _ 
AND.-REGARDING 

RISK ASSESSMENT JSSUES AND UPCOMING 
JEP MEETING RE:-REVIEW DRAFT 
DOMAIN FORM AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO MS. 
FRENCH REGARDrNG SAME RE.­
REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 

REGARDING PARENTVJSJT 
TODAY AND COMPLETE FINAL AGREED 
REVISION TO SElTLEMENT AGREEMENT 
RE .• 

!lEGIN REVIEW OF STUDENT RECORDS 
RECEIVED FROM R~ 

REVIEW REVISED DOMAINICONSENT 
FORM AND DR.AFT E-MAIL TO PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME RE~ 

REVIEW RISK ASSESSMENT REPORT AND 
DRAFT E-MAIL TO 
REGARDING SAME RE:­

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \\/!Tl-~ 
-RE:-MATTERS; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING JSSUES FOR 
RESOLUTION AT TODA Y'S IEP MEETING RE: -

0.70 h,qf $147.00 

0.90 

O. \O 

0.10 

0.30 

hrs.(·~!89.00 

hrs.q) $21.00 

hrsqf $21.00 

hrs.~f $63.00 



Z6670 

06106/2014 

0610912014 

06110/2014 

06112/2014 

06/13/2014 

06/16/2014 

0611712014 

0611712014 

06/19/2014 

DISTRJCT 225- COOK lnvoice# 

E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY AND 
REGARDING PENDING PSYCHIATRIC 
EVALUATION AND RELATED CASE ISSUES 
RE:e, 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
RELEASE FORMS FOR DIAGNOSTIC 
PLACEMENT REFERRALS AND 
ADDITIONAL STUDENT EVALUATIONS; 
REVIEW DRAFT OF 6/5/14 JEP CONFERENCE 
REPORT AND E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 

AND 
REGARDING SAME RE;~ 

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING BOARD APPROVAL AND 
FINAL EXECL'TION OF SETTLEMENT 
AGREEMENT RE:- E-CORRESPONDE,'ICE 
WITH , AND 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING TIME 
L\NE FOR COMPLETION Of ADD\TlONAL 
STUDENT EVALUATIONS AND SUMMER 
FOOTBALL CAMP !SSUE RE ... 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
REQUEST FOR COPY OF STUDENT'S FINAL 
EXAMS AND RELATED MATTERS RE:~ 

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING ISSUES RELATIVE TO PARENT 
REQUEST FOR COPIES Of STUDENl'S FINAL 
EXAMS AND RESEARCH lLLJNOIS CASE 
LAW RELATIVE TO SAME RE: -

REVIEW E-MAIL FROM 
REGARDING DIAGNOSTIC PLACEMENT 
UPDATERE:­

REVJEW E-MAJL FROM 
REGARDING STATUS OF DIAGNOSTIC 
PLACEMENT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
WITH PARENTS' ATTORNEY AND 
FOLLOW-UP E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE 
WITH AND~II-
REGARDING SAME RE:-

DRAFT E-MAIL TO~AND~ 
--REGARDlNG CASE LAW 
RELA 11VE TO PARENTS' KEQU EST FOR 
COPIES OF STUDENTS FINAL EXAMS RE: • REVIEW E-MA!l. FROM BRIDGE VIEW'S 
~REGARDING STATUS OF 
PARENT VISIT RE:e, 

13035 

0.10 
Pag;j~ 
hrs.'----A $21.00 

1.00 hrscf $210.00 

0.30 hrs.Cf $63.00 

0.10 ~ $21.00 

0.10 hrs.~$2!.00 

0.30 hrs.qp $63.00 

0.30 hrs~ $63.00 

0.10 hrs. qf S2 l .OO 



Z6670 

06/2412014 

DISTR1CT 225 - COOK Invoice# 13035 Page 3 

0612512014 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
REGARDJNG STUDENT 

ATTENDANCE AT WRESTLING CAMP; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE W!TH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME RE:~ 

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY, AND. 

REGARDING STUDENT 
ATTENDANCE AT WRESTLING EVENT AND 
RELATED MATTERS RE:91, 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL fEES 

TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.20 $42.00 

0.20 hrs~ $42.00 

················ 
$1,092.00 

$1,092.00 

················ 
$1,092.00 

Sl,092.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

July 10, 2014 
Bill Through 06/30/2014 

Invoice# 13034 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVJEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Matter Number O 

RECEIVED AUG O 3 2014 

$945.00 

$945.00 

-----··------------- . 

• 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www ,sragahauser.com 

July 10,2014 
Bill Through 06130/2014 
lnvoice# 13034 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT225 
380! WESTLAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 

SUJTE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONftoENTIAL 
ATIORNEY-CLIENI 
PRIVlllS~ 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

06/05/2014 

06117/2014 

TRAVEL TO AND An-END IEP MEETING 
AND CONFER WITH AND •. 
--REGARDING NEEDED 
FOLLOW-UP RE:. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH. 
~ RE, DRUG FREE WORKPLACE ACT 
POLICY 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATfER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

4.40 hrqf S924.00 

-~" 0.10 hrs. S21.00. 

----------------
5945.00 

$945.00 

$945.00 

$945.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

wwv,• .sragahauser.com 

August 06, 20 !4 
Bill Through 07/31/2014 

Invoice# 13250 A TS 

!OARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

) 

iLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT225 
801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 

UITE 200 
:L£NVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

Z6670 

0 

SCHOOL LAW 
RECEIVED AUG 2 0 2014 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

$441.00 

$441.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

v..wv,,·.sragahauser.com 

Augus\06,2014 
Bill Through 07/31/2014 
Invoice# 13250 A TS 

BOARD OF EDU CA T!ON Client Number Z6670 
GLENilROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

MattcrNumber O 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIOEr!TIAt 
AHORNEV-CllEITT 
PRIVILEGE 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVJCES RENDF;RED 

07101/2014 

0710812014 

07/08/2014 

07/14/2014 

07122/2014 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL fEES 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAJL 
REGARDING OPINION OF COUNSEL 
LET!'ER; REVJEW FILES 

REVIS!:'. OPINION OF COUNSEL LETTER 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VITI!~ 
REGARDING COMPETITIVE BIDDING; 
REVIEW BID SPEClflCATIONS 

WORK ON AUDITOR LETTER 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH~ 
.... RE: TIME LINE fOR TEACHERS TO 
RESIGN AND !MPACTON PROSPECTIVE 
EMPLOYING DISTRICT 

Total Fees 

TOTAL fEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOT AL BALANCE DUE 

0.40 hrs.~ $84.00 

0.30 

0.30 

0.80 

0.30 

hrs . ..f!." n 163.00 

hrs. ~~63.00 

hrs.6,168.00 

hrs. ("1--f!., $63.00 

$441.00 

$441.00 

$441.00 

S44J.OO 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Gove111ors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6&66 

www.sragahauser.com 

November 06, 2014 
Bill Through 1013112014 

Invoice# 13962 JMJ 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLEN BROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

Ol 

j 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

RECEIVED f/QV 1 8 Z,Dl.4 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL J'EES FOR THIS MATTER 

$3,948.00 

$3.948.00 

·-----

. --- -- . 

- ,,_, ~-' .. -----------,, ,1 .. ~. ---
11.131 f.. ___ . -

/_. .v 

' ' . ·-· .. ' - ' ... "":, .. 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suile 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 fax: (708) 799-6866 

W\l'w.sragahauser .com 

November 06, 2014 
Bill Through 10131/2014 
Tnvoicell 13962 JMI 

BOARD Of EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Maner Number O I 

SUITE 200 
GLENV!EW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTl~l 
AHOR1iEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREO.: 

10101/2014 

10/0112014 

10/01/2014 

10101/2014 

10/0212014 

10/02/2014 

I 0102/2014 

10/02/2014 

I 0/0212014 

I 010212014 

I 0/0312014 

I 0/03/2014 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2009 EEC 
PARTNERS 

PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE RE: HARBOR TECH 

UPDATE flLE WITJI APPROVAL FOR 
SETTLEMENT RE: HARBOR TECH CENTER 

SITE VISIT ON INSPECTION DATE RE· 
NEIMAN MARCUS 

PREPARE FOR ALLSTATE SETTLEMENT 
CONFERENCE 

REV!EW ORDERS SENT FROM TAXPAYER'S 
ATTORNEY RE: SALES RATIO CASES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
l'AXPA YER'S A Tl"ORNEY RE: 
NORTHRROOK COURT MALL 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXl'A YER'S AT!"ORNEY RE, PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS 

EXCI !ANGE OF EMAi LS \VITI I TAXP1\ YliR'S 
A TT OR.NEY AND APPRAISER RE: MACY'S 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 20 I 0, 20 11 AND 
2012 NORTHBROOK RACQUETCLUll 

EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITH DR. 
SIENA RE: DUPAGE TAX OBJECTION 
LITIGATION 

UPDATE FILE WITH EMAIL RE: 
STIPULATION ON PATRIOT COURTYARDS 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.50 hrs 

0.10 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.80 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

S63.00 

S l 05.00 

$63.00 

$210.00 

$ I 05.00 

$21.00 

563.00 

$63.00 

$84.00 

S63.00 

$168.00 

$63.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 13962 Page 2 

I 0/0312014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DAT!; 0.40 hrs. S84.00 
ON STATUS OF DISCOVERY ON SPOCASES 
CONSOLIDATION 

1010612014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTOR}.'EY RE: THE BARKING 
LOT 

10/06/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH CORRESPONDENCE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
FROM TAXPAYER RE: PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS 

l 0/0612014 PREPARE FORAND ATTEND STATUS AND 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE COURT DA TE 
ON CONSOLIDATED CASES 

10/07!2014 CALCULATE LOSSES ON SErfLEMENT 0.50 hrs. SIOS.00 
SCENARIOS fOR PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE TOMORROW ON 2009 ULLIE 
KINl\'ARD 

10107/2014 TELf:PHONE CONFERENCE WITJ·I 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: ALLSTATE 

10/07/2014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXl'A YER 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ATTORNEY WITH OFFER TO SETl"LE 2009 
EEC PARTNERS 

10107/2014 WORK ON MULTI YEAR SETTLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
PROPERTY DYNAMJCS 

10/07/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXl'A YER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2009 TECJ INY 
ESTATES 

10/08/2014 PREPARE FOR AND /dTEND l'TAB PRE l.50 hrs. $315.00 
HEARING CONFERENCE AND l'ARTICll'A TE 
IN NEGOTIATIONS WITH STATE::'$ 
ATTORNEY AND TAXPAYER ATTORNEY, 
REACII AND EXECUTE STIPULATION RE: 
2009 HARl30R TECH CENTER 

l 0/1012014 PREPARE FOR AND A TT END COURT DA TE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
FOR DISCOVERY STATUS 

10/13/2014 TELEPI !ONE CONFERENCE \V!TH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER"S ATfORNEY RE: l'ATRJOT 
COURTYARDS 

1011312014 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
WITH SETTLEMENT SCENARIOS AND 
RECENT SALES DATA AND DRAfT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: POTENTIAL 
SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 EEC PARTNERS 

10/1312014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VITI-I 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE EEC 
PARTNERS STIPULATION 



26670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 13962 Page 3 

10/14/2014 EXECUTE STIPULATION AND DRA!'T 0.30 hrs. 563.00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
ATTORNEY RE: ACCEPTANCE OF 2009 EEC 
PARTNERS STIPULATION 

1011412014 TELEPHO}!E CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: THE !,ARKING 
LOT STIPULATION 

10115/2014 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY !'OR STIPULATION 
ON 2009 PATRIOT COURTYARDS 

1011512014 PREPARE FOR AND A TT END SETTLEMENT l.50 hrs. $315.00 
CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE ON SPO CASES 
RE:ALLSTATE 

10/16/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER A TTOR.NEY RE: 2009 HILLING ER 

10/20/2014 DRA!'T E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 hrs. 563.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: STIPULATION 
FOR PATRIOT COURTYARDS 

10/20/2014 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE RE: 0.30 hrs. 563.00 

STIPULATION FOR TI-IE BARKING LOT 

1012012014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. S63.00 

TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: MACY'S 

10120/2014 TELEPHONE CONFER!,NCE WITH 0.30 hrs. S63.00 

TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: WALGREEN 
co. 

10120/2014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TOT AXPA YER'S 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

ATTORNEY RE: STIPULATION FOR l'ATRJOT 
COURTYARDS 

1012112014 MEETING WITH STATE'S ATTORNEY RE: 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

CONSOLIDATED CASES ON SALES RATIO 
STUDY 

10123(2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2009 PROLOGIS 

I 0123/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2009 TECHNY 
ESTATES 

10124/2014 EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: TAX RATE 
OBJECTIONS 

l 0/24/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB FJNAL ORDER 0.40 hrs. S84.00 

AND Vl,RIFY VALUE WITH STJPULATION 
RE: 2010 ARCHITEX 

10/2412014 EXECUTE NEW STIPULATION AT SAME 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

VALUE FOR 2009 ECC PARTNERS 



Z6670 

10/27/2014 

DJSTRJCT 225 - COOK Invoice# 13962 Page 4 

10127/2014 

10129/2014 

10129/2014 

10/30/2014 

UPDATE FILE WITH STATUS OF 
SEITLEMENTNEGOTIATIONS RE, 2010 
TRIENNIAL FOR NORTHBROOK RACQUET 
CLUB 

UPDATE F!LE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2012 NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: MACY'S 

EXECUTE STIPULATION AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
AITORNEY RE: 2009 PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ...... 
RE: AUTHORIZATION RESOLUTION 

TGtal Fees 

13ILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.30 hrs $63.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.20 hrs. S42.00 

S3,948.00 

SJ,948.00 

$3.948.00 

53,948.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

w,vw.srngahauser.corn 
November 06, 2014 

Bill Through 10131/2014 
Invoice# 13956 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

26670 

03 

$1,323.00 

$1,323.00 

;/tJ.3/J' 
/ / 

' .. 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suile 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

November 06, 2014 
Bill Through J0/3112014 
Invoice# 13956 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 03 

SUJTE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONflDEIHIAl 
AHOR!IEY-CUE!ff 
PRIVILEGE 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATfERS 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

10/0112014 

10/01/2014 

10/02/2014 

10/02/2014 

10/0612014 

REVIEW ISBE CONTINUANCE 
CONF!RMATJON AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH PARl:'.NTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING STATUS OF SETTLEMENT 
COMPLETION RE:. 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
ALLEGATIONS CONCERNING STAFF 
TREATMENT OF STUDENT; REVIEW AND 
RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
REGARDING SAME RE;. 

REV!EW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
PARENT'S A TI"ORNEY REGARDING ST A TUS 
OF PSYCHIATRIC EVALUATION RE:­
REVIEW ISBE HOME/HOSPITAL TEACHER 
CERTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS AND 
DRAFT E-MAIL TO 
REGARDING SAME 

REVIEW E-MAIL FROM AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH 
REGARDING TUITION B,\SIS OF 
UN!LA TERAL PLACEMENT AND PENDING 
PSYCHIATRIC EVALUATION RE:. 

REVIEW E-MAIL FROM PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING REQUESTED 
CHANGES TO DRAFT SETTLEMENT 
AGREEMENT; DRAFT E-MAIL TO AND 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH .. 
-REGARDING SAME RI:'.:~ 

0.10 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

S21.00~ 

$630oqf' 

$42.0~ 

$63.00 9() 



26670 

10/07/2014 

10/08/2014 

10/15/2014 

10/17/2014 

10/20/2014 

10/21/2014 

10/21/2014 

DJSTRJCT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

REVIEW ADDITIONAL E-MAIL FROM,m,, 
-REGARDING RESPONSE TO 
PARENT ALLEGATIONS AND DRAFT 
E-MAIL TO PARENTS' ATrORNEY 
REGARDING SAME RE~ PREPARE 
REVISIONS TO PROPOSED SETTLEMENT 
AGREEMENT, AND DRAFT E-MAJL TO AND 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME RE,9il 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING UPCOMING MDRC 
MEETINGR~ 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH-
~REGARDING COMMUNICATION 
BETWEEN AND PARENTS 
ATTORNEY RE,. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
AN-

REGARDING STUDENTS SUICIDAL 
IDEA TJON AND ALLEGA TlONS OF SEXUAL 
ASSAULT AND WHETHER STUDENT 
RECORD INFORMATION MAY BE 
DISCLOSED TO POLICE 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING STATUS 
OF SETTLEMENT REVISIONS RE~ 
REVIEW ADDITIONAL IEP CONFERENCE 
MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM-
~AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO 
PARENTS' ATTOR."<EY REGARDING SAME 
RE:-

PREPARE ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO 
PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND 
DRAFT E-MAIL TO PARENTS' An.ORNEY 
REGARDING SAME RE;-

DRAFT E-MAIL TO PARENT'S ATTORNEY 
REGARDING PREPARATION OF !CG 
APPLlCA TION RE-

13956 

0.70 

Page 

hrs. 

0.70 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

2 

$147.00 { l 

$141.ooq.f 

s21.ooq\f 

$21.00 lf p 

$21.00~ 

$63.00 q(? 

$2100 '-fr' 



26670 

10/2212014 

I 012312014 

10124/2014 

10/25/2014 

1012712014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING ADDITIONAL 
REQUESTED REVISIONS TO DRAfT 
SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; PREPARE 
REVISIONS AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME 
RE:.REVlEW E-MAIL FROM PARENT 
REGARDING EFFORTS TO COMMUNICATE 
WITH DISTRICT'S RE:-

REVJEW E-MA!L FROM PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING SETfLEMENT 
PROVISIONS AND £-CORRESPONDENCE 
WITH REGARDING SAME RE: 

• REVIEW E-MAJLS FROM PARENT 
REGARDING IMPENDING RELEASE OF 
STUDENT FROM HOSPITALIZATION RE:­

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
PARENT'S ATTORNEY REGARDING 
STUDENT'S ANT!CIPATED RETURN TO 
ILUNOJS AND RESUMPTION OF PRIVATE 
DAY SCHOOL PLACEMENT RE:-

ORAFT E-MAIL TO PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING DISTRICT'S PRELIMINARY 
RESPONSE TO ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO 
DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RE:­
DRAFT E-MAIL TO 
REGARDING RECE!PTOF ADDITIONAL 
HOSPITAL RECORDS AND STUDENT'S 
RETURN TO ILLINOIS RE:-

REVIEW E-MAILS PROM •••• AND 
SOUTH CAMPUS DIRECTOR REGARDING 
STUDENT'S RETURN PROM OUT-OF-STATE 
HOSPITALIZATION; TELEPI-JONE 
CONFERENCE WITH PARENT'S ATI"ORNEY 
REGARDING SAME RE~ 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING FURTHER 
CONTINUANCE OF DUE PROCESS WHILE 
FlNAL REVISIONS TO SETTLEMENT 
AGREEMENT ARE DETERMINED RE-

13956 Page 3 

0.30 hrs. S6300C)y? 

0.20 hrs. S42.ooqv 

0.10 hrs. s21.ooqP 

0.10 hrs. S21.00 q p 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 qf 



26670 

10/2812014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

10/29/2014 

10130/2014 

I0/3112014 

£-CORRESPONDENCE W!Tl-1 PARENT'S 
ATTORNEY AND RE:~ 
DRAFT MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE AND 
E-MAIL TO JHO AND PARENTS' ATfORNEY 
REGARDING SAME RE:. REVIEW DUE 
PROCESS REQUEST FJLED BY PARENT AND 
E·CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING SAME; DRAFT LETTER TO 
ISBE'S REGARDING 
REAPPOINTMENT OF TO SERVE 
AS !HO; DRAFT LETTER TO. 
REGARDING INSURANCE NOTIFICA Tl ON 
AND £-CORRESPONDENCE WIT~ 
REGARDING SAME; DRAFT LETTERS TO 
PARENTS REGARDING PROCEDURAL 
SAFEGUARDS AND RESOLUTION MEETING 
AND E-MAIL TO REGARDING 
SAME; REVIEW E-MAILS BETWEEN PARENT 
AND REGARDING TODAY'S 
lEP MEETING AND CASE ISSUES RE. 

TELEPHONECONfERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATrORNEY REGARDING ADDITIONAL 
SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS RE,. 
REVIEW MERIDELL D!SCHARGE REPORTS 
AND RELATED E-MAILS RE:-

REVJEW HOME-SCHOOL E-MAJLS 
REGARDJNO PLANNED MEETINGS; REVIEW 
E-MAIL AND PRE-HEARING ORDERS 
RECEIVED FROM IHO RISEN RE:. 

INITIATE WORK ON ADDITIONAL 
SETTLEMENT REVJSIONS AND REVIEW 
E-MAIL FROM PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING SAME RE:.REVIEW 
CORRESPONDENCE FROM !SEE'S,-. 
REGARDING REASSIGNMENT OF~ 
TO SERVE AS IHO AND RELATED MATTERS 
RE-

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

13956 

1.30 

Page 

hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

4 // 

$273.00 q\ 

$105.oo qP 

$21.00 cf 
$42.00yf 

Sl,323.00 

Sl,323.00 

S 1,323.00 

Sl ,323.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite JO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

August 06, 2014 
Bill Through 07131/2014 

Invoice# 13251 A TS 

RECEJvi,:u SEP OJ;,-
" ' 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

NOPO. 

Z6670 

OJ 

S4,l58.00 

$4,158.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, lllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

w,.vw.sragahauscr.com 

August 06, 2014 
Bil! Through 07131/2014 
Invoice# 13251 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL D!STR1CT225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 03 

SUITE 200 
GLENVJEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIO£NTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEllE 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MA TIERS 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RF;NDERED 

07/0212014 

07/07/2014 

07108/2014 

07114/2014 

07/1512014 

07119/2014 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
A"ffORNEY REGARDING CHANGE IN 
PROPOSED PSYCHOLOGICAL 
EVALUATORS; E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY,......_ AND 

REGARDING SAME AND 
RELATED MATTERS RE:-

REVJEW UPDATE FROM~ 
REGARDING PARENT CONSENT TO 
REVISED DOMAIN fORM RE:­

TELEPHONE CONfERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
A ITORNEY REGARDING EVALUATION 
AND FOOTBALL CAMP ISSUES; 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING SAME RE~ 

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH_.._, 
AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
UPCOMING !El' MEETING 

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
A"rfORNEY AND 
REGARDING 8120/14 IEP MEETING RE:­

CONFER WITH PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING INTENTION TO PROCEED 
WITH DUE PROCESS ACTION AND BASES 
FOR SAME RE:-

0.30 hrs.o/ $63.00 

0.10 hrs. Z £ $21.00 

0.30 hrs. gf 563.00 

hrscf S2 I .00 

hrs. g? $21.00 

0.20 hrs. ~f $42.00 

0.10 

0.10 



Z6670 

07/21/2014 

0712212014 

07/23/2014 

07123/2014 

07/23/2014 

07/24/2014 

07/25/2014 

07/25/2014 

07/25/2014 

07/25/2014 

07/28/2014 

07/28/2014 

DlSTRICT 225 - COOK lnvoice# 

REVIEW DUE PROCESS REQUEST 
RECEIVED FROM PARENTS' ATIORNEY; 
E·CORRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCES WITH~ AND-

REGARDING SAME; DRAFT 
LETIER TO JSBE'S~REGARD!NG 
NEW DPCN AND REQUEST FOR 
APPOINTMENT OF !HO; DRAFT LETIER TO 
~EGARDING INSURANCE 
NOTIFICATION; DRAFT LETTER TO 
PARENTS REGARDING PROCEDURAL 
SAFEGUARDS AND LEGAL RESOURCES; 
DOCKET PRE-HEARING TIME LINES RE:. 

BEGIN REVIEW OF AMENDED DPCN AND 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATIORNEY AND 
REGARDING SAME RE:. 

REVIEW NOTICE OF 8120/14 IEP MEETING 
RE:. 

DRAFT E-MAILS TO 
-RE .. 

AND-

BEGIN REVIEW OF STUDENT RECORDS FOR 
RESPONSE TO DPCN RE:-

E-CORRESPONDENCE \VITI I ISBE'S 
AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY 

REGARDING ASSIGNMENT OF MEDIATOR 
RE:. 

REVIEW LETIER AND PRE-HEARING 
ORDERS RECEIVED FROM ASSIGNED IHO 

RE:-

REV!EW AND COMPARE DRAFT AND 
REVISED DPCN IN PREPARATION FOR 
RESPONSE TO SAME RE:-

CONTINUE TO REVIEW STUDENT RECORDS 
IN PREPARATION FOR RESPONSE TO DPCN 
RE:9, 

E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE T09 
.....,REGARDING INFORMATION 
NEEDED FOR RESPONSE TO DPCN RE:­

REVIEW LETIER FROM ISBE'S ~ 
REGARDING ASSIGNED 11-!0 AND 
PRE-HEARING TlME LINES RE:. 

REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE AND 
ADDITIONAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM 

RE:-

13251 

1.30 

0.20 

0.10 

0.10 

1.60 

0.10 

0.20 

0.60 

2.90 

0.10 

0. l O 

0.30 

Page 2 

hrs.r,l-12- $273.00 

ms qf 1,2.00 

hrs.qr $21.00 

hrs. ,"cf'- $21.00 

hrsq( $336.00 

hr~ $21.00 

hrsqr 542.00 

hrs.q-f $126.00 

hrsqf$609.00 

hrs.gr $21.00 

hro/ $21.00 

hrs. QJ) $63.00 



26670 

0712812014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

07129/2014 

07/2912014 

07130/2014 

07/30/2014 

07/30/2014 

07/30/2014 

07131/2014 

07/3112014 

07/31/2014 

WORK ON DRAFT RESPONSE TO DPCN; 
E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCES WITH9; 
-REGARDING NEEDED 
JNFOR.M.ATION FOR SAME; REVIEW 
PR.IV A TE EVALUATION REPORT FOR SAME 
RE:~ 

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH lHO, ISBE'S 
ASSIGNED MEDIA TOR, AND 

PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING STATUS 
CONFERENCE AND MEDIATION DATES RE: -BEGIN REVIEW OF PRELIMINARY DRAf-T 
OF DISTRICT'S RESPONSE TO DPCN RE:­

REVlEW PARENT E-MAIL REGARDING 
REQUEST FOR IEP MEETll\'G AND 
INTFNTION TO BRING COUNSEL AND 
DRAFTE-MAlLTO­
REGARDING SAME RE,. 

REVIEW LETTER FROM ISBE'S COLEGROVE 
REGARDING STATE-SPONSORED 
MEDIATION ANO EXTENSIVE 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH ASSIGNED 
MEDIATOR, PARENTS' ATTORNEY, AND • 
.... REGARDING SAME RE"9 

PREPARE AGREED MOTJON FOR 
CONTINUANCE AND £-CORRESPONDENCE 
WJTH !HO REGARDING SAME RE:. 

COMPLETE PRELIMINARY REVIEW OF AND 
REVISIONS TO DRAFT RESPONSE TO DPCN 
AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO. 
REGARDING SAME RE:. 

REVIEW LETfER FROM JSBE'S-­
REGARDING REQUIRED RESOLUTION 
SESSION RE:. 

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
AND PARENTS' ATrORNEY REGARDING 
8121114 MEDIATION RE:. 

TELEPl!ONE CONFERENCE AND 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING PROPOSED REVISIONS TO 
PRELIMINARY DRAFT OF DISTRICl'S 
RESPONSE TO DPCN AND PREPARE SAME 
RE. 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

13251 

7.80 

0.30 

0.50 

0.10 

Page 3 

hr~l,638.00 

hrqf $63.00 

hrs.qfs105.00 

hrs. qf $2 l .OO 

0.50 hrsqf $105.00 

0.20 hrs.crf $42.00 

0.50 hrs. q~105.00 

0.10 hrsqf S21.00 

0.10 h~ $21.00 

1.00 hrs~f $210.00 

$4,158.00 

$4,158.00 
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TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $4, 158.0() 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 54,158.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway • Suite 10 

Fl=,moor, lllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-676f5 Fax: (708) 799-6366 

www.sragahauser.com 

September 05, 2014 
Bill Through 09/30/2014 

Jnvo{cc# 13519 J1\,fl 

h'.ECEI\'EO --

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK J-nGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026--1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES fOR TIIIS MATTER 

Client NI.UTlhf!r 

Matter Number 

26670 

or 

J 

14 

$7 ,812.00 

~7,812 DO 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
I 9730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

wwv..•.sragahauser.corn 

September 05, 2014 
Bill Through 09/30/2014 
Invoice# 13519 JMI 

IlOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DlSTRTCT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

MatterNumbcr 01 

SUITE 200 CON'IDE~TIAl 

GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 Al TURNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

08/0112014 

08/01/2014 

08/04/2014 

08/04/2014 

08/04/2014 

08/04/2014 

08/05/2014 

08/06/2014 

08/06/2014 

08/06/2014 

08/0612014 

PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT 
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WITH STATE'S 
ATTORNEY, TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY AND 
JUDGE RE: PROPERTY TAXES 

PARTICIPATE IN NEGOTIATIONS FOR 
SETTLEMENT OF 20 I 0, 2011 AND 2012 THE 
BARKING LOT 

WORK ON DISCOVERY AND ANSWERS TO 
COMPLAINT ON SALES RATION CASES RE: 
PROl'ERTY TAXES 

TELEPIIONECONFERENCE WITH STATE'S 
ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING CONFERENCE 
ON HARllOR TECH 

PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE ON ECC PARTNERS 

CALCULATE REVENUE LOSSES IN 
SETTLEMENT SCENARIOS FOR 
SETTLEMENT ON MULTI-YEAR 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT 
STATUS HEARlNG RE: RATE OBJECTIONS 

DRAFT ANSWERS TO AMENDED 
JNDIVIDUAL COMPLAINT ON SALES RATIO 
CONSOLIDATION CASES RE: PROPERTY 
TAXES 

WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT FOR 
MULTI-YEAR LAKE COOK TERRACE 

1.50 hrs. 

0.60 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

$315.00 

$126.00 

$84.00 

$63.00 

$105.00 

$105.00 

S84.00 

S42.00 

S84.00 

584.00 

563.00 
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0810712014 PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING CONFERENCE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ON EEC PARTNERS, LLC 

0810712014 PREPARE FOR PRE IIEARING CONFERENCE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ON HARBOR TECH CENTER 

0810712014 MEETING WITH APPRAISER RENZ! RE: ALL 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
OPEN PTAB CASES FOR DISTRJCT 

08/08/2014 RESEARCH DEFENSES FOR RATE 2.00 ltrs. $420.00 
OBJECTIONS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
WITH.-. 

08/1112014 RESEARCH LOSS FACTOR RATE OBJECTION 2.20 hrs. $462.00 
CASES 

08/11/2014 EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITl--Je 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
,...RE: MEETING ON RATE OBJECTIONS 

08111/20!4 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB PRE HEARING 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
CONFERENCE DATE RE: 2009 IPM PLUS, LLC 

08/1112014 UPDATE FILE WITH PT AB PRE HEARING 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CONFERENCE DA TE RE: 2009 PROPERTY 
DYNAMICS 

08/1112014 UPDATE FILE WITH PT Ari PRE I-IEAR!NG 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
CONFERENCE DA TE RE: 2009 
NORTHBROOK COURT PROFESSIONAL 
PARTNERS 

0811212014 RESEARCH CASES AND AUTHORITY ON 1.40 hrs. $294.00 
LOSS FACTOR RE: RATEOilJECTIONS 

0811212014 WORK ON REVIEW OF FINANCIAL 1.00 hrs. S210.00 
ST A TEMENTS RE: RA TE OBJECTIONS 

0811212014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: POSSIBLE 
SETTLEMENT OF HARBOR TECH CENTER 
PRIOR TO PHC 

0811212014 UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2012 PA TRI OT 
COURTYARDS CONDO ASSOCIATION 

0811312014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 he. $105.00 
CONFERENCE ON 2009 NORTHBROOK 
COURT PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS 

0811312014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE ON 2009 IPM PLUS 

08113/2014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE IIEARJNG 0.50 h<s. SlOS.00 
CONFERENCE ON 2009 PROPERTY 
DYNAMICS 

0811312014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND PTAB PRE 0.90 hrs. $189.00 
HEARJNG CONFERENCE REc 2009 EEC 
PARTNERS 

0811312014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND Pl"AB PRE 0.90 hrs. $189.00 
HEARING CONFERENCE RE: 2009 HARBOR 
TECH CENTER 
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08!15/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE 3.50 hrs. $735.00 
WJTH,.-RE:TAXRATE 
OBJECTIONS 

08/1812014 WORK ON SETTLEMENT OFFER FOR 1.00 hrs. S210.00 
ALLSTATE 

08!18/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE SETTLEMENT 
ON 2010, 201 l AND 2012 THE BARKJNG LOT 

OS/1812014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: NEIMAN 
MARCUS GROUP 

08!19/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE'S 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ATTORNEY RE: HARllOR TECH CENTER 

08119/2014 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: OFFER TO 
SETTLE 2009 ECC PARTNERS, LLC 

0811912014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. SlQS.00 
CONFERENCE AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH TAXPAYER ATTORNEY 
RE: 2009 NORTHBROOK COURT 
PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS 

08/1912014 PREPARE FOR PTAB l'RE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH TAXPAYER ATTORNEY 
RE: 2009 IPM PLUS, LLC 

OS/1912014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH TAXPAYER An-ORNEY 
RE: 2009 PROPERTY DYNAMICS 

08/20/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH REVISED APPRAISAL 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
FROM TAXPAYER RE: PATRJOT 
COURTYARDS CONDO ASSOCIA TJON 

OS/20/2014 EXCHANGE OF E-MAILS AND TELEPHONE 0.80 hrs. $168.00 
CONFERENCES WITH TAXPAYER'S 
ArfORNEY IN NEGOTIA rlONS FOR 
POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT FOR 2012 PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS CONDO ASSOCIATION 

08/20/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2012 PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS CONDO ASSOCIATION 

08/2112014 PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT 2.50 hrs. $525.00 
SETTLEMENTCONFERENCE WITH 
TAX PA YER AND JUDGES RE: PROPERTY 
TAXES 

08125/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: THE BARKING 
LOT 
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08/2512014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS CONDO ASSOCIA TJON 

08/25/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: EEC PARTNERS 

08/26/2014 REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL LOO hrs. $210.00 
ON WILLOW HILL EXECUTIVE; WORK ON 
REVENUE CALCULATIONS; EMA!~ 
~RESEARCH PROPERTY TAX BILL 

08/26/2014 WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF MUL Tl-YEAR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDO 
ASSOCIATION AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH TAXPAYER'S 
ATTORNEY 

08/26/2014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. SI05.00 
CONFERENCE ON 2009 PROPERTY 
DYNAMICS 

08/2612014 PREPARE FOR PTAl3 PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $] 05.00 
CONFERENCE ON 2009 JPM PLUS 

08/26/2014 PREPARE FOR PTAl3 PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $ I 05.00 
CONFERENCE ON 2009 NORTHBROOK 
COURT PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS 

08127/2014 EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITH DR. 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
SIENA AND DISTR1CT29 RE: WILLOW HlLL 
EXECUTIVE/PROPERTY TAXES 

08/27/2014 WORK ON NEGOTlA TIONS FOR 0.40 hrs. $84.00 

SElrLEMENTOF 2010, 2011 AND2012 
PA TRI OT COURTYARDS 

08127/2014 WORK ON SETI"LEMENT OF 2009 EEC 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
PARTNERS 

08/27/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. 563.00 
APPRAISER RE: 2012 THE BARKING LOT 

08/29/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
TAXPAYER'S A TIORNEY RE: THE BARKING 
LOT 

09/0212014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 NORTHBROOK 
COURT PROFESSIONAL PARTNERS 

0910212014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 IPM PLUS 

09/02/2014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
CONFERENCE RE: PROPERTY DYNAMICS 

09/0212014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE'S 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

ATTORNEY RE: ALLSTATE 

09/02/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS 
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Total Fees $7,812.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $7,812.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $7,812.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 57,812.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

FloMmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-67(;,(j Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragMauser.com 

September 04, 2014 
Bill Through 09!30/2014 

lnvoice# 13-418 ATS 

/ 

BOARD OF EDUCATION CIJ.enl Number Z6670 

GLTh'BROOK !-UGH SCHOOL DISTRlCT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVrEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATfER 

Matter Numbo!r O 

$42.00 

$42 00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, !llinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

V."NW .sragahauser.com 

September 04, 2014 
Bill Through 09/30/2014 
Invoice# 13418 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

MauerNumber O 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

COllflO!:NTIAL 
AllORN!:Y-CLIETff 
PRl~ILEGE 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENOERGD 

08/2212014 REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM 
~REGARDING COMl'ETIT!VE 
BIDDING 

Total Fees 

Il!LLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR T!IIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.20 hrs. S42.00 

$42.00 

$42.00 

$42.00 

$42.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC ) 
19730 Governors Higlnvay - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

December 05, 2014 
Bill Through 11/30/2014 

Invoice# 14131 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATJON Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRlCT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, JL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

llECEl VE!J ,;;:_~· ; Q ~J14 

26670 

0 

I~ 
//,/31/ 
;' / 

S42.00 

$42 00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

'N'lv,v.sragahauscr.com 

December 05, 2014 
Bill Through 11/30/2014 
Invoice# 14131 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATT0RNEY-CU£HT 
PRIVILEGE 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

11/12/2014 E-CORRESPONDENCE TO AUl)ITORS RE: 
UPDATE ON ANNUAL AUDIT INQUIRY 
LETTER PRIOR TO ISSUANCE OF AUDIT 

Tol3l fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

Mutter Number O 

0.20 hrs. S42.00 

542.00 

542.00 

542.00 

542.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highv,1ay - Suite l O 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

ww"•.sragahauscr.com 

December 05, 2014 
Bill Through 11/30/2014 

Invoice# 14133 JMT 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DJSTR1CT225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENV!EW, IL 60026-1241 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

1u,:c1,:.1 v ~: n 1['.' ; ,'' ,, 11 .,,· . ' I·' . 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

26670 

01 

,,....,, 
tl,J'iuf 

' , 

$3,801.00 

S3,801 00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

December 05, 2014 
Bill Through 11/30/2014 
Invoice# 14133 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTR1CT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

MallerNumber Ol 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATiORIIEV-CllrnT 
PRIVILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

11103/2014 

11/03/2014 

11/04/2014 

11/04/2014 

11/04/2014 

l 1/05/2014 

11/05/2014 

1110612014 

l 110612014 

11/0612014 

ll/0612014 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE2012 

UPDATE FILE WITH STATUS OF REPORT RE: 
201 I COM ED 

TELEl'HONECONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: MACY'S 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: NEJMAN 
MARCUS 

MEETING WITH STATE'S ATrORNEY RE: 
POSSlllLE SETTLEMENT !'OR ALLSTATE:: 
SPO 

PREPARE FOR STATUS HEARING ON RATC: 
OBJECTIONS 

WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT FOR 
ALLSTATE SPO 

LJPDA TE FILE WITH STATUS OF 
STIPULATION AT THE BOARD OJ' REVJEW 
RE: 2009 VALLEY LO 

UPDATE FJLE WITH STATUS OF 
STIPULATION AT BOARD OF REVIEW RE: 
2009 NORTHBROOK COURT PROFESSIONAL 
PARTNERS 

UPDATE Fl LE WITH STATUS OF 
STIPULATION AT BOARD OF REVIEW RE: 
2009 PROPERTY DYNAMICS 

UPDATE FJLE WITH STATUS OF 
STIPULATION AT BOARD OF REVIEW RE: 
2009 !PM PLUS 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

S210.00 

$42.00 

S210.00 

;h63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 
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11/07/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
STATUS DA TE FOR CONSOLIDATED SALES 
RAT!O CASES 

11/10/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S AITORNEY RE: 2010 JOHN'S 
COURT BUILDINGS 

11110/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER"S ATTORNEY RE: COM ED 

1111012014 WORK ON MULTI-YEAR SETILEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

MACY'S 

l 1/1112014 PREPARE POTENTIAL. SETTLEMENT 1.00 hrs. S210.00 
V AL\JES AND PAYMENT PLAN FOR 
ALLSTATE 

1111112014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.00 hrs. NIC 

APPRAISER RE: 2009 TECHNY EST A TES 

ll/ll/2014 UPDATE fILE WITH STATUS Of APPEAL 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
FOR 2009 DOWN YORK AND EARi, GREY 
ENTERPRISES 

11/11/2014 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S AITORNEY TO SEND 
STIPULATION FOR 20 I 0, 20 11 AND 2012 THE 
BARKING LOT 

1111112014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. 563.00 
TAXPAYER"S AITORNEY RE: 2012 COM ED 

11113/2014 WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

VALUE fOR 2009 MINOGUE, JEFF 

11/13/2014 WORK ON ro·1 ENTIAL SEITLEMENT 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
VALUE FOR 2009 3170 MACARTHUR, LLC 

l 1/1312014 WORK ON POTENTIAL SEITLEMENT 0.40 lirs. $84.00 

VALUE FOR 2009 HILLING ER, ROBERT 

l 1/1412014 PREPARE FOR AND AITEND COURT DATE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
RE: CONSOLIDATED SALES RATIO CASES 
MOTIONS 

l 1/1712014 TELEPHONECONfERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATfORNEY RE: 2009 
MINOGUE, JEFF 

11/17/2014 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND 0.50 hrs. SlOS.00 
SEITLEMENT SCENARIO LOSSES IN 
REVENUE AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT RE: 
SEITLEMENT FOR 2009 Mll\OGUE, JEFf 

11/17/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.20 lirs. $42.00 

DEERFIELD PARK DISTRICT RE: 2012 
WALGREEN'S 

11118/2014 UPDATE FJLE WITH STIPUL.A TION FOR 2009 0.20 hrs. $42.00 

MINOGUE, JEFF 
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11/1812014 SITE VISIT AND INSPECTION WITH 

1.00 hrs. 5210.00 TAXPAYER AND APPRAISER TO 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

ll/18/2014 EXECUTE STIPULATJON AND DRAFT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
ATTORNEY RE, ACCEPTANCE OF 
SETTLEMENT ON 2009 MINOGUE, JEFF 

ll/18/2014 UPDATE f!LE WITH STATUS ON 2009 
PROLOG!S 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

11120/2014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TOT AXPA YER'S 
ATTORNEY FOR STIPULATION ON THE 
BARKING LOT 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

I ]12012014 MEETJNG WITH STATE'S ATTORNEY 
REGARDING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS 
RE: ALLSTATE 

1.50 hrs. $315.00 

11/24120 14 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.20 hrs $42.00 TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: TECHNY 
ES"l'A TES PTA13 APPEAL 

I 112412014 UPDATE flLE WITH FINAL ORDER AND 
VERIFY VALUE WITH STIPULATION RE: 
2009 DUNDEE ALBANY 

0.40 hrs. $84.00 

J 1/24/2014 TELEPHONE co;,.,'FERENCE WITlf 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE2009 TECHNY 
ESTATE'S 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

11/2512014 PREPARE FOR PTAB HEARING ON 2009 
TECHNY ESTATES 

1.00 hrs. $210.00 

l l/25/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.50 hrs. $ I 05.00 TAXPAYER"S AD'ORNEY WIT!! OFFER OF 
SETTLEMENT, CALCULATE AV VALUES 
AND LOSSES WITH STJPULA TION AND 
DRAFT CORRESPOl\"DENCE TO TO\\!NSl-l!P 
RE: 2009 TECHNY EST A TES 

11126/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY FOR STIPULATION 
ON 2009 TECHNY ESTATES 

I 1/26/2014 PREPARE fOR PTAll HEARING ON 2009 
HILLING ER l.00 hrs. 5210.00 

----------------
Total Fees $3,801.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 
$3,801.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 
$3,801.00 
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TOTAL BALANCE DUE $3,801.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

flossrnoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

v.ww.sragahauser .com 

December 05, 2014 
Bill Through l 113012014 

Invoice# 14132 ATS 

GLENI3ROOK HIGH SCHOOL DJSTRJCT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 RECE1VE" 0[ .. ,.., -c 1 () 2014 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

26670 

OJ 

$4,557.00 

----------------
$4.557 00 
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l l/04/2014 PREPARE NOTICE OF fNSUFFICIENCY IN 0.50 hrs. $105.00 q.Y7 

RESPONSE TO PARENT'~L 
CORRESPONDENCE TO 
REGARDING NEEDED INFORMATION RE:-

,21.ooqr 11/04/2014 REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.10 hrs. 
REGARDING RECENT 

STUDENT RECORDS RE:. 

S6J.ooqP 11/05/2014 REVIEW PARENT'S JEE REQUEST AND 0.30 hrs. 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING SAME; REVIEW RULING ON 
DISTRICT'S NOTICE OF INSUFFICIENCY OF 
DPCN AND E·CORRESPONDENCE WITH-
-REGARDING SAME RE·-

$42.ooqf 11/05/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH- 0.20 hrs . 
.... REGARDING UPCOMING IEP AND 
RESOLUTION MEETINGS RE:. 

$105.00 qP 11/06/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH- 0.50 ho . 
....,REGARDING PENDING SPECIAL 
EDUCATION MA TIERS(-) 

$21.00~ 11/06/2014 REVIEW E-MAIL FROM SOUTH CAMPUS O. l O hrs. 
THERAPIST RE: 9JREVIEW 
HOME-SCHOOL E-MAILS AND 
NOTIFICATION OF 11110/14 IEP 
CONFERENCE RE:. 

$21.00 qf l 1/0812014 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ISBE'S 0.10 hrs. 
~REGARDING REQUIRED 
RESOLUTION SESSION RE:. 

11/09/2014 DRAFT NARRATIVE FOR CROSS DUE 3.50 hrs. 5735.00 qf 
PROCESS COMPLAINT REGARDING 
PARENT REQUEST FOR INDEPENDENT 
EVALUATION; E-MAIL CORRESPONDEl\'CE 
TO REGARDING SAME 
RE:-

11/09/2014 WORK ON SUMMARY OF ASSESSMENT 1.30 hrs. $273.ooq:7 
DATA OF STUDENT'S MATH SKILLS 
REGARDING PARENT REQUEST FOR 
INDEPENDENT EVALUATION RE·· 

s21.ooqf 11/10/2014 REVIEW PARENrs AMENDED DPCN AND 0.10 hrs. 
RELATED E-MAIL FROM !HO RISEN RE. 

11/10/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VITI-I 0.30 hrs. $6J.oq9 
REGARDING DRAFT 

CROSS-DPCN, PARENT'S AMENDED DPCN, 
AND RESPONSE TO SAME RE:-

11/10/2014 COMPLETE WORK 0:-,/ CROSS DUE PROCESS 1.50 hrs. $315.00 qr 
COMPLAINT; E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE 
ISBE'S-REGARDINO SAME RE:. 
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11/10/2014 REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL 0.20 hrs. $42.00 q '{' 

CORRESPONDENCE FROM~ 
..... REGARDING RESPONSE TO 
PARENT REQUEST FOR !EE RE:. 

$21.00 qP 
1111112014 REVIEW AMENDED DUE PROCESS 0. t O hrs. 

REQUEST FILED BY PARENT RE:. 

s210.ooqP 1111112014 PREPARE INITIAL DUE PROCESS LETTERS 1.00 hrs. 

RE:. 

1111112014 BEGIN WORK ON RESPONSE TO AMENDED 1.00 hrs. s210.oosP 

DPCN RE:. 

1111112014 WORK ON UPDATE TO AUDITOR'S LETTER 0.30 hrs. $63.00 qf 
RE:. 

s21.ocqf 11/12/2014 £-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 0.10 hrs. 

ATTORNEY REGARDING FINAL 
EXECUTION OF SETTLEMENT BY PARENTS 

RE:-

1111212014 REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM 0.10 he $21.00 qr 
REGARDING 

STUDENT RECORDS SINCE FEBRUARY 2014 
RE:. 

$42.00 qf 
l l/1212014 REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL 0.20 hrs. 

CORRESPONDENCE FROM-
~REGARDING RESPONSE TO 
PARENT REQUEST FOR EVALUATION AND 
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION TO INCLUDE 
IN SAME RE:. 

$42.ooC:\( 
11/1212014 REVIEW PARENT'S RESPONSE TO 0.20 hrs. 

CROSS-DPCN RE:. 

1111212014 E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO~ 0.10 hrs. $21.00 c;-r 
REGARDTNG 

NEEDED STUDENT RECORDS RE-

l l/1212014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.10 hrs. $21.00 yf 
REGARDING NOTICE 

TO PARENT OF DECISION REGARDING 
REQUEST FOR RE-EVALUATION; REVIEW 
SAME AND E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 

REGARDING 
SUGGESTED REVISION 

1111312014 REVIEW HOME-SCHOOi. E-MAILS O. l O hrs. 52100 qf 
REGARDING ALLEGED IRREGULARITIES IN 
I lll0/14 IIEP REI £-CORRESPONDENCE 
WITH REGARDING NEXT 
BOARD MEETlNG DA TE FOR FINAL 
EXECUTION OF SETTLEMENT RE-
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11/14/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH AND 0.30 hrs. ,,3.00 qr 
DRAFT E-MAIL TO PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING TIME LINE FOR BOARD 
EXECUTION OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH IHO 
REGARDING PARTIES' JOINT MOTION FOR 
FURTHER CONT!NUANCEOF DUE PROCESS 
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL OF 
SETTLEMENT RE:. 

S273.00 qv I l/l6/2014 REVIEW ADDJTIONAL RECORDS FOR 1.30 hrs. 
RESPONSE TO AMENDED DPCN RE-

$294.004 l 111712014 WORK ON RESPONSE TO AMENDED DPCN 1.40 hrs. 
RE:. 

11/18/2014 REVIEW ADDITIONAL RECORDS AND 2.30 hrs. $483.00~ "() 
CONTINUE TO WORK ON RESPONSE TO 
AMENDED DPCN; E-MAIL 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ..... 
- REGARDING SAME RE;. 

521.00 qp l l/19/2014 £-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 0.10 hrs. 
REGARDING PARENT REQUEST TO RECORD 
RESOLUTION SESSION AND POTENTIAL 
DELAY TO PERMIT FAMILY ATTENDANCE 
IN PERSON VS. TELEPHONICALLY RE:. 

11/19/2014 PREPARE FINAL RESPONSE TO AMENOC:D 0.20 hrs. $42.0qf 
Dl'CN; E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 
HEARING OFFICER AND PARENTS 
REGARDING SAME RE. 

11119no14 REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM 0.10 hrs. $21.00 ~ 
REGARDING RECEIPT 

OF MEDICAL CERTIFJCA TION RE:-

l l/2012014 REVIEW ORDER ON CONTINUANCE FROM 1.00 hrs. $210.00 0{) 
JIIO RE:- REVIEW E-MAIL 
FROM REGARDING 
RESOLUTION WARNIJ\'G NOTICE AND 
FROM PARENT REGARDING MULTIPLE 
ISSUES RE:.WORK ON TUITION 
REIMBURSEMENT REQ~ 
REVIEW E-MAIL FROM 
REGARDING UNILATERAL PLACEMENT 
HISTORY AND DRAFT LEITER AND E-MAIL 
TO PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
DISTRICT'S RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR 
REIMBURSEMENT R~ONE 
CONFER.ENCE WITH 
REGARDING~AND~ATTERS 

$63.00~ 11/2112014 REVIEW RESOLUTION AND !EP MATERIALS 0.30 hrs. 
RECEIVED FRO~RE:-
REVIEW PROGRESS REPORT FROM DAY 
SCHOOL RE:. 



Z6670 

11/2412014 
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1112512014 

11/2812014 

11130/2014 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

REVIEW E-MAIL FROM JSllE'S 
REGARDING RETRACTION OF RESOLUTION 
WARNING NOTICE RE,. 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS FROM 
P,\RENT AND ll·l~REGARDING 
PARENTS' REQUEST FOR CONTINUANCE 
AND WITHDRAWAL OF IEE REQUEST; 
REVIEW E-MAILS REGARDING 
HOMEBOUND INSTRUCTION AND RELATED 
MATTERS RE:. REVIEW E-MAILS FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY, AND 
-REGARDING STATUS OF FINAL 
EXECUTION OF SETTLEMENT RE:. 
REVIEW RECORDS REQUEST AND 
UNILATERAL PLACEMENT NOTICE RE .• 

£-CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING 
CONTINUANCE OF DUE PROCESS RE,. 

DRAFT E-MAIL TO PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING FINAL EXECUTION OF 
SETTLEMENT AND WITHDRAWAL OF DPCN 
RE:. 

Total Fees 

TOTAL l'EES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DIJE 

0.10 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

$21.00 ctr 
S63.00 C\f 

S21.00 q.P 
$21.00 ~ 

$4,557.00 

$4,557.00 

$4,557.00 

S4,557.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, lllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

v,rwv,•.srngahauscr.com 

November 06, 2014 
Bill Through 10/3112014 

Invoice# 13955 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATIO:-l Client Number 26670 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTR1CT225 Matter Number O 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, TL 60026-124\ 'fRCflVf.O OEC 1 (I lOl·I 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Sl,617.00 

St,617.00 

I ,(7.{.v() -·_ 
,, ... ~ .... 

I : , ·_ . f-l-'J-/ 

; ,, 
. ·'C ., < 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite l O 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .sragalrnuser.com 

November 06, 2014 
Bill Through 10/31/2014 
Invoice# 13955 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Clienl Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL D!STR1CT225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 

SUITE 200 cormornTIAl 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 A HORNEY-CLIENT 

PRIVILEGE 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

1010112014 

10/01/2014 

10/08/2014 

10/09/2014 

10/10/2014 

1011312014 

10114/2014 

1011512014 

10/16/2014 

WORK ON RESPONSE TO ANNUAL. 
AUDITOR'S INQUIRY l..ETTER 

WORK ON RESPONSE TO REQUEST l'OR 
ANNUAL AUDJTOR'S LETTER 

'R•E•V•'•E·w·v·o·, c.,.-1MiiA11'•L•M11Ei1SiiS,\G E FROM -
• RE: STUDENT 
CLUB ISSUE; REVIEW EQUAL ACCESS ACT 
PROVISIONS· TELEP! IONE CONFERENCE 
\VlTH RE: SAME 

REVIEW E-MAILS OETWEE~ 
ANO PARENT REGARDING ONGOING 
STUDENT DISABILITY Cl..ASSIFICATION 
AND SCHOOL ATTENDANCE ISSUES RE:­

BEGIN WORK ON EQUAL. ACCESS ACT 
CLUB ISSUE RAISED BY -RESEARCH ISSUE RELATED TO EQUAL 
ACCESS ACT 

CONTINUE TO RESEARCH STUDENT CLUB 
ISSUE UNDER EQUAL ACCE.SS ACT 

EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE \VITll­
~REGARDING EQUAL ACCESS 
QUESTION 

REVIEW CUSTODIAL CONTRACT; 
RESEARCH CONTRACT LAW 

Total Fees 

IHLLING SUMMARY 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.60 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

1.80 hrs. 

1.70 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

2.20 hrs. 

$63.00 i1v 
$ I 05.00 ~ 

$126.00 .v<: 

$42.00 9 to 

S42.00 

S378.00 

$357.00 

$1,617.00 



L.6670 DISTR1CT 225 - COOK 
TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOT AL BALANCE DUE 

Invoice# 13955 Page 2 
Sl,617.00 

$1,617.00 

Sl,617,00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

January 09, 2015 
Dill Through 12131/2014 

Invoice# 14360 CNS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRJCT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL U\1/1/ 

TOTAL l'EES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

INVOICE APPROVAL 
T PROVED 

Z6670 

0 

$504.00 

$504.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Jllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizw.com 

January 09, 2015 
Bill Through 12/31/2014 
Invoice# 14360 CNS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 

SUITE 200 ,:ormDENTIAL 

GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 Al! U:lt,EY-CliENT 
Pfm'llf.GE 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVJCES RENDERED 

12/02/2014 

1210912014 

12/09/2014 

12/22/2014 

REVIEW 13RIGl-!TBYTES SERVICE 
AGREEMENT; REVIEW ON-LINE TERMS 
AND CONDITIONS; DRAFT EMAIL TO 
CLTENT 

WORK ON AUDIT UPDATE 

REVIEW AND REPLY TO 
£-CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
-RE, STATUS OF REPLY TO AUDITORS 
CONCERNING REQUESTED UPDATE (NO 
CHARGE PER ALAN T. SRAGA) 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM 
~REGARDING EMPLOYEE 
CONTRACTS 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

2.00 hrs.\@f $420.00 

0.20 hrs.~ 542.00 

0.20 hrs. '{0/ N/C 

0.20 hrs.\&Lf $42.00 

5504.00 

$504.00 

$504.00 

5504.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserino.com 

January 09, 2015 
Bill Tlrrough 1213\/2014 

Invoice# 14361 CNS 

BOARD Ol' EDUC A T!ON 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRJCT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATfER 

Client Number 

Metter Number 

1-i~ 
l/'63/f 
/ ,/ 

/ 

Z6670 

03 

$168.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite l O 

Flossmoor, lllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauseriao.com 

January09,2015 
Bill Through 12/31/2014 
Invoice# 14361 CNS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE A VENUE 

Maner Number 03 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

cmm orn11AL 
AllORIIEY-CLIWT 
PRl~lllGE 

SPECIAL EDU CA T!ON MATTERS 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

12/01/2014 

12/0212014 

12/03/2014 

12/04/2014 

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY AND IHO 
REGARDING WITHDRAWAL OF DUE 
PROCESS REQUEST RE:-

REVIEW E-MAILS FROM PARENT AND 
ATTORNEY REGARDING STATUS OF 
DISTRICT'S REEVALUATION AND 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDTNG SAME RE:­

REV]E,\V ISllE CONTINUANCE ORDER AND 
PRE-HEAR])\'G CONFERENCE SCl-!EDULE 
AND E-MAIL REGARDING 
SAME RE:.E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
PARENT'S AlTORNEY AND 
REGARDING STATUS OF COMPLETION Of­
PSYCHIATRIC EVALUATION RE:­

DRAFT E-MAIL TO IHO~REGARDING 
1116/15 PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE RE­
DRAFT DISTRICT'S RESPONSE TO 
UNIL,\TERAL PLACEMENT},'OT!CE RE:. 
AND E-MAIL TO PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING STUDENT REGISTRATION RE· -12/04/2014 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY RE:.AND. MATTERS 

Total Fees 

0.10 $21.00 

0.10 hrsq? $21.00 

0.10 hr~p $21.00 

0.40 hrs. qf S84.00 

0.10 hrs. ef $21.00 

Sl68.00 

$168.00 
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TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MA TIER $168.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $168.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 fax: (708) 799-6866 

WW\V.hauserizzo.com 

January 09, 2015 
Bill Through 12/31/2014 

Invoice# 14385 JMl 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATfER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

26670 

Ol 

54,095.00 

----------------
$4,095 00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: {708) 799-6766 fax: {708) 799-6866 

\Vl.Vw.h.auscrizw.com 

January 09, 2015 
Bill Through 12/3112014 
Invoice# 14385 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

01 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CO~FIDEIHIAL 
ATlORIIEY-CUrnT 
PRNILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

12101/2014 

12/0112014 

12/0\12014 

1210212014 

l 210312014 

12105/2014 

12108/2014 

]210812014 

12/0812014 

12/08/2014 

12/0912014 

Ul'DA TE FILE \\IITJ-1 PARK DISTRICT 
ADOPTION Of SCHOOi, DISTRICT 
EVIDENCE AND BOARD OF REVIEW NOTES 
ON APPEAL RE: 2012 WALGREENS 

DRAfT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 
fAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY TO SEND 
STll'ULA TION ON 2009 TECI-INY ESTA TES 

EXECUTE STIPULATION AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
ATTORNEY RE: 2009 TECHNY ESTATES 

UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 
ACCEPTANCE OF STlPULATION AND 
CANCELLATION OF HEARING REc TECHNY 
ESTATES 

UPDATE FILE WITH APPROVAL OF 
SETTLEMENT ANO LETTER FROM HEARING 
OFFICER CALLING OFF l·IE,\RING ON 
TECHNY ESTATES 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND PTAB 
1-IEAR!NG ON PRESENT STIPULA TIO"N RE: 
2009 TECHNY ESTATES 

RE-EXECUTE STIPULATION FOR 2009 
PROPERTY DYNAMICS 

RE-EXECUTE STJPULA TJON FOR 2010 
PROPERTY DY}IAMICS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WIT! I 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: WAI.GREENS 

TELEP I IONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: MACY'S 

UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB PRE-1-lEARING 
CONfERENCE RE: 2009 FRANK PINTZ 

0.30 hrs 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

l .50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 he. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

$63.00 

S63.00 

$63.00 

S6J.00 

$63.00 

$315.00 

$63.00 

S63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 
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12/09/2014 UPDATE FILE W!TH PTAB PRE-HEARING 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 RICHARD LOUNDY 

1210912014 UPDATE FILE W!TH PTAB PRE-I-I EARING 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 JOHN'S COURT 
BUILDINGS II 

12/09/2014 UPDATE FJLE WITH !'TAB PRE-HEARING 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

CONFERENCE RE: 2009 JOHN'S COURT 
BUILDINGS I 

12109/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH REI3Ul1'AL EVIDENCE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

FROM TAXPAYER RE: 2012 -12109/2014 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: STIPULATION 
FOR THE BARKING LOT 

12/09/2014 UPDATE fIL E WITH ST A TUS OF REBUTTAL 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

RE: 2012 WALGREENS 

12111/2014 WORK ON POTENTIAL MULTI-YEAR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

SETTLEMENT FOR MACY'S 

12111/20!4 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. S63.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: THE NEIMAN 
MARCUS GROUP 

12/1112014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTH 0.20 hrs. $42.00 

TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY Rf:: INTERVENOR 
OFFER TO SETTLE NEIMAN MARCUS 
GROUP 

]2/] l/2014 ATTEND RATE OBJECTION STATUS CALL 0.10 hrs. $21.00 

12112/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

RE: LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT SALES RATIO 
CONSOLI DA TED CASES 

12/1212014 PREPARE FOR l'TAB PRE-HEARING 0.40 hrs. 584.00 

CONFERENCE RE: JOHN'S COURT 8UILDING 

' 
12112/2014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE-HEARING 0.40 hrs. $84.00 

CONFERENCE RE: JOHN'S COURT BU!LDIJ\'G 

" 
12112/2014 PREPARE FOR PT AB PRE-HEARING 0.40 hrs. $84.00 

CONFERENCE RE: RICHARD LOUNDY 

I 2/l 2/2014 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE-HEARING 0.40 hrs. $84.00 

CONFERENCE RE: FRANK PINTZ 

12/16/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER ATfORNEY RE: 2009 FRANK 
PINTZ 

12116/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WIT! I 0.30 hrs. S63.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2009 RICHARD 
LOUNDY 
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12/1612014 TELEPIIONECONFERENCE \VlTH 0.30 he. $63.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: TWO 2009 
JOHNS COURT BUILDINGS, LLC CASES 

12116/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 he. $63.00 
TAXPAYER A'ITORNEY RE· 2012 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

12/1612014 WORK ON MULTI· YEAR SErrLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. S l 05.00 

MACY'S 

12/1712014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: \VALGREENS 

1211712014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT 2.00 hrs. S420.00 

CONFERENCE RE: ALLSTATE 

1211912014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
RE: STATUS OF DISCOVERY ON SPO CASES 

1212212014 UPDATE FILE WITH STATlJS OF 0.30 h,s. $63.00 
INTERVENOR PROPOSED STIPULATION RE: 
2012 NEIMAN MARCUS GROUP 

1212212014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

ATTORNEY FOR STIPULATION RE; THE 
8,\RKING LOT 

1212212014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: POSSIBLE 
SE'ITLEMENT FOR2009 LORD & TAYIDR 

1212312014 WORK ON MULTI-YEAR SE'ITLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

MACY'S 

1212912014 PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING CONf'ERENCE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

ON 2009 JOHN'S COURT GUILDINGS I AND II 

1212912014 PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING CONFERENCE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

ON 2009 LOUNDY, RICHARD 

1212912014 PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING CONFERENCE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

ON 2009 P!NTZ, FRANK 

1213012014 UPDATE FILE WITH POSStBLE 
SETTLEMENT FOR 2012--

0.70 hrs. $147.00 

1213012014 WORK ON WALGREEN SEn"LEMENT IN 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

PTAB AND CIRCUIT COURT 

1213012014 UPDATE FILE WITH STATUS OF 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

STJPULATION RE: 2012 PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS 

1213012014 MEETING WITH STATE'S ATTORNEY 1.50 hrs. $315.00 

REGARDING POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT 
SCENARIOS RE: ALLSTATE 

--------------·· 
Total Fees $4,095.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 



Z6670 DlSTRlCT 225 - COOK 
TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

Invoice# 14385 Page 4 
$4,095.00 

$4,095.00 

54,095.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799·6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

February 11, 2015 
Bill Through 01/31!2015 

Invoice# 14582 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Metter Number 

' ' 

Z6670 

01 

/l.rf>1f 

' ,/ 

$5, 103.00 

$5, 103 00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway • Sui le 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

V.'Ww.hauserizzo.com 

February 11, 2015 
Bill Through 01/31/2015 
invoice# 14582 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 01 

SUITE 200 
GLENVJEW, JL 60026-1241 

CONFIDtNTIAl 
ATIORliEY-CLIHH 
PRIVllEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

01/0612015 

01/06/2015 

01/06/2015 

01/06/2015 

01/07/2015 

01/07/2015 

01/08/2015 

01/09/2015 

01/0912015 

Ol/09/2015 

01/09/2015 

01/12/2015 

COMPILE CHART OF CURRENTI.Y OPEN 
PTAB CASES AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO BUSINESS 
MANAGER RE· YEAR END SUMMARY Of 
OPEN PTA!l CASES 

PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING CONFERENCE 
ON JOHN'S COURT BUii.DINGS 3058~ AND 
30651 

PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING CONFERENCE 
ON 2009 RICHARD LOUNDY 

PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING CONFERENCE 
ON 2009 FRANK PJNTZ 

TEI.EPHONECONfERENCE WITH 
TAXl'A YER'S ATTORNEY RE: Tl-IE BARKING 
COT 

WORK ON ALLSTATE SPO 

REVIEW NOTICE Of APPEAL ON THE 
BARKING LOT(2013); WORK ON REVENUE 
CA LC ULA TJONS; EMAIL DISTRICTS 

WORK ON PTAB INTERVENTION ON THE 
BARKING LOT (2013) 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 
fOR SALES RATIO CASES 

UPDATE FILE AND CHART WITH 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION RE: 
2013 THE BARKING LOT 

DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 
TAXPAYER A n·oRNEY RE: THE FJARKINO 
COT 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR TWO 2009 
JOHN'S COURT PROPERTIES 

0.40 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.60 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

$84.00 

$84.00 

$84.00 

$63.00 

563.00 

$126.00 

$105.00 

$42.00 

584.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$84.00 
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OJ/!2/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2012 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

01113/2015 PREPARE FOR PRE HEARJNG CONFERENCE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ON 2009 JOHN'S COURT BUILDINGS I 

01/1312015 PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING CONFERENCE 0.70 hrs. $147.00 
ON 2009 JOHN'S COURT BUILDINGS II 

01/13/2015 PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING CONFERENCE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ON 2009 RICHARD LOUNOY 

01/1312015 PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING CONFERENCE 0.30 lus. $63.00 
ON 2009 FRANK PINTZ 

01/14/2015 A TT END PTAB PREHEARING CONFERENCE 1.60 hrs. $336.00 
RE: JOHNS COURT BUILDINGS, RICHARD 
LOUNDY, AND FRANK PINTZ 

01/15/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hr:;. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: LAKE COOK 
TERRACE 

01/16/2015 REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
ON MACY'S; WORK ON REVENUE LOSS 
CALCULATIONS; EXCHANGE EMAii. 
MESSAGES WITH DISTRICT 

01/16/2015 WORK ON PTAB INTERVENTION ON 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
MACY'S 

0!116/2015 UPDATE FILE AND CHART WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION RE: 
2013 MACY'S 

01/16/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ON STATUS OF DISCOVERY RE: 
CONSOUDA TED SALES RA TIO SPO CASES 

01/19/2015 WORK ON MULTI YEAR SETTLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

01/20/2015 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE Tl IE BARKING 
LOT 

01/20/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTH 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
TAX PA YER ATTORNEY REc 2009 LOUNDY 

01/2012015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VITI I 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2009 PINTZ, 
FRANK 

01/20/2015 CALCULATE AV DIFFERENCE AND LOSSES 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
WITH NEW EVIDENCE SUBMITTED BY 
TAXPAYER AND ACCEPTED BY PTAB AND 
SETTLEMENT SCENARIOS AND 
SETTLEMENT JN CIRCUIT COURT RE: 2009 
LOUNDY, RICHARD 

0] /2012015 UPDATE FILE WITH NEW STATUS DATE ON 0.30 lrrs. $63.00 
ALLSTATE SPO 
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01/20/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WJTH 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
APPELLANT'S ATTORNEY SERGO 
REGARDING PTAB SETTLEMENT RE: 
RICHARD LOUNDY AND FRANK l'!NTZ 

01/21/2015 MEETING WITH STATE'S ATTORNEY RE: 1.20 hrs. $252.00 
SETTLEMENT POSS!BILITIES FOR 
ALLSTATE 

OJ/21/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2009 LOUNDY, 
RICHARD 

01/21/2015 WORK.ON SETTLEMENT OF JOHN'S COURT 0.50 hrs. SlOS.00 
BUILDINGS 

01/2112015 TELEPI IONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.60 hrs. $]26.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY TO NEGOTIATE 
SETTLEMENT, CA LC ULA TE AV VALUES 
,\ND LOSSES WITH SETTLEMENT 
SCENARIOS AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: 2009 PJNTZ, FRANK 

01/21/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH AND 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
APPELLANT'S A 1TORNEY SERGO 
REGAR.DING PT All SETTLEMENT RE: 
FRANK PJNTZ 

01/22/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF 2009 LOUNDY, 0.50 hrs. $ l 05.00 
RICHARD 

01/2212015 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND DA TE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW TAXPAYER'S 
APPRAISAL REPORT RE: 2013 THE BARKING 
LOT 

01122/2015 CALCULATE POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
LOSSES ON 2013 MACY'S 

01/22/2015 CALCULATE AV VALVES AND LOSSES 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
WITH SETTLEMENT VALUE AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: LOUNDY, RICHARD 

01/2212015 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
APPELLANT'S ATTORNEY SERGO 
REGARDING PTAB SETTLEMENl' RE: 
RICHARD LOUNDY AND FRANK PINTZ 

01123/2015 PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT STATUS 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
COURT DATE ON CONSOLIDATED SALES 
RATIO CASES 

01/2612015 EXECUTE STlPULATJON AND DRAFT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CORRESPOC\'DENCE TO STATE'S ATTORNEY 
RE: 2004 LOUNDY, RICHARD 
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01/26/2015 EXECUTE STIPULA T!ON AND DRAFT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO STATE'S ATIORNEY 
RE: 2004 PINTZ, FRANK 

01/26/2015 UPDATE FILE AND REVIEW PTAB FINAL 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
ORDER AND VERJFY VALUE \VJTH FILE 
STIPULATION RE: 2012 PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS 

01/26/2015 UPDATE FILE AND REVIEW PTAB FINAL 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
ORDER AND VERIFY VALUE WITH FJLE 
STIPULA TJON RE: 2010 HEARTLAND PLAZA 

01/2612015 UPDATE FILE AND REVIEW PTAB FINAL 0.40 hrs. S84.00 
ORDER AND VERJFY VALUE WITH FILE 
ST!PULA TJON RE: 2009 ECC PARTNERS, LLC 

01/2612015 UPDATE FILE AND REVIEW PTAB FINAL 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
ORDER AND VERIFY VALUE WITH FILE 
STIPULA T!ON RE: 2009 HARBOR TECH 
CENTER 

01/26/2015 UPDATE FILE AND REVIEW PTAB FINAL 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
ORDER AND VERIFY VALUE WITH fl LE 
STIPULATION RE: 2009 !PM PLUS, LLC 

01126/2015 UPDATE flLEAND REVIEW PTAB FJNAL 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
ORDER AND VERIFY VALUE WITH FILE 
STIPULA TJON RE: 2009 HEARTLAND PLAZA 

01/2612015 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND REVIEW 0.50 hrs. $ I 05.00 
EXPERT'S PRELIMINARY ANALYSIS 
REPORT AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT RE: 2013 
THE BARKING LOT 

01126/2015 CALCULATE AV VALUES, LOSSES IN 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
REVENUE WITH SE-ITLEMENT SCENARIOS 
AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT RE: 
SETTLEMENT FOR JOHNS COURT 
BUILDINGS AT 2025 JOHN'S DRIVE 

01/2612015 CALCULATE AV VALUES, LOSSES !N 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
REVENUE WITH SElTLEMENT SCENARIOS 
AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT RE: 
SETTLEMENT FOR JOHNS COURT 
BUILDINGS AT 2075 JOHN'S DRIVE 

01/27/2015 WORK ON SETILEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. 5105.00 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

01/2712015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: MACY"S 

0112812015 EXCHAJ\"GE OF EMAILS WITH ASSISTANT 0.40 hrs. S84.00 
SUPERJNTENDENT RE: FIVE SEASONS 
PROPERTY 
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0112912015 

0112912015 

01/2912015 

01/29/2015 

01129/2015 

01/30/2015 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: JOHN'S 
COURT BUILDINGS STIPULATIONS 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
FOR FULL APPRAISAL REPORT TO SUBMIT 
AS INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 2013 THE 
BARKING LOT 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
FOR RESTRICTED USE REPORT OF MARKET 
VALUE RE: 2013 MACY'S 

UPOA TE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 
AND DATE TO FJLE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW APPRAISAL 
REPORT OF TAXPAYER RE: 2013 MACY'S 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: WALGREEN'S 

REVJE\V MOTION TO QUASH SUBPOENA OF 
MICHAEL KELLY FILED BY TAX PA YER 
ATTORNEY AND NOTICE OF DEPOSITJON 
OF ECONOMIST FOR !LL!NOIS APPRAISAL 
BOARD 

PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT COURT 
DATE FOR MOTION TO QUASH APPRAISER 
SUBPOENA FOR SALES RA TIO CASES 

Total Fees 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DVE 

0.JO hrs. $63.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.40 hrs. $84.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.10 hrs. $21.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

$5.1 03.00 

$5,103.00 

$5, l 03.00 

SS, 1 03.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite l O 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

March 06, 2015 
Bill Through 02/2812015 

!nvoice# 14720 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

INVOICE APPROVAL 
MATERIAL A APPROVED 

SIGN 

26670 

0 

$273.00 

$273 00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC ; 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illin01s 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

May 06, 2015 
Bill Through 04/30/2015 

Invoice# 14981 CLP 

··;,;·-, . . ,.;_ ::.--< "-« 
& l;._,n,,{_,l' .,, ,.,,-,. 

·-'1,''-:,·n n...~.i • • sf . . 
,·>< ·','. (',.( 

, . ' 
-.•(" .. ,,. ,, 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

Client Num 

Matter Number 0 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES $546.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATIER $546.00 

r'iAY '4Z015 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite JO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

Muy06,20JS 
Bill Through 04/30/2015 
Invoice# 14981 CLP 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-124! 

SCHOOL LAW 

CONFIDENTIAl 
ATTORNEY·CllrnT 
PRIVILEGE 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

Client Number 26670 

Mauer Number O 

04/24/2015 REVIEW AND REVISE AGREEMENT WITH 
ILUNOJS BONE AND JOINT SURGEONS: 

1.50 hrs. ~c..9f $315.00 

04127/20!5 

04/28/2015 

04/29120]5 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

REVIEW AGREEMENT 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GENERAL 
COUNSEL FOR ILLINOIS BONE AND JOINT 
SURGEONS REGARDING 
,....AGREEMENT; DRAFf EMAILS TO 
CLIENT 

DRAFT EMAIL TO COUNSEL FOR TLLINO!S 
BONE AND JO!NT INSTITUTE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE W!TH COUNSEL 
FOR JLLINOIS ~Q__JO!NT INSTITUTE; 
WORK ON~ 
AGREEMENT 

Total fees 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALAi\"CE DUE 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.20 hrs. $42.00 

0.60 hrs. $126.00 

$546.00 

$546.00 

$546.00 

$546.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .hauserizzo.com 

May06,20J5 
Bill Through 04/30/2015 

Invoice# 15038 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SU!TE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

RECEJ VEU MAY 1 4 2015 

INVOICE APPROVAL 
l~ATERIAL RC 

SIGN 

DATE £db£_ P.C·. No 
ACCT. No. /J,(}//-

O PARTIAL G"FtNAL E(No P.O. ---

26670 

01 

$5,859.00 

SS,859.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite JO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

May06,2015 
Bill Through 04/3012015 
Invoice# 15038 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Mauer Number OI 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
AlTORNl:¥-CUENT 

PROPERTY TAXES PRIVILEGE 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

04/01/2015 

04110/2015 

04/01/2015 

04/01/2015 

04/0212015 

04/02/2015 

04/0212015 

04/03/2015 

04/06/2015 

04/0612015 

04107/20]5 

04/0712015 

04107/2015 

RESEARCH DISTRICT FINANCIALS: EMAIL 
DISTRICT RE: LIMITED BONDS TAX RATE 
OBJECTIONS 

RESEARCH PLEADINGS ISSUE RE: LIMITED 
BONDS TAX OBJECTIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: 20111-'ATRIOT 
COURTYARDS 

WORK ON SE11'LEME/','T FOR 2011 
WALGREEN COMPANY 

WORK ON ALLSTATESPO 

TELEP!!ONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: STATUS OF REPORT ON 
2013 MACY'S 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE, 2010 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 
FOR CONSOLIDATED SALES RATIO CASES 

WORK ON STIPULATION FOR 2009 DOWN 
YORK AND EARL GREY 

TELEPHONE CONf'ERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: STATUS OF REPORT ON 
2013 MACY"S NORTHBROOK 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF MACY"S 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VITI-I 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

0.70 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hr>. 

0.30 hrs. 

$147.00 

$42.00 

563.00 

$105.00 

5210.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$84.00 

$105.00 

$63.00 

$105.00 

$105.00 

$63.00 
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04/0712015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER A TIORNEY RE: 2010 CHICAGO 
CAPITAL HOLDINGS 

04/07/2015 REVIEW MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN O.IO hrs. $21.00 
RESPONSE TO OBJECTOR'S MOTJON FOR 
SUMMARY JUDGMENT RE: RATE 
OBJECTION 

04/08/2015 REVIEW LEGAL MEMO ON LIMITED BOND 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
TAX OBJECTIONS 

04/09/2015 REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
ON MISSION HILLS GOLF COURSE 

04/09/2015 EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITH DR. 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
SIENA RE: BOND DOCUMENTS FOR RATE 
OBJECTIONS: WORK ON STORAGE 

04/09/2015 WORK ON PTAB INTERVENTION ON 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
MISSION HILLS GOLF COURSE 

04/10/20[5 WORK ON BOND RECORDS INDEX RE: 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
LIMITED BONDS TAX OBJECTIONS 

04/10/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYERATIORNEY RE: PTAB 
PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE 

04/10/2015 UPDATE CHART AND FILE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION RE: 
2012 MISSION HILLS GOLF COURSE 

04/13/2015 PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION OF HOR BAS 0.20 hrs. $42.00 

04/13/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB PRE HEARING 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CONFERENCE DATE RE: 2009 LAKE COOK 
TERRACE 

04/13/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB PRE HEARING 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CONFERENCE DATE RE: 2009 JER' 
MONOGUE 

04/13/2015 TELEl'HONECONFERENCE WITH 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
TAXPAYER A TIORNEY RE: FRANK 
ALLGAUER NEGATIONS FOR SETILEMENT 

04/13/2015 REVIEW COURT ORDER AND SUBPOENA 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
DOCUMENTATION RE: IN RE LEVEL 
ASSESSMENT Sl'O 

04/14/2015 REVIEW OBJECTORS' RESPONSE TO 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
MOTION TO SUBSTITUTE JUDGES ON 
LIMITED BONDS OBJECTION 

04/14/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VITI! 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: DOWN YORK 
AND EARL GREY 

04/l4/2015 WORK ON SETILEMENT WITH TAXPAYER'S 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
ATTORNEY RE: 201 I ALLGAUER 
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04/l5/2015 PREPARE FOR STATUS HEARING AND 0.20 hrs. $42.00 

PRESENTATION OF MOTION TO 
SUBSTITUTE JUDGES 

04/1512015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND PTAB PRE 1.50 hrs. $315.00 
HEARING CONFEREN"CE AND HOLD 
SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS REc 2009 
DOWN YORK AND EARL GREY 

04/15/2015 REVIEW RESPONSE TO MOTION FOR 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
SUBSTITUTION OF JUDGE RE: RATE 
OBJECTION 

04/l6/2015 MEETJNG WITH STATE"S ATTORNEY RE: 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
MOTION ARGUMENT ON LEVEL OF 
ASSESSMENT CASES 

04/1712015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTE..'>JD TELEPHONE 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY GROUP; 
EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITH 
ATTORNEYS 

04/1712015 PREPARE FOR AND A1TEND COURT DATE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND ARGUMENT ON LF..VEL OF 
ASSESSMENT CASES 

04/20/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $[05.00 
CONFERENCE RE 2009 JEFF MINOGUE 

04/20/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 LAKE COOK 
TERRACE 

04120/20I5 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAil WITH 0.30 hr.I. 563.00 
FILING OF Il'ffERVENOR EVIDENCE RE. 
2013 MACY'S NORTHBROOK 

04/20/2015 UPDATE FILE WJTH TAX PA YER EVJDENCE 0.40 he. $84.00 
AND DATE TO FILE fNTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW LEGAL 
ARGUMENT SET FORTH BY TAXPAYER RE. 
2012 M!SSION HILLS GOLF COURSE 

04/20/2015 NEGOTIATE POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT WITH 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY FOR 2009 DOWN 
YORK AND EARL GREY 

04/21/2015 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
SETTLEMENT SCENARIOS AND LOSSES 
WITH SETTLEMENT AND DRAFf 
CORRESPONDEN"CE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: 2009 DOWN YORK 
AND EARL GREY, LTD. 

04/21/2015 EXECUTE STJPULATION AND DRAFf 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
ATTORNEY RE; ACCEPTANCE ON 2009 
DOWN YORK AND EARL GREY 

04/21/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH CORRESPONDENCE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
FROM TAXPAYER TO BOARD OF REVIEW 
RE: 2009 JEFF MINOGUE STIPULATION 
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04/2112015 WORK ON LEGAL ARGUMENT ON MISSION 0.40 ho. $84.00 
HILLS GOLF COURSE TAX APPEAL 

04/2212015 MEETING WlTH TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: 1.30 hrs. $273.00 
SETILEMENT NEGOTIATIONS FOR 
ALLSTATE 

04122/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATIORNEY RE: 2009 LORD & 
TAYLOR 

04/2212015 REVIEW PT AB SUBMJSSIONS RE: MISSION 1.50 hrs. $3!5.00 
HILLS GOLF COURSE ASS ESSY/ENT 

04/23/2015 REVIEW DEFENSES FOR RE LEV ANT 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
EXHIBITS TO LIMITED BONDS OBJECTIONS 
MOTJON: PREPARE FOR AND A TIEND 
A TIORNEY GROUP MEETING 

04/23/2015 WORK ON POTENTIAL SETILEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
2009 LAKE COOK TERRACE 

04/23/2015 WORK ON POTENTIAL SETrLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
2009 JEFF MINOGUE 

04/23120!5 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTH 
TAXPAYER A TIORNEY RE: 2009 IIILLINGER 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

04/23/20!5 PREPARE FOR ATIORNEY GROUP MEETING 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
CONCERNING LIMITED BONDS 
OBJECTIONS EXHIBITS 

04/24/2015 WORK ON MOTION TO DISMISS LIMITED 0.30 hr~. $63.00 
BOND OBJECTION PLEADING 

04/24/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND DISCOVERY 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
STATUS DATE RE: LEVEL Of ASSESSMENT 
CONSOLIDATED CASES 

04/24/2015 WORK ON LEGAL ARGUMENT ON 2012 0.30 hri,. $63.00 
MISSION HILLS GOLF COURSE 

04124/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: STATUS OF REPORT 
AUTHORITY FOR 2011 PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS 

04/24/2015 COMPLETE INITIAL REVJEW OF 1.00 hrs. S2l0.00 
TAXPAYER'S PTAH SUBMISSIONS; REVIEW 
MISSION HJLLS WEBSITE RE: MISSION 
HILLS GOLF COURSE OPEN SPACE 
ASSESSMENT APPEAL 

04/27/2015 RESEARCH PLEADINGS DEFECTS IN 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
LIMITED BONDS OBJECTIONS 

04/27/2015 WORK ON DETERM!NA TION OF EXHIBITS 0.10 hrs. 521.00 
TO BE USED ON LIMITED BOND OBJECTION 

04/2712015 UPDATE FJLE WITH EXTENSION DATE TO 0.30 he. $63.00 
FILE L\JTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 2012 
MISSION HJLLS GOLF COURSE 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway . Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

w,vw.hauserizzo.com 

June04,2015 
Bill Through 05/31/2015 

Invoice# 15213 JMI 

BOARD OF EDU CA T!ON Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRJCT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVJEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

Z6670 

Ol 

TOTAL FEES RECEIVED JUN 1 5 2015 

TOTAL FEES FOR THJS MATTER 

$5,460.00 

$5,460 00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

June 04, 2015 
Bill Through 05/3\12015 
lnvoicell 15213 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE A VENUE cm:FIDHITIAl 

MaucrNumber 01 

SUITE 200 AllORNEY·CLIENT 
PlllVILEGE 

GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

0510\/2()15 

05/0112015 

05104/201 S 

05/04/2015 

05104/2015 

05105/2015 

05/0612015 

05/0612015 

05/07/2015 

05/07/2015 

05/07/2015 

WORK ON SCHEDULING A Tl'ORNEY 
TELECONFERENCE; REVIEW REPLY ON 
MOTION TO SUBSTITUTE JUDGES 

PREPARE FOR AND An"END STATUS DATE 
ON CONSOLIDATED SALES RATIO CASES 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 LORD & 

TAYLOR 
WORK ON SETfLEMENT FOR MULTI YEAR 
WALGREENS 

PREPARE FOR DEPOS!TION OF~ 
- FROM COLLECTOR RE: ALLSTATE 

SPO 

PREPARE FOR AND ATfEND DEPOSITION 
OF 
TREASURER'S OFFICE, RE: CONSOLIDATED 
SALES RATIO CASES 

REVIEW DRAFT JOINT RESPONSE ON 
LIMITED BONDS OBJECTJON 

PREPARE FOR ANO ATTEND DEPOSITION 

OF 
TREASURER'S OFFICE, RE: CONSOLlDA TED 
SALES RATIO CASES 

REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 
ON 3170 MACARTHUR LLC; WORK ON 
REVENUE LOSS CALCULATIONS; 
EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITII 
DISTRICT 

WORK ON PTAB INTERVl::NTIONS ON 3170 
MACARTHUR LLC 

Ul'DA TE FILE AND CHART \VITI I 
TAXP,\YER REQUESTED REDUCTION RE: 
3170 MACARTHUR LLC 

0.20 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.90 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.90 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

$42.00 

$84.00 

$ t 05.00 

$105.00 

S210.00 

$189.00 

$42.00 

$189.00 

$105.00 

$63.00 

S63.00 
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05/07/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. Sl05.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 JEF!' MINOGUE 

05/07/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 LAKE COOK 
TERRACE 

05/07/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE, 2009 
)-]!LUNGER, R0!3ERT 

05/08/2015 WORK ON DRAFT MOTJON TO DISMISS 0.40 hrs. 584.00 

BRIEF RE: LIMITED BONDS OBJECTION; 
REVIEW DRAFT SUMMARY JUDGMENT 
RESPONSE AND EXCHANGE EMA TL 
MESSAGES WITH WITH ATTORNEY 
BARRITT 

05/08/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND ST A TUS 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
COURT DATE FOR SALES RATIO CASES 

05/11/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ATTORNEY GROUP RE: LIMITED BONDS 

0.10 hrs. S2 l .OO 

OBJECTIONS 

05/11/2015 WORK ON 2009 MINOGUE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

05/11/2015 WORK ON 2009 LAKE COOK TERRACE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

05/11/2015 WORK ON 2009 DOWN YORK & EARL GREY 0.50 hrs. S\05.00 

05/11/2015 TC,LEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER A"l1'0RNEY RE: 2011 ALLGAUCOR 
TAX APPEAL 

05/1212015 TELEPIIONE CONFERENCE \VITI-I 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NEGOTIATIONS 
FOR 2009 LAKE COOK TERRACE 
SETTLEMENT 

05/l 2/2015 WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. Sl05.00 
MULTJ YEAR NORTHBROOK RACQUET 
CLUB 

05112/2015 WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT FOR 
MULTI YEAR NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

0.50 hrs. Sto5.00 

05/13120\5 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND Pf AB 1.50 hrs. $315.00 

PREHEARING CONFERENCE AND 
PARTICIPATE IN NEOOTIA TIONS TO 
ATTEMPT TO SETTLEMENT RE: 2009 LAKE 
COOK TERRACE 

05/13/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND PTAB 1.30 hrs. $273.00 

PREHEARlNO CONFERENCE AND 
PARTICIPATE JN NEGOTJATIO;,.,'S TO 
ATTEMPT TO SETTLEMENT RE: 2009 JEFF 
MINOGUE 
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05/14/2015 REV!EW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

ON NORTHBROOK COURT MALL; WORK ON 
REVENUE LOSS CA LC ULA TIONS; 
EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITH 
DISTRICT 

05/14/2015 WORK ON PTAB INTERVENTION FOR 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

05/14/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2009 3170 MAC 
ARTHUR 

05/14/2015 UPDATE FILE AND CHART WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION RE: 
2013 NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

05/14/2015 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

W!TH PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO BUSINESS 
MANAGER RE. 2009 LAKE COOK TERRACE 

05114/2015 EXECUTE STIPULATION AND DRAFT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
ATTORNEY RE: ACCEPTANCE ON 2009 
LAKE COOK TERRACE SETTLEMENT 

05/15/2015 WORK ON CHART FOR LIMITED BONDS 0.20 hrs. S42.00 

OBJECTIONS 

05/15/2015 PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT COURT 0.40 hrs. $84.00 

DATE FOR LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT 
CONSOLI DA TED CASES 

OSI\ 512015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT AND PREPARE 0.50 hrs. Sl05.00 

FOR PTAB PRE HEARING CONFERENCE RE: 
2009 DOWN YORK & EARL GREY 

OS/1512015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. NIC 
TAXPAYER ATl'ORNEY RE: 2009 FRANK 
ALLGAUER 

05/1812015 PREPARE FORAND ATTEND TELEPHONE 0.20 hrs. $42.00 

CONFERENCE W!TH A n·oRNEY GROUP RE: 
LIMITED BOND OBJECTIONS 

05/18/2015 TEI.EPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: POSSIBLE 
MUL Tl YEAR SETTLEMENT FOR 3 l 70 
MACARTHUR LLC 

05/1812015 WORK ON FINALIZATION OF SETTLEMENT 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

FOR LAKE COOK TERRACE 

05/18/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2011 ALLGAUER 

0.30 hrs. S63.00 
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05/1912015 DRAFT REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF TIME 0.40 hrs. $84.00 

TO FILE INTERVENOR EVIDENCE AND 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
TO PERFORM FULL APPRAISAL REPORT RE: 
201 l PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDO 
ASSOCIATION 

OS/1912015 DRAFT REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF TIME 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TO FJLE INTERVENOR EVIDENCE AND 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
TO PERFORM FULL APPRAISAL REPORT RE: 
2011 PATRJOTCOURTYARDS CONDO 
ASSOCIATION 

05/19/2015 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

FOR RESTRICTED ESTIMATE OF MARKET 
VALUE FOR 2013 3170 MACARTHUR LLC 

05/20/2015 WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT FOR 0.50 hrs. S\05.00 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

05/21/2015 WORK ON MACY'S SETTLEMENT 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

05/21/20]5 TELEPHONE CONfERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: WALGREEN CO. 

05/21/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS CONDO ASSOCIATION 

05/2212015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 

ON LEVEL OF ASSESSMENT 
CONSOLIDATED CASES 

05122120\5 PREPARE FOR PTAB PREHEARINO 0.50 hrs. $105.00 

CONFERENCE RE: AND .. -05/2612015 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 

AND DATE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW Al'l'RAJSAL 
REPORT FROM TAXPAYER RE: 20 13 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

05/26/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 20\J THE BARKING 
LOT 

05/26/2015 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APl'RAISER 0.00 hrs. N/C 
TO PERFORM RESTRICTED USE ESTIMATE 
OF VALUE FOR 2013 NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

05/2712015 WORK ON MACY'S SETTLEMENT 0.50 hrs. S105.00 

05/27/2015 WORK ON POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT FOR 0.50 lu·s. Sl05.00 
NORTJIBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

05/27/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VlTH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2009 
ALLGAUER, FRANK 
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05/27/2015 PREPARE FOR PRE HEARING CONFERENCE 0.50 hrs. $ l 05.00 
RE: 2009 HILLING ER, ROBERT 

05/28/2015 REVIEW DRAFT BRIEF AND AFFIDAVIT ON 0.10 hrs. $2!.00 
LIMITED BONDS 013JECllON "'10Tl0N 

05128/2015 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND REVIEW 0.50 hrs. $ l 05.00 
EXPERT'S RESTRICTIVE USE REPORT AND 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TOWNSHIP 
TREASURER RE: 2013 MAC ARTHUR 

05/29/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 201 l ALLGAUER 

05129/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR THE BARKING 0.50 hrs. S 105.00 

LOT 

05/29/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURTON 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
MOTION TO COMPEL RE: LEVEL Of 
ASSESSMENT CONSOLI DA TED CASES 

----------------
Total fees $5,460.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $5,460.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $5,460.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE S5,4G0.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 1 0 

Flossmoor, Jllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

\vv.w.hauserizzo.com 

June04,2015 
Bill Through 05/31/2015 

Invoice# 15160 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLEN BROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LJ\W 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

26670 

0 

,O·/_'f.:JVEl) JUN 16?~·: 

~OVED: 

/ 

$420.00 

$420 00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

W\Vw.hauserizzo.com 

June 04, 2015 
Bill Through 0513112015 
Invoice# 15 I 60 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

0 

SU!TE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAl 
AITORNl:Y-CUENT 
PRl~ILEGE 

SCHOOL LAW 
/COR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

05/01/2015 

05/05/2015 

TELEPHONE CON!'ERENCE WITH COUNSEL 
FOR ILLTNOIS BONE AND JOINT SURGEONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH_ 
..-,TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
~RESEARCHJNSURANCE 
COVERAGES; RESEARCH ILLINOIS 
ATHLETIC TRAINERS ACT 

Tomi l'ees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL l'EES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.20 hrs. ~ $42.00 

1.80 hrs. $378.00 

$420.00 

$420.00 

$420.00 

5420.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway · Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www,hauserizzo.com 

March 06, 2015 
Bill Through 02128/2015 
Invoice# 14720 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

COIIFIOtNTIAl 
AlTORNEY·CllrnT 
~R1Vil£CE 

Client Number Z6670 

Matter Number O 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

02/1612015 REVIEW AND REVISE PROGRESSIVE 
AGREEMENT; REVlEW GENERAL 
,\GREEM ENT; DRAFT EMAIL TO CLIENT 

1.30 hrs.@273.00 

Total Fees S273.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $273.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $273.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE S273.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fnx: (708) 79'9-6866 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

www.hauseri.zzo.com 

February 12,2015 
Bill Through 01131/2015 

Invoice# 14596 CLP 

GLENBROOK 1-IlGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 6()026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATfER 

INVOICE APPROVAL 

s~~~~~ 
DATE~C~----
ACCT. No. tfPtf 
O PARTlAl. i3FJN>,L rj"NOP.O. 

Client Number 

Mattw Numtx:f 

Z6670 

0 

' ; ~,•1<> 
' 

S27J.OO 

$273 00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

February 12, 2015 
Bill Through 01/3112015 
Invoice# 14596 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z667[1 
GLENBROOK J-l!Gll SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 

MatterNumber O 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

COMFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

SCHOOL LA \V 
FOR PROl'E_$SIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

01109/2015 

01/\912015 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ADMINISTRATOR RE: NAME CHANGE AND 
SCHOOL RECORDS 

REVIEW EMAIL FROM~REVIEW 
RFP FOR INTERNET SERVICES, DRAFT 
EMAJLTO~ 

Total Fees 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.30 

\.00 

$273.00 

$273.00 

$273.00 

5273.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

www.hauserizw.com 

March 06, 2015 
Bill Through 02/28/2015 

Invoice# 14721 JMl 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-124! 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

01 

INVOICE APPROVAL 
I.IAH"IAL R 

SIGN 

DATE ~ -·- P.,). Na -----
ACCT. No. _./ts,Gc'elcl ____ _ 

O PARTIAL !!'(FINAL e{No P.O. 

S4.746.00 

54,746 00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

vN,'lN.hauserizzo.com 

March06.2015 
Bill Through 0212812015 
Invoice# 14721 JMI 

BOARD or EDUCATJON Client Number Z:6670 
GLEN BROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 01 

SUJTE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

COMFIDEIHIAl 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFJ:SSJONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

02/0312015 

02/0312015 

02/04/2015 

02105/2015 

02/05/2015 

02105/2015 

02/05/2015 

02/06!2015 

02/1012015 

02110/2015 

UPDATE FILio WITH RESTRICTED REPORT, 
CALCULATE AV V ALUF:S AND LOSSES 
WITH VALUE AND REVIEW EXPERT 
REPORT AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT RE: 2013 
MACY'S 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
TO PERFORM A FULL APPRAISAL REPORT 
TO rruo AS INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2013 MACY'S 

TELEPHONE CONl'ERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE. SloTl'LEMENT 
AND 2013 TAX YEAR APPEAL ON THE 
BARKING LOT 

TELEPHONE CONl'ERENCE \VITH 
APPRAISER RE: MACY'S 

SElTLEMENT NEGOTJA TIONS FOR 
ALLSTATE 

DRAFT £-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT RE: 2009 
JOHN'S COURT BUILDINGS SFITLEMENTS 

EXECUTE STIPULA TJONS AND DRAF'I 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER 
ATTORNEY RE: TWO JOl-ll\'S COURT 2009 
PROPERTIES 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND STATUS 
COURT DA TE ON CONSOLIDATED SALES 
RATIO CASES 

PREPARE FOR PROPERTY TAX RATE 
OBJECTIONS STATUS 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT Of- MULTI YEAR 
MACY'S 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

$105.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

5105.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

S6~.00 

$21.00 

$ I 05.00 
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02/1012015 WORK ON SETTU:OMENT FOR 2009 0.50 hrs. 5105.00 
NORTHBROOK COMMERCIAL PROPERTIES 

02110/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 LORD & 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAYLOR 

02/1112015 ATTEND TAX RATE OBJECTIONS STATUS 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
HEARING 

02/11/2015 EXCHANGE OF E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
WITH TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 
SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS FOR MACY'S 

02/1312015 EMAIL DISTRICT RE, STATUS OF TAX RATE 0.80 hr>. Si68.00 
OBJECTIONS 

02116/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAD PRE HEARING 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
CONFERENCE DATE RE: 2009 LAKE COOK 
TERRACE 

0211612015 UPDATE flLE WITH PTAB PRC: HEARl1'."G 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
CONFERENCE DATE RE: 2009 LOUNDY, 
RICHARD 

02/1612015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB PRE HEARING 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CONFERENCE DATE Rlo: 2009 PINTZ, FRANK 

02116/2015 UPDATE f!LE WITH PTAB PRE HEARING 0.30 hrs. 563.00 
CONFERENCE DA TE RE: 2009 JOHN'S 
COURT BUILDINGS (2075) 

02/16/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB PRE HEARING 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CONFEREJ\"CE DA TE RE: 2009 JOl-ll\"S 
COURT BUILDINGS (2025) 

02/17/2015 REV JEW COLLECTOR'S MOTION TO QUASH 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
THE SUBPOENA OF JOI-IN HORBAS AND 
PREPARE fOR COURT 

02/17/2015 WORK ON MACY'S POTENTIAL 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
SETTLEMENT 

02/17/2015 PREPARE fOR AND ATTEND STATUS 2.30 hrs. $483.00 
COURT DATE RE: ALLSTA'I E Sl'O 

02/l 8/2015 REVIEW J\"OTICES \VITI-I INCONSISTENT 0.40 hrs $84.00 
INFORMATION; RESEARCH DOCKETS 

02/18/2015 TEl,EPHONE CONfERENCE WITH BOARD 0.30 hrs. S63.00 
OF REVIEW AND TELEPI-IONECONHORENCE 
WITH PTA!l RE: 2011 DOUBLE FILING OF 
PATRIOT COURTYARDS 

02/18/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs Sl05.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 JOHN'S COURT 
BUILDINGS 09-30584 AND 09-30651 

02/1812015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $ I 05.00 
CONfERENCE RE: 2009 PINTZ, FRANK 

02/18/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 LOUNDY, RICHARD 
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02/18/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 LAKE COOK 
TERRACE 

02119/2015 REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 hrs. $1 05.00 
ON PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDOMINIUM 
ASSOCIA Tl ON; WORK ON REVENUE LOSS 
CALCULATIONS; EMAIL DISTRICT 

02/19/2015 WORK ON PTAB INTERVENTION ON 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDO 
ASSOClA TJON 

02/19/2015 REVIEW OBJECTORS' TEST MOTION ON 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
WORKING CASH BOND RATE OBJECTIONS 

02119/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF THE BARKING 0.50 hrs. $ I 05.00 
LOT 

02(20/2015 REVIEW LEGAL BRIEFS IN OTHER COUNTY 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
RE: WORKING CASH BONDS OBJECTIONS 

02!2012015 PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT COURT 0.30 hrs. 563.00 
DATE FOR MOTION TO QUASH SUBPOENAS 
RE: SALES RATIO CASES 

0212312015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
ATTORNEY GROUP RE; JOINT EFFORTS TO 
LITJGA TE WORKING CASH BONDS 
013JECTJON 

0212412015 WORK ON MACY'S GLOBAL SETfLEMENT 0.50 hrs. S l 05.00 

02/24/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.50 hrs. $\05.00 
TAXPAYER ATl'ORNEY ANLJ PREPARE FOR 
PTAEl PRE HEARING CONFERENCE ON 2009 
LAKE COOK TERRACE 

02/2412015 TELEPHONE CONl'ERENCE \VITI! 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY AND PREPARE l'OR 
!'TAB PRE HEARIC\'G CONFERENCE ON 2009 
RICHARD LOUNDY 

02!2412015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY AND PREPARE FOR 
l'TAB PRE I iEARING CONFERENCE ON 2009 
l'RANK PINTZ 

02/2412015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY AND PREPARE FOR 
PTAB l'RE HEARING CONFERENCE ON 2009 
JOHNS COURT BUILDINGS 2075 AND 2025 

02/2512015 EXCHANGE OF EMAILS AND 1.00 hrs. S2 I 0.00 
NEGOTIATIONS FOR POTENTIAL 
SETTLEMENT ON LORD & TAYLOR 

02(25/2015 WORK ON STIPULATIONS FOR THE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
BARKING LOT 

02/26/2015 WORK ON POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT ON 2009 0.40 hrs. 584.00 
LAKE COOK TERRACE 
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02/2612015 WORK ON POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT ON 2009 0.40 hrs. $84.00 

RICHARD LOUNDY 

0212612015 WORK ON POSSl!3LE SETTLEMENT ON 2009 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
FRANK PINTZ 

02126/2015 WORK ON POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT OF 0.40 hrs. S84.00 
BOTJ-12009 JOHN'S COURT APl'EALS 

02/26/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 

02127/2015 WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT FOR 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
2012 WALGREEN CO. 

02/27/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: TRIENNIAL OF 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

02/27/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
RE: MOTION TO QUASI I 

----------------
Total Fees $4.746.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $4,746.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR Tl-llS MATTER S4.746.00 

TOTAL BALAJ'iCE DUE: 54, 746.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

April06,2015 
Bill Through 03/31/2015 

Invoice# 14767 JMI 

GOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Maller Number GLEN BROOK HIGH SCHOOL DJ STRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL fEES FOR THIS MATTER 

RECEIVED APR 13 

/ 

26670 
Ol 

2015 

%,426.00 

$6,426 00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauserizzo.com 

April 06, 2015 
Bill Through 03/31/2015 
lnvoicell 14767 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

MauerNumber 01 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW_ IL 60026-1241 

CONfl0£UTIAL 
ATIOnNEY·CllEl!T 
PRIVILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

03!02/2015 

03(0212015 

03102/2015 

03(02/2015 

03/0212015 

03!02/2015 

0310212015 

0310212015 

03/03/2015 

03103/2015 

03!03(2015 

WORK ON SUMMARJES l'OR WORKING 
CASH BOND OBJECTIONS 

PREPARE FOR PTA!l PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 LAKE COOK 
TERRACE 

PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 RICHARD LOUNDY 

PREPARE FOR PTA!l PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 FRANK PINTZ 

PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARTNG 
CONl'ERF,NCE RC 2009 JOHN'S COURT 
BUILDINGS 09-30534 

PREPARE FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE RE: 2009 JOHN'S COURT 
BUILDINGS 09-30651 

UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 
AND DATE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW TAXPAYER 
APPRAISAL REPORT RE: 201 I PATRIOT 
COURTY ARIJS CONDO ASSOCIATION 

DRAl'T CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
TO PERl'ORM AN INITIAL ESTIMATE OF 
MARKET VALUE FOR SUBJECT PROPERTY 
REc 2011 PA TR!OT COURTYARDS 

WORK ON AI.LSTATE PROPOSED 
SETTLEMENT SCENARIOS 

WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT FOR 
20091-IILLINGER, ROBERT 

UPDATE FILE WITH APPRAISAL PAYMENTS 
AND D!STRICT30 RE: 2011 AND 2012 
!'A TR!OT COURTYARDS 

0.20 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hr:;. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.60 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

$42.00 

SIOS.00 

$ I 05.00 

$105.00 

SS4.00 

$84.00 

$126.00 

$42.00 

$210.00 

$105.00 

563.00 



Z6670 DISTR!CT 225 - COOK Invoice# 14767 Pnge 2 
03/03/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 

APPRAISER RE: PROGRESS ON REPORT FOR 
0.30 hrs. $63.00 

2013 MACY'S 

03/03/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2009 LORD & 

0.30 hrs $63.00 

TAYLOR 

03/04/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 
ON CONSOLI DA TED CASES 

0.30 hrs. 563.00 

03/04/20]5 UPDATE FILE \VJTH DATE FOR PTAB PRE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
HEARIJ\'G CONFERENCE RE: 2009 DOWN 
YORK & EARL GREY 

03/04/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF TWO JOI-INS 
COURT OUILDINGS CASES 

0.30 his. S63.00 

03/05/2015 PREPARE FOR ANO ATTEND ATTORNEY 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
TELECONFERENCE RE RESPONSE TO 
WORKING CASH BONDS OBJECTION 
MOTION 

03/05/2015 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB \VITI-! 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE ON 2013 
MACY'S 

03/05/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF 2009 RICHARD 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
LOUNDY AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
WITH TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY AND DRAFT 
E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY wrn1 
STIPULAT!ON 

03/0512015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT OF 2009 FRANK 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
PINTZ AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
WITH TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY AND DRAFT 
E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 
TAXPAYER"$ ATTORNEY \VITII 
STIPULATION 

03/05/2015 EXAMINE STJPULA TJONS FOR BOTH CASf,S 0.30 hrs. 563.00 
OF JOIJN'S COURT BUILDINGS 

03/06/2015 AlTEND MEETING REGARDING 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
QUESTIONS REQUESTED IN DF.POSJTION 
AND DISCOVERY ISSUES RE: SPO CASES 

03/06/2015 UPDATE FILE WITH EXPERT'S RESTRICTED 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
USE ESTIMATE OF MARKET VALUE FOR 
20 11 PATRIOT COURTYARDS 

03/09/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATrORNEY RE: STIPULATION 
ON 2009 LAKE COOK TERRACE 

03/09/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTl-l 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: STIPULA T!ON 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

ON 2009 RICHARD LOUNDY 



Z6670 DJSTRJCT 225 - COOK Invoice# 14767 Page 3 
03/09/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 

TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 
0.30 hrs. $63.00 

STJPULA T!ONS ON 2009 JOHN'S COURT 
BUILDINGS 

03/09/2015 PREPARE FOR PTAEl PRE HEARING 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
CONFERENCE ON 2009 DOWN YORK & 
EARL GREY ENTERPRISES 

03110/20]5 WORK ON CHART SUMMARY FOR 
WORKING CASH BONDS TAX OBJECTIONS 

0.40 hrs. $84.00 

RE: PROPERTY TAXES 

03/l 012015 WORK ON TWO 2009 JOHN'S COURT 
BUILDJJ\'GS STIPULATIONS 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

03/l 0/2015 PREPARE FOR ALLSTATE SPO COURT DATE 0.50 hrs. $ I 05.00 
03/11/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATIEND PTAB 

PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE AND 
0.90 hrs. $189.00 

NEGOTIATE SETTLEMENT OFFER RE: 2009 
LAKE COOK TERRACE 

03/1112015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEl\'D PTAB 
PRE-HEARING CONl'ERENCE AND 

0.90 hrs. $189.00 

NEGOTIATE SETTLEMENT Ol'l'ER RE, 2009 
RICHARD !DUNDY 

03!] 1/2015 PREPARE l'OR AND ATTEND PTAB 
PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE AND 

0.90 hrs. $189.00 

NEGOTIATE SETTLEMENT OFFER RE: 2009 
!'RANK PJNTZ 

03111/2015 PREPARE FORAND ATfEND PTAB 
PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE AND 

0.90 hrs. $189.00 

NEGOTIATE SETTLEMENT OFFER RE: 
JOI !N'S COURT BUILDINGS 

03111/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND l'TA!l 
PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE AND 

0.90 hrs. $1.~9.00 

NEGOTIATE SETTLEMENT OFFl::R RE: RE: 
JOHN'S COURT BUILDINGS II 

03/12/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND TAX 
OBJECTIONS STATUS HEARING; 
CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEYS RE: JOINT 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

RESPONSE ON WORKJNG CASH BONDS 

03/12/2015 RESF.:ARC! I STANDARDS FOR MOTION f-OR 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
SUElSTITUTION OF JUDGE RE· RATE 
OBJECTIONS 

03/13/2015 MEETING WJTl-l TAX PA YER"S ATTORNEY 
RE: ALLSTATE SPO 

1.00 hrs. $21 0.00 

03/13/2015 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 
ON CONSOLIDATED SALES RATIO CASES 

0.30 hrs. 563.00 

03/13/2015 RESEARCH POSSIBILITY or SUBSTITUTION 
OF JUDGES; DRAFT LEGAL OPINION RE: 

0.20 hrs. 542.00 

RA TE OBJECTIONS 



26670 DISTRJCT 225 - COOK Invoice# 14767 Page 4 

03!16/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE, POSSIBLE 
SETTLEMENT ON 201 0 CHICAGO CAPITAL 
HOLDINGS 

03/16/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE· 2013 MACY'S 

031]7/2015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT SCENARIOS JN 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
PREPARATION FOR PTAB PRE HEARING 
CONFERENCE ON 2009 DOWN YORK & 
EARL GREY ENTERPRISES 

03/17/2015 DRAFT MOTION FOR SUBSTITUTION OF 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
JUDGES RE: RA TE OBJECTIONS 

03/18/2015 PREPARE FOR AND A TT END CONFERENCE 0.10 hrs. $2 l .00 
WITH ATTORNEY GROUP RE: JOINT 
RESPONSE ON WORKING CASH BONDS 
RA TE OBJECTIONS 

03/18/2015 RESEARCH AND WORK ON MOTION FOR 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
SUBSTITUTION OF JUDGES FOR WORKJNG 
CAST! 

03/18/20 15 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 LAKE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
COOK TERRACE 

03/18/2015 PREPARE FOR DEPOSITIONS ON 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
CONSOLIDATED SPO CASES 

03/19/2015 WORK ON POSSlllLE PLEADING DEFENSE 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
TO WORKING CASH BOND OBJECTIONS; 
EMAIL ATTORNEY GROUP 

03/19/2015 CALCULATE AV VALUES, REVIEW 0.50 hrs. $ I 05.00 
EXPERrS S RESTRICTED USE REPORT AND 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSISTANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: APPRAISAL REPORT 
FOR201 I PATRIOTCOURTYARDS 

03/19/2015 TELEP! IONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE,..._.. .-

03/1912015 TELEPIIONECONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE· NORTHBROOK 
RACQUETCl,UB 

03/1912015 PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
CONSOLIDATED CASES DISCOVERY 
STATUS COURT DATE 

03/19/2015 RESEARCH; DRAFT LEGAL OPINION 0.20 hrs. 542.00 
CONCERNING STANDARDS FOR 
AMENDMENTS TO RATE OBJECTION 
COMPLAINT RE: RATE OBJECTIONS 

03120/2015 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT RE· 
PA TRI OT COURTYARDS 



Z6670 DJSTRICT 225- COOK Invoice# 14767 Pugc 6 
03/31/2015 WORK ON RESEARCHJNG !lOND HISTORY 0.30 hrs. $63.00 

RE: WORKING CASH BONDS RA TE 
OBJECTION 

03/3]/2015 WORK ON MOTION FOR SUBSTITUTION OF 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
JUDGE RE: RA TE OBJECTIONS 

03/3112015 WORK ON POTENTIAL MULTI-YEAR 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
SEITLE:.1ENT FOR MACY'S 

OJ/3112015 WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR 2009 LORD & 0.50 hrs. 5105.00 
TAYLOR 

------·-·-------
To!ul Fees $6,426.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $6,426.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATI'ER $6,426.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 56,426.0ll 

INVOICE APPROVAL 
•MTEAIAL ~ECEIYCO & PAYMENT APPROVED, 

SIGN----------/ 
DATE --- P.O. No. ---­

.lCCT. No. -~=---=--­
nPAi'HIAL 0FINAL nNo P.O. 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governor:, Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinoi! 60422 
Phone: (706) 799--6766 Fax: (708) 799-6666 

www.hauscrizzo.com 

April 06, 2015 
Bill Through 03/31/2015 

Invoice# 14766 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 

GLENBROOK 1-flOH SCHOOL DJSTRICT 225 
J80l WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 6{)026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS i\111.TIER 

Metter Number O 

WECEJVf:/ APR 1 6 2015 

Sl,302.00 

------·-
$1 ,302.00 



HAUSER IZZO, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite IO 

Flossmoor, lllinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.hauseriz20,com 

April 06, 2015 
Bill Through 03/31/2015 
Invoice# 14766 CLP 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK H!GH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Client Number 26670 

Matter Number O 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, TL 60026-1241 

CONFIOEITTIAt 
ATTORNEY-ClJENT 
PruVlU:OE 

SCHOOL LAW 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

03/0512015 

03/16/2015 

03/J 9/2015 

03/24/2015 

03/24/2015 

03/26/20]5 

03/3012015 

03131120] 5 

03/31/20]5 

BILLING SU:'1-1MARY 

DRAFT FORM SERVICES AGREEMENT 

REVJ!;;W AND RESPOND TO EMAIL; REVIEW 
ORIGINAL CONTRACT TEMPLATE AND 
PROPOSED MODIFICATIONS TO CONTRACT 
TEMPLATE 

EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITH­
~RE: FOIA FOR SPECIAL EDUCA TJON 
LEGAL INVOICES (NO CHARGE PER 
A lTORNEY IZZO) 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
REGARDING FLECK 

LANDSCAPING CONTRACT 

REVJSE SERVICES AGREEMENT; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE \VITI-!~ 

TELEl'f-lONE CONFERENCE WITH,.. 
REGARDJNG REPAIR CARE IJ\'C.; REVIEW 
CONTRACT IVJTH REPAIR CARE 

REVIEW REPAIR CARE AGREEMENT; 
REVIEWIE~l,IA~JLS BETWEEN ~ND 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO 
EMAILfROM-. 

REVHOW FRONTLINE TECHNOLOGlf:S 
AGREEMENT; DRAFT SUPPLEMENTAL 
PROVISIONS 

RESEARCH STUDENT TECHNOLOGY 
PRIVACY CONTRACT TERMS 

Tornl Fees 

2.00 hrs_cf( $420.00 

0.50 hrs.a%- $105.00 

0.40 hrs. \ti" NIC 

0.20 hrs_cvr $42.00 

0.40 hrs~r $84.00 

0.90 hrffy $189.00 

0.80 hrs. fJf $168.00 

1.20 hrs. \I:)! S252.00 

0 20 hrs. *" $42.00 

----------------
$],302.00 



26670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK 

TOTAL FEES 

TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

Jnvoice# 14766 Page 2 

$1,302.00 

$],302.00 

ST,302.00 



































































































































































SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

June 06, 2014 
Bill Through 05/31/2014 

Invoice# 12770 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRJCT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Z6670 

01 

/ 

$5,145.00 

$5, 145.00 

RECEIVEV JUN l 7 cU14 

._,,. ' 

' r·' 

,.-1, -,tf 
· /I.J3 If' 

,,( ~ 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

June 06, 2014 
Bill Through 05/31/2014 

Invoice# 12770 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 01 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

05/01/2014 

05/02/2014 

05/02/2014 

05/05/2014 

05/06/2014 

05/06/2014 

05/07/2014 

05/12/2014~".~~ 

05/12/2014 

05/12/2014 

05/13/2014 

05/13/2014 

05/13/2014 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 3.00 
ON ALLSTATE 

COMPLETE DISCOVERY REQUEST AND 0.30 
PREPARE FOR MOTION COURT DATE AND 
UPDATE FILE WITH AMENDED 
COMPLAINTS FOR TAXPAYER 

UPDATE FILE WITH DEF AULT OF BOARD 0.30 
OF REVIEW ON 2011 

WORK ON MATERIALS FORT AX 0.20 
OBJECTIONS MEETING 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT 0.50 
CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL 

WORK ON ALL ST A TE 1.00 

EMAIL SUMMARY TO OPPOSING COUNSEL 0.10 

REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 
ON WALGREENS; WORK ON REVENUE 
CALCULATIONS; EMAIL DISTRICTS 

REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 
ON WORK ON REVENUE 
CALCULATIONS; EMAIL DISTRICT 

REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 
ON PATRIOT COURTYARDS; WORK ON 
REVENUE CALCULATIONS; EMAIL 

DISTRICT . ~
11
~·~.,..., ... 

~AB INTERVENTIONS ON ~i30 

WORK ON PTAB INTERVENTIONS ON 0.30 
PATRIOT COURTYARDS 

WORK ON PTAB INTERVENTION ON 0.30 
WALGREEN 

hrs. 

hrs. 

hrs. 

hrs. 

hrs. 

hrs. 

hrs. 

hrs. 

hrs. 

hrs. 

hrs. 

hrs. 

hrs. 

$630.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$42.00 

$105.00 

$210.00 

$21.00 

$105.00 

$105.00 

$105.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 



Z6670 DISTRJCT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12770 Page 2 

05/14/2014 UPDATE FILE AND REVIEW AMENDED 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER COMPLAINTS IN 
CON SO LIDA TED CASES 

05/14/2014 UPDATE FILE AND CHART WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION RE: 
2012 WALGREEN CO 

05/14/2014 UPDATE FILE AND CHART WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION RE: 
2012 

05/14/2014 UPDATE FILE AND CHART WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION RE: 
2012 PATRIOT COURTYARDS 

05/14/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER REBUTTAL 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
EVIDENCE RE: 2011 NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

05/14/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER REBUTTAL 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
EVIDENCE RE: 2011 NEIMAN MARCUS 

05/15/2014 REVIEW AND RECORD EAV FIGURES FOR 0.10 hrs. $21.00 
OBJECTORS IN 2007-2010 

05/15/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
AND PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR 
CON SO LIDA TION FOR ALL PURPOSES AND 
CASE MANAGEMENT ORDER 

05/15/2014 CALCULATE POTENTIAL LOSS BY WAY OF 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
REFUND RE: 2012 

05/16/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CASE 3.00 hrs. $630.00 
MANAGEMENT CALL RE: ALLSTATE 

05/19/2014 WORK ON RAYMOND AND ASSOC IA TES 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
SPO 

05/19/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2011 WA LG REEN 
CO. 

05/20/2014 EMAIL DISTRICT RE: TAX OBJECTORS' 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
EAVS 

05/20/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH CORRESPONDENCE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
FROM TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 20 I I 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

05/21/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH PT AB FINAL ORDER 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND VERIFY VALUE WITH STIPULATION 
RE: 2009 BORDERS 

05/21/2014 REVIEW ORDER OF COURT ON HEARING 0.20 hrs. $42.00 
FOR MOTION TO CON SO LIDA TE AND 
PREPARE FOR COURT DATE 

05/22/2014 MEETING WITH APPRAISER RE: 1.00 hrs. $210.00 
TAXPAYER'S REBUTTAL EVIDENCE ON 
NEIMAN MARCUS 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12770 Page 3 

05/23/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND DA TE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW TAXPAYER 
APPRAISAL REPORT RE: 2012 -05/23/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND DATE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW TAXPAYER 
APPRAISAL REPORT RE: 2012 WALGREEN 
CO. 

05/23/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
AND DATE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW TAXPAYER 
APPRAISAL REPORT RE: 2012 PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS 

05/23/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
RE: CON SO LIDA TED CASES 

05/27/2014 WORK ON EVALUATING LA TEST 0.60 hrs. $126.00 
SETTLEMENT OFFER FOR 2005-06 RA TE 
OBJECTIONS 

05/27/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH PROCESSING 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
INFORMATION FOR INTERVENOR 
REBUTTAL EVIDENCE ON 2011 NEIMAN 
MARCUS 

05/28/2014 WORK ON PTAB INTERVENTION ON 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
MACY'S 

05/28/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BOARD 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
OF REVIEW; REVIEW SETTLEMENT 
PROPOSAL ON DUNDEE ALBANY PT AB 
CASE 

05/28/2014 REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 hrs. $105.00 
ON MACY'S; WORK ON REVENUE 
CALCULATIONS; EMAIL DISTRICT 

05/28/2014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PT AB WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2012 

05/28/2014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PT AB WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2012 WALGREEN CO. 

05/28/2014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TO PERFORM PRELIMINARY ANALYSIS OF 
MARKET VALUE FOR 2012 PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS CONDO ASSOCIATION 

05/28/2014 UPDATE FILE AND CHART WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER'S REQUESTED REDUCTION RE: 
2012 MACY'S 

05/28/2014 WORK ON PROPOSED SETTLEMENT FOR 0.40 hrs. $84.00 
2009 DUNDEE ALBANY, LLC 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12770 Page 4 

05/30/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
APPRAISER RE: 2012 PATRIOT COURTYARD 

05/30/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND ST A TUS 1.50 hrs. $315.00 
COURT DATE 

05/30/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $63.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: MACY'S 

----------------
Total Fees $5,145.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $5,145.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $5,145.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $5,145.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

June 06, 2014 
Bill Through 05/31/2014 

Invoice# 12771 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 

Z6670 

0 

/ 

GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 
RECEIVED JUN 1 7 2014 

SCHOOL LA'N 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

1/.f.31/ 
v' 

$273.00 

$273.00 

/. ',, ,, 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

June 06, 2014 
Bill Through 05/31/2014 
Invoice# 12771 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

05/23/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES (3) WITH •. 
O AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY 

05/28/2014 

05/28/2014 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

REGARDING CASE ISSUES AND NEXT 
STEPS; E-CORRESPONDENCE WlTH GBN 
ADMINISTRATORS AND PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING UPCOMING I I 
MEETING RE:. 

REVIEW BIDDING ISSUES FOR GRANT 
FUNDED PROJECT 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL 
REGARDING COMPETITIVE BIDDING 

Total Fees 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.90 hrs ... $189.00 

0.20 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

-$42.00 

~42.00 

$273.00 

$273.00 

$273.00 

$273.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

June 06, 2014 
Bill Through 05/31/2014 

Invoice# 12772 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES 

TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

03 

/ 

$2,310.00 

$2,310.00 

RECEIVED JUN 172014 

. . (,~,(,-,If . 

IIP3Jcf 
/ ./ .. ) 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

June 06, 2014 
Bill Through 05/31/2014 
Invoice# 12772 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 03 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

05/01/2014 

05/06/2014 

05/08/2014 

05/09/2014 

05/12/2014 

05/13/2014 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
- REGARDING CASE STATUS 
RE: •. 

REVIEW PARENT E-MAIL REGARDING 
REQUEST FOR PRIVATE SCHOOL 
REFERRALS AND CONFER WITH. 
- REGARDING SAME RE: 

REVIEW E-MAIL FRO~EPHONE 
CONFERENCE WJTH ....... 
REGARDING POTENTIAL FURTHER 
DEFERMENT OF EXPULSION HEARING; 
DRAFT E-MAIL TO AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING SAME RE:. REVIEW 
LETTER AND E-MAIL FROM PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING UNILATERAL 
PLACEMENT AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO •. 
9£ I REGARDING SAME RE:. 

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH····· .. 
REGARDING STUDENT'S EARLY 
DISCHARGE FROM HOSPITAL 
REHABILITATION PROGRAM; CONFER AND 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME, PLUS 
SETTLEMENT DEMAND AND DISTRICT'S 
PRELIMINARY RESPONSE TO SAME RE:. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCES W1TH DR. 
RIGGLE AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY RE:­
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH····· 
REGARDING REQUEST BY FEEDER 
DISTRICT FOR MEETING RE:. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WJTH. 
-REGARDING PENDING SPECIAL 
EDUCATION MATTERS ••• 

0.10 hrs. $21.00 

0.10 hrs. $21.00 

0.50 hrs .• $105.00 

0.30 hrs. ff/I $63 .00 

0.40 hrs. ~84.00 

0.30 hrs.-$63.00 



Z6670 

05/13/2014 

05/14/2014 

05/14/2014 

05/15/2014 

05/16/2014 

05/19/2014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH MS. PEARSON 
REGARDING PROPOSED RESPONSE TO 
PARENTS' SETTLEMENT DEMAND AND 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE W1TH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING STATUS OF SAME 
RE: .. TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING UNILATERAL 
PLACEMENT AND REQUEST FOR DISTRICT 
COMMUNICATION W1TH ~OR, 
AND DRAFT E-MAILS TO_ 
AND REGARDING SAME 
RE:. DRAFT PROPOSED RESPONSE TO 
ELEMENTARY DISTRICT REQUEST FOR 
MEETING TO ADDRESS CASE ISSUES RE: 
• TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
UPCOMING IEP MEETING AND DRAFT 
E-MAIL TO-REGARDING 
SAMERE:.- -

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH •. 
, AND PARENTS' 

ATTORNEY REGARDING ISSUES RELATIVE 
TO REQUEST FOR DISTRICT 
COMMUNICATION W1TH PRIVATE 
TUTORING SERVICE; PREPARE RELEASE OF 
fNFORMA TION FORM fN CONNECTION 
WITH SAME RE:. 

E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH •• 
AND AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH -
REGARDING SETTLEMENT AND 
EXPULSION ISSUES; REVISE DISTRICT'S 
RESPONSE TO SETTLEMENT DEMAND AND 
DRAFT E-MAIL TO PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDfNG SAME RE-

E-CORRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCES WITH PA RENTS' 
ATTORNEY, , AND • 
•••• REGARDING SETTLEMENT 
ISSUES AND AGREED FOLLOW-UP RE:. 

DRAFT RESPONSE TO PARENTS' 
UNILATERAL PLACEMENT NOTICE RE: • 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY AND E-CORRESPONDENCE 
WITH AND-
REGARDING SCHOOL WORK ISSUE 
RELATIVE TO UNI LATERALLY PLACED 
STUDENT RE:. 

12772 

1.00 

Page 2 hr"W $210.00 

0.50 hrs-#$105.00 

0.40 hrs. - $84.00 

0.50 hrs.9,105.00 

0.20 hrs .• $42.00 

0.30 $63.00 



Z6670 

05/20/2014 

05/21/2014 

05/22/2014 

05/26/2014 

05/27/2014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING INDEPENDENT EVALUATOR'S 
DIAGNOSTIC IMPRESSIONS RE:. 
COMPLETE PRELIMINARY DRAFT OF 
PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND 
RELATED E-MAIL TO .-..AND. 

- RE:.; RESEARCH DUTY TO PAY 
FOR SPECIAL EDUCATION STUDENT 
TUITION DURING UNILATERAL DRUG 
REHAB PLACEMENT AND DRAFT E-MAIL 
TO REGARDING SAME RE: 

ePTELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY AND 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH­
AN~ REGARDING 
PROVISION OF GBN COURSE WORK WHILE 
STUDENT IS UNILATERALLY PLACED RE: .. 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
AND Eil REGARDING PRIVATE 
TUTORING RE: · E-CORRESPONDENCE 
WITH AND 
REGARDING REVISIONS TO DRAFT 
SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; PREPARE 
REVISIONS AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME 
RE:. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING.AND. 
MATTERS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 

REGARDING PARENT 
ALLEGATIONS AND CASE ISSUES RE: e 
REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND 
DRAFT E-MAIL TO .... AND. 
- REGARDING SAME RE:. 

E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH MS. PEARSON 
REGARDING REQUESTED CHANGES TO 
DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND 
E-CORRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING SAME RE:.REVIEW··· 
RECORDS RECEIVED FROM 
AND E-CORRESPONDENCE AND 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME RE: -
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 

~ND-­
REGARDING UPCOMING IEP MEETING AND 
TUTORING ISSUES RE:~ 

12772 Page 3 

2.20 hrs. -$462.00 

0.40 hrs ... $84.00 

0.70 hrs~147.00 

0.10 hrs .• $21.00 

1.00 hrs. $210.00 



Z6670 

05/28/2014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

05/29/2014 

05/30/2014 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

£-CORRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH AND. 

RE: REVIEW E-MAILS 
FROM AND FELICITY 
SCHOOL DIRECTOR REGARDING 
PLACEMENT OPTION RE: .TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH AND REVIEW E-MAIL 
FROM PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
FELICITY OPTION AND COMPLETION OF 
SETTLEMENT RE: i9 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY AND REVIEW E-MAIL FROM 

REGARDING AGREED 
SETTLEMENT REVISIONS AND PREPARE 
~~REVIEW E-MAILS FROM. 
--,XND PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING RELEASE OF REQUESTED 
RECORDS RE. TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
AND £-CORRESPONDENCE WITH-
_...- AND REGARDING 
RISK ASSESSMENT, PROPOSED 
EV ALUA TIOJ AND OTHER PENDING 
ISSUES RE: 

WORK ON REQUESTED REVISIONS TO 
PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND 
DRAFT E-MAIL TO PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING SAME RE: .. 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING TUTORING AND 
EVALUATION ISSUES AND REVIEW 
PSYCHOLOGICAL EVALUATION REPORT 
RE~ 

Total Fees 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

12772 4 

0.70 hrs $147.00 

0.80 hr $168.00 

0.50 hrs. $105.00 

$2,310.00 

$2,310.00 

$2,310.00 

$2,310.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

May 09, 2014 
Bill Through 04/30/2014 

Invoice# 12619 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE A VENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

r-~~,-N-V-OIC~E=-A_P_P_R_O_V_A_L~~~ 

MATERIAL D & p YMENT APPROVED: 

SIGN 

DATE -f--/9-,f P.O. No. 

ACCT. No. IJ,{j/.J'. 

0PARTIAL ~INAL ij;;0 P.O. 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

0 

$2,730.00 

----------------

$2,730.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

May 09, 2014 
Bill Through 04/30/2014 
Invoice# 12619 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

04/14/2014 

04/14/2014 

04/15/2014 

04/16/2014 

04/17/2014 

04/17/2014 

04/17/2014 

04/17/2014 

04/18/2014 

04/18/2014 

04/21/2014 

RESEARCH DISTRICT ZONING 
OBLIGATIONS 

REVIEW EMAIL FROM_.. 
REGARDING ZONING MATTER 

RESEARCH CASE LAW ON ZONING AND 
LOCAL MUNICIPALITY JURISDICTION 
OVER SCHOOL DISTRICTS 

RESEARCH VILLAGE ZONING CODE; 
PREPARE FOR MEETING 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING AT 
DISTRICT REGARDING ZONING MATTERS 

REVIEW BEVERAGE GUIDELINES AND 
MEMO 

REVIEW TRIAL COURT MEMORANDUM 
OPINION AND ORDER IN CRYSTAL LAKE 
ZONING CASE; DRAFT OPINION LETTER 
REGARDING ZONING 

RESEARCH HEALTHY SNACK AND 
BEVERAGE REQUIREMENTS, ABA 
GU~~PARE EMAIL RESPONSE 
TO ~GARDING SAME 

WORK ON LEGAL OPINION ON ZONING 
REQUIREMENT FOR PARKING 

REVISE OPINION LETTER REGARDING 
ZONING ORDINANCE 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM 
MAN HARD ENGINEERING; REVIEW STAFF 
REPORTS FROM ZONING BOARD HEARING; 
REVIEW STAFF REPORTS FROM PLAN 
COMMISSION 

Total Fees 

0. 70 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

2.70 hrs. 

0.80 hrs. 

2.50 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

1.80 hrs. 

1.50 hrs. 

0.60 hrs. 

0.80 hrs. 

1.20 hrs. 

$147.00 

$42.00 

$567.00 

$168.00 

$525.00 

$42.00 

$378.00 

$315.00 

$126.00 

$168.00 

$252.00 

$2,730.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12619 Page 2 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $2,730.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $2,730.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $2,730.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

April 07, 2014 
Bill Through 03/31/2014 

Invoice# 12324 ~ 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE A VENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

.,/ 

Z6670 

03 

r , 

$5,980.00 

$5,980.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

April 07, 2014 
Bill Through 03/31/2014 
Invoice# 12324 4lt 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 03 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

03/03/2014 

03/03/2014 

03/04/2014 

03/04/2014 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DISTRICT 
ADMlNISTRA TORS REGARDING FOIA 
REQUEST ISSUES AND NEEDED 
FOLLOW-UP; ADDITIONAL TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH -
REGARDING ELEMENTARY DISTRICT 
INFORMATION RELATIVE TO STUDENT; 
REVIEW SELECT ELEMENTARY DISTRICT 
RECORDS THAT PARENTS SEEK TO ADD TO 
DISTRICT 225 FILE AND 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING SAME, PLUS INDEPENDENT 
EVALUATOR CONT ACTS RE~ 

RESEARCH STATUTORY PROVISIONS AND 
PUBLIC ACCESS COUNSELOR DECISIONS 
REGARDING FOIA REQUEST AND 
DOCUMENTS POSSESSED BY PRIVATE DAY 
SCHOOL RE:. 
REVIEW AND RESPOND TO PARENT 
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING CASE 
DEVELOPMENT, CONT ACT WITH. AND 
REQUEST FOR NEW PRE-HEARING 
CONFERENCE DA TE; E-CORRESPONDENCE 
WITH REGARDING SAME RE: • CONTINUE REVIEW OF PUBLIC ACCESS 
COUNSELOR DECISIONS; PREPARE DRAFT 
E-MAIL TO -REGARDING FOIA 
REQUEST AND DOCUMENTS POSSESSED 
BY PRIVATE DAY SCHOOL RE:. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.60 hrs. 

$200.00 

$80.00 

$120.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12324 Page 2 

03/05/2014 E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 0.60 hrs. $120.00-
AND !HO RJSEN REGARDING NEW 
PROPOSED DATES FOR PRE-HEARING 
CONFERENCE; REVIEW RECENT PARENT 
E-MAILS REGARDING SELECTION OF 
INDEPENDENT EVALUATOR AND OTHER 
CASE ISSUES AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH~ 
REGARDING SAME RE· 

03/05/2014 ADDITIONAL TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 0.40 hrs. NIC'41 
WITH-REGARDING CASE 
ISSUES AND DIRECTION RE.(NO 
CHARGE PER ATTORNEY ENGLER) 

$80.00 fl' 03/06/2014 REVIEW PARENT E-MAILS REGARDING 0.40 hrs. 
SELECTION OF INDEPENDENT EVALUATOR 
AND OBJECTION TO INDIVIDUAL SOCIAL 
WORK SERVICES AND 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH ....... 
REGARDING SAME RE4il REVIEW OFFER 
OF SETTLEMENT RECEIVED FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY AND DRAFT E-MAIL 
TO-REGARDING SAME RE:. 

$160.00 "' 03/06/2014 BEGIN WORK ON REDACTION OF 0.80 hrs. 
ATTORNEY INVOICES FOR DISTRICT'S 
RESPONSE TO FOIA REQUEST RE:-

$200.00, 03/06/2014 BEGIN REVIEW OF STUDENT RECORDS 1.00 hrs. 
RECEIVED FROM RE: .. 

$140.00, 03/07/2014 CONTINUE REVIEW OF STUDENT RECORDS 0.70 hrs. 
RE:. 

03/10/2014 REVIEW LATEST PARENT E-MAIL 0.30 hrs. $60.00,,,,, 
REGARDING REQUEST TO TERMINATE 
SCHOOL SOCIAL WORK SERVICES AND 
PREFERENCE FOR PRIVATE THERAPY AND 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING SAME, PLUS ST A TUS OF 
SELECTION OF INDEPENDENT 
EVALUATOR; REVIEW E-MAIL FROM ... 

-REGARDING MOTION FOR 
CONTINUANCE; DRAFT E-MAIL TO. 

REGARDING PENDING FOIA 
REQUEST RE:. 

$20.00" 03/10/2014 REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 0.10 hrs. 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
REQUEST FOR IEP; DRAFT E-MAIL TO. 

REGARDING 

03/10/2014 BEGIN PREPARATION OF DISTRICT'S 1.50 hrs. $300.00 "' 
PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE DISCLOSURE 
MATERIALS 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12324 Page 3 

03/10/2014 CONTINUE TO REVIEW AND REDACT 6.10 hrs. $1,220.00 
ATTORNEY BILLS FOR FOIA DISCLOSURE 
TO PARENT RE:. 

03/11/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES (4) WITH- 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
- AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY 

REGARDING POTENTIAL TERMS AND 
CONDITIONS OF SETTLEMENT 

03/11/2014 REVIEW LA TEST HOME-SCHOOL 0.10 hrs. $20.00 
COMMUNICATIONS RE. 

03/11/2014 CONTINUE TO REVIEW AND REDACT 9.20 hrs. $1,840.00 
ATTORNEY BILLS FOR FOIA DISCLOSURE 
TO PARENT RE:. 

03/12/2014 COMPLETE WORK ON REDACTION OF 3.70 hrs. $740.00 
INVOICES IN RESPONSE TO PARENTS' FOIA 
-.CORRESPONDENCE WITH 

REGARDING SAME; 
REVIEW OTHER FOIA RESPONSES 
PROVIDED TO PARENTS R'4t 

03/13/2014 REVIEW E-MAILS FROM IHO AND PARENT 0.10 hrs. $20.00 
REGARDING MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE 
OF PHC; DRAFT E-MAIL TO~ 
REGARDING STATUS OF SEL CTION OF 
INDEPENDENT EVALUATOR RE:. 

03/14/2014 E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH-, 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
PARENTS, AND - REGARDING 
WITHDRAW AL OF IEE REQUEST AND 
DISTRICT DUE PROCESS REQUEST; REVIEW 
IHO'S WITHDRAWAL ORDER AND DRAFT 
REQUEST FOR CORRECTION TO SAME; 
REVIEW AND EDIT PRELIMINARY DRAFT 
OF DOMAIN/CONSENT FOR IEE FORM RE:. 

03/14/2014 REVIEW 2/26/14 IEP CONFERENCE 0.20 hrs. $40.00 
SUMMARY REPORT AND 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME RE:. 

03/14/2014 REVIEW ISBE CONTINUANCE ORDER RE: • 0.10 hrs. $20.00 

03/20/2014 E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH IHO AND 0.10 hrs. $20.00 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
CONVERSION OF 3/24/14 PHC TO STATUS 
CONFERENCE IN LIGHT OF PENDING 
SETTLEMENT RE:. 

03/21/2014 PREPARE PRELIMINARY DRAFT OF 0.80 hrs. $160.00 
PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND 
DRAFT E-MAILS TO AND 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME 
RE:-

03/24/2014 PARTICIPATE IN STATUS CONFERENCE 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
AND PREPARE MOTION FOR 
CONTINUANCE REQUESTED BY IHO RE:. 



Z6670 

03/27/2014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH-
._ REGARDING PENDING SPECIAL 

03/31/2014 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

EDUCATION MATTERS ; REVISE 
DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RE: .. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING CASE HISTORY 
AND ANTICIPATED REQUEST FOR 
RE.SIDENTIAL PLACEMENT; 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH ••••• 
REGARDING SAME RE: .. REVIEW !HO 
AND ISBE CONTINUANCE ORDERS RE:. 

Total Fees 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

12324 

0.50 

Page 4 

hrs. $100.00 

0.30 hrs. $60.00-

$5,980.00 

$5,980.00 

$5,980.00 

$5,980.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www. sragahauser. com 

May 09, 2014 
Bill Through 04/30/2014 

Invoice# 12620 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

03 

~~ 
1/()3/.f' 

.r ,,/ 

$2,982.00 

$2,982.00 



Z6670 

04/09/2014 

04/11/2014 

04/14/2014 

04/15/2014 

04/16/2014 

04/17/2014 

04/18/2014 

04/21/2014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH. 
~EGARDTNG BOARD REVIEW OF 
CHANGES TO DRAFT AGREEMENT; MAKE 
FINAL CHANGES; TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH AND DRAFT E-MAIL 
TO PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
SAME, PLUS FURTHER EXTENSION OF 4/1/4 
14 PRE-HEARING CONFERENCJ::~ 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH -
REGARDING 4/24/14 IEP CONFERENCE RE: -REVIEW E-MAIL FROM AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING STUDENT'S EXECUTION OF 
SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND JOINT 
REQUEST FOR FURTHER CONTINUANCE OF 
4/14/14 PHC; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO 
E-MAIL FROM REGARDING 
SAME RE:. 

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH. 
..... AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING 4/18/14 STATUS CONFERENCE 
RE:. 

DRAFT JOINT MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE 
TO PERMIT COMPLETION OF PENDING 
SETTLEMENT AND E-CORRESPONDENCE 
WITH IHO AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING SAME RE:. 

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY AN~REGARDING 
FINAL EXECUTION OF SETTLEMENT 
AGREEMENT AND WITHDRAW AL OF DUE 
PROCESS REQUEST RE. 

E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH ••••• 
REGARDING REQUEST FOR COPIES OF NOC 
AND DRAFT IEP AND REVIEW SAME RE: • REVIEW ISBE ORDERS RE:-
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENT'S 
ATTORNEY AND 
REGARDING REQUEST FOR 
CONTINUATION OF SOUTH CAMPUS RE: .. 

12620 Page 2 

0.40 hrs. -$84.00 

0.30 hrs. $63.00 

0.10 hrs. t $21.00 

0.30 hrs~ $63.00 

0.20 hrs. fl/II $42.00 

0.40 

0.10 

0.10 

hr~ 
$84.00 

hrst/l... $21. 00 

hrs . .., $21.00 



Z6670 

04/22/2014 

04/23/2014 

04/23/2014 

04/23/2014 

04/24/2014 

04/24/2014 

04/25/2014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ... 
-REGARDING CASE ISSUES RE: 11111 DRAFT E-MAIL TO ... - . -

REGARDING TRANSFER OF STUDENT 
RECORDS FROM STUDENT'S FORMER TO 
NEW DISTRJCT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 
WITH ATTORNEY FOX REGARDING 
POSSIBLE REPRESENTATION OF FAMILY 
AND 4/23/14 MANIFESTATION 
DETERMJNA TION RE:-

TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH ••• 
AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
MDR ISSUES; REVIEW ADDITIONAL 
RECORDS RECEIVED FROM ...... IN 
CONNECTION WITH SAME; PARTICIPATE IN 
MOR CONFERENCE; REVIEW AND EDIT 
PRELIMINARY DRAFT OF MOR 
CONFERENCE SUMMARY AND MEETING 
~-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
.__. REGARDING SAME; REVIEW 

FINAL MOR SUMMARY AND NOTES AND 
DRAFT E-MAILS TO PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING SAME, PLUS PLAN TO 
INITIATE FBA/BIP WHEN STUDENT 
RETURNS TO SCHOOL SETTING RE:. 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
SETTLEMENT IMPLEMENTATION ISSUES 
RE:. 

REVIEW PRIVATE NEUROPSYCHOLOGICAL 
EVALUATION REPORT AND ADDITIONAL 
MATERJALS FROM SOUTH CAMPUS AND 
PREPARE FOR 4/24/14 IEP MEETING RE: --

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY RE: .TRAVEL TO AND 
ATTEND IEP MEETING RE:. 

UPDATE TEMPLATE RECORDS REQUEST 
LETTER AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO-
.-, REGARDING STATUTORY 
RECORDS REQUEST AND RESPONSE TIME 
LINES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH .. 
-REGARDING PARENTS' REQUEST 
TO DEFER EXPULSION HEARING TO 
PERMIT INFORMAL RESOLUTION OF 
DISCIPLINARY AND PROGRAMMATIC 
DISPUTES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME RE .. 

12620 

0.70 

Page 3 

hrs.-147.00 

3.50 hrs' $735.00 

0.10 hrs" $21.00 

1.00 hr'ff $210.00 

4.30 hrs., $903.00 

0.40 hrs . .,, $84.00 

0.50 hrs.-$105.00 



Z6670 DISTRJCT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

04/25/2014 

04/29/2014 

04/30/2014 

04/30/2014 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
REGARDING PARENT 

REQUEST TO OBSERVE BRIDGE VIEW 
SCHOOL AND DEFERMENT OF FBA/BIP 
PAPERWORK.RE:. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH Ill 
-REGARDING NEEDED 

FOLLOW-UP RE:. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 

ATTORNEY RE: -

REVIEW LETTER TO ELEMENTARY 
DISTRICT FROM PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING OBJECTION TO RELEASE OF 
RECORDS TO DISTRICT 225; 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING SAME RE:111111 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

12620 

0.10 

0.10 

0.10 

21.00 

$42.00 

$21.00 

$21.00 

$2,982.00 

$2,982.00 

$2,982.00 

$2,982.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 / 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www .sragahauser.com 

May 09, 2014 
Bill Through 04/30/2014 

Invoice# 12621 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

01 

n·IL~.(--.1.'V\\.•·.,·· \\,\\/ 1,;,'!n1~ 
1'.L _,9.~J 'f1 

':"~;, l )/··d I LJ Ll1 "1 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES $2,394.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $2,394.00 

//J$ /J' 
../ / 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

May 09, 2014 
Bill Through 04/30/2014 
Invoice# 12621 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE A VENUE 

Matter Number O 1 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

04/01/2014 

04/01/2014 

04/01/2014 

04/01/2014 

04/02/2014 

04/03/2014 

04/03/2014 

04/04/2014 

04/04/2014 

04/07/2014 

WORK ON EXCESS A CCU MULA TION RA TE 
OBJECTION CHARTS 

UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 201 l COM ED 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: STATUS OF 201 l LAKE 
COOK TERRACE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: POSSIBLE 
SETTLEMENT ON EVERGREEN ALLIANCE 
GOLF,LTD. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: 2011 NEIMAN MARCUS 

UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 201 l NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

CALCULATE AV VALUES AND LOSSES IN 
REVENUE, PARTICIPATE IN NEGOTIATIONS 
AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT RE: 
POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT ON 20 l l 
EVERGREEN ALLIANCE GOLF, LTD 

REVIEW RESPONSE AND WORK ON 
ALLSTATE DISCOVERY 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 201 l MACY'S 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING 
WITH. CO-INTERVENOR AND STATE'S 
ATTORNEY ON SALES RATIO 
CON SOLID A TED CASES 

1.80 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.25 hrs. 

$378.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$105.00 

$210.00 

$63.00 

$52.50 



Z6670 

04/08/2014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

04/08/2014 

04/08/2014 

04/10/2014 

04/11/2014 

04/11/2014 

04/1 i/2014 

04/14/2014 

04/15/2014 

04/17/2014 

04/28/2014 

04/28/2014 

04/28/2014 

04/29/2014 

04/29/2014 

04/29/2014 

04/30/2014 

BILLING SUMMARY 

UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 201 l NEIMAN 
MARCUS 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
TO PERFORM FULL APPRAISAL REPORT ON 
EVERGREEN ALLIANCE GOLF 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT FOR MACY'S 

WORK ON DISCOVERY OF CONSOLIDATED 
CASES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2010 CHICAGO 
CA PIT AL HOLDINGS 

UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER REBUTTAL 
EVIDENCE RE: 201 l NEIMAN MARCUS 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
FOR REVIEW REPORT OF TAXPAYER 
EVIDENCE RE: 2011 NEIMAN MARCUS 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
RE: REBUTTAL EVIDENCE ON NEIMAN 
MARCUS 

PROPOUND DISCOVERY REQUESTS TO 
TAXPAYER 

WORK ON ALLSTATE DISCOVERY 

EXECUTE STIPULATION A ND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER'S 
ATTORNEY RE: 2011 EVERGREEN 
ALLIANCE GOLF. LTD. 

UPDATE FILE WITH PTAB FINAL ORDER RE: 
2009 VON MAUR 

UPDATE FILE WITH PT AB FINAL ORDER RE: 
2009 MARGEN MANAGEMENT 

EXCHANGE EMAIL MESSAGES WITH 
ATTORNEY RE: 2005 AND 2006 COOK RA TE 
OBJECTIONS 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB WITH 
FILING OF INTERVENOR REBUTTAL 
EVIDENCE RE: 2011 NEIMAN MARCUS 

REVIEW MOTION TO LIFT ST A Y AND 
AMEND ORDER OF CONSOLIDATION 
DISCOVERY RE: ALLSTATE 

UPDATE FILE WITH PROPOSED 
SETTLEMENT FROM TAXPAYER 
ATTORNEY RE: 20l~REALTY 

Total Fees 

12621 Page 2 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.25 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$105.00 

$84.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$52.50 

$210.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$42.00 

$63.00 

$84.00 

$63.00 

$2,394.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12621 Page 3 

TOTAL FEES $2,394.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $2,394.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $2,394.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

March 10, 2014 
Bill Through 02/28/2014 

Invoice# 12152 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE A VENUE 
SUITE 200 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

03 

GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 RECEIVED APR O 4 2014 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES $3,340.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $3,340.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

March 10, 2014 
Bill Through 02/28/2014 
Invoice# 12152 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 03 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CON Fl DENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

02/01/2014 

02/03/2014 

02/04/2014 

02/04/2014 

02/05/2014 

02/05/2014 

02/05/2014 

REVIEW E-MAIL FROM 
REGARDING RA TI ON ALE FOR REQUEST 
FOR NEW SUBSTANCE ABUSE 
EVALUATION RE: ... 

REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM 
ASST. PRINCIPAL 3 AND SELECT 
RECORDS FOR RESPONSE TO SUBPOENA; 
PREPARE LETTER TO PRESIDING JUDGE 
REGARDING SAME RE: .. 

REVIEW PEER SERVICES REPORT AND 
DRAFT E-MAIL TO PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING SAME; REVIEW AND RESPOND 
TO ADDITIONAL E-MAIL FROM PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING SUPPLEMENT AL 
SUBSTANCE ABUSE EVALUATION 
REQUESTED BY DISTRICT RE: -

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING INSURANCE 
COVERAGE/STATUS UPDATE ISSUES RE:-

E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY AND-
REGARDING PENDING EVALUATIONS AND 
RELATED MATTERS RE:. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH -
-REGARDING.MATTER AND 
ISSUES RELATIVE TO HOMEBOUND 
INSTRUCTORS 

REVIEW RESEARCH REGARDING 
HOMEBOUND INSTRUCTORS ISSUES; 
REVIEW AND EDIT PRELIMINARY DRAFT 
OF E-MAIL T~ REGARDING 
SAME 

0.10 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

$20.00 

$100.00-

$100.00 

$20.00. 

$20.00 

$40.00 -

$200.00 



Z6670 DISTRJCT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12152 Page 2 

02/05/2014 RESEARCH REGARDING QUALIFICATIONS 0.60 hrs. $120.00 
FOR HOMEBOUND TEACHERS 

02/06/2014 E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 0.10 hrs. $20.00 
REGARDING MEDICAL INFORMATION 
FROM CURRENT PHP AND PENDING 
EVALUATION AT ROSECRANCE RE. 

02/10/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
-REGARDING PARENT IEE 
REQUEST AND OPTIONS/STRATEGY FOR 
FOLLOW UP RE:. 

02/12/2014 REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 0.50 hrs. $100.00 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
EVALUATION AND IEP MEETING STATUS 
RE:. REVIEW AND EDIT PRELIMINARY 
DRAFT OF DUE PROCESS REQUEST AND 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH M~ 
REGARDING SAME RE:. 

02/14/2014 REVIEW UNILATERAL PLACEMENT NOTICE 0.70 hrs. $140.00 
AND £-CORRESPONDENCE AND 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY AND MS.-
REGARDING SAME; £-CORRESPONDENCE 
AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MS . 
..... REGARDING NEEDED 
FOLLOW-UP TN DUE PROCESS MATTER 
AND NEW CASE ISSUES RE:. 

02/18/2014 £-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
ATTORNEY AND IHO REGARDING 
FURTHER CONTINUANCE OF 2/24/14 
PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE; 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH MR.-. 
REGARDING PARENT E-MAILS TO STAFF 
AND RELATED MATTERS RE:. 

02/18/2014 REVIEW LA TEST E-MAILS FROM PARENT 0.50 hrs. $100.00 
AND £-CORRESPONDENCE WITH MS. 
--REGARDING RESPONSE TO 
SAME; REVIEW LETTER FROM ISBE'S 
EU LASS REGARDING APPOINTMENT OF •. 
._TO SERVE AS SUBSTITUTE THO AND 
RELATED PRE-HEARING MATTERS; 
REVIEW E-MAIL AND PRE-HEARING 
ORDERS RECEIVED FROM~ RE: e 

02/19/2014 £-CORRESPONDENCE WITH MS . ._. 0.10 hrs. $20.00 
REGARDING SUBSTITUTE IHO AND 
NEEDED FOLLOW-UP RE:.REVIEW 
MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE FILED BY 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY RE:e 

02/21/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. 0.20 hrs. $40.00 
REGARDING HOMELESS SPECIAL 

EDU CATTON STUDENT ISSUE AND NEEDED 
FOLLOW-UP 



26670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12152 Page 3 

$20.oofl 02/21/2014 REVIEW PARENT RESPONSE TO DISTRICT'S 0.10 hrs. 
DPCNRE:. 

02/23/2014 £-CORRESPONDENCE WITH MS . ._. 0.10 hrs. $20.00 
REGARDING STATUS OF STUDENT 
ATTENDANCE AT ADS AND RELATED 
COMMUNICATION FROM PA ...... 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING PROPOSED STATUS 
CONFERENCE RE:. 

02/23/2014 -ENCE WITH 0.10 hrs. $20.00 
, AND PA RENTS' ATTORNEY 

REGARDING 2/26/14 IEP MEETING RE .. 

02/24/2014 E-CORRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHON. 0.80 hrs. $160.00 
CONFERENCE WITH~ RE: 
AND .MATTERS; £-CORRESPONDENCE 
V/ITH PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
2/26/14 IEP MEETING AND ST A TUS OF 
EVALUATION REPORTS RE:A REVIEW 
ISBE CONTINUANCE ORDER RE:.; DRAFT 
E-MAIL TO-REGARDING 
ALTERNATE PROPOSED STATUS 
CONFERENCE DA TE; REVIEW AND 
RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
REGARDING FISCAL RESPONSIBILITY FOR 
HOMELESS SPECIAL EDUCATION STUDENT 

02/24/2014 RESEARCH APPLICABILITY OF FEDERAL 1.30 hrs. $260.00 
LAW, IF ANY, TO HOMELESS STUDENT 
WITH NON-HOMELESS PARENTS WHO 
RETAIN GUARDIANSHIP; BEGIN WORK ON 
DRAFT E-MAIL TO DIRECTOR--
REGARDING SAME 

02/25/2014 REVIEW PSYCHIATRIC EVALUATION AND 1.00 hrs. $200.00 
DRAFTOFROSECRANCERE~ 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 

, AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING SAME; COMPLETE 
PREPARATION FOR 2/26/14 IEP 
CONFERENCE RE. 

02/25/2014 REVIEW HOME-SCHOOL 0.20 hrs. $40.00 
E-CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING W AIYER 
OF REQUIRED RESOLUTION SESSION; 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WIT~ 
REGARDING 2/28/14 STATUS CONFERENCE 
RE:. 

02/26/2014 TRAVEL TO AND ATTEND IEP 4.50 hrs. $900.00 
CONFERENCE RE:. 



26670 

02/27 /2014 

DISTRJCT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

02/27/2014 

02/28/2014 

DRAFT E-MAIL TO ISBE'S EULASS 
REGARDING RESOLUTION W ATV ER AND 
RELATED DOCUMENTATION; 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH ~ND 
PARENT REGARDING WITHDRAWAL OF 
ADDITIONAL PENDING DUE PROCESS 
ACTION INITIATED BY PARENTS; 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE A~ 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH ---­
REGARDING PARENT'S FOIA REQUEST AND 
REVIEW SAME; DRAFT LETTER TO PARENT 
REGARDING POSSIBLE INFORMATION 
RESOLUTION OF IEE DISPUTE AND REVIEW 
PARENT RESPONSE TO SAME RE:. 

REVIEW AND EDIT DRAFT NOTES OF 2/26/14 
IEP MEETING AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO. 
-REGARDING SAME RE:. 

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENT AND 
REGARDING TODA Y'S 

STATUS CONFERENCE WITH -
PARENT, AND ADDITIONAL 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH. 
- REGARDING OUTSTANDING 
FOIA REGARDING AND POSSIBLE 
INDEPENDENT EVALUATORS RE:. 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOT AL BALANCE DUE 

12152 Page 4 

1.70 hrs. $340.00 

0.30 hrs. $60.00 • 

0.70 hrs. $140.00 

$3,340.00 

$3,340.00 

$3,340.00 

$3,340.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

April 07, 2014 
Bill Through 03/31/2014 

Invoice# 12381 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

Matter Number GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

RECEIVED APR 'I 4 2014 

Z6670 

01 

-~-:_//:-JI/: .. --­

//J3J f 
v" 

$1,720.00 

$1,720.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

April 07, 2014 
Bill Through 03/31/2014 
Invoice# 12381 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 1 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

03/03/2014 

03/04/2014 

03/05/2014 

03/06/2014 

03/07/2014 

03/07/2014 

03/10/2014 

03/11/2014 

03/17/2014 

03/17/2014 

03/17/2014 

UPDATE FILE WITH STATUS OF 2011 
EVIDENCE ON NEIMAN MARCUS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2011 
NORTHBROOK COURT MALL 

UPDATE FILE WITH COUNTY EVIDENCE RE: 
2011 LAKE COOK TERRACE 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND TAX RATE 
OBJECTIONS ST A TUS HEARING 

EMAIL DISTRICT WITH RATE OBJECTIONS 
UPDATE RE: PROPERTY TAXES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 
NOTES ON APPEAL AND DECISION TO FILE 
NO EVIDENCE RE: 2011 

REVIEW MOTION TO LIFT STAY AND 
MOTiON TO COMPEL FILED BY STATE'S 
ATTORNEY TO BE ARGUED NEXT WEEK 

PREPARE FORAND ATTEND COURT DATE 
FOR MOTION TO LIFT STAY ON CASES 

UPDATE FILE AND REVIEW BOARD OF 
REVIEW NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2011 
ALLGAUER, FRANK 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2008 AND 2009 
STIPULATIONS AND 2010 PENDING 
MATTER ON FUEL SYSTEMS/51 ST & 
MONITOR 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$20.00 

$20.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$80.00 

$80.00 

$60.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12381 Page 2 

03/17/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH FINAL DATE TO FILE 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 2009-.. 

03/19/2014 PREPARE DISCOVERY REQUESTS FOR 1.00 hrs. $200.00 
ALLSTATE SPO 

03/19/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
ON CONSOLIDATED CASES MOTION TO 
COMPEL 

03/20/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: MACY'S 

03/21/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH PT AB FINAL ORDER 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
AND VERIFY VALUE WITH FILE RE: 2010 
PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDO 
ASSOCIATION 

03/21/2014 WORK ON ALLSTATE DISCOVERY 1.00 hrs. $200.00 

03/24/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2011 NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

03/24/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
CORRESPONDENCE RE: 2011 NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

03/25/2014 WORK ON DISCOVERY RESPONSES 0.30 hrs. $60.00 

03/26/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND STATUS 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
COURT DATE 

03/28/2014 WORK ON ALLSTATE DISCOVERY 1.00 hrs. $200.00 

----------------
Total Fees $1,720.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $1,720.00 

TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $1,720.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $1,720.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

April 07, 2014 
Bill Through 03/31/2014 

Invoice# 12323 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PERSONNEL MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

02 

/ 

$180.00 

$180.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

April 07, 2014 
Bill Through 03/31/2014 
Invoice# 12323 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PERSONNEL MATTERS 

CON Fl DENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

03/06/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERE~T. --AND-- RE: PERSONNEL ISSUE 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

Matter Number 02 

0.90 hrs. $180.~ 

$180.00 

$180.00 

$180.00 

$180.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

April 07, 2014 
Bill Through 03/31/2014 

Invoice# 12322 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Matter Number O 

RECEIVED 4PR 2 1 2014 

$1,320.00 

$1,320.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

April 07, 2014 
Bill Through 03/31/2014 
Invoice# 12322 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

03/03/2014 

03/03/2014 

03/04/2014 

03/04/2014 

03/04/2014 

03/05/2014 

03/06/2014 

03/11/2014 

03/13/2014 

03/20/2014 

REVIEW EMAIL FROM -­
REGARDING INTERGOVERNMENTAL 
AGREEMENT; REVIEW DRAFT 
INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT 

REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING ZONING 
ISSUE WITH VILLAGE OF GLENVIEW 

REVIEW ZONING AND PARKING ISSUES 

~PHONE CONFERENCES WITH .. 
... REGARDING ZONING; RESEARCH 
CASE LAW ON ZONING REQUIREMENTS 
FOR SCHOOL DISTRICTS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH .. 
... REGARDING VALUE ENGINEERING; 
RESEARCH COMPETITIVE BIDDING 
ST A TUTE AND CRIMINAL CODE 
REGARDING 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MARCUS 
THIMM; REVISE INTERGOVERNMENTAL 
AGREEMENT; DRAFT EMAIL TO CLIENT 

REVIEW PROPOSED LEGISLATION RE: 
PARKING AND ZONING 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM 
- REGARDING COMPETITIVE 
BIDDING 

REVIEW EMAILS FROM......, 
REVIEW AND REVISE RECURRING COST 
ALLOCATION EXHIBIT FOR E-RA TE 
PROGRAM 

I.W.E_HONE CONFERENCE WITH­
... REVIEW INTERGOVERNMENTAL 
AGREEMENT AND PRICING/BANDWIDTH 
EXHIBIT 

0.40 hrs. 

0. 70 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

1.20 hrs. 

0.80 hrs . 

0.80 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

$140.00. 

$80.0. 

$240.00 

$160.00 

$160.00 

0.80 hrs. $160.00 

0.50 hrs. $100.00 

•• •. i,t. 



DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 26670 

03/21/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH -
.... REGARDING 

INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT 

Total Fees 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

12322 Page 2 

0.20 hrs . $4 .00 

$1,320.00 

$1,320.00 

$1,320.00 

$1,320.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highwayt-~e"'l O 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

~)_f~IJ 

'~-~,t._.1 

www.sragahauser.com 

March 10, 2014 
Bill Through 02/28/2014 

RECEP V .~ i 1\1)/\~ 1 701L 

Invoice# 12196 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

--3-11-l'f 
//J31f 

........ ,,;' 

Z6670 

01 

$2,800.00 

$2,800.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

March 10, 2014 
Bill Through 02/28/2014 
Invoice# 12196 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 1 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIViLEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

02/03/2014 

02/03/2014 

02/04/2014 

02/04/2014 

02/05/2014 

02/06/2014 

02/07/2014 

02/07/2014 

02/10/2014 

02/11/2014 

02/11/2014 

UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2011 THE BARKING 
LOT 

EXCHANGE OF EMAILS WITH TAXPAYER'S 
ATTORNEY AND WORK ON SETTLEMENT 
FOR 2009 BORDER'S AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO ASSIST ANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: SETTLEMENT FOR 
BORDER'S 

EXECUTE STIPULATION AND DRAFT 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER'S 
ATTORNEY RE: ACCEPTANCE OF 
SETTLEMENT AND INSTRUCTION TO 
SUBMIT TO BOARD OF REVIEW FOR 
APPROVAL OF 2009 BORDERS 

UPDATE FILE WITH ST A TUS OF APPEAL RE: 
2009 DOWN YORK AND EARL GREY 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2011 MACY'S 

WORK ON DISCOVERY ISSUES ON CASE 
RA TIO STUDY CONSOLIDATED CASES 

WORK ON RESPONSE TO DISCOVERY ON 
CON SO LIDA TED CASES 

WORK ON ALLSTATE SPO 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: 2011 LAKE COOK TERRACE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
COURT MALL 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NEIMAN 
MARCUS 

0.30 hrs. 

0.70 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

$60.00 

$140.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$80.00 

$200.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12196 Page 2 

02/11/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
APPRAISER RE: STATUS OF APPRAISAL 
REPORT ON 2011 FRANK ALLGAUER 

02/11/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: MACY'S 

02/12/2014 WORK ON POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT WITH 0.50 hrs. $100.00 
TAXPAYER ON NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

02/13/2014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2011 EVERGREEN ALLIANCE GOLF, LTD. 

02/13/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
APPRAISER RE: 2011 ALLGAUER VALUE 

02/14/2014 PREPARE FOR COURT DATE RE: ALLSTATE 0.30 hrs. $60.00 

02/18/2014 WORK ON ST A TUS AND 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
COUNTER-PROPOSAL ON RATE 
OBJECTIONS 

02/18/2014 PREPARE FOR COURT DATE ON ALLSTATE 0.50 hrs. $100.00 
SPO 

02/20/2014 REVIEW COMPLETED FULL APPRAISAL 0.50 hrs. $100.00 
REPORT FOR 2011 ALLGAUER 

02/20/2014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PT AB WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2011 ALLGAUER TAX APPEAL 

02/20/2014 PREPARE FOR COURT DATE TOMORROW 0.20 hrs. $40.00 

02/21/2014 PREPARE FOR AND APPEAR AT COURT 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
DA TE ON CONSOLIDATES SALES RA TIO 
CASES 

02/24/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

02/25/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 3.00 hrs. $600.00 
FOR ALLS TA TE SPO 

02/25/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2011 
WALGREEN CO. 

02/27/2014 WORK ON ALLSTATE SPO 1.00 hrs. $200.00 

02/27/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: 2011 MACY'S 

02/28/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2010 JOHN'S 
COURT BUILDINGS 

----------------
Total Fees $2,800.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 



26670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12196 Page 3 

TOTAL FEES $2,800.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $2,800.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $2,800.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

/ 

www.sragahauser.com 

March 10, 2014 
Bill Through 02/28/2014 

RECEJ VEb 1MA0 2 1 ',U . I\ l l't 

Invoice# 12151 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WESTLAKEAVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOT AL DISBURSEMENTS 

TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

0 

$2,580.00 

$130.80 

$2,710.80 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www. sragahauser. com 

March 10, 2014 
Bill Through 02/28/2014 
Invoice# 12151 ATS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERPD 

01/10/2014 

02/03/2014 

02/03/2014 

02/05/2014 

02/05/2014 

02/07/2014 

02/10/2014 

02/10/2014 

02/11/2014 

02/12/2014 

REVIEW BROTHERS CONTRACT 
AND EMAILS 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS 
REGARDING ••1t 
BROTHERS/HARTFORD MATTER 

REVIEW AND EDIT BOARD POLICY #8500 
AND POLICY/ADMINISTRATIVE 
PROCEDURE #8410; WORK ON 
PRELIMINARY DRAFT OF E-MAIL TO-

- REGARDING SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE CALL WITH •. 
AND COUNSEL FOR HARTFORD; 

REVIEW TAKEOVER AGREEMENT IN 
.... BROTHERS MATTER 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CLIENT; 
REVIE~ BROTHERS MOTION TO 
DISMISS AND AFFIDAVITS 

REVIEW EMAILS AND DRAFT AFFIDAVITS 
FOR AN~ 

~MAILS AND AFFIDAVITS FROM 
...... AN-DRAFT 

EMAIL TO COUNSEL FOR HARTFORD 
REGARDING.,, BROTHERS 
LITIGATION 

WORK ON ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO 
POLICY 8510 AND 8410, AND PROCEDURES 
8410; E-CORRESPONDENCE TO ....... 
RE: SAME (NO CHARGE PER AT~ 
SRAGA) 

PREP ARE DPCN FOR IEE 

REVIEW PACKET REGARDING GIS 
DEMOGRAPHY STUDY 

1.00 hrs. .$200.00 

0.30 hrs. 60.00 

1.40 hrs. -280.00 

0.80 hrs .• $160.00 

0.70 hrs .• $140.00 

0.40 hrs. $80.00 

0.40 

1.40 hrs."" N/C 

0.50 hrs 

0.80 



Z6670 

02/13/2014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

02/19/2014 

02/20/2014 

02/24/2014 

02/26/2014 

02/26/2014 

02/27/2014 

DISBURSEMENTS 

DRAFT RESOLUTION REGARDING GIS 
DATA MATTER 

REVIEW E-RA TE PROGRAM 
REQUIREMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH 
fNTERGOVERNMENT AL AGREEMENT FOR 
INTERNET SERVICES 

DRAFT fNTERGOVERNMENTAL 
AGREEMENT FOR INTERNET SERVICES 

REVIEW COMMENTS FROM CLIENT; DRAFT 
MODIFICATIONS TO 
fNTERGOVERNMENTALAGREEMENTFOR 
INTERNET ACCESS; DRAFT EMAIL TO 
CLIENT 

REVIEW PROCEDURES FOR REJECTING ALL 
BIDS 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM 
-REGARDING COMPETITIVE 
BIDDING 

WORK ON FOIA RESPONSE FOR STUDENT 
SERVICES SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND 
ATTORNEY INVOICES 

Total Fees 

12151 Page 2 

-.20 hrs. $240.00 

1.00 hrs. I $200.00 

3.00 

0.80 

hrs. I $600.00 

hrs. ' $160.00 

0.20 hrs. f 40.00 

0.20 hrn. ~40.00 

0.20 hrs. -$40.00 

$2,580.00 

02/03/2014 MESSENGER SERVICE TO OAK BROOK OFFICE AND SKOKIE 
COURTHOUSE FOR DELIVERY OF COURTESY COPIES TO JUDGE 

130.80 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TOT AL DISBURSEMENTS 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

Total Disbursements $130.80 

$2,580.00 

$130.80 

$2,710.80 

$2,710.80 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

www.sragahauser.com 

February 10, 2014 
Bill Through 01/31/2014 

Invoice# 12002 A TS 

GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SPECIAL EDIJCAT10N MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

03 

.. .. 
~ 1 1 

$3,580.00 

$3,580.00 

~ 
3-_.r-i'f- , i 

1/p81f 

.':, . 
~·--····-, ·- ---· 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

February 10, 2014 
Bill Through 01/31/2014 
Invoice# 12002 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE A VENUE 

Matter Number 03 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

01/02/2014 

01/03/2014 

01/03/2014 

01/06/2014 

01/08/2014 

01/09/2014 

E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH .. 
-AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY 

REGARDING CONTINUATION OF PHC, 1/6/14 
ST A TUS CONFERENCE, AND RELATED 
MATTERS RE .. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING NEW 
DEVELOPMENTS RE:. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH. 
_.. REGARDING POTENTIAL FLSA 
IMPLICATIONS OF STUDENT VOCATIONAL 
TRAINING AND INITIATE RESEARCH 
REGARDING SAME 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH-AND 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING CASE 
DEVELOPMENTS, FURTHER 
CONTINUANCE, AND EXTENSION OF 
PRE-HEARING TIME LINES; DRAFT E-MAIL 
TO AND ......... 
REGARDING SAME AND NEEDED 
FOLLOW-UP; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO 
E-MAIL FROM PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING RELEASE FOR 
COMMUNICATIONS WITH PRIVATE 
THERAPIST RE. 

~ENCE WITH 
-AND PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING UPCOMING IEP MEETING AND 
RELATED MATTERS RE .. 

REVIEW ISBE AND­
CONTINUANCE ORDERS RE. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.40 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

$40.00 

$40.00 

$80.0 

$100.00 

$100.0 

$20.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12002 Page 2 

01/09/2014 E-CORRESPONDE~RENTS' 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
ATTORNEY AND 
REGARDING REQUEST FOR IEP MEETING 
AND RELATED MATTERS RE:. REVIEW 
DOMAIN FORM AND £-CORRESPONDENCE 
WITH PARENTS' ATTORNEY,-
AN-REGARDING SAME, 
PLUS STATUS OF REQUESTED RELEASE 
FORMS RE:. 

01/10/2014 £-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 0.10 hrs. $20.00 
ATTORNEY AND 
REGARDING INCOMPLETE RELEASE FORM 
AND RELATED MATTERS RE:- $20.00. 01/13/2014 REVIEW CORRECTED RELEASE FORM 0.10 hrs. 
RECEIVED FROM PARENTS' ATTORNEY RE: .. 

01/13/2014 £-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 0.50 hrs. $100.00 
ATTORNEY, AND~. 
~GARDING STATUS OF 
EXECUTION OF RELEASE FORMS TO 
PERMIT COMMUNICATIONS WITH PRIVATE 
PROVIDERS, PENDING DISTRICT 
EVALUATIONS, AND RELATED MATTERS RE. 

01/14/2014 E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 0.50 hrs. $100.00 
ATTORNEY AND DISTRICT 
ADMINISTRATORS REGARDING 
OUTSTANDING RELEASE FORMS AND 
EVALUATIONS AND RELATED MATTERS 
RE:. 

01/14/2014 RESEARCH U.S. DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 3.00 hrs. $600.00 
REGULATIONS, GUIDANCE, AND OPINION 
LETTERS REGARDING VOCATIONAL 
TRAINING FOR STUDENTS WITH 
DISABILITIES AND WAGE REQUIREMENTS 
UNDER THE FLSA; DRAFT RESPONSE TO 
INQUIRY FROM SITE ATTORNEY 
REGARDING SAME 

01/15/2014 -ENCE WIT~, 1.00 hrs. $200.00 
AND PA RENTS' ATTORNEY 

REGARDING WHEREABOUTS OF NEEDED 
RELEASE FORMS, PENDING EVALUATIONS, 
AND POSSIBLE INTERIM PLACEMENT; 
REVIEW HOSPITAL RECORDS AND 
PRIVATE PSYCHOLOGIST REPORT RE: ... 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 12002 Page 3 

01/16/2014 E-CORRESPOND.CE WITH PARENTS' 0.60 hrs. $120.00 cf7{ { 
ATTORNEY RE: E-CORRESPONDENCE 
AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
REQUEST TO CANCEL PLANNED IEP 
MEETING AND RELATED MA~ 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING SAME RE:. 

$2oooq{(£ O l/l 7 /2014 £-CORRESPONDENCE WITH DISTRICT 0.10 hrs. 
ADMINISTRATORS AND PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING SCHEDULING OF 
PRIVATE EVALUATIONS AND POSSIBLE 
INTERIM PLACEMENT OF STUDENT AT 
COMPASS RE:. 

$60.00 t 01/20/2014 REVIEW E-MAILS REGARDING 0.30 hrs. 
POSTPONEMENT OF PSYCHIATRIC 
EVALUATION AND HOMEBOUND 
INSTRUCTION RE:. TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH PARENT'S ATTORNEY 
REGARDING BASIS OF REQUEST FOR IEP 
MEETING RE:. 

$60.00~ 01/22/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. 0.30 hrs. 
~GARDING.AND. 
MATTERS AND NEW STUDENT TRANSITION 
PLANNING DISPUTE 

$&oooy(,{( 01/22/2014 E-CORRESP~H PARENTS' 0.40 hrs. 
~ ,AND •. 

REGARDING EXECUTED 
RELEASES FOR OUTSIDE EVALUATORS 
AND RELATED MATTERS; REVIEW DRAFT 
REPORT REGARDING PARENTS' BASC 
RA TING SCALES AND £-CORRESPONDENCE WITi REGARDING SAME 
RE: 

$40.00 ~ 01/22/2014 £-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 0.20 hrs. 
AND PARENT'S ATTORNEY REGARDING 
UPCOMING TEP MEETING AND REQUEST 
FOR CLARIFICATION OF PARENT 
CONCERNS 

$20.00~'it 01/23/2014 REVIEW IHO AND ISBE CONTINUANCE 0.10 hrs. 
ORDERS RE:. 

$20.00 0f '?i 01/24/2014 ~ RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 0.10 hrs. 
REGARDING RECORDS TO BE 

RELEASED TO ; REVIEW AND 
RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING DISTRICT'S 
ATTEMPTS TO SCHEDULE INTERIM 
HOMEBOUND INSTRUCTION REt9 



Z6670 

01/24/2014 

01 /27/2014 

01/28/2014 

01/28/2014 

01/28/2014 

01/29/2014 

01/30/2014 

01/30/2014 

01/31/2014 

DISTRJCT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

REVIEW SUBPOENA AND COURT ORDER 
REGARDING STUDENT RECORDS; REVIEW 
AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL 
CORRESPONDENCE FROM DIRECTOR 

~REGARD1NG SAME RE:. 

E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
AND REGARDING !HO'S 
CONTINUANCE ORDERS, NEW PHC DA TE, 
AND PARENTS' OBJECTION TO 
ADDITIONAL SUBSTANCE ABUSE 
ASSESSMENT RE:. 

E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING ADDITIONAL SUBSTANCE 
ABUSE EVALUATION RE. 

ADDITIONAL E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
_.REGARDJNG STATUS OF 
PSYCHIATRJC EVALUATION, PARENTS' 
REQUEST TO SCHEDULE IEP MEETING 
WHILE EVALUATIONS ARE PENDING, AND 
INSURANCE NOTIFICATION ISSUE RE:. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASST. 
ST A TE'S ATTORNEY AND SUBPOENA FOR 
STUDENT RECORDS RE:. 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS FROM 
AND-REGARDING 

INSURANCE COVERA~ 

BEGIN REVIEW OF SELECT RECORDS 
RECEIVED FROM- IN 
PREPARATION FOR l/31/14 IEP 
CONFERENCE; DRAFT E-MAIL TO PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING DRAFT GOALS RE: • E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DIRECTOR 
-AND PRJNCIPAL._. 
REGARDING SUBPOENA FOR STUDENT 
RECORDS AND NO NEED FOR APPEARANCE 
IN COURT RE:. 

COMPLETE REVIEW OF SELECT RECORDS 
AND DRAFT GOALS; E~NDENCE 
AND MEETING WITH-AND GBS 
STAFF REGARDING SAME IN PREPARATION 
FOR TODA Y'S IEP MEETING; TRAVEL TO 
AND ATTEND IEP MEETING RE .. 
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 
~REGARDING POTENTIAL RISK 
ASSESSMENT AND "CLEAR AND PRESENT 
DANGER" REPORTING RELATIVE TO GBN 
STUDENT; £-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY AND MS._.,. 
REGARDING COMPLETION OF SUBSTANCE 
ABUSE EVALUATION RE: -

12002 Page 4 {:} 

0.30 hrs. $60.00 ~\ 

0.10 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

5.80 hrs. 

$20.00 C\ Y« 

$20.00~ 

$2000~{ 

$200.00 ~ 

$20.ooqf 

$1,160.00 ~ 



Z6670 DISTR1CT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

01/31/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARENT'S 
ATTORNEY REGARDING CASE ISSUES AND 
REQUESTS TO BE ADDRESSED AT TODA Y'S 

,)EP M~~JING RE: • _. 

01/31/2014 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES . .. ,. 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-~IL. 
coRp._E~~.Q,NDENCJ;: FROM it,s~- PRiN~~ AL 
CUMTvffNtiS REGA:fIDING RESPONSE TO 
SUBPOENA/COURT ORDER FOR RECORDS 
RE:. 

• IJ, 
Total Fees 

~-,., . ,-, 

•• 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

12002 Page 5 

0.30 hrs. $60.00 c;f 
~ 

$4000~ 0.20 hrs. 

$3,580.00 

$3,580.00 

$3,580.00 

$3,580.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 RECEIVRD 

www.sragahauser.com 

February 10, 2014 
Bill Through 01/31/2014 

Invoice# 12001 .... 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SCHOOL LAW 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

0 

,,, . '\l: '. 
'', I , 1 · -

,-·· - ) ' 

/ 
/ 

t="FR ? 4 2014 

$1,580.00 

$1,580.00 

-~· ,··:~. I 
//-J~J! 

. . --- -- ... -.... 'ft . 'fj 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

February 10, 2014 
Bill Through 01/31/2014 
Invoice# 12001 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

SCHOOL LAW 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

01/08/2014 

01/09/2014 

01/09/2014 

01/09/2014 

01/13/2014 

01/15/2014 

01/23/2014 

01/24/2014 

01/27 /2014 

01/27/2014 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BERT / 
CHALLET REGARDING-BROTHERS 
LITIGATION 

REVIEW EMAIL FROM COUNSEL FOR I 
HARTFORD; REVIEW MOTION FOR ~ 
SUMMARY JUDGMENT, AFFIDAVITS, 
TAKEOVER AGREEMENT IN~ 
BROTHERS MATTER 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH. 
-RE: OPEN MEETINGS ISSUE AND 

STUDENT ISSUE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
ASSISTANT U.S. ATTORNEY RE: OUTCOME 
OF INDICTMENT; REVIEW ~CORD; 
£-CORRESPONDENCE TO -RE: 
SAME 

REVISE OPINION OF COUNSEL LETTER; 
DRAFT EMAIL TO CLIENT 

REVIEW AFFIDAVITS OF ~ROTHERS / 
EMPLOYEES; REVIEW MOTION TO DISMISS . 
1N HARTFORD INSURANCE MATTER 

WORK ON~ROTHERS HARTFORD/ 
MATTER 

REVIEW DRAFT REVISIONS TO BOARD 
POLICIES FORWARDED BY_. 

REVIEW STUDENT DISCIPLINARY POLICY, 
PROCEDURE AND SEARCH AND SEIZURE 

WORK ON REVIEW OF BOARD POLICY RE: 
SEARCH AND SEIZURE 

0.30 hrs.' $60.00 

2.00 hrs. f $400.00 

0.40 hrs.- $80.00 

0.70 hrs. Jrt~l40.00 

0.30 hrs. ·-wi ..,e_ $60. 00 

1.00 hrs.\~ $200.00 

0.50 hrs.\'\ $100.00 

0.40 hrs. ·7Vl, .,e $80.00 

0.60 hrs. 70-tl$ l 20.00 

0.40 hrs.~ $80.00 



Z6670 

01/28/2014 

01/30/2014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

REVIEW £-CORRESPONDENCE AND 
~HMENTFORWARDED BY • 
... RE: AMENDMENT TO BOARD 
POLICIES AND PROCEDURES· 
£-CORRESPONDENCE TO 
SAME 

RE: 

REVlEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM 

12001 Page 2 

0.50 hrs. ·-y,tt.f.,$100.00 

0.40 $80.00 
COUNSEL FOR HARTFORD INSURANCE; / 
~MAIL TO CLIENT REGARDING 
~ROTHERS LITIGATION 

hrs.~ 

01/30/2014 

01/31/2014 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH --
-RE: SCHOOL CALENDAR ISSUE 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM 
COUNSEL FOR HARTFOR~FT EMAIL / 
TO CLIENT REGARDING~ BROTHERS 
MATTER 

Total Fees 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

0.10 hrs. 'J"'lf.. $20.00 

0.30 $60.00 

$1,580.00 

$1,580.00 

$1,580.00 

$1,580.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com k.ECEJVEP FFY -1 ? ?014 
February 07, 2014 

Bill Through O 1/31/2014 
Invoice# 11942 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

01 

°l=::/ I.-I'/: 
. 1/f:lJ/ 

$2,880.00 

$2,880.00 

I , 

.,r,...,n;,,-\L.. ~'-.
1

_ 
--,/'' 

-----.... -~ -- -- -·- . 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

February 07, 2014 
Bill Through O 1/31/2014 
Invoice# 11942 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number 26670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number O 1 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

01/02/2014 

01/02/2014 

01/03/2014 

01/03/2014 

01/03/2014 

01/03/2014 

01/07/2014 

01/07/2014 

01/08/2014 

01/08/2014 

UPDATE FILE WITH APPRAISAL FOR 
SETTLEMENT AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH TAXPAYER'S 
ATTORNEY FOR STIPULATION RE: PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS CONDO. ASSOCIATION 

WORK ON ISSUES RE: RATIO STUDY AND 
DISCOVERY TOTAL 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ST A TE'S 
ATTORNEY RE: ALLSTATE SPO 
CONTINUANCE DA TE 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: SUBSEQUENT SALE OF 
EVERGREEN ALLIANCE GOLF, LTD. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER REGARDING ST A TUS OF 
APPRAISAL RE: 2011---

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2010 AND 2011 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY AND 
NEGOTIATIONS FOR POSSIBLE 
SETTLEMENT RE: NORTHBROOK COURT 
MALL 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2011 MACY'S 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: NEIMAN 
MARCUS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 
APPRAISER RE: 2011 WALGREEN CO. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.50 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

0.30 hrs. 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$100.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 

$60.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 11942 Page 2 

01/08/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
APPRAISER RE: 2011 

01/08/2014 CALCULATE AV VALUES, MARKET 0.50 hrs. $100.00 
VALUES AND LOSSES AND REVIEW 
EXPERT'S PRELIMINARY ANALYSIS 
REPORT AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT FOR 
FULL APPRAISAL REPORT ON 2011 
EVERGREEN ALLIANCE GOLF 

01/09/2014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TO PERFORM FULL APPRAISAL REPORT TO 
SUBMIT AS INTERVENOR EVIDENCE ON 
2011 EVERGREEN ALLIANCE GOLF TAX 
APPEAL 

01/13/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: STIPULATION 
FOR PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDO 
ASSOCIATION 

01/14/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND PROVE UP 3.00 hrs. $600.00 
COURT DATE FOR 

01/14/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 
NORTHBROOK RACQUET CLUB 

01/16/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
APPRAISER RE: PROGRESS OF REPORT ON 
2011 EVERGREEN ALLIANCE GOLF 

01/17/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD OF REVIEW 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2011 LAKE COOK 
TERRACE 

01/17/2014 WORK ON DISCOVERY ISSUES 0.30 hrs. $60.00 

01/20/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: FUTURE VON 
MAUR 

01/22/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH FINAL ORDER FROM 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
PTAB ON WITHDRAWAL OF APPEAL RE: 
2008 LOVESTREET 

01/22/2014 EXECUTE STIPULATION AND DRAFT 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
CORRESPONDENCE TO TAXPAYER'S 
ATTORNEY RE: SETTLEMENT OF 2010 
PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDO 
ASSOCIATION 

01/23/2014 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
RE: CON SO LIDA TED SALES RA TIO CASES 

01/24/2014 WORK ON ALLSTATE DISCOVERY 1.00 hrs. $200.00 

O l /24/2014 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PT AB WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2011 WALGREEN CO. 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 11942 Page 3 

01/27/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
BOARD OF REVIEW FOR PROCESSING 
STIPULATION RE: 2010 PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS CONDO ASSOCIATION 

01/28/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH EVID 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
DATE RE: 2011 

01/28/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: NORTHBROOK 
RACQUET CLUB 

01/29/2014 PREPARE FOR COURT DATE AND 1.00 hrs. $200.00 
POTENTIAL ARGUMENT FOR ALLSTATE 

01/29/2014 WORK ON DISCOVERY RESPONSES ON 0.20 hrs. $40.00 
CONSOLIDATED CASES 

01/30/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: THE BARKING 
LOT 

01/30/2014 UPDATE FILE WITH AGREED JUDGMENT 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
ORDER ON 2009~ ASSOC IA TES .. 

01/31/2014 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER ATTORNEY RE: FUTURE YEARS 
SETTLEMENT FOR VON MAUR WITHOUT 
REFUND 

----------------
Total Fees $2,880.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $2,880.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $2,880.00 

TOT AL BALANCE DUE $2,880.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway- Suite 10 RECEIVED JAN 2 2ffi1·' 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

January 08, 2014 
Bill Through 12/31/2013 

Invoice# 11 772 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

26670 

03 

$800.00 

$800.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

January 08, 2014 
Bill Through 12/31/2013 
Invoice# 11 772 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 03 

SUITE 200 CONFIDENTIAL 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 ATl OR NEY-CLIENT 

PRIVILEGE 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

12/11/2013 

12/11/2013 

12/12/2013 

12/17/2013 

12/17/2013 

l 2/l 7 /2013 

12/20/2013 

12/26/2013 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
REGARDING ISSUES 

RELATIVE TO FAILURE TO ADEQUATELY 
MANAGE SELF-CARE BY STUDENT WITH 
DIABETES 

BEGIN WORK ON DISTRICT'S PRE-HEARING 
CONFERENCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENTS 
(WITNESS LIST) AND DRAFT E-MAIL TO •. 
-REGARDING SAME RE. 

CONTINUE WORK ON PREPARATION OF 
DISTRICT'S PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE 
DISCLOSURE ST A TEMENTS 

E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH._.... 
AND MR.- REGARDING PARENT 
REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL IEP OR 
RESOLUTION ~ETING AND RELATED 
MATTERS RE:-

~ESPOND TO E-MAILS FROM 
........ ANDPARENTS'ATTORNEY 
REGARDING CASE STATUS RE:-

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 
-REGARDING ISSUES/OPTIONS 
RELATIVE TO STUDENT FAILURE TO 
ADEQUATELY SELF-MANAGE DIABETES 
CARE 

REVIEW E-MAIL FROM PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING TEP MEETING IN 
LIEU OF PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE ON 
1/6/13 RE:. 

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY REGARDING 
PROPOSAL TO FURTHER CONTINUE 
PRE-HEARING CONFERENCE RE:. 

0.10 hrs. 

1.50 hrs. 

1.00 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.20 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

0.10 hrs. 

$20.00 ( ( 

$300.00 gf 

$200.00~ 

$40.00 ( ( 

$20.0~ 

$40.00 't, i 

$20.00 {, ti CA/ 

$20.00 { ~qr 



Z6670 

12/27/2013 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

12/30/2013 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES 

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY AND MR. 

GARDING POSTPONEMENT 
OF 1/6/14 PRE-HEARlNG CONFERENCE AND 
REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL IEP MEETING 
RE:. 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND 
£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING PROPOSED 
FURTHER CONTINUANCE OF .AND 
RELATED MATTERS; £-CORRESPONDENCE 
WITH Ms . ...,,m MR. 
REGARDING SAME RE:. 

Total Fees 

TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

11772 Page 2 

0.20 hrs. $40.00 ({ 

0.50 hrs. $100.00 ~ t_ 

$800.00 

$800.00 

$800.00 

$800.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

January 08, 2014 
Bill Through 12/31/2013 

RECEIVE ft JAN 2 9 201ii 

Invoice# 11745 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

PROPERTY TAXES 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

01 

/-)--9-1/f 
//J3/.f 

/ 

$5,220.00 

$5,220.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

January 08, 2014 
Bill Through 12/31/2013 
Invoice# 11745 JMI 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 01 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

CONFIDENTIAL 
ATTORNEY-CLIENT 
PRIVILEGE 

PROPERTY TAXES 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

12/02/2013 

12/02/2013 

12/03/2013 

12/03/2013 

12/03/2013 

12/03/2013 

12/03/2013 

12/05/2013 

12/05/2013 

12/05/2013 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 
-RE: 2011 LAKE COOK TERRACE 

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT DATE 
RE: 2-50 INTERVENOR DISCLOSURES AND 
LOCAL RULE AMENDMENT 

DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PT AB WITH 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2011 THE BARKING LOT 

WORK ON POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT ON 
2010 PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDO. 
ASSOC IA Tl ON 

PREPARE FOR PTAB HEARING ON 
LOVESTREET 

WORK ON SETTLEMENT 
WITH STATE'S ATTORNEY 

UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 
AND DATE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW OF TAXPAYER 
APPRAISAL REPORT RE: 2011 THE BARDING 
LOT 

EMAIL STATE'S ATTORNEY TO CONFIRM 
DISTRICT'S REPRESENT A Tl ON RE: 
PROPERTY TAX RATE OBJECTIONS 

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STATE'S 
ATTORNEY RE: 

CA LC ULA TE AV VALUES AND LOSSES AS 
WELL AS SETTLEMENT LOSSES AND 
DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO A SIST ANT 
SUPERINTENDENT RE: CASE 
11 COT03803 AND 11 .. 
3804 

0.30 hrs. $60.00 

0.40 hrs. $80.00 

0.30 hrs. $60.00 

0.40 hrs. $80.00 

1.00 hrs. $200.00 

0.70 hrs. $140.00 

0.40 hrs. $80.00 

0.10 hrs. $20.00 

0.30 hrs. $60.00 

0.80 hrs. $160.00 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 11745 Page 2 

12/05/2013 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
APPRAISER RE: PIN NUMBER NOT OWNED 
BY COMPLAINANT ON 2011 W ALGREENS 

12/05/2013 PREPARE FOR HEARING ON LOVESTREET 1.00 hrs. $200.00 

12/05/2013 WORK ON DISCOVERY ISSUES AND SALES 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
RATIO STUDY OF INTERVENORS AND 
ST A TE'S ATTORNEY 

12/09/2013 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER REBUTTAL 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
EVIDENCE RE: 2010 NEIMAN MARCUS 

12/09/2013 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO APPRAISER 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
REGARDING REBUTTAL EVIDENCE RE: 

12/09/2013 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND TAXPAYER'S 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
REPORT OF MARKET VALUES AND 
CALCULATE POTENTIAL LOSS BY REFUND 
RE: 20 l l THE BARKING LOT 

12/09/2013 ~ORCOURTDATEONAGF 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
PO CASES 

12/09/2013 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: POSSIBLE 
SETTLEMENT FOR 2010 PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS CONDO. ASSOCIATION 

12/10/2013 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY TO WORK OUT 
POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT OF 2011 PATRIOT 
COURTYARDS CONDO ASSOCIATION 

12/10/2013 UPDATE FILE WITH PRELIMINARY 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
ANALYSIS OF MARKET VALUE RE: 2011 
LAKE-COOK TERRACE 

·$ 

12/10/2013 CALCULATE AV :CbSSES AND STIPULATION 0.50 hrs. $100.00 
VALUES AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO ASSIST ANT SUPERINTENDENT RE: 
POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT FOR 20 IO 
PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDO. 
ASSOCIA Tl ON 

12/10/2013 ATTEND COURT HEARING REGARDING 3.20 hrs. $640.00 
~MENT, AND PROVE UP FOR 

AX OBJECTION CASES 

12/11/2013 REVIEW AND RECORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 hrs. $100.00 
ON WORK ON REVENUE 
CALCULATION; EMAIL DISTRICT 

12/11/2013 RE~CORD NOTICE OF APPEAL 0.50 hrs. $100.00 
ON ALLIANCE GOLF LIMITED; 
WOR ON REVENUE CALCULATION; 
EMAIL DISTRICT . ~~ 

12/11/2013 DRAFT COURT APPEARANCE FORM ON 0.10 hrs. $20.00 
PROPERTY TAX RATE OBJECTIONS 2007 -
2010; PREPARE FOR STATUS HEARING 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 11745 Page 3 

12/11/2013 UPDATE FILE WITH BOARD ~W 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
NOTES ON APPEAL RE: 2011 
REALTY 

12/11/2013 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO PTAB TO 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
ADOPT EVIDENCE OF COOK COUNTY 
BOARD OF REVIEW RE: 2011 LAKE-COOK 
TERRACE 

12/11/2013 DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: LOVESTREET 
HEARING 

12/12/2013 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND INITIAL 
STATus·tfEi\RING, WORK ON FILING 

0.20 hrs. $40.00 

APPEARANCES 

12/12/2013 UPDATE FILE AND CHART WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER REQUESTED REDUCTION RE: 
2011 EVERGREEN ALLIANCE GOLF LIMITED 

12/12/2013 UPDATE FILE AND CHART WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXP REDUCTION RE: 
2011 

12/13/2013 DRAFT EMAIL TO TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
RE: LOVESTREET 

12/13/2013 PREPARE FOR POSSIBLE HEARING ON 0.60 hrs. $120.00 
LOVESTREET 

12/13/2013 UPDATE FILE WITH WITHDRAW AL NOTICE 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO 
ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT RE: 
WITHDRAW AL OF 2008 LOVESTREET 

12/16/2013 EMAIL DISTRICT RE: ST A TUS HEARING ON 0.10 hrs. $20.00 
RA TE OBJECTIONS 

12/16/2013 WORK ON ALLSTATE SPO 0.50 hrs. $100.00 

12/16/2013 WORK WITH APPRAISER ON VALUATION 0.50 hrs. $100.00 
OF PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDO 
ASSOCIATION 

12/16/2013 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
APPRAISER RE: 2011 WALGREEN COMPANY 

12/16/2013 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
APPRA-'tSE~: 2011 MACY'S 

12/17/2013 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND PTAB 1.00 hrs. $200.00 
HEARING AND FORMAL WITHDRAWAL OF 
APPEAL BY TAXPAYER ON 2008 
LOVESTREET 

12/17/2013 DRAFT"C'=)RRESPONDENCE TO PT AB WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
FILING OF INTERVENOR EVIDENCE RE: 
2011 MACY'S 

12/18/2013 -AB INTERVENTION ON 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
ALLIANCE GOLF, LTD. 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 11745 Page 4 

12/18/2013 WORK ON PTAB INTERVENTION ON 0.30 hrs. $60.00 

12/18/2013 UPDATE FTLE WITH PT AB ST A TUS LETTER 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
RE: 2010 TCJ GROUP 

12/18/2013 WORK ON DISCOVERY ISSUES AND 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
EXPERT REPORTS RE: CONSOLIDATED SPO 
CASES 

12/23/2013 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2009-.. _. 

12/23/2013 MEETING WITH STATE'S ATTORNEY RE: 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
PLAN ON DEFENSE OF CONSOLIDATED 
CASES 

12/27/2013 UPDATE FILE WITH ADDITIONAL 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
REBUTTAL EVIDENCE RE: 2010 NEIMAN 
MARCUS 

12/27 /2013 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: 2010 PATRIOT 
couRiv~itbs ·m~BCS'X~~ocrAT10N 

12/27/2013 CA LC ULA TE AV VALUES AND LOSSES AND 0.50 hrs. $100.00 
LOSSES WITH SETTLEMENT ON NEW 
VALUES AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE 
TO ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT RE: 2010 
PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDO 
ASSOCIATION 

12/27/2013 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: POSSIBILITY 
TO SETTLE 2010 CHICAGO CAPITAL 
HOLDINGS 

12/30/2013 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
AND DATE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW TAXPAYER'S 
REPORT RE: EVERGREEN ALLIANCE GOLF 
LIMITED. 

12/30/2013 UPDATE FILE WITH TAXPAYER EVIDENCE 0.40 hrs. $80.00 
AND DATE TO FILE INTERVENOR 
EVIDENCE AND REVIEW TAXPAYER'S 

~ 
12/31/2013 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND MARKET 0.30 hrs. $60.00 

VALUES AND CALCULATE POTENTIAL 
LOSSES BY REFUND RE: 2011 EVERGREEN 
ALLIANCE GOLF CLUB 

12/31/2013 CALCULATE AV VALUES AND MARKET 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
VALUES AND CALCULATE POTENTIAL 
LOSSES BY REFUND RE: 2011 

12/31/2013 UPDATE FILE WITH ST A TUS OF EVIDENCE 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
RE: 20 I l WALGREEN CO. 



Z6670 DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 11745 Page 5 

12/31/2013 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
TAXPAYER'S ATTORNEY RE: STIPULATION 
ON 2010 PATRIOT COURTYARDS CONDO 
ASSOCIATION 

12/31/2013 WORK ON ALLSTATE SPO 1.00 hrs. $200.00 

12/31/2013 PREPARATION FOR TRIAL MANAGEMENT 0.30 hrs. $60.00 
CALL HEARING FOR ALLSTATE SPO 

----------------
Total Fees $5,220.00 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $5,220.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $5,220.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $5,220.00 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

September 04, 2014 
Bill Through 08/31/2014 

RECEIVED S[r) 2 6 2014 

Invoice# 13419 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 
SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 

TOTAL FEES 

Client Number 

Matter Number 

Z6670 

03 

$7,770.00 

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $7,770.00 

.. 

{lP;f / 



SRAGA HAUSER, LLC 
19730 Governors Highway - Suite 10 

Flossmoor, Illinois 60422 
Phone: (708) 799-6766 Fax: (708) 799-6866 

www.sragahauser.com 

September 04, 2014 
Bill Through 08/31/2014 
Invoice# 13419 A TS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION Client Number Z6670 
GLENBROOK HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 225 
3801 WEST LAKE AVENUE 

Matter Number 03 

SUITE 200 
GLENVIEW, IL 60026-1241 CiJr!F!D~N:IAL 

Ai 'U, ::Y-CUfNT 
h,iVJLi:.Gf 

SPECIAL EDUCATION MATTERS 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SER_VICES RENDERED 

07/28/2014 

08/01/2014 

08/02/2014 

BEGIN WORK ON DRAFT RESPONSE TO 

~ 
REVIEW E-MAIL FROM ....... .. 
REGARDING FACTUAL ASSERTIONS IN 
DRAFT RESPONSE TO -COMPLETE 
FINAL REVISIONS TO RESPONSE AND 
DRAFT E-MAIL TO ISBE'S EULASS 
REGARDING SAME; REVIEW EMAIL FROM 

-REGARDINGS/21/14 
MEDIATION RE:.. -"'. 

1.10 

0.70 

0.10 h 

08/04/2014 

REVIEW E-MAIL FROM~ 
REGARDING 1/24/14 IEP ~-

E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PA~ 

•

Y, ANI:9111111t 
£GARDING RESOLUTION 

AND REVIEW EVALUATION 

0.30 hrs .• $63.00 

08/05/2014 

08/06/2014 

08/07/2014 

08/07/2014 

08/07/2014 

REPORT FROM PRIVATE THERAPIST RE-

E-CORRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING MOVE-IN STUDENT RE: 
E-CORRESPONDENCE WITH 
REGARDING PARENT REQUEST FOR IEP 
MEETING RE:~ 

REVIEW-ONTINUANCE ORDER RE: -TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. 
PEARSON REGARDING P~ 
EDUCATION MATTERS -

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY RE: ... 

E-CORRES~ WITH 
AND MR.-REGARDING PARENT 
REQUEST FOR IEP MEETING RE-

0.40 hrs. $84.00 

0.20 $42.00 

0.50 

0.10 hrs $21.00 

0.10 hrs $21.00 



Z6670 

08/22/2014 

08/23/2014 

08/25/2014 

08/25/2014 

08/25/2014 

08/25/2014 

08/25/2014 

08/26/2014 

08/26/2014 

DISTRICT 225 - COOK Invoice# 

TRAVEL TO GBN AND ATTEND IEP 
MEETING RE:9'fRA VEL TO GBS AND 
ATTEND ADMINISTRATIVE MEETING RE: ... 
DRAFT E-MAIL TO~ 
REGARDING OUTCOME OF MEDI TION 
AND NEED TO SET PHC DA TE RE: .. 

TELEPHON .. RENCE WITH GBS 
PRINCIPAL ASSOC. PRINCIPAL 
AND DIRECTOR PEARSON RE: SPECIAL 
EDUCATION PERSONNEL MATTER 

PARTICIPATE IN CASE STATUS 
CONFERENCE WITH4llllilrELEPHONE 
CONFERENCE WITH PARENTS' ATTORNEY 
REGARDING SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL AND 
PLANNED FOLLOW-UP RE: -

REVIEW LA TEST E-M~ 
COMMUNICATIONS Rt::'!1111191' 
£-CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING 
FOLLOW-UP IEP MEETING RE: 4111' 
REVIEW CURRENT IEP AND FILE 
MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR 8/26/14 
IEP MEETING RE ... 

£-CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARENTS' 
ATTORNEY REGARDING REQUE1W2R 
RESIDENTIAL PLACEMENT RE:~ 
TRAVEL TO AND ATTEND IEP MEETING RE: 
~FER WIT~ND DR. 
-EGARDING CASE HISTORY AND 
ISSUES RE:~ 

REVIEW LETTER FROM PARENTS' 
ATTORi'\JEY REGARDING SETTLEMENT 
OFFER AND DRAFT E-MAILS T04illlt 

..-.ND~EGARDING 
SAME; BEGIN REVIEW OF IN/OUTPATIENT 
HO SPIT AL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM 
PARENTS' ATTORNEY; REVIEW 
£-CORRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHONE 
~C::E WIT~ND 
-EGARD!NGMEETING WITH 
PARENT/EMPLOYEE CONCERNING 
COMMUNICATIONS WITH STAFF; PREPARE 
CONTINUANCE MOTION AND REVIEW 
ORDER RECEIVED FROM "9REGARDING 
SAME RE:-

13419 Paf 
5.00 hrs. $1,050.00 

(0.10) hrs., $(21.00) 

0.70 hrs~ $147.00 

4.30 hrs.,. $903.00 

0.40 hrs. - $84.00 

0.10 hrs., $21.00 

$147.00 

0.90 hrs.lfllllfi 89.00 



Z5670 DISTRJCT 225 - COOK Invoice# 13419 Page S 

BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL FEES $7,770.00 

TOT AL FEES FOR THIS MATTER $7,770.00 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $7,770.00 






























